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1 L. INTRODUCTION.
2 By Order dated September 13, 2012, the Honorable Robert H. O’Brien (the “Court™)
3| granted in part and denied in part the Application To Approve Conservation and Liquidation
41l Expenses (“First Application”) filed by Applicant Insurance Commissioner of the State of
5| California in his capacity as Liquidator of Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company
6{l (“Commissioner”™). (September 13 Order, Exhibit 11.) Specifically, the First Application was
7|l granted in part as to the fees and expenses for eight of the fifteen consultants/vendors requested in
81l the Application, which total $3,001,098.18:
9l 1. ART Movers: $ 10,198.71
104 2 Conservation & Liquidation Office: $1,586,348.91
11 3 Cooke’s Crating: $§  6,74047
12 4 Epstein Turner Weiss: $ 912,053.30
13 5. Joshua Solomen $ 6925510
14 6 Kane Corporation: $ 313,292.19
15 7 Ultimate Staffing: $ 46,189.56
16 8 Wisener Nunnally Gold, LLP $ 57,019.94
17 The Court did not approve the fees and expenses of seven consultants/vendors requested
18] in the First Application based upon documentation deficiencies that the Court concluded
19| undermine a proper initial determination of the propriety of the fees. At the conclusion of its
20{ September 13, 2012 Order, the Court instructed the Commissioner to submit a revised amount for
21| approval minus the amounts not approved. (September 13 Order, Ex. 13, p. 5:19-20.) Thereafter,
221 by Order dated October 26, 2012, the Court instructed the Commissioner to resubmit its First
23| Application “excising the disapproved amounts.” (October 26 Order, Exhibit 14.) The non-
241 approved fees and expenses are excluded from this Revised Application and will be the subject of
25| a separate Second Application to Approve Conservation and Liguidation Expenses. (September
26|l 13 Order, Ex. 13, p. 2:12-20.)
27 The delay between the October 26, 2012 Order and the filing of this Revised Application
28 is due to the Commissioner’s now dismissed appeal of Judge O’Brien’s September 13 and
A Pestosionsl Conperaion
)
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Lt October 26, 2012 Orders. On November 9, 2012, due to Judge O’Brien’s non-approval of the
24 fees and expenses of the seven consultants/vendors, the Commissioner filed a Notice of Appeal to
3l| preserve appellate rights. Thereafter, on November 20, 2012, in accordance with the October 26
4| Order, the Commissioner previously filed this Application seeking approval of the expenses for
5{ the eight vendors whose expenses were approved in the September 13th Order. However, on
6| January 9, 2013, at the hearing on said Application, Judge O’Brien declined to hear the
7|l application on the basis that the Notice of Appeal divested the superior court of jurisdiction as to
8|l all matters addressed in the Orders including the eight vendors whose fees were approved. The
91 Court thereafter issued a minute order stating that the application is “stayed pending appeal.”
10§ Now, after further research and review of the Court’s September 13 and October 26 Orders, the
11| Commissioner has concluded that the Orders are non-final, non-appealable interim receivership
12} orders for which additional documentation and information can be submitted to support the fees
13§ and expenses incurred. Accordingly, on August 29, 2013, the Commissioner dismissed the

14l appeal. (Declaration of Michael R. Weiss, 4 11, Exhibits 15 and 16.)

15 By this Revised Application and pursuant to the Court’s Orders, the Commissioner hereby
16} seeks an order approving the fees and expenses for the eight consultants/vendors stated above and

17 previously requested in the First Application in the amount of $3,001,098.18.

18

19] 1L STANDARD OF REVIEW FOR TRIAL COURT’S APPROVAL OF FEES AND
20 EXPENSES INCURRED BY INSURANCE COMMISSIONER IN CONSERVING
21 AND LIQUIDATING INSURANCE COMPANIES.

22 In In re Executive Life Insurance Company (1995) 32 CaLApp.élth 344, 399-403, the trial

23| court approved more than $60 million in fees to attorneys and other professionals for services

24 performed at the direction of the Insurance Commissioner as liquidator of Executive Life

254 Insurance Company. (/d, at p. 399-403.) The Court of Appeal affirmed the tr1al court’s approval
26| of the fees and expenses, holding that the Commissioner had supplied the trial court with

271l “adequate information” for the trial court to evaluate and confirm that the Commissioner had

28|l performed his duty to determine that the fees and expenses were proper and rendered to protect
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the insurer’s estate, policyholders and creditors. (/d) The information provided to the trial court
was the following:

1. Declarations reciting that detailed timekeeping and invoices seeking payment were
received and carefully reviewed by the Commissioner’s staff and the proposed payments were

reasonable and necessary for the rehabilitation of Executive Life and in its best interests,

2. Brief descriptions of the services performed by each of the professionals seeking
payment,
3. A sample of original invoices permitting the court to test the accuracy of the

declarations, and

4. A description of the tasks performed, time spent and amount billed for each person

. for each day. (id)

Specifically, the Court of Appeal stated:

The power of the Commissioner to employ professionals and to pay them
for their services is found in section 1064.2, subdivision (c). A related power,
exercised through the Attorney General, is to be found in section 1036. Both
sections require “approval” by the trial court of fees which the Commissioner

proposes to pay.

“Approval,” as opposed to the “award” language more common in fee-
shifting statutes, connotes an initial discretion in the Commissioner to determine
whether fees billed are proper. The Commissioner is the public officer designated
as the steward for the funds of the insolvent insurer whose estate he or she
administers. The Commissioner's initial determination necessarily requires
adequately detailed information describing the work performed, by whom 1t was
performed, the time spent and when it was spent, and the rate and amount billed,
unless an approved contract of employment specifies a different basis of
compensation. |[Citation.] The Commissioner should possess sufficient
information to be able to determine from the billings any excessive or duplicative
charges, and seek clartfication and correction where appropriate. Where
compensation is on other than an hourly basis, the Commissioner must possess
adequate information to determine that the terms of the engagement were satisfied.

To obtain court approval for payment of the fees deemed appropriate, the
Commissioner must supply the court with adequate information to permit
intelligent evaluation of the basis for the Commissioner's determination. The court
must be satisfied that the Commissioner has performed his duty to protect the
interests of the estate. It is not required by statute, nor is it practical, for the court
to undertake a detailed review of the invoices before approving payment. The
Commissioner must, however, be ready to provide whatever documentation the
court may find necessary in determining the propriety of the Commissioner's
request that payment be approved.

-3
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These standards were met in this case. The Commissioner's motions for
approval of fees were accompanied by declarations from employees of {Executive
Life] or from the Commissioner's special counsel. These declarations recite that
“extremely detailed” invoices seeking payment for legal or other professional
services were received and carefully reviewed in their detail by the
Commissioner's staff. They recite that the proposed payments to the professional
firms “are reasonable and necessary for the rehabilitation” and are in the best
interests of [Executive Life]. Also attached to the motions were brief descriptions
of the services performed by each of the professionals seeking payment.

The court had other substantial evidence that supplemented and
corroborated these declarations. At the court's request, the Commissioner supplied
under seal for the court's inspection a sample of original invoices from its lead
counsel, Rubinstein & Perry, thus permitting the court to test the accuracy of the
declarations based upon them. These invoices cover the months of March, May
and July, 1992. They include a description of the tasks performed, the time spent,
and the amount billed for each attorney or legal assistant for each day. These
invoices, which appear to be representative of the billing practices utilized in this
case, provide a substantial basis for the court to believe the Commissioner was
receiving adequate information upon which to exercise his discretion regarding
payment to professionals for services rendered. (/d, at p. 399-403.)

. OVERVIEW OF GOLDEN STATE’S CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION.

Golden State’s conservation and liquidation has been complex and the Commissioner’s
staff has worked hard to address the numerous issues presented by Golden State’s hazardous

condition which necessitated its conservation and liquidation. Immediately upon taking over the

. company on September 30, 2009 and for fifteen months thereafter through December 2010, the

Commissioner’s on-site staff ran the day-to-day operations of the insurance company with over

106,000 policyholders, over 120,000 policies, over 100 full-time employees, over 100 agents, 7
district offices located throughout the country and an approximately $300,000 monthly operating
loss at the beginning of the conservation. During this time, Golden State had no executive,
financial or legal management other than the management provided by the Commisstoner and his
staff. To address these deficiencies, gain control over and run Golden State’s operations, arrest
the company’s financial deterioration, manage the company’s multi-million portfolios of

insurance policies, mortgage loans and securities, and position the company for a sale, merger or

| assumption, as well as many other actions, the Commissioner required the services of the

Commissioner's Conservation & Liguidation Office ("CLO") and specialized vendors and

consultants including managerial personnel, accountants, actuaries, attorneys, real estate

-4 -
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professionals and others (collectively, “Commissioner’s staff”). {Declaration of Scott Pearce
(“Pearce Dec.”), § 6.)

As a result of the work performed by the Commissioner’s staff, the Commissioner
successfully transferred Golden State’s 120,000 policies with over $70 million in reserve liability
to a financially solvent insurer at no loss to policyholders, secured insurance guarantee coverage
for those policyholders and disabled persons not transferred to the solvent insurer, maintained
pension plan benefits and provided employment transition assistance for Golden State’s
employees, resolved lawsuits and claims against the company, wound-down the company’s

operations, and completed many other essential actions. Without the transfer of Golden State’s

- policies to a financially solvent insurer, many of the 120,000 policies would have been subject to

the benefit limitations and reductions required by state insurance guaranty associations, including
the requirement that policy benefit payments are limited to “eighty percent” of benefits under
California Guaranty Act and Insurance Code § 1067.02(c). Similarly, without the insurance
guarantee coverage for policyholders and disabled persons not transferred to the solvent insurer,
their policies and disability benefits would likely remain unpaid due to Golden State’s insolvency.

(Pearce Dec., 9§ 7.)

Operating the company, transferring the policies, reducing liabilities, resolving litigation

| and the many other actions, all require expenses. Over 21 applications seeking court approval of

| all major actions taken by the Commissioner have been filed with the Court, nearly all of which

were approved; and thus, the Commissioner’s actions and related expenses were reasonable,
necessary, transparent and appropriately handled and disclosed. The conservation and liquidation
of Golden State was no simple or uncontested matter and, instead, required the services of
sophisticated and experienced professionals for which approval of the expenses for their services

is now requested. (Pearce Dec., §8.)

1

i

i
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IV.  DESCRIPTIONS OF THE SERVICES PERFORMED BY FACH CONSULTANT.

The services performed by each of the eight consultants previously approved by the Court

in its September 13 Order are described below and set forth in Mr. Pearce’s Declaration attached

| hereto, 49 9(a)-(h), and Exhibit 1.

I. Commissioner’s CLO: The CLO is an administrative service entity created by the
Commissioner to administer the estates of insurers undergoing conservation or liquidation in
California. Upon obtaining a conservation or liquidation order, the Insurance Commissioner
generally delegates his statutory administrative duties over the insurer to the CLO and/or to
special deputy insurance commissioners, pursuant to Insurance Code § 1035. The CLO's
administrative expenses are allocated to each conservation or liquidation estate it manages on a
pro rata basis ("Allocated Expenses"). Allocated Expenses are non-estate specific expenses and
include office supplies, rent, utilities and other occupancy expenses as well as salaries and
benefits for CLO and CAB employees. The portion of Allocated Expenses charged to each estate
is determined by the amount of time CLO employees worked on estate matters. For example, if
total estate hours for a particular month is 4,000 hours, and 200 of those are attributed to Golden
State, the CL.O would charge Golden State’s estate 5% (or 200/4,000) of the Allocated Expenses

for that month. Allocated Expenses also include the CAB's administrative expenses, which are

- based on hours billed by the CAB's legal staff and the pass-through billings associated with work

performed by the Attorney General’s Office.

2. Epstein Turner Weiss: Epstein Turner Weiss is a law firm that provided legal

services to the Commissioner and his staff including providing advice concerning insurance
conservation and liquidation, rehabilitation, reinsurance, policy termination, asset liquidation,
employment termination, litigations, real estate, re-negotiation of lease terms and terminations,
Golden State’s retirement plan and PBGC issues, private sector employment and employment

discrimination claims and litigation matters, the sale of Golden State’s book of insurance

| business, corporate governance, and other issues and matters pertaining to Golden State.

3. Wisener Nunnally Gold: Wisener Nunnally Gold is a law firm that provided legal

services including assisting with negotiating the sale of the Golden State’s insurance policies and
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| annuity contracts and drafting the agreements for said sale, transfer of historical materials to

UCLA Library, and additional related matters.

4, Kane Corporation: Kane Corporation provided mortgage loan marketing services

and commercial real estate consulting services to the Commissioner regarding Golden State’s
commercial mortgage loan portfolio and office buildings, marketed and solicited Golden States
commercial mortgage loan portfolio in an effort to maximize its value, assisted with the sale of

two foreclosed loans, inspected each district office, evaluated and interviewed local real estate

- brokers to develop an asset disposition plan, and continues to assist in the disposition of

remaining real estate assets.

S. Ultimate Staffing: Ultimate Staffing provided temporary employment services,

which were necessary to assist the Commissioner in sorting, boxing, inventorying and removing
thousands of boxes containing Golden State’s records from Golden State’s home office building

in December 2010.
6. Cooke’s Crating: Cooke’s Crating provided fine art packing and transporting for

Golden State’s fine art collection, historical matters and records, which were necessary to
properly package and transport these items.

7. ART Movers: ART Movers provided fine art storage for Golden State’s fine art
collection, historical matters and records.

8. Joshua Solomon: Joshua Solomon provided equipment disposition and consulting

services, including organizing and inventorying Golden State’s fine art collection and historical
materials, clearing out Golden’s State’s home office building, and disposing of certain of Golden
State’s equipment, furniture and assets.

(Pearce Dec., § 9(a)-(h).)

V. THE COMMISSIONER HAS PROVIDED “ADEQUATE INFORMATION TO

PERMIT INTELLIGENT EVALUATION” OF THE EXPENSES.

To detail the Commissioner’s expenses for the twenty-seven month period from

September 30, 2009 through December 31, 2011, the Commissioner has divided the time period
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at igsue by year — 2009, 2010 and 2011, Sections A, B and C below provide a detailed summary

- of the work performed by the Commissioner’s staff during the years 2009, 2010 and 2011, and

provide the names, hourly rates, total expenses incurred and brief scope of work for each
consultant hired to assist the Commissioner at issue here. Section D below provides a summary
of the Declaration from the Commissioner’s Senior Estate Trust Officer Scott Pearce, reciting that
detailed timekeeping and invoices seeking payment were received and carefully reviewed by the
Commissioner’s staff, the proposed payments to consultants were reasonable and necessary for
Golden State’s conservation and liquidation, and the work performed and expenses were in the

best interests of Golden State’s estate. Section E discusses the four months of invoices attached

| hereto as FExhibits 3 through 10. Section F provides a summary of the Commissioner’s reduction

in Golden State’s expenses from its peak in 2009 through June 2012,

A. 2009 - Work Performed and Fees/Expenses Incurred.

On September 30, 2009, the Commissioner was appointed Golden State’s Conservator
because as of June 30, 2009, Golden State was financially impaired and deemed to be operating in
a hazardous financial condition in that its reported paid-in capital and surplus of assets in excess
of liabilities was $1,650,693 instead of the required $5,000,000, and because Golden State could

no longer continue its operations without conservation because it lacked sufficient paid-in capital

- and surplus to ensure policyholder safety. (Pearce Dec., §10.)

Immediately thereafter, during the next 90-days from September 30 through December 31,
2009, the Commissioner’s primary objectives were to take control of all aspects of Golden State
and its operations and to ensure the company’s financial situation did not deteriorate further.
Taking control of Golden State and its operations and arresting the company’s financial
deterioration were no easy tasks, as both objectives required extensive work to be performed.
(Pearce Dec., | 11.)

From September through December 2009, the Commissioner’s staff performed the

following necessary and significant work, in addition to additional work on a daily basis:
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Took control of Golden State and its day-to-day operations, including its over 100
employees, 86 captive insurance and annuity agents, expenses, bank and financial
accounts, policy maintenance and premium collection.

Notified and served copies of the Order of Conservation on all of Golden State’s
directors, officers, employees, district offices, landlords, banks, financial
institutions, guaranty associations and reinsurers, as required by statute.
Physically took control of Golden State’s home, district and satellite offices and
office buildings, including locations in (1) Los Angeles; (2) Oakland; (3) Vallejo;
(4) Chicago; (5) Dallas; (6) Tyler, Texas; (7) Beaumont, Texas; (8) Houston,
Texas; (9) Detroit, Michigan; (10) Charlotte, North Carolina; (11) Winston-Salem,
North Carolina; and (12) Rocky Mount, North Carolina.

Took control of and actively maintained Golden State’s 120,000 life, health and
disability insurance policies and annuity contracts, having a premium volume of
approximately $10 million. Maintaining Golden State’s in-force policies and
annuity contracts was essential to maximize Golden State’s estate value.

Took control of and actively managed Golden State’s portfolio of commercial
mortgage loans, consisting of 67 loans having a total principal balance of
approximately $25,230,775.

Took control of and directed the management of a portfolio of investment grade
bonds valued in accordance with the National Association of Insurance
Commissioners’ (“NAIC”) practices and procedures manual at approximately
$27,507.445 and a portfolio of investment grade stocks valued in accordance with
NAIC’s practices and procedures manual at approximately $4,663,168.

Evaluated Golden State’s business, business operations, operational capabilities,
financial condition, assets, liabilities and records to determine the sustainability
and long-term prospects of Golden State and its insurance business.

In November 2009, based on Golden State’s financial condition and its operational

capabilities, determined that the business operations of Golden State were not
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sustainable and the best course of action for Golden State’s policyholders and
creditors was to position the company for a sale, merger or assumption of its life,
annuity and health insurance policies and contracts by a third party.

Prepared a comprehensive bid and request for proposal package for the purpose of
soliciting interest from potential bidders for the purchase of Golden State’s
insurance and annuity contract business including bids for the sale of the entire
company, and thereafter sent detailed and extensive information packages to
thirteen interested parties and completed numerous on-site visits and due diligence
evaluations of Golden State by the interested parties.

Backed up all of Golden State’s data systems.

Created and implemented annuity surrender procedures to ensure that
policyholders would not cash out their annuity and insurance products, to prevent a
run-on-the-bank situation.

Completed an assessment of Golden State’s finance department.

Completed and filed Golden State’s (a) annual pension report and audit, (b)
December 31, 2008 financial audit, and (¢) September 30, 2009 financial audit and
Quarterly Financial Statement.

Analyzed the costs and benefits of consolidating and/or closing certain of Golden
State’s district and satellite offices.

Implemented employee reductions and termination of Golden State’s general
agents.

Implemented incentive programs and procedures to collect past due premiums, to
retain business with Golden State and to retain employees to limit departures of
key personnel.

Commenced and completed re-negotiations of home and district office leases.
Responded to numerous state and federal employment complaints, claims and

lawsuits in California, [llinois, Texas and North Carolina.

(Péarce Dec., 9 11(a)-(r).)
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1 | To complete the above and additional work, the Commissioner incurred $738,159.94 in
2{ fees and expenses in 2009. $422,721.42 of this amount was previously approved by Judge David
3l P. Yaffe, and $207,345.39 of this amount was incurred to the four consultants and vendors listed
4| in this Revised Application and remains to be approved in this Revised Application. The
54 following shows the fees and expenses not previously approved which were incurred to the four
6] consultants/vendors listed in this Revised Application who provided services in 2009, at their
7| hourly rates and total for 2009.
8
9| Consultant Hourly Rates Total 2009  Scope of Work
10 CLO $157.95 $138,806.80 Operations, on-site management
11{| Epstein Turner Weiss $150-295 $ 46,401.74 Legal services, all aspects, litigation
12}l Joshua Solomon $100 $ 14,282.82 On-site consulting, project management
13{| Kane Corporation  $149-250 $ 7.854.07 Real estate portfolio management
14 $207,345.43
15§ (Pearce Dec., 9 12, 13; and see Spreadsheet attached as Exhibit I, which details additional
16|l information on the Commissioner’s staff and consultants and the scope of work performed.)
17
18 B. 2010 - Work Performed and Fees/Expenses Incurred.
19| In 2010, after gaining control over Golden State’s operations and financial condition, the
20 Commissioner’s primary objections were to evaluate proposals to have a financially solvent
21| company purchase Golden States policies, annuity contracts and commercial mortgage portfolio,
221l while maintaining the premium collection book of business. The Commissioner’s secondary
231l objectives were to close and consolidate district offices, reduce staff, reduce liabilities, monetize
24| assets and develop a closing plan to discontinue district offices and vacate the Los Angeles Home
251 Office in the most cost effective and efficient manner by the close of 2010, which he successfully
264 did. (Pearce Dec., 4 14.)
27 To accomplish his 2010 objectives, the Commissioner’s staff performed the following
281 necessary and significant work, in addition to additional work on a daily basis:
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In January 2010, after the Commissioner provided detailed and extensive
information packages to interested parties and completed numerous on-site visits
and due diligence evaluations, five insurers submitted bids for the purchase of
Golden State’s business and/or policies. From January through September 2010,
the Commissioner (a) performed in-depth evaluations of the five bids, (b) selected
IA American Life Insurance Company to purchase the approximately 120,000 in-
force life, health and disability insurance policies and annuity contracts, (c)
negotiated detailed purchase and assumption agreements with IA American, (d)
drafted and provided written notice of the transaction to the holders of the
approximately 120,000 policies and annuity contracts, and (e) drafted and filed
extensive pleadings seeking court approval of the transaction.

On September 2, 2010, after receiving court approval, the Commissioner and 1A
American completed the Assumption Reinsurance Agreement which resulted in
the transfer to JA American of Golden State’s policies and annuity contracts (a
substantial benefit to the policyholders) and transfer to [A American of
approximately $71 million in reserve liability and certain of Golden State’s assets
totaling approximately $60 million including Golden State’s commercial mortgage
portfolio, bond portfolio, stock portfolio and other assets. Without this transaction,
many of the 120,000 insurance policies would have been subject to the benefit
limitations and reductions required by state insurance guaranty associations,
including the “eighty percent” policy payment limitation under Insurance Code §
1067.02(c).

Throughout 2010, the Commissioner continued to negotiate and resolve with TA
American numerous post-transaction policy, reinsurance and accounting issues,
address regulatory and reinsurance issues concerning the transaction, and address
policyholder concerns regarding the purchase of their policies by IA American.
Throughout 2010, began the process of winding down Golden State’s employment

operations and terminated Golden State’s employees including Golden State’s
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former executives, Board of Directors, eighty-six captive insurance and annuity

agents, underwriting department, and all of Golden State’s over 100 employees

and personnel, in compliance with state and federal employment notice and
termination requirements.

As part of the winding down of Golden State’s employment, continued to

implement employment incentive plans and employment assistance programs to

assist Golden State’s employees and lessen the adverse impact on employees and

Golden State’s business operations. The programs included:

(a) A successful Employee Retention Incentive Plan in which key employees
were provided a monetary incentive to continue their employment through
certain dates in 2010. The incentive plan was necessary to maintain key
employees to assist with day-to-day business operations and the migration
of policies to IA American.

(b A successful Premium Collection Incentive Plan in which district managers
and agents were provided a monetary incentive to collect past due
premiums from policyholders, so as to minimize lost revenues due to
unpaid premiums at the conclusion of the conservation.

(c) Pre-termination employment transition assistance services to employees
including pre-termination retirement plan counseling and pre-termination
governmental assistance and counseling seminars and programs.

Consolidated and reduced Golden State’s district offices, which significantly

reduced Golden State’s operating expenses.

Terminated office leases and successfully re-negotiated the leases for Golden

State’s Home Office building in Los Angeles and two district offices, securing

significant rent reductions and early terminations without penalty.

Implemented an office closing plan to timely vacate Golden State’s Home Office

in Los Angeles and remaining district offices, under which essential business

related materials were transferred to the Home Office to be inventoried and sent to
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1 storage, business equipment was returned to lessors and/or disposed of, and the
2 Home Office and district office spaces were cleaned and vacated.
3 9. Commenced and completed a system-wide back-up of all electronic data generated
4 and/or stored by Golden State and installed a back-up server to improve system
5 reliability.
6 10.  Prepared Golden State’s annual retirement plan report and retirement plan audit.
7 11.  Worked with an actuarial consulting services firm to develop reserve valuations
8 | and projections for Golden State’s liabilities used to assist the Commissioner with
9 valuing Golden State’s insurance policies and annuity contracts for sale.
10 12, Actively managed Golden State’s mortgage portfolio, and marketed and sold
i1 foreclosed property.
12 13. Established hardship committee to review and respond to policyholder surrender
13 requests larger than $5,000.
14 14.  Maintained annual premium income at above projected estimates prior to policy
15 assumption by IA American.
16 15. Completed and filed Golden State’s year end 2008 and 2009 Annual Statements.
17 16. Marketed district offices for sale.
18 17.  Migrated electronic policy and mortgage portfolio information to IA American.
19 18, Completed an inventory of Golden State’s fine art and collection of historic
20 materials, and undertook efforts to market and sell the items.
211 19. Inventoried and removed 5,400 boxes of records located at Home Office.
2211 (Pearce Dec., 99 15(a)-(s).)
23 To complete the above and additional work, the Commissioner incurred a total of
24{ $1,509,864.26 in fees and expenses during 2010 to the eight consultants and vendors listed in this
25 Revised Application. The following shows the fees and expenses incurred to the eight
26|l consultants/vendors listed in this Revised Application who provided services in 2010, at their
271l hourly rates and total for 2010.
28
Epstein Turner Weiss
Mo ‘EEFEEOS“ 14
Los Angeles, GA 90071 MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF REVISED APPLICATION
TO APPROVE CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION EXPENSES




GA!'GRPMCASES204-410-04\Pleadings\Fee App Revised\Motion 102813\Revised Memo.doc

I|| Consultant Hourly Rates Total 2010  Scope of Work

2% CLO $157.95 $702,696.66 Operations, on-site management

3| Epstein Turner Weiss $150-295 $443,085.36 Legal services, all aspects, litigation

41 Wisener Nunnally $250 $ 41,185.60 Legal services, reinsurance, art portfolio

5| Joshua Solomon $100 § 54,972.28 On-site consulting, project management

6|l Cookes Crating $49 $ 5,319.47 Professional packing and transportation

7 ART Movers $817/month  §  467.71 Fine art storage, historical materials

8{ Ultimate Staffing $21.88-67.70 $ 46,189.56 Temporary employment services

9l Kane Corporation §$149-250 $215,047.62 Real estate portfolio management
10 $1,509,864.26
11| (Pearce Dec., 19 16, 13; and see Spreadsheet attached as Exhibit 1.)
12
134 C. 2011 - Work Performed and Fees/Expenses Incurred.
14 In January 2011, the Commissioner was discharged as Conservator and appointed
15| Liquidator of Golden State Mutual. All aspects of the liquidation were transitioned to the CLO in
161l San Francisco. The Commissioner’s primary objectives in 2011 were to monetize Golden State’s
17|l remaining assets, resolve liabilities and wind up the affairs of Golden State in a cost effective
18|l efficient manner. Throughout 2011 the Commissioner was challenged with resolving numerous
19 | non-assumed liabilities including Golden State’s multi-million pension liability, long term
204 disability policy claimants and employee life insurance benefits, and with responding to numerous
21| policyholder, creditor and public concerns regarding the transfer of policies, disposition of assets
22| and historical significance of Golden State. (Pearce Dec., §17.)
23 To accomplish his 2011 objectives, the Commissioner’s staff performed the following
24|l necessary and significant work, in addition to additional work on a daily basis:
25 1. Negotiated and reached agreement with the National Organization of Life and
26 Health Insurance Guaranty Associations (“NOLHGA”) through which NOLGHA
27 agreed to provide coverage to Golden State’s group life certificate holders, long-
28
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term disability claimants, and non-assumed policy liability. Without NOLHGA’s
coverage, the insureds would likely lose coverage and not receive benefits.
Terminated Golden State’s 401(k) retirement plan, which required extensive work
to locate former employee plan participants and secure required termination forms
from plan participants.

Negotiated for, terminated, received court approval and transferred Golden State’s
pension plan to the PBGC, the result of which maintained pension payments for
Golden State’s plan participants.

Resolved significant issues concerning the PBGC’s purported multi-million dollar
lien claim against Golden State’s assets due to the multi-million dollar
underfunded portion of the pension plan, and expended significant time and effort
to negotiate and ensure that the termination and transfer of the pension plan to the
PBGC did not establish or control the priority of PBGC’s claim.

Completed a second request for proposal process for the sale of Golden State’s fine
art collection and historical materials including its removable murals, 120 pieces of
African-American art and historical materials. Upon selecting prevailing bidders,
prepared three separate purchase and sale agreements for Court approval. The
Court approved the agreement to transfer Golden State’s historical materials to the
UCILA Library; the agreement to sell the murals was withdrawn because the bidder
withdrew; and the agreement to sell the art collection was dented by the Court.
Loaned a significant portion of Golden State’s art collection to the California
African American Museum for display as part of a continuing city-wide art
exhibition.

Extensively evaluated and responded to community concerns regarding Golden
State and its policyholders, historical significance, historical materials and art
collection including murals.

Filed numerous applications with the Court for approval of administrative actions

including applications for approval of sales of Golden State’s real property, the
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1 liquidation of Golden State, continuation of the proof of claim deadline,

2 settlements of claims and lawsuits against Golden State, and other actions.

3 9. Completed final financial “True Up” reconciliation and Release Agreement with

4 1A American.

5 10.  Responded to numerous data and records requests from IA American.

6 11. Responded to numerous claim and policy related inquires.

7 12. In 2011 as well as 2010, resolved most lawsuits, complaints, claims and legal

g matters that were either pending at the time of conservation or had been

9 commenced against Golden State during conservation. The larger litigation
10 | matters and disputes include:
. (a) Equal Employment Opportunity Commission v. Golden State, United States
12 District Court for the Western District of North Carolina, Statesville
1 Division, Civil Action No. 3:09¢v00105. This was a discrimination action
14 against Golden State by the Equal Employment Opportunity Commission
15 (“EEOC™) on behalf of a former employee. The action resolved through
16 settlement, with approval applied for and granted by both Judge Yafte and
7 the United States District Court for the Western District of North Carolina.
18 (b) Willie M. Grady v. Golden State, Discrimination Complaints filed with
19 Hlinois Department of Human Rights and City of Chicago Commission of
20 Human Relations by a former employee who was demoted for violations of
51 his employment agreement and the Court’s Order Appointing Conservator
25 by his appointment with competing insurance companies during his
25l employment with Golden State and his solicitation of Golden State’s
24 policyholders to switch to other insurance companies after the
25 conservation. The Commissioner’s staff responded to the complaints and,
26 based on those responses and further requests for information, the
7 complaints were dismissed without hearing.
28

A Profssions Corparsion
_17- _
Los Angeles, CA 50071 MEMOCRANDUM IN SUPPORT OF REVISED APPLICATION
TO APPROVE CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION EXPENSES




Epstein Turner Weiss

[y

[ N L N L o o L ™ Tt
- N S - T = T S v R ey =

28

A Professionai Corporation

633 West Fifth Strect
Suite 3330
Los Angeles, CA 90071

N T T B« LY. TP Y UC T N

(©)

(d)

(e)

®

G\GRPUCASES\204-410-04\Pleadings\Fee App Revised\Wotion 102813 Revised Memao.doc

Valerie Belcher v. Golden State, Discrimination Complaints also filed with
Iilinois Department of Human Rights and City of Chicago Commission of
Human Relations by a former employee who was demoted for violations of
her employment agreement and the Court’s Order Appointing Conservator
by her appointment with competing insurance companies during her
employment with Golden State and her solicitation of Golden State’s
policyholders to switch to other insurance companies after the
conservation. The Commissioner’s staff responded to the complaints and
again, based on those responses and further requests for information, the
complaints were dismissed without hearing.

Childs v. Golden State, California Labor Commissioner Case No. 06-
93878 DG. This was an employee wage waiting time penalty claim by a
former employee. The Commissioner’s staff responded to the claim and,
after a hearing, the claim was denied by the Labor Commissioner.

James H. Nunya v. Golden State, L.os Angeles Superior Court Case No.
LAM 08M11746. Mr. Nunya is a former employee who unsuccessfully
sought damages from Golden State in Los Angeles Small Claims Court,
and appealed the denial of his claim to the Los Angeles Superior Court,
assigned to the Honorable Coleman Swatt, Judge. In response to this
Courts September 30, 2009 Order Appointing Conservator and Restraining
Orders, Judge Swatt stayed the case.

Community Impact Development I, LLC (“CID”) v. Golden State. Dispute
over ownership of murals. The Commissioner’s staff commenced
depositions and document subpoenas to evaluate CID’s ownership claim to
the murals, evaluated and responded to CID’s complaint claiming
ownership of the murals, and participated in pre-trial discovery and

preparations. The case is currently pending for trial in October 2013.
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1 () Numerous employment, policy and miscellaneous claims against Golden

2 State’s assets,

(Pearce Dec., 1% 18(a)-(IX(7).)

Lid

4 To complete the above and additional work, the Commissioner incurred a total of
51 $1,283,888.53 in fees and expenses during 2011 to the six consultants and vendors listed in this
61l Revised Application. The following shows the fees and expenses incurred to the six
71l consultants/vendors listed in this Revised Application who provided services in 201 1, at their
8|l hourly rates and total for 2011.
9
10)i Consultant Hourly Rates Total 2010  Scope of Work
11§ CLO $157.95 $744,845.45 Qperations, management
12| Epstein Turner Weiss $150-295 $421,666.20 Legal services, all aspects, litigation
13} Wisener Nunnally — $250 $ 15,834.34 Legal services, reinsurance, art portfolio
14|} Cookes Crating $49 $ 1,421.00 Professional packing and transportation
151l ART Movers $817/month  $ 9,731.00 Fine art storage, historical materials

16) Kane Corporation £149-250 $ 90,390.54 Real estate portfolio management
17 $1,283,888.53
18] (Pearce Dec., § 19, 13; and see Spreadsheet attached as Exhibit 1.)

19
20 D. Declarations Confirming the Expenses are Proper.
214 As declared by the Commissioner’s Senior Estate Trust Officer Mr. Pearce, the

22| Commissioner and his staff received detailed timekeeping and invoices from each of its

23| consultants and service providers at issue here for the work performed, carefully reviewed the

24| timekeeping and invoices for any excessive or duplicative charges, and sought clarification and

251 correction where appropriate. Mr. Pearce also has declared that the proposed payments sought for
26|l approval were reasonable and necessary for Golden State’s conservation and liquidation, are

27| reasonable for the services performed and were rendered in the best interests of Golden State’s

28|l estate. Further, as part of his declaration, Mr. Pearce summarized the services performed by each

Epstein Turner Weiss
A Professional Corporation
433 West Fifth Street _ 19 -
Suite 3330

Los Angeles, CA 50071 MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF REVISED APPLICATION
TO APPROVE CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION EXPENSES




GAIGRPUCASES\204-410-04\Pleadings\Fee App Revised\Motion 102813\Revised Memo.doc

1|l of the consultants at issue here and has attached a spreadsheet detailing the hourly rates or

2| payment basis for the consultants, the total amounts incurred for each of the years 2009, 2010 and
3] 2011, and a short summary of the services performed. (Pearce Dec., 1 6-23; Declaration of

4| Michael R. Weiss, 49 2-6; and Declaration of Robert H. Nunnally, Jr., 7 1-15.)

50

6 E. Samples of Original Invoices Also Confirm the Expenses are Proper.

7 Samples of original invoices representing at least four months of the total expenses

81l requested to be approved in this Application are attached for cach consultant as Exhibits 3

9l through 10. A four month sample of invoices is attached for consultants and vendors CLO,

10| Epstein Turner Weiss, Wisener Nunnally Gold, Kane Corporation and Joshua Solomon. All
11|l invoices are attached for consultants and vendors Ultimate Staffing, Cooke’s Crating and ART
121l Movers, because a four month sampling of invoices was not available due to their more limited,

13l project based work performed. (Pearce Dec., 9 20-22, Exhibit 2.)

14

15 F. Expenses from 2007 through June 2012 Show Significant Expense Reductions
16 during Conservation and Liquidation.

17 Prior to conservation, Golden State’s general expenses greatly increased in 2009 over

18]l years 2007 and 2008, increasing to $13,457,390 in 2009. After 2009, the Commissioner reduced
19]l general expenses for 2010 by nearly $3 million and reduced general expenses for 2011 by another

20| $9 million to $1,617,845. The table below shows Golden State’s expenses for 2007 through 2011.

21 Taxes, Licenses, Fees
- Year General Expenses (excludes federal income tax) Total
73 2007 $ 8,820,497 $ 936,927 $ 9,757,424
24 2008 $ 7,686,229 $ 941,937 § 8,628,166
95 2009 $11,691,063 $1.766,327 $13,457,390
26 2010 $ 8,659,217 $2.011,914 $10,671,131
27 2011 $ 1,617,845 $ 0 $ 1,617,845
28
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{Pearce Dec., 4 23.)

G. The Liabilities Driving Golden State’s Net Asset Deficiency and, Therefore,

Limited Remaining Assets, are Not Related to the Commissioner’s expenses.

The liabilities driving Golden State’s net asset deficiency and, therefore, limited remaining
assets, are not related to the Commissioner’s expenses, except in that the Commissioner’s work
substantially reduced the liabilities. The current liability to insurance guarantee associations for
assuming non-transferred policy obligations and the liability to the Pension Benefit Guarantee
Corporation (“PBGC”) for assuming Golden State’s substantial pre-conservation un-funded
pension obligations are estimated to be at least $2,212,900 and at least $5,124,800, respectively.
These liabilities would exist even without the Commissioner’s expenses because (1) the liability
to state guarantee associations is due to their covering the benefits owed under Golden State’s
non-assumed policies and (2) the pension liability existed prior to conservation due to Golden

State pot fully paying its pension fund obligations. Such liabilities are Priority Class 2 and

holders who are a Priority Class 8 liability under Insurance Code § 1033. Accordingly, even
without any of the expenses for the services performed at issue here, the estimated liability to
insurance guarantee associations and the PBGC likely will prohibit any payment to Certificate of
Contribution holders since the net asset deficiency as of December 31, 2011, of $8,693,400
exceeds the requested expenses. (Pearce Dec., §24.)

The Commissionet’s efforts reduced these un-funded Habilities by transferring over $11
million in liability to IA American and working with the PBGC in transferring the pension plan.
Without the Commissioner’s efforts and necessary related expenses, the liability to policyholders
and insurance guarantee associations would be at least $11 million greater and the cost of
administering the policies and liabilities would be substantial, likely an additional several million
doliars. Liabilities would be at least $11 million greater because in September 2009, at the time
of conservation, Golden State had approximately $70 million in policy reserve liability and over

$60 million in assets including its commercial mortgage portfolio, bond portfolio and stock
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1}j portfolio. These assets were transferred to 1A American along with the $70 million in reserve
24 liability in order to transfer the 120,000 policies, with IA American accepting the $11 reserve
31l deficiency as the cost of purchasing the policies. In other words, the rehabilitation and
4l reinsurance plan realized the value in an ongoing book of life insurance business for the creditors
5| of Golden State, while liquidation would have lost that value. Without the $60 million in assets,
6] the policies would not have been transferred; and without the transfer of the $11 million in
7 reserve deficiency to 1A American, the liability to policyholders and insurance guarantee
8| associations would be that much greater along with a likely several million dollar expense to
9| administer the policies and liabilities. (Pearce Dec., §25.)
10
11 VI.  INADDITION TO COMPLIANCE WITH EXECUTIVE LIFE, THE APPROVAL
1210 OF THE FEES AND EXPENSES REQUESTED HEREIN IS CONSISTENT WITH
13 THE CONSERVATOR’S AND THE LIQUIDATOR’S BROAD AUTHORITIES
14 AND DISCRETION.
15 Impaired and insolvent insurance companies are precluded from seeking relief in
161l bankruptey. (11 U.S.C. § 109(b)(2) (“A person may be a debtor under chapter 7 of this title only
171 if such person is not . . . a domestic insurance company”).) Instead, California, like most states,
18]l has statutory proceedings subjecting impaired and insolvent insurers to orderly conservation,
19| rehabilitation and/or liquidation. California’s statutory proceedings are codified in Insurance
20l Code § 1010 ef seq. (Garamendi v. Golden Eagle Insurance Company (2005) 128 Cal.App.4™
214t 452 (Insurance conservation proceedings are special proceedings subject to the provisions of the
22| California Insurance Code).)
23 The approval of the fees and expenses requested herein is consistent with the
74| Conservator’s and the Liquidator’s authorities and discretion under the Court’s Orders appointing
25]l conservator and liquidator, the Insurance Code and case law.
26 First, the Order Appointing Conservator directed the Insurance Commissioner as
27 Conservator to conduct the business of Golden State or so much thereof as the Conservator may
28l deem appropriate, and authorized him to employ special deputy commissioners, assistants, clerks
i rtesiann Conporaon
| 22
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and legal counsel, and to give to each of them those powers that the Conservator deemed

| necessary. (Order Appointing Conservator, 99 1, 8, 13 and 14, Exhibit 11, citing Insurance Code

§§ 1035(a), 1036 and 1037.) Similarly, the Order Appointing Liquidator directs the Liquidator to
liquidate and wind up the business of Golden State and to act in all ways and exercise all powers
necessary for the purpose of carrying out this Order. (Order Appointing Liquidator, 1 1, 2,
Exhibit 12, citing Insurance Code § 1016.)

Second, Insurance Code § 1037, entitled “Powers of commissioner as conservator or
liquidator,” provides broad powers to the Insurance Commissioner as conservator and liquidator

of insurance companies and authorizes the Liquidator to sell and dispose of Golden State’s

property. Section 1037 states in pertinent part:

Upon taking possession of the property and business of any person in any
proceeding under this article, the commissioner, exclusively and except as
otherwise expressly provided by this article, either as conservator or liquidator:

(a) [Conservation of assets; conduct of business.] Shall have authority to
collect all moneys due that person, and to do such other acts as are necessary or
expedient to collect, conserve, or protect its assets, property, and business, and to
carry on and conduct the business and affairs of that person or so much thereof as

to him or her may seem appropriate.

(d) [Acquisition and disposition of property.] Shall have authority without
notice, to acquire, hypothecate, encumber, lease, improve, sell, transfer, abandon,
or otherwise dispose of or deal with, any real or personal property of that person at
its reasonable market value, or, in cases other than acquisition, sale, or transfer on
the basis of reasonable market value, upon such terms and conditions as the
commissioner may deem proper. However, no transaction involving real or
personal property shall be made where the market value of the property involved
exceeds the sum of twenty thousand dollars ($20,000) without first obtaining
permission of the court, and then only in accordance with any terms that court may

prescribe.

[General powers.] The enumeration, in this article, of the duties, powers
and authority of the commissioner in proceedings under this article shall not be
construed as a limitation upon the commissioner, nor shall it exclude in any
manner his or her right to perform and to do such other acts not herein specifically
enumerated, or otherwise provided for, which the commissioner may deem
necessary or expedient for the accomplishment or in aid of the purpose of such

proceedings.

Z23 .
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L[ Third, California case law supports the broad grant of powers accorded the Insurance
2l Commissioner to transfer assets when he is conserving, rehabilitating, and/or liquidating
3|| insurance companies. For instance, in Executive Life, the Court of Appeal stated that:
4 The Commissioner is an officer of the state (Caminetti v. Pac.
Mutual L. Ins. Co. (1943) 22 Cal.2d 344, 354 [139 P.2d 908]) who, when
> he or she is a conservator, exercises the state's police power to carry
6 forward the public interest and to protect policyholders and creditors of the
insolvent insurer. (Carpenter v. Pacific Mut. Life Ins. Co. (1937) 10 Cal.2d
7 307, 330-331 {74 P.2d 761}].)
8 In exercising this power, the Commissioner is vested with broad discretion.
9 (Commercial Nat. Bank v. Superior Court [(1993)] 14 Cal.App.4th [393] at p.
402.) This discretion is subject to statutory limitations (see id. at p. 409) and the
10 requirement that the exercise of discretion be neither arbitrary nor improperly
f discriminatory. (Carpenter v. Pacific Mut. Life Ins. Co., supra, 10 Cal.2d at p.
11 329)
12 A
{(Executive Life, supra, at p. 356.)
13 The Court concluded that:
14 ... The trial court reviews the Commissioner’s actions under the abuse of
15 discretion standard. (Commercial Nat. Bank v. Superior Court, supra, 14
Cal. App.4th 393, 398): was the action arbitrary, i.e. unsupported by a rational
16 basis, or is it contrary to specific statute, a breach of the fiduciary duty of the
17 conservator as trustee, or improperly discriminatory?

181l (Executive Life, supra, at p. 358}

Here, the fees and expenses incurred by the Conservator and Liquidator during the period
September 30, 2009 through December 31, 2011 are not an abuse of discretion. Accordingly, the

1|l fees and expenses should be approved by the Court.

23f VIE  CONCLUSION
24 For the foregoing reasons and pursuant to the Court’s September 13 and October 26, 2012
5| Orders, the Court should grant the Commissioner’s Application to Approve Conservation and
26 Liguidation Expenses and approve the amounts requested therein, which are:
27 I. Commissioner’s CLO: $1,586,348.91
28 2. Epstein Turner Weiss: $ 912,053.30
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1 3. Wisener Nunnally Gold: $  57.019.94
2 4, Kane Corporation: $ 313,292.19
3 5. Ultimate Staffing: $ 46,189.56
4 6. Cooke’s Crating: $  6,740.47
5 7. ART Movers: $ 10,198.71
6 8. Joshua Solomon $ 6925510
7 $3,001,098.18
8
9| DATE: October 28, 2013 KAMALA D. HARRIS
Attorney General of California
10 FELIX E. LEATHERWOOD
11 W. DEAN FREEMAN
Supervising Deputy Attorneys General
12 LISA W. CHAO
13 Deputy Attorney General
14 EPSTEIN TURNER WEISS
A Professional Corporation
15 —
6 By: .{:‘:5:' B o L b,
! MICHAEL R. WEISS
17 Attorneys for Applicant
: INSURANCE COMMISSIONER OF THE
18 STATE OF CALIFORNIA
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27|
28
Epstein Turner Weiss
A Professional Corporation
633 \gzs[{:;gi;)ﬂsnem _ 25 _
Los Angeles, CA 50071 MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF REVISED APPLICATION
TO APPROVE CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION EXPENSES
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DECLARATION OF SCOTT PEARCE
IN SUPPORT OF COMMISSIONER’S REVISED APPLICATION TO APPROVE
CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION EXPENSES

I, Scott Pearce, declare as follows:

1. I have personal knowledge of the facts and circumstances set forth in this
declaration, and if called upon to do so, I could and would competently testify thereto.

2. I am the Senior Estate Trust Officer for the Insurance Commissioner’s
Conservation & Liquidation Office. Starting on September 30, 2009, and continuing to the
present, | have been and currently am the Estate Trust Officer on behalf of the Insurance
Commissioner in his Statutory Capacity as Conservator (“Conservator”) and then as Liquidator
(“Liquidator”) of Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company (“Golden State™).

3. As the Senior Estate Trust Officer on behalf of the Conservator and now
Liquidator of Golden State, I am responsible for the supervision and management of matters
pertaining to the conservation and liquidation of Golden State.

4, I have read the Liquidator’s Application To Approve Conservation And
Liquidation Expenses, the Supplemental Submission in Support of said application and this
Revised Application (“Revised Application™).

5. Based on my supervision and management of matters pertaining to Golden State,

my experience, review and understanding of the events related to the conservation and now

- liquidation of Golden State, my and my staff’s review of the files and records routinely

| maintained in the regular and ordinary course of business and believed to be entered

contemporaneously by persons having knowledge of the events recorded and whose job duties
include recording them, and my review of this Revised Application and its supporting papers and

documents, 1 state the following:

Overview of Golden State’s Conservation and Liguidation.

6. Golden State’s conservation and liquidation has been complex and I and the
Commissioner’s staff have worked hard to address the numerous issues presented by Golden

State’s hazardous condition which necessitated its conservation and liquidation. Immediately
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upon taking over the company on September 30, 2009 and for fifteen months thereafter through
December 2010, the Commissioner’s on-site staff ran the day-to-day operations of the insurance
company with over 106,000 policyholders, over 120,000 policies, over 100 full-time employees,
over 100 agents, 7 district offices located throughout the country and an approximately $300,000
monthly operating loss at the beginning of the conservation. During this time, Golden State had
no executive, financial or legal management other than the management provided by the
Commissioner, his staff and me. To address these deficiencies, gain control over and run Golden
State’s operations, arrest the company’s financial deterioration, manage the company’s multi-
million portfolios of insurance policies, mortgage loans and securities, and position the company
for a sale, merger or assumption, as well as many other actions, we required the services of the
Commissioner's Conservation & Liquidation Office ("CLO") and specialized vendors and
consultants including managerial personnel, accountants, actuaries, attorneys, real estate
professionals and others (collectively, “Commissioner’s staff””).

7. As a result of the work performed by the Commissioner’s staff, the Commissioner

| successfully transferred Golden State’s 120,000 policies with over $70 million in reserve lability

to a financially solvent insurer at no loss to policyholders, secured insurance guarantee coverage
for those policyholders and disabled persons not transferred to the solvent insurer, maintained
pension plan benefits and provided employment transition assistance for Golden State’s
employees, resolved lawsuits and claims against the company, wound-down the company’s
operations, and completed many other essential actions. Without the transfer of Golden State’s
policies to a financially solvent insurer, many of the 120,000 policies would have been subject to
the benefit limitations and reductions required by state insurance guaranty associations, including

the requirement that policy benefit payments are limited to “eighty percent” of benefits under

. California Guaranty Act and Insurance Code § 1067.02(c). Similarly, without the insurance

| guarantee coverage for policyholders and disabled persons not transferred to the solvent insurer,

their policies and disability benefits would likely remain unpaid due to Golden State’s insolvency.
8. Operating the company, transferring the policies, reducing liabilities, resolving

litigation and the many other actions, all require expenses. Over 21 applications seeking court

.
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approval of all major actions taken by the Commissioner have been filed with the Court, nearly all

of which were approved; and thus, the Commissioner’s actions and related expenses were

- reasonable, necessary, transparent and appropriately handled and disclosed. The conservation and

liquidation of Golden State was no simple or uncontested matter and, instead, required the
services of sophisticated and experienced professionals for which approval of the expenses for
their services is now requested.

Descriptions of Services Performed by Each Consultant.

9. The services performed by each of the eight consultants at issue in this Application

are described below:

a. Commissioner’s CLO: The CLO is an administrative service entity created

by the Commissioner to administer the estates of insurers undergoing conservation or liquidation

| in California. Upon obtaining a conservation or liquidation order, the Insurance Commissioner

| generally delegates his statutory administrative duties over the insurer to the CLO and/or to

special deputy insurance comrmissioners, pursuant to Insurance Code § 1035. The CLO's
administrative expenses are allocated to each conservation or liquidation estate it manages on a
pro rata basis ("Allocated Expenses"). Allocated Expenses are non-estate specific expenses and
include office supplies, rent, utilities and other occupancy expenses as well as salaries and
benefits for CLO and Consumer Affairs Bureau (“CAB”) employees. The portion of Allocated
Expenses charged to each estate is determined by the amount of time CLO employees worked on
estate matters. For example, if total estate hours for a particular month is 4,000 hours, and 200 of
those are attributed to Golden State, the CLO would charge Golden State’s estate 3% (or
200/4,000) of the Allocated Expenses for that month. Allocated Expenses also include the CAB's
administrative expenses, which are based on hours billed by the CAB's legal staff and the pass-
through billings associated with work performed by the Attorney General’s Office.

b. Epstein Turner Weiss: Epstein Turner Weiss is a law firm that provided

legal services to the Commissioner and his staff including providing advice concerning insurance
conservation and liquidation, rehabilitation, reinsurance, policy termination, asset liquidation,

employment termination, litigations, real estate, re-negotiation of lease terms and terminations,

-3
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| Golden State’s retirement plan and PBGC issues, private sector employment and employment

discrimination claims and litigation matters, the sale of Golden State’s book of insurance
business, corporate governance, and other issues and matters pertaining to Golden State.

c. Wisener Nunnally Gold: Wisener Nunnally Gold is a law firm that

provided legal services including assisting with negotiating the sale of the Golden State’s
insurance policies and annuity contracts and drafting the agreements for said sale, transfer of
historical materials to UCLA Library, and additional related matters.

d. Kane Corporation: Kane Corporation provided mortgage loan marketing

services and commercial real estate consulting services to the Commissioner regarding Golden
State’s commercial mortgage loan portfolio and office buildings, marketed and solicited Golden
States commercial mortgage loan portfolio in an effort to maximize its value, assisted with the
sale of two foreclosed loans, inspected each district office, evaluated and interviewed local real
estate brokers to develop an asset disposition plan, and continues to assist in the disposition of

remaining real estate assets.

e Ultimate Staffing: Ultimate Staffing provided temporary employment

services, which were necessary to assist the Commissioner in sorting, boxing, inventorying and

removing thousands of boxes containing Golden State’s records from Golden State’s home office

| building in December 2010.

f. Cooke’s Crating: Cooke’s Crating provided fine art packing and

transporting for Golden State’s fine art collection, historical matters and records, which were

necessary to properly package and transport these items.

2. ART Movers: ART Movers provided fine art storage for Golden State’s

fine art collection, historical matters and records.

h. Joshua Solomon: Joshua Solomon provided equipment disposition and

consulting services, including organizing and inventorying Golden State’s fine art collection and

historical materials, clearing out Golden’s State’s home office building, and disposing of certain

| of Golden State’s equipment, furniture and assets.

-4 -
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2009 - Work Performed and Fees/Expenses Incurred.

10, On September 30, 2009, the Commissioner was appointed Golden State’s
Conservator because as of June 30, 2009, Golden State was financially impaired and deemed to
be operating in a hazardous financial condition in that its reported paid-in capital and surplus of
assets in excess of liabilities was $1,650,693 instead of the required $5,000,000, and because
Golden State could no longer continue its operations without conservation because it lacked
sufficient paid-in capital and surplus to ensure policyholder safety.

1. Immediately thereafter, during the next 90-days from September 30 through

| December 31, 2009, the Commissioner’s primary objectives were to take control of all aspects of

Golden State and its operations and to ensure the company’s financial situation did not deteriorate
further. Taking control of Golden State and its operations and arresting the company’s financial
deterioration were no easy tasks, as both objectives required extensive work to be performed.
From September through December 2009, the Commissioner’s staff performed the following
necessary and significant work, in addition to additional work on a daily basis:

a. Took control of Golden State and its day-to-day operations, including its
over 100 employees, 86 captive insurance and annuity agents, eXpenses,
bank and financial accounts, policy maintenance and premium collection.

b. Notified and served copies of the Order of Conservation on all of Golden
State’s directors, officers, employees, district offices, landlords, banks,
financial institutions, guaranty associations and reinsurers, as required by
statute.

c. Physically took control of Golden State’s home, district and satellite offices
and office buildings, including locations in (1) Los Angeles; (2) Oakland;
(3) Vallejo; (4) Chicago; (5) Dallas; (6) Tyler, Texas; (7) Beaumont, Texas;
(8) Houston, Texas; (9) Detroit, Michigan, (10) Charlotte, North Carolina;
(11) Winston-Salem, North Carolina; and (12) Rocky Mount, North

Carolina.

-5.
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Took control of and actively maintained Golden State’s 120,000 life, health
and disability insurance policies and annuity contracts, having a premium
volume of approximately $10 million. Maintaining Golden State’s in-force
policies and annuity contracts was essential to maximize Golden State’s
estate value.

Took control of and actively managed Golden State’s portfolio of
commercial mortgage loans, consisting of 67 loans having a total princtpal
balance of approximately $25,230,775.

Took control of and directed the management of a portfolio of investment
grade bonds valued in accordance with the National Association of
Insurance Commissioners” (“NAIC”) practices and procedures manual at
approximately $27,507,445 and a portfolio of investment grade stocks
valued in accordance with NAIC’s practices and procedures manual at
approximately $4,663,168.

Evaluated Golden State’s business, business operations, operational
capabilities, financial condition, assets, liabilities and records to determine
the sustainability and long-term prospects of Golden State and its insurance
business.

In November 2009, based on Golden State’s financial condition and its
operational capabilities, determined that the business operations of Golden
State were not sustainable and the best course of action for Golden State’s
policyholders and creditors was to position the company for a sale, merger
or assumption of its life, annuity and health insurance policies and
contracts by a third party.

Prepared a comprehensive bid and request for proposal package for the
purpose of soliciting interest from potential bidders for the purchase of
Golden State’s insurance and annuity contract business including bids for

the sale of the entire company, and thereafter sent detailed and extensive

-6 -
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information packages to thirteen interested parties and completed numerous
on-site visits and due diligence evaluations of Golden State by the
interested parties.

Backed up all of Golden State’s data systems.

Created and implemented annuity surrender procedures to ensure that
policyholders would not cash out their annuity and insurance products, to
prevent a run-on-the-bank situation.

Completed an assessment of Golden State’s finance department.
Completed and filed Golden State’s (a) annual pension report and audit, (b)
December 31, 2008 financial audit, and (¢} September 30, 2009 financial
audit and Quarterly Financial Statement.

Analyzed the costs and benefits of consolidating and/or closing certain of
Golden State’s district and satellite offices.

Implemented employee reductions and termination of Golden State’s
general agents.

Implemented incentive programs and procedures to collect past due
premiums, to retain business with Golden State and to retain employees to
limit departures of key personnel.

Commenced and completed re-negotiations of home and district office
leases.

Responded to numerous state and federal employment complaints, claims

and lawsuits in California, Hlinois, Texas and North Carolina.

To complete the above and additional work, the Commissioner incurred

$738,159.94 in fees and expenses in 2009. $422,721.42 of this amount was previously approved

by Judge Yaffe, and $207,345.39 of this amount was incurred to the four consultants and vendors

listed in this Revised Application and remains to be approved in this Revised Application. The

following shows the fees and expenses not previously approved which were incurred to the four

-7 -
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consultants/vendors listed in this Revised Application who provided services in 2009, at their

hourly rates and total for 2009.

Consultant Hourly Rates Total 2009 Scope of Work _
CLO $157.95 $138,806.80 Operations, on-site management

Epstein Turner Weiss $150-295 $ 46,401.74 Legal services, all aspects, litigation

Joshua Solomon $100 $ 14,282.82 On-site consulting, project management

- Kane Corporation  $149-250 § 7.854.07 Real estate portfolio management

$207,345.43
13. Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit | is a spreadsheet detailing rate
and expense information regarding the Commissioner’s staff and consultants and the scope of

work performed by the staff and consultants.

2010 - Work Performed and Fees/Expenses Incurred.

14. In 2010, after gaining control over Golden State’s operations and financial
condition, the Commissioner’s primary objections were to evaluate proposals to have a financially

solvent company purchase Golden States policies, annuity contracts and commercial mortgage

| portfolio, while maintaining the premium collection book of business. The Commissioner’s

secondary objectives were to close and consolidate district offices, reduce staff, reduce liabilities,

monetize assets and develop a closing plan to discontinue district offices and vacate the Los
Angeles Home Office in the most cost effective and efficient manner by the close of 2010, which

he successfully did.
15.  To accomplish his 2010 objectives, the Commissioner’s staff performed the
following necessary and significant work, in addition to additional work on a daily basis:

a. In January 2010, after the Commissioner provided detailed and extensive
information packages to interested parties and completed numerous on-site
visits and due diligence evaluations, five insurers submitted bids for the
purchase of Golden State’s business and/or policies. From January through

September 2010, the Commissioner (a) performed in-depth evaluations of

-

DECLARATION OF SCOTT PEARCE




Epstein Turner Waiss

R N T N T N O T S N T N S
- O I S =T - T - T SO V- TS G

28

A Professional Corporation

633 West Fifth Strest
Suite 3330
Los Angetes, CA 9007]

—

O B0 -1 N Wy B L3 D

GAGRPAICASES\204-410-04\Pleadings\Fee App RevisedMotion 102813\Fee Revised Pearce Dec.doc

the five bids, (b) selected IA American Life Insurance Company to
purchase the approximately 120,000 in-force life, health and disability
insurance policies and annuity contracts, (¢) negotiated detailed purchase
and assumption agreements with 1A American, (d) drafted and provided
written notice of the transaction to the holders of the approximately
120,000 policies and annuity contracts, and (e} drafted and filed extensive
pleadings seeking court approval of the transaction.

On September 2, 2010, after receiving court approval, the Commissioner
and [A American completed the Assumption Reinsurance Agreement
which resulted in the transfer to [A American of Golden State’s policies
and annuity contracts {(a substantial benefit to the policyholders) and
transfer to IA American of approximately $71 million in reserve liability
and certain of Golden State’s assets totaling approximately $60 million
including Golden State’s commercial mortgage portfolio, bond portfolio,
stock portfolio and other assets. Without this transaction, many of the
120,000 insurance policies would have been subject to the benefit
limitations and reductions required by state insurance guaranty
associations, including the “eighty percent” policy payment limitation
under [nsurance Code § 1067.02(c).

Throughout 2010, the Commissioner continued to negotiate and resolve
with IA American numerous post-transaction policy, reinsurance and
accounting issues, address regulatory and reinsurance issues concerning the
transaction, and address policyholder concerns regarding the purchase of
their policies by IA American.

Throughout 2010, began the process of winding down Golden State’s
employment operations and terminated Golden State’s employees including
Golden State’s former executives, Board of Directors, eighty-six captive

insurance and annuity agents, underwriting department, and all of Golden

-9.
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State’s over 100 employees and personnel, in compliance with state and

federal employment notice and termination requirements.

As part of the winding down of Golden State’s employment, continued to

implement employment incentive plans and employment assistance

programs to assist Golden State’s employees and lessen the adverse impact
on employees and Golden State’s business operations. The programs
included:

(H) A successful Employee Retention Incentive Plan in which key
employees were provided a monetary incentive to continue their
employment through certain dates in 2010. The incentive plan was
necessary to maintain key employees to assist with day-to-day
business operations and the migration of policies to IA American.

(2) A successful Premium Collection Incentive Plan in which district
managers and agents were provided a monetary incentive to collect
past due premiums from policyholders, so as to minimize lost
revenues due to unpaid premiums at the conclusion of the
conservation.

(3) Pre-termination employment transition assistance services to
employees including pre-termination retirement plan counseling
and pre-termination governmental assistance and counsehing
seminars and programs.

Consolidated and reduced Golden State’s district offices, which

significantly reduced Golden State’s operating expenses.

Terminated office leases and successfully re-negotiated the leases for

Golden State’s Home Office building in Los Angeles and two district

offices, securing significant rent reductions and early terminations without

penalty.

-10 -
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Implemented an office closing plan to timely vacate Golden State’s Home
Office in Los Angeles and remaining district offices, under which essential
business related materials were transferred to the Home Office to be
inventoried and sent to storage, business equipment was returned to lessors
and/or disposed of, and the Home Office and district office spaces were
cleaned and vacated.

Commenced and completed a system-wide back-up of all electronic data
generated and/or stored by Golden State and installed a back-up server to
improve system reliability.

Prepared Golden State’s annual retirement plan report and retirement plan
audit.

Worked with an actuarial consulting services firm to develop reserve
valuations and projections for Golden State’s liabilities used to assist the
Commissioner with valuing Golden State’s insurance policies and annuity
contracts for sale.

Actively managed Golden State’s mortgage portfolio, and marketed and
sold foreclosed property.

Established hardship committee to review and respond to pelicyholder
surrender requests larger than $5,000.

Maintained annual premium income at above projected estimates prior to
policy assumption by IA American.

Completed and filed Golden State’s year end 2008 and 2009 Annual
Statements.

Marketed district offices for sale.

Migrated electronic policy and mortgage portfolio information to IA
American.

Completed an inventory of Golden State’s fine art and collection of historic

materials, and undertook efforts to market and sell the items.

<11 -
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1 S. Inventoried and removed 5,400 boxes of records located at Home Office.
2 16. To complete the above and additional work, the Commissioner incurred a total of
3| $1.509,864.26 in fees and expenses during 2010 to the eight consultants and vendors listed in this
4)i Revised Application. The following shows the fees and expenses incurred to the eight
51l consultants/vendors listed in this Revised Application who provided services in 2010, at their
6|l hourly rates and total for 2010.
7
8li Consultant Hourly Rates Total 2010  Scope of Work
of CLO $157.95 $702,696.66 Operations, on-site management
10{ Epstein Turner Weiss $150-295 $443,985.36 Legal services, all aspects, litigation
11} Wisener Nunnally — $250 $ 41,185.60 Legal services, reinsurance, art portfolio
12|l Joshua Solomon $100 $ 54,972.28 On-site consulting, project management
13 Cookes Crating $49 $ 5,31947 Professional packing and transportation
141 ART Movers $817/month §$ 467.71 Fine art storage, historical materials
15]} Ultimate Staffing $21.88-67.70 $ 46,189.56 Temporary employment services
161 Kane Corporation $149-250 $215,047.62 Real estate portfolio management
17 $1,509,864.26
18| (See Exhibit 1 for additional information.)
19
20 2011 - Work Performed and Fees/Expenses Incurred.
21 17. In January 2011, the Commissioner was discharged as Conservator and appointed
22|l Liguidator of Golden State Mutual. All aspects of the liquidation were transitioned to the CLO in
231l San Francisco. The Commissioner’s primary objectives in 2011 were to monetize Golden State’s
24|l remaining assets, resolve liabilities and wind up the affairs of Golden State in a cost effective
25 | efficient manner. Throughout 2011 the Commissioner was challenged with resolving numerous
26l non-assumed liabilities including Golden State’s multi-million pension liability, long term
771 disability policy claimants and employee life insurance benefits, and with responding to numerous
28
A Profesioml Corporaion
e
Los Angeles, CA 90071
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policyholder, creditor and public concerns regarding the transfer of policies, disposition of assets

and historical significance of Golden State.

18.  To accomplish his 2011 objectives, the Commissioner’s staff performed the

following necessary and significant work, in addition to additional work on a daily basis:

a.

Negotiated and reached agreement with the National Organization of Life
and Health Insurance Guaranty Associations (“NOLHGA”™) through which
NOLGHA agreed to provide coverage to Golden State’s group life
certificate holders, long-term disability claimants, and non-assumed policy
liability. Without NOLHGA’s coverage, the insureds would likely lose
coverage and not receive benefits.

Terminated Golden State’s 401(k) retirement plan, which required
extensive work to locate former employee plan participants and secure
required termination forms from plan participants.

Negotiated for, terminated, received court approval and transferred Golden
State’s pension plan to the PBGC, the result of which maintained pension
payments for Golden State’s plan participants.

Resolved significant issues concerning the PBGC’s purported multi-million
dollar lien claim against Golden State’s assets due to the multi-million
dollar underfunded portion of the pension plan, and expended significant
time and effort to negotiate and ensure that the termination and transfer of
the pension plan to the PBGC did not establish or control the priority of
PBGC’s claim.

Completed a second request for proposal process for the sale of Golden
State’s fine art collection and historical materials including its removable
murals, 120 pieces of African-American art and historical materials. Upon
selecting prevailing bidders, prepared three separate purchase and sale
agreements for Court approval. The Court approved the agreement to

transfer Golden State’s historical materials to the UCLA Library; the
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agreement to sell the murals was withdrawn because the bidder withdrew;
and the agreement to sell the art collection was denied by the Court.
Loaned a significant portion of Golden State’s art collection to the
California African American Museum for display as part of a continuing
city-wide art exhibition.

Extensively evaluated and responded to community concerns regarding
Golden State and its policyholders, historical significance, historical
materials and art collection including murals.

I'iled numerous applications with the Court for approval of administrative
actions including applications for approval of sales of Golden State’s real
property, the liquidation of Golden State, continuation of the proof of claim
deadline, settlements of claims and lawsuits against Golden State, and other
actions.

Completed final financial “True Up” reconciliation and Release Agreement

with [A American.

Responded to numerous data and records requests from IA American.
Responded to numerous claim and policy related inquires.

In 2011 as well as 2010, resolved most lawsuits, complaints, claims and

legal matters that were either pending at the time of conservation or had

been commenced against Golden State during conservation. The larger
litigation matters and disputes include:

(1) FEqual Employment Opportunity Commission v. Golden State,
United States District Court for the Western District of North
Carolina, Statesville Divistion, Civil Action No. 3:09¢v00105. This
was a discrimination action against Golden State by the Equal
Employment Opportunity Commission (“EEOC”) on behalf of a
former employee. The action was resolved through settlement, with

approval applied for and granted by both Judge Yaffe and the

- 14 -
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1 United States District Court for the Western District of North

2 Carolina.

3 (2) Willie M. Grady v. Golden State, Discrimination Complaints filed

4 with Illinois Department of Human Rights and City of Chicago

5 Commission of Human Relations by a former employee who was

6 demoted for violations of his employment agreement and the

7 Court’s Order Appointing Conservator by his appointment with

8 competing insurance companies during his employment with

9 Golden State and his solicitation of Golden State’s policyholders to
10 switch to other insurance companies after the conservation. The
11 | Commissioner’s staff responded to the complaints and, based on
12 those responses and further requests for information, the complaints
I3 were dismissed without hearing.
14 (3) Valerie Belcher v. Golden State, Discrimination Complaints also
15 filed with Illinois Department of Human Rights and City of
16 Chicago Commission of Human Relations by a former employee
17 who was demoted for violations of her employment agreement and
18 the Cowrt’s Order Appointing Conservator by her appointment with
19 competing insurance companies during her employment with
20 Golden State and her solicitation of Golden State’s policyholders to
214 switch to other insurance companies after the conservation. The
22 | Commissioner’s staff responded to the complaints and again, based
23 on those responses and further requests for information, the
24 complaints were dismissed without hearing.
25 (4) Childs v. Golden State, California Labor Commissioner Case No.
26 06-93878 DG. This was an employee wage waiting time penatty
27 claim by a former employee. The Commissioner’s staff responded
28

A Peneesons) Corpraian
o
Los Angeles, CA 9007
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1 to the claim and, after a hearing, the claim was denied by the Labor
2 Commissioner.
3 (5) James H. Nunya v. Golden State, Los Angeles Superior Court Case
4 No. LAM 08M11746. Mr. Nunya is a former employee who
5 unsuccessfully sought damages from Golden State in Los Angeles
6 Small Claims Court, and appealed the denial of his claim to the Los
7\ Angeles Superior Court, assigned to the Honorable Coleman Swatt,
8 Judge. In response to this Courts September 30, 2009 Order
9 Appointing Conservator and Restraining Orders, Judge Swatt
10 stayed the case.
11 (6) Community Impact Development I, LLC (“CID”) v. Golden State.
12 Dispute over ownership of murals. The Commissioner’s staff
13 commenced depositions and document subpoenas to evaluate CID’s
14 ownership claim to the murals, evaluated and responded to C1D’s
15 complaint claiming ownership of the murals, and participated in
16 pre-trial discovery and preparations. The case is currently pending
17 for trial in December 2012.
18 (7) Numerous employment, policy and miscellaneous claims against
19{t Golden State’s assets.
20 | 19. To complete the above and additional work, the Commissioner incurred a total of
214 $1,283,888.53 in fees and expenses during 2011 to the six consultants and vendors listed in this
22|l Revised Application. The following shows the fees and expenses incurred to the six
2311 consultants/vendors listed in this Revised Application who provided services in 2011, at their
241 hourly rates and total for 2011.
25
26} Consultant Hourly Rates Total 2010  Scope of Work
274 CLO $157.95 $744,845.45 Operations, management
28| Epstein Turner Weiss $150-295 $421,666.20 Legal services, all aspects, litigation
A Ponfsonal Corporsin
P e
Los Angeles, CA 50071
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Wisener Nunnally  $250 $ 15,834.34 Legal services, reinsurance, art portfolio
Cookes Crating $49 $ 1,421.00 Professional packing and transportation
ART Movers $817/month $ 9,731.00 Fine art storage, historical materials

Kane Corporation $149-250 $ 90.390.54 Real estate portfolio management

$1,283,888.53

(See Exhibit 1 for additional information.)

Declarations Confirming the Expenses are Proper and Sample Invoices.

20. I and the Commissioner’s staff received detailed timekeeping and invoices from
each of the Commissioner’s consultants and service providers at issue here for the work
performed. We carefully reviewed the timekeeping and invoices for compliance with the scope of

work for which the consultants were retained, any excessive or duplicative charges, and sought

| clarification and correction where appropriate. The proposed payments sought for approval were

reasonable and necessary for Golden State’s conservation and liquidation, are reasonable for the
services performed and were rendered in the best interests of Golden State’s estate.

21.  Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibits 3 through 10 are true and
correct copies of original invoices representing at least four months of the expenses requested to
be approved in this Application. A four month sample of invoices is attached for consultants and
vendors CLO, Epstein Turner Weiss, Wisener Nunnally Gold, Kane Corporation and Joshua
Solomon. All invoices are attached for consultants and vendors Ultimate Staffing, Lewis & Ellis,

Cooke’s Crating and ART Movers, because a four month sampling of invoices was not available

- due to their more limited, project based work performed.

22. Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit 2 is a spreadsheet showing the
sample size total in comparison to the total expense for each consultant.

Expenses from 2007 through June 2012 Show Significant Expense reductions during

Conservation and Ligquidation.

23.  Prior to conservation, Golden State’s general expenses greatly increased in 2009

over years 2007 and 2008, increasing to $13,457,390 in 2009. After 2009, the Commissioner

217 -
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reduced general expenses for 2010 by nearly $3 million and reduced general expenses for 2011 by

another $9 million to $1,617,845. The following table shows Golden State’s expenses from 2007

through 2011.

- Year

2007
2008
2009
2010
2011

(General Expenses

Taxes, Licenses, Fees

{excludes federal income tax) Total

$ 8,820,497
$ 7,686,229
$11,691,063
$ 8,659,217
$ 1,617,845

$ 936,927 $ 9,757.424
§ 941,937 $ 8,628,166
$1,766,327 $13,457,390
$2,011,914 $10,671,131
$ 0 § 1,617,845

The liabilities driving Golden State’s net asset deficiency and, therefore, limited

remaining assets, are not related to the Commissioner’s expenses.

24.

The liabilities driving Golden State’s net asset deficiency and, therefore, limited

remaining assets, are not related to the Commissioner’s expenses, except in that the

Commissioner’s work substantially reduced the liabilities. The current liability to insurance

guarantee associations for assuming non-transferred policy obligations and the liability to the

Pension Benefit Guarantee Corporation (“PBGC”) for assuming Golden State’s substantial pre-

conservation un-funded pension obligations are estimated to be at least $2,212,900 and at least

$5,124,800, respectively. These liabilities would exist even without the Commissioner’s

| expenses because (1) the liability to state guarantee associations is due to their covering the
- benefits owed under Golden State’s non-assumed policies and (2) the pension liability existed

| prior to conservation due to Golden State not fully paying its pension fund obligations. Such

liabilities are Priority Class 2 and Priority Class 7 liabilities, which are priority classes paid before

the Certificate of Contribution holders who are a Priority Class 8 lability under Insurance Code §

1033. Accordingly, even without any of the expenses for the services performed at issue here, the

estimated liability to insurance guarantee associations and the PBGC likely will prohibit any

-18 -

DECLARATION OF SCOTT PEARCE




Epstein Tamer Weiss

W8 ~1 oy Wt B W D e

[SO TR S T NS O N o T D o et e — V—

28

A Professional Corporation

633 West Fifth Street
Suite 3330
Los Angeles, CA 99671

GAGRPUCASES\204-410-04'\Pleadings\Fee App Revised\Motion 102813\Fee Revised Pearce Dec.doc

payment to Certificate of Contribution holders since the net asset deficiency as of December 31,

2011, of $8,693,400 exceeds the requested expenses.

25, The Commissioner’s efforts reduced these un-funded liabilities by transferring

over $11 million in liability to IA American and working with the PBGC in transferring the

| pension plan. Without the Commissioner’s efforts and necessary related expenses, the liability to

policyholders and insurance guarantee associations would be at least $11 million greater and the
cost of administering the policies and liabilities would be substantial, likely an additional several
million dollars. Liabilities would be at least $11 million greater because in September 2009, at
the time of conservation, Golden State had approximately $71 million in policy reserve liability
and over $60 million in assets including its commercial mortgage portfolio, bond portfolio and
stock portfolio. These assets were transferred to 1A American along with the $71 million in
reserve liability in order to transfer the 120,000 policies, with TA American accepting the $11
reser-ve deficiency as the cost of purchasing the policies. In other words, the rehabilitation and
reinsurance plan realized the value in an ongoing book of life insurance business for the creditors
of Golden State, while liquidation would have lost that value. Without the $60 millioﬁ in assets,
the policies would not have been transferred; and without the transfer of the $11 million in
reserve deficiency to 1A American, the liability to policyholders and insurance guarantee
association would be that much greater along with a likely several million dollar expense to
administer the policies and liabilities.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the
foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on this 22 day of October, 2013, at San Frangisco, California.

SCYTT PEARCE

i
1
LY
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1 DECLARATION OF MICHAEL R. WEISS

2 IN SUPPORT OF COMMISSIONER’S REVISED APPLICATION TO APPROVE

3 CONSERVATION AND LIQUIDATION EXPENSES

4 [

5 I, Michael R. Weiss, declare as follows:

6 1. I am over 18 years of age and have personal knowledge of the facts and

71 circumstances set forth in this declaration, and if called upon to do so, I could and would

8§l competently testify thereto.

9 2. I am an attorney licensed to practice law in the State of California, and am a
10]] partner with the law firm Epstein Turner Weiss, A Professional Corporation. [and Epstein,
11§} Turner Weiss have been retained by the Insurance Commisstoner of the State of California, in his
121 capacity as Conservator (“Conservator”™) and then as Liquidator (“Liquidator”) of Golden State
13)| Mutual Life Insurance Company (“Golden State™), to provide legal services concerning Golden
14| State. I make this declaration in support of the Liquidator’s Application To Approve
15 | Conservation and Liquidation Expenses (“Application™).
16 3. I received my license to practice law in California in December 1995, and have
17} practiced law in California continuously since that date. In addition to my law degree, | have a
18] Masters of Science in Applied Economics and a Bachelors of Arts in Economics.
19 4. I have practiced in the area of insurance company conservation and liquidation for
20| the past twelve vears, the first four years with the California Attorney General’s Office and the
21| past eight years in private practice. I have represented the California Insurance Commissioner
221 regarding the conservations and liquidations of Superior National Insurance Company, Superior
231 Pacific Casualty Company, California Compensation Insurance Company, Combined Benefits
241 Insurance Company, Commercial Compensation Casualty Company, Golden State Mutual Life
25} Insurance Company, HIH America Compensation and Liability Insurance Company, and several
26| other insolvent insurance companies. [ also have represented the Oklahoma Department of
27 Insurance, Illinois Department of Insurance and Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
28| concerning liquidation and asset issues and litigations.
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1 5. With respect to the conservation and liquidation of Golden State Mutual Life
2| Insurance Company, [ and my firm Epstein Turner Weiss have provided and continue to provide
3|l extensive legal services to the Insurance Commissioner including without limitation advice and
41 litigation services concerning insurance conservation and liquidation, rehabilitation, reinsurance,
5} policy termination, asset liquidation, employment termination, litigations, real estate, re-
6| negotiation of lease terms and terminations, Golden State’s retirement plan and PBGC issues,
7| private sector employment and employment discrimination claims and litigation matters, the sale
8}l of Golden State’s book of insurance business, corporate governance, and many other issues and
9|l matters pertaining to Golden State.
10 6. The invoices attached as Exhibit 7 are true and correct copies of original invoices
11}l submitted by me to the Commissioner for legal services performed during the period March 2010
12] through June 2010.
13 7. Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “11” is a true and correct copy
14} of the Order Appointing Conservator and Restraining Order dated September 30, 2009.
15 8. Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “12” is a true and correct copy
16) of the Order Appointing Liquidator and Injunction in Aid of Liquidation dated January 28, 2011,
17 9. Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “13” is a true and correct copy
18| of the Court Order Re: Application To Approve Conservation And Liquidation Expenses And
19} Motion To Compel Discovery dated September 13, 2012,
20 10.  Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “14” is a true and correct copy
21| of the Court Order dated October 26, 2012.
22 11. The delay between the October 26, 2012 Order and the filing of this Revised
23| Application is due to the Commissioner’s now dismissed appeal of Judge O’Brien’s September 13
24| and October 26, 2012 Orders. On November 9, 2012, due to Judge O’Brien’s non-approval of the
25 | fees and expenses of seven consultants/vendors, the Commissioner filed a Notice of Appeal to
261 preserve appellate rights. Thereafter, on November 20, 2012, in accordance with the October 26
27| Order, the Commissioner filed an Application seeking approval of the expenses for the eight
28] vendors whose expenses were approved in the September 13th Order. However, on January 9,
A Pt Corporsion
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2013, at the hearing on said Application, Judge O’Brien declined to hear the application on the
basis that the Notice of Appeal divested the superior court of jurisdiction as to all matters
addressed in the Orders including the eight vendors whose fees were approved. The Court

thereafter issued a minute order stating that the application is “stayed pending appeal.” After

| further research and review of the Court’s September 13 and October 26 Orders, the

Commissioner has concluded that the Orders are non-final, non-appealable interim receivership
orders for which additional documentation and information can be submitted to support the fees
and expenses incurred. Accordingly, on August 29, 2013, the Commissioner dismissed the
appeal.

12.  Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “157 is a true and correct copy
of the Court’s January 9, 2013 Minute Order.

13. Attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit “16” is a true and correct copy
of the Commissioner’s Request for Dismissal of Appeal filed August 29, 2013.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the
foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on this 28" day of October, 2013, at Los Angeles, California.

MICHAEL R. WEIS

S5
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Declaration of Robert . Nunnally, Jr.

I, Robert H. Nunnally, Jr., do hereby make this declaration and declare the following facts to
be true and correct under the penalty of perjury of the laws of the State of California.
1. I'am Robert H. Nunnally, Jr. I am over the age of eighteen. ] am competent to be a witness. I
have personal knowledge of the facts which I declare, which I acquired through my involvement in

the matters I address in this declaration, If called upon to testify, I could and would do so,

2. 1 graduated with high honors from the University of Arkansas at Little Rock School of Law
in 1984. I received my license to practice law in the State of Texas in 1984, and in the State of
California in 1988. | became registered to practice before the United States Patent and Trademark
Office in 2000. In addition to my law degree, [ hold an undergraduate degree in physics from the
University of Arkansas, located at Fayetteville,

3. Since 1984, I have worked as a practicing attorney, with an emphasis on insurance company
insolvency, commercial litigation and intellectual property law, I am currently a limited liability
partner in Wisener*Nunnally*Gold, LLP in Garland, Texas. Prior to my relocation to Garland,

Texas, I was a sharcholder in Rubinstein & Perry, a professional corporation, in Los Angeles,

California.
4. Throughout my career, I have assisted insurance regulators who act as receivers of insurance

companies in rehabilitation or liquidation. I have been extensively involved in

insurance company fransactions which seek to revitalize troubled insurance companies, This
experience includes my work as co-lead trial counsel with Mr. Steven Green, Esq. of the California
Attorney General’s Office in connection with the Pacific Standard Life Insurance Company
rehabilitation. In that case, a successful plan of rehabilitation was implemented after court approval
following a contested trial.

5. I assisted the California Insurance Commissioner as Rehabilitator of Golden Fagle Insurance
Company in connection with the rehabilitation plan for Golden Eagle Insurance Company. In that
role, I served as one of the negotiators of the plan of rehabilitation for the company.

6. I assisted the Texas Special Deputy Receiver of Universal Insurance Exchange in the drafting

Declaration of Robert H. Nunnally, Jr. in support of Fee Supplement
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and successful litigation of a contested rehabilitation plan for that company. Ihandled the

rehabilitation trial as co-lead counsel, and served as a primary counsel in the drafting of the plan of

rehabilitation itself.
7. I am the current lead counsel representing the California Insurance Commissioner in

connection with the liquidation of the Mission Insurance Company Trust, the Mission National
Insurance Company Trust and the Enterprise Insurance Company Trust. In that role, I have provided
a diverse array of services to my client, including, without limitation, serving as lead counsel to the
Insurance Commissioner as Trustee in connection with the successful sale of solvent subsidiary
Mission Insurance Company of Texas.

8. In my litigation practice, I represent insurance liquidators and rehabilitators in connection
with litigation issues involving director and officer liability, reinsurance litigation, proof of claim
litigation including the complex coverage matters that can arise in connection with proofs of claim.
9. I have given seminar presentations and written articles about insurance company liquidation
and rehabilitation a number of times throughout my career.

10. In my intellectual property practice, I have experience with the sale and licensing of
intellectual property, including in particular patents and trademarks. In the copyright realm, I
provide litigation representation, particularly in relation to intellectual property rights tied up in
insolvency proceedings. My practice experience includes representation of various creators of
intellectual property and purchasers of collectible material, including, without limitation,
independent film-makers, pharmaceutical companies, coin dealers, and authors.

11, Inaddition to my professional experience as an aftorney, I have direct expetience in dealing
with intellectual property, its licensing, preservation and use, I am the co-owner of the netlabel
Negative Sound Institute, a creative commons music netlabel which makes music by artists from
several countries available to listeners under Creative Commons licenses. In addition, I make
electronic music in my own right under the artist name Gurdonark. My music has appeared in the
soundtrack to film documentaries, computer games, televised programs, podcasts, and over one

thousand internet videos released in a variety of formats in a variety of countries. I advocate for

Declaration of Robert H. Nunnally, Jr. in support of Fee Supplement
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employment of a creative commons in which archived media is, with its owners’ permission, made

available for the common use of all within the context of an ordered and systematic copyright

scheme,
i2. In connection with the Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company matter, I was asked to

provide assistance in drafting the successful plan of rehabilitation for the company. I worked with
Michael Weiss on this project. We managed the work to ensure that no duplication ensued. I helped
to negotiate aspects of the plan of rehabilitation, to draft its terms, and to assist in the drafting of the
motion for approval.

13. I also was asked to provide assistance in evaluating issues related to the preservation of the
company’s historical assets and the realization of funds for the benefit of creditors from the
company’s artwork.

14. Iread an objection to the fee motion which questioned whether my Texas firm could
properly bill travel time. My firm, located in Garland, Texas, intentionally charges a rate lower than
the rate customary in Los Angeles, California. I have twenty seven years of experience as a lawyer.
Yet my billing rate on this matter is $ 250 an hour, far below the rate of similarly-situated lawyers in
Los Angeles County. My firm’s travel expenses have been paid in this matter, but my overall fees
and expenses are well under the customary fees and expenses of lawyers of ny experience,

15, Yattach as Exhibit “8” and incorporate into this declaration a true and correct copy of my
firm’s invoices for the period April through July 2010, along with what I am informed are approval
notations by representatives of the Conservation and Liquidation Office, These fees and eXpenses
wer¢ reasonable and necessary, I am familiar with the rates in the California market due to the fact

that I practiced there for ten years and still handle a percentage of my caseload in California. The fees

and expenses my

i
Hl
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firm has charged are below-market fees and roasonable expenscs.

[ hereby dectare the foregoing facts to be teue and correct under the penalty of petjury of the laws of

the State of California on this . _day of August, 2012.

|

Robert H. Nuﬁnaﬂy, Jr.
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CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE
P.0). Box 26994

San Francisco, CA 941280894
Tek 415.678.5000 Fax: 415,576.5002

wew.eaclo.org
August 9, 2010
Golden State Mutuat Insurance Company
1999 West Adams Boufevard
Los Angeles, CA 90018-3514
Involce
For services rendered/expense ref mﬁursement for the month
of June 201(:
(document support details on followlny pages)
Staffing - CLO Employees 3 27,942.58 4 '
Department of Insufance charges 868.75 7 Eg ,\a '%L ;D
Department of Justice charges 5,865.00 7 g =) Q P e
Travel Bxpense to GSM offices $701.077 et e
Courler & Postage 19217
Accounting & Audit 4800”7
Investiment Expense 100.53 ~
Subtotal 44,545.14
Less: Previous billing adjustment 3,000.00
Total $ 41,545.14
A

Please make your remittance payable to “Conservation and Liquidation Office.” If you have any
questions or need additional information, ploass contact the undersigned, Thank yon,

Sineerely,

Regina Alava
Conservation & Liquidation Office

(415) 676-5083

APPROVED: @@JL:’ZQQ__ . g /r / L0
nte

David E, Wilson, SDIC, Conservator

a-f“%
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Attachments to June 2010 Golden State Mutual service billing
June 2019 Direct Hours Detall for Golden State Mutual code 906:

@ 20L.5 hours x $138.6729= $27,942.58 i f

Falaraditay it Seits ot
Masith % | 2010 CLO Total Hours - By Emiployee Asof 6/20/2010
Ayt frdit L

Sum of YTUs Cupd sih ™

g Nagae v i1 i 2 32 syl it

Alava, Reginz 200 60

jeung, Cedlila 150 156

thang, Shaerong 1.25% 125

Minehan, Ray 250 4,50

Majzbt, Mohammed 1Lo0¢ 1,000

Pearce, Scott 13050 11050

Vast, Michele 38,75 16,75

Wilson, David - 3500 35.00

Yitn, Winnle 100 140G

vt Fatal 158,00 100 5.75 3695 pLehNete}

June 2010 DOT Detall for Golden State Mutusl code 996:

296 Golden Siote Mutual Lifa insurence Company j 0.25] 888.75]"”

Qolden Staks Wutuel Mife Intwrsnce Coumpany 7?5
SAEM Weas
By Wettad Pask Hours  Rate Fottnt  Daagpiptien
LERE:EE He T4 L] 300,35 rebrB/Ersvapticn agreevost
QY= AN~ ED L ] 39 .00 £4hLD dhcunmnt s
Fe-JuM-10 H3 1 [ ] 134,40 exlad Sprusanta
NG » 1 £3% IN00 quspension of /A froe othet statas
W lUM LD ey 13 1214 L5 Hied versivan of closing docusenats
S . P R L N NI R U TR
rosal Swpleps 4.35 508, 75
Taizl fkrin oL 4.13 [R5
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June 2010 DOJ Detail for Golden State Mutnal code 9962

34.50 hours @170.00= $5,865.00

BEMUND G BROWN IR,
Astoracy Gendenl

IOt Bveed, Shirpvmnla, CA SIAHL

Sinie of Cwlifornle g EOY
DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE j@
ooy upes; (HITEILASON BT

Summary of Legat Servicss

Cllent Agondy!  Coreorvaton & Lipidsgen
Cllent Agency £ G151

Bitkap Comslintt 16000 %

Professiond Type: Attomey

T Rt Ao R -t

Have: Y6
Arse of Low; CY-BATITN &
B Luonse Boukostoiiar
s, Serter D Craut hesmed Trdk
LATOORRI1IEE  Framrt Cowed (00T} T
Mrdf by A5 S ‘
) Dot Reomrd Rode
[ 10 Twaxwros ar v, s Pt el E=3
LAGDOICVORET BN COMMA Y EREMONT U 959
B Brag: £33 Pdd
Nl By Narter Dy b Aodt ot Trapit Ltooonl Cods
CAMRICYTIAS NN COML VVCITERN eTER (53
AATOOCVOIEE 4 £ Supried Mimooal Ll
LATCOSTVITAY LT E S W SUPERIOR WA,
TAICOPCYHIT  THE COMVHATIONXS, ALFICH
LAOIICVINTE S COM YV PALATRIUANGS
ARSIV NS COMMRY SALTN NATS, 913
Masger Dondes STant A uvice Sty Ansery
Mtk | Matet Gedsrigifon L2t Adccesr§ Bode
ROOMSOTOOT  Crank Banas - Bl Agaiiy LV-BAT 13
ISt il Satith
Hrtinr e Dusaription LAeek Roourd Code
TAZCMBOTHT  Inpucerce Commiaiondr ¢ Fromn] Lie e wocat Clrrgprny (OO0
WAZOORTITT  Duisber REToad s F41 Mrm s pe Exiararich {00 .
9%6
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June 2020 Travel Expense Duotal! for Golden Stete Mutual code 996:

$ 1,289.60 June g/l + $6,559.97 + $1,851.50 July g/1=39,701.07
Trizt Balanca f Ladgar Comparison - Work With Account Ladgar

QB L2010
QU120

Luslomisa nd ] Gnd FormatNamed

LTS
Dabit

438 89
1.843.70 i
18270
1590
152,79
1600
876.37
1,481.02 ]
73834
§87.84
6,558 07

8559 s@

b

08/011201%
obr30r2010

Luslomize Geid « Qfd Forrmal Namet

Belerl fnd Chse Form  Hoew  Regorl Took
v 0o =
Accaunt 596.65018,1 Teaveat-Smpioyes
Ledger Typs 1 AN Generpt Ledger Fram Date ~
Ledgot Tima 2 AA Qurieral Ladyer Thru Date ~
TyporSubledgar *
® Postag Cyunpostad i Yo 4018487
Rucorets .12
M ﬁi ¥a Nor: Coe Gri. Frpdamibon LY ¢
¥y Humbar o Date Explanation -Remark- Amount
[ Py 77287 QU715 Q13172 Wison, Dadd Traval Exp 082313-626M0
[ (44 77329 0048 QTNZ.. Amcrcan Expréss - 0001 378209627601008 05/24-06)24H0
(] PY 71328 GOT15 QUIL. Amurican Exprésg - 0001 I70238627801000 05/28-06724/10
O ' F7329 0QY46 OVAMZ. Amercan Expross - 9001 ITAZ0BE27HH4008 05280812440
s} Py 77320 00745 07/, Americen Express - 0001 I75238027801008 DH28-06124/10
0 2% 77328 00715 Q7F3H2 . Amarican Exurass - D00t 37820852780 1008 06/28-08/24110
[ PV 77346 00718 O¥/3172., Vass, Michels Traval Exp 077)6-09/10
{3 PY TTI47 gati8 OYR2. Paarce, Jogd Traval Exp 06R21-25M0
[ PV 7348 00718 0¥B342 . Pozrge Jcont Travel Exg 06/26-07/0110
] Y 77421 00718 0732 . Pearce, Scoit Traval Exp 07316110
| Column Total
i1 Ladget Tata!
Triat Batance ! Ledger Comparison « Work With Account Ledger
Select Find  Closs Foom  Bow  HReport  Teol
o 0O B 08B
Accaunt 998,85018 2 Fravet.Non-emgic; o0
Ladges Yype 1 AR Ganaral Lécigar fFrom Dala ~
LedgarType 2 A Gengral Ledger Fhiy Dale ~
TyneSubledger . .
®Postad Q Unpostad Cm Y10 5,706 20
Recogd> § .40
i o Do o GIL £xplonation [A 8}
U @ Ty lBuniber Co s Expianation femaerk- Amovnt
1 v TT098 00715 08/3072. Amerdcan Expresy - 9004 370208627901008 042 2-06/28H0
1 PV 77096 00715 083072, Amodcan Expresy « 0001 378288627801008 04/27-05220140
.C} »y 77098 00718 08A30/2.. Amadcan Bxpredy - D00 I78208827804000 J427-05:28/10
[} PV TrOSE 00715 003002, Amarten Exprasa - 0001 370290627801008 Q4i27-05720/10
I} Py 71098 00715 06MO/2  Amedess Exags - 0001 378208627801008 J4727-06/26M0
N Py TT088 QU715 OBA30RZ. Amercan Express - Q00T I78298627801008 04227052810
| ) 71096 00715 0313072, Amedoan Expregs- 0001 37829862780 1004 0427-05/26/10
3 PY 77098 00715 083072 Amodcan Exgrosq - 0001 370298627601008 04/27-05.26H0
" Cufumn Totat
|| Ledger Tola
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frial Balance / Ledgar Compatison - Work With Account Ledger

Safact Find  Clise Form fow  Regerl Yools
w o B o ]
Account 595065018 2 Traval-Non-smployes
Letpor Typs AA GonerfLedgsr Fror Data » [ 2 LEE
Latioes Tyos 2 AN Qeneral Ladger Thru Date ~ N30T
TypelSulindper *
& posted O Unpostad O Mt Lgs 7 56770
Records 1. 19 wuslemize fiad - Grid Formi Name
") g Do Doc Toa G Explanation 1T LT
Ty Kumbar co oxtn Explananon JRaraark- Amount Gabit
o Py 7739 0O7IS 0N, Amorcan Express - 0001 3792627801008 05:29-08:24/10 15.00
[ [ 7320 00748 073U2.  Amotcan Express « 0001 37829862780 {008 ©5R28-06724110 15270
[ Y 77329 00715 OVMIRR.  Amedcan Express « 0001 3782F8827001003 0B2A-08/24710 15.00
| BV 77320 00748 OT/3Y2.  Arnedcan Sxprose - 0001 378298027801008 05428-06/24710 305 40
! PV 77329 $OTAS 073122 Amercen Express - 0001 378293627801008 06/28-06/24/10 1500
3 Py 77326 OBT18 07A12.. Amurican Express - 0031 379298827801008 0528052410 305.40
l »V 77329 00715 OFRAT/Z.. Amarcan Expross -0001 370208927601008 0823-08/24110 16 00
] PV 77320 00716 07/312. Arngrcan Express -G001 478208827801008 DH28-08/24/10 194,40
1 oy 77320 00715 072 . Amercan Sxpross - 000+ 37829802740 TH08 05/28-00/24/10 15,00
o PY 77329 00715 QF/3HFZ.  Amtiican Crpross - 0007 378299627801008 05/28.008.24/0 22340
1! PV TT320 0D7I5 G742, Amarcan Express - 0003 7879852760 1008 0BR2B-DBR2L10 15 00
M Py 7320 00718 O¥/3HL,  Amadcan Exress - 0001 378208627801008 06/28-06:24/10 179 40
[} (Y 77329 D078 07N, Amalcan Bxproes - 0001 I74200827804008 06720-08/24/10 165,40
1 Y 77320 OG745 07@Y2. Amedean BExprass - D001 376208627901008 05/28-06724/10 17940
(] Y . FTA28 DOTIS OV/AVZ. Amedcan Erpress - DO%Y 37620882750 1C08 05/28-06/24110 15.00
] Py 77320 00716 QPR Amaenican Express »0001 I7SRUB027BO 1008 06/28-06/24/10 179 40
[ By TTA29 00748 OWANAR.L  Amercen txprass «QUOY 3702986278C1008 0SR28-06/24/10 18.00
1 Column Tolat 1,851 SJ@ 1
June 2618 Courler and Postage Expense for 996:
$18.77 + 44=$19.21
Trial Balance { Ledger Comparison - Work With Account Ledger
goort Fnd  Clese Form  How Rogor Zouls
4 X 0O B ik
Avcount 98665019 Daoitrary Brpunss
LedgerType 1 AN Uangra! Ladger FremDate - L8 42010
Ledger Typa 2 AA Gotera! Ladygae Thrs Date = Q6012010
TrpeiSubledger .
@ Posted Ounposted QM Yo 59328
Recgrds 1-4 Lustonwe Gryd  Grid Fanmat Name!
] ﬁ ta  Doo boe Gk Exphingilon LT14 LT
Iy Humfier Co tale Explerssion Horadri- Amount Dottt
'l PY¥ 77070 0OTI5 0unMZ.,  Foderat Bxgiresy AC; 1818-7785-2 10.58
) Py 77200 00715 O6/0/Z. Faderat Exprass MG 1818-7795-2 818
3 Calumn Tolal 18771
0 Ledger Tol! 18 77@
< K '

24
—

3@ 19
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Trial Balance [ Ledger Comparisoh - Work With Account Ledger
gelect Fpd  Close Form  [Qow  Regort Yool T

Q@ X 0O &

Aczount 99865602 Pistage Expanse
Ladgar Tyna § FYy Cendral Ladper From Daty ~ 061041010
tadgarTipe 2 AA Ganersl Ledger ThneDale ~ 0613072010
Typefdubledgar *
@ rostad QO unpasted Al Yo 174
Records 1.3 Customize Grip * Grid FormetNamat
£ g b e Doc Ol Explanation LT ¢ L¥i
Humber  Co Date Explanailon . ~Remsck. Artieunt Debit

[ JE 51982 00745 QAN June 'O Poslags expen.. 44

1 ’ Colwnn Tolal 44

3 Ledget Total 4@

rd

June 20190 Accounting & Audit for 96:

348
= YTD Audit fees for GSM $532
fess YTD previously billed amounts $484

Balance of 348 to be billed

B 'maI Hal:mcel Lodger COmpzriscn Work Whh Accwnt Ledger
Selad Fpd  Chse Fom  Hove Repert Toecl
0O B O R

T e &
Acoourt 908 63002 Atcourting & Avdtng Exp
Ladgor Type 1 AA Ganaral Ladge: Ferom Date IR0
{edgarHpe 2 A General Ledier Thry Qate * 0873002010
Tyne'Subledger .
© Postes O unpetlod QM ¥1o 53200
fleconda 1.8 Cuslemaa tid  Geld Format Namst -
] @ Y %;uoc tior G ‘ £aptinadion 174 LY
mber Co fste Explanation ~Remark- Amount Debit
1] F”v‘ 78508 00785 02282, State ofCaifumnle-Dapl., OFR 10909 Jan 210 4508
r Y 75643 00715 033172, Shtle of Califomia-Dept,. OFRI0B-09-Feb 2010 18740
| AC 91438 GOY1S 040/2.. Apd 2010 Accrual SHate of Califamia Dopartment 240,00
L | AC 16838 00715 G502, Apd 2040 Accrual Slate of Calforrita Dapartment 240.00-
] s 76901 90715 $5H3Y2,. Slate of Colomis-Dept.. DFRADS-0%41ar 2010 240.03
| PV 79976 00715 053172, Stale of Calfornla.Depl., DFR102-094nr 2010 48.90 ;%,
1 ey 77186 G071 Q8/30/2.,. Slats of Caklomla-Oopt , DFR10$-094ay 2610 42.00
' : ' Coltm Tatal 53200
) LedgarTolar | SN F1 U
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June 2010 Investirent Peol {nterest xpense for 596;

frxitiz) fa0o1
050 208.30 -1

-50.88

88003 82001 2002
~126.82

Trisl Batsnee ! Ledger Camparison - Worlt With Account Ledgar
Fatny %‘J

Account

Ledger Type 1
Ledgar Type 2
TypasSubladgor

& posted

ftecords 1. §9

Faen How R%fut

PEEHIOOLY
AA

AA

Chunpostad |

Taeh

Taxabia irterasl-Foar
Sgngtal Lodgor

Genaral Lagss

QM Yo

p2005
67.34

b e i oy LA b— i L s LA

Honlh ’
Totaf
L100.53
From Ualg ERILIT
TisruBate 28:30° 204D

Aot

Lot Gt FormatNamat

{ IR
| (e Do gorg [:2 1) Explansiian Lre £Y e
F R py Hinnbar o> Vatx Eapinralion P At Dot
[ ] < 19306 00161 000 . Bring JDE (3 Mt volua | acouad fnkPoot iIREING) 70.28
| o 92482 00157 OMIBAE. Inuostment B¢ 0349 IerterestRac g - Onrparaly 24.98-
[ o] 2182 00151 QUAI0H . Ivasimenl JE's 0310 intérest Meeyvd - U3 & Gaut 1232
£ =} B2 0G15Y 104 L Invesanant JE 3410 Andrtiad INE Purcl - ConiGond 8.85
1 =] 92184 00351 GUII02,. BINng JOE [ Rdfvaie .. sccrvad mi-Poot IRFiorsNG] 7144
) =) V2171 00301 9041012, vo-gllocste Bunatder Our,. Intaresi Hecyd - Corparate Coer
" o 2171 90I0F 09302 ro-uliodato Gupunilor Our.. Inlaras] Itoghd - 413 & Got te2,
] o B2I7] (OO 0873077 (S-alacnle Bupendr Gur  ACCSa Ihi Pusclt - SOMIGwA 241
0 Gt 02472 GO 467107 Ra-Alecatad Suponar € . Agorund NP ol IRSWIsIng traY-
W Gotusms Tolat soas- o
= N e g e ()
‘Trial Batance | Ledyer Comparison - Work With Account Ledger
Sewct Fe Ujess Form Jooy Ragad Too%
v -3
Acound 904 58001 tivegtanost Exponto
Ledgar ipo ¥ A Gozsrof Lodgat From{ga * 5012010
Ledger pe2 A% Gaageal Lodgy Fhty Qui * 03630720 40
TyoaiSulledger 2
@ Posted Y anpgsted Coal yto “ig.
Rucards 1.3 Leihowrs et GhgFormet Namat «
1 e 4 Do Don Dov B, Explansdtion [Ag] (A 4]
Ty MHumber Co pute Exptanation RErriark. Ariouid Dobit
N o] 92423 00451 OB, Alocate Juni0investn,, S0
[} Column Total 50
] vedger Totat . 50 @
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Trial Balancs / L'adg'er Comparison - Work With Acsount Ladger
foeck  Fpd Clae Fere Hewr  Report Toos

v & X O W B R

Acchunt 998.88003 inferast Expense
Ledger Type 4 AA Genaraf . edpar Fram Date = 080
Lodper Type 2 AA Genaralf Lodger Thia Cate ~ Lk il ia b
TyparSubisdoer .
® fogled “CUnposted S OM YT ‘ B02.70
Roterds 1-4 Cestomiza ot | 604 FormatNamm
0 Q ‘?; mMr 2:: gf;c Ciplasilon E;E::;::? " . hLLm ‘ ::::Jn
O L+ 92162 ODB1 0B/30A.. investmantJER 0810  EffactolMelint RecExp 200,24
0 Cf 92171 6001 Q613012 re-slfocate Supador v Effact of Natint Recitixp Eis]
7] Calumn Tolal 20930
[ ‘ Ledyor Tolal ' 208.30 @
Trial Balance f Ledger Comparisen - Trial Balance / {edger Comparison
Seket Fpd  Chse fow  Jools
v & X H =B
8Mdp o Accaunt * 89681001 {TIsalact/ Skip To
Ledger Tyoo 1 AA Genaral Lodger " Level OfDetalt 9
LadgerTyps 2 AA tGengral Logger . LT 1 Thru Ferfod 6
Type/Subledper . LT 2 Thru Rorfod 6
Records 1.23 (3]0 . S wens Sup - GHd For
Account Actount Genoral Ledger Parlod
0 flumber Dancripiion Balanco General Ledger falapse Son
] Goldan Stat Mutual Life ins
I} 99601001 Galn/lLosy Salo or Raap P4E
3 89882000 Sucurites
] 9682008 LT Realizad GriLs-Pool RS 20.68.
N 89882002 8T Realizad GnLs-Pool ,-" 125,82~ 383.41-
] #96.82003 inactve-L 094 Saie LT Sac
[ $46.82004 inaclive-Loss Sgle 8T Sag
[ 996,82005 Mark to MarketPoo! 67.34 1101
O 99582008 64, on Sata LT Non Paool Sag .
[} §86.82007 GiL n Sale 8T Non Pool Bac
[J 94882008 G/ Non Pos] Reag of Se¢ Y
) 996820083 ReAnp Stat Daposit
3] $98.82008 GA, Non Posl Regp of See o
[ 99882009 GriLs on Transfer fo Poo! e -
[1 98682000 Securlties 58,59- (0) 402.08-
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June 2010 Pravious hilifng sdjustment for 996G;

April billing total was $3,000 more than detail, The June bitl will is reduced for this overpayment

received by the CLO,

Invoice
i
K For services rendered/expense reimbursement for thel.r;:mﬂt
of April 2010; -
(dorumemtsupport detalls on following pages)
Staffing-- CLO Employees $ 25,676.95
Departmont of Insurance charges 903.50
Department of Justice charges 3,060.00
Travel Expense to GSM offices 5,923.51
Office Supplies and Cowrier 261.11
Accounting & Audit 442.00
Investment Expense ' 1515

25,676.95
903.50
3,060.00
5.923.61
2611
442.06
pp— A L

36.338.22

o s

.-

et
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CowsgrvATION & LiguipaTioN OFFICE

PO, Box 26894

San Frandlsgo, CA 94126.0884

Tel: 415.876.5000 Fax: 415.6765002
vavw.cacio.org

September 7, 2010

‘Golden State Mutual Insurance Company
1999 West Adams Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 90018-3514

Invoice

For services rendered/expense reimbursement for the month

of July 2010;
{document support detalls on following pages)

Staffing — CLO Employees 3 24,759.52 }/
Depariment of Insurance charges 556.00 ’
1,062.50

Department of Justice charges

N

Travel Bxpense to GSM offices | 7,134.48
Office Supplies and Courier 9,145
Accounting & Audit 22,007
Investment Expense 339.54
Total $ 3388318

i

Please make your remittance payable to “Conservation and Liquidation Cffice.” If you have any
questions or need additional information, please vontact the undersigned, Thank you.

Sincerely,
Regina Alava

Conservation & Liquidation Office
{415) 676-5083

APPROVED: &b\ﬂﬁt) 4 def/)%w

David E. Wilson, SDIC, Conservator

i

s
%ﬁé{)sﬁ ", I /

/'
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Attachments to July 2010 Golden State Mutual service billing

July:2010 Diréct Hours:Detail for Golden Stite Mutual code 996;

179 hours x $138.32135= $24,755.52 ?f'

[estaterp " Jags  {alT T

pouth 7 I 20108 CLO Total Hours - By Employee As of 7/31 /301
PayPerfud {aly i~ : ‘

Sum af YTBhrs Dept 15|+ ‘
‘Enployes Name v 11 21 31 32 42 Graud Total
[Alava, Regiua 2.00 2,001
!,C:'oﬂm‘.-a, Teonelle 2.00 8,00
3 Jeung, Cecthla 160 100/~
iLia_ug. Shzorang . 128 125
Molabt, Mohammed | 100 _ o0
!?adway, Carol L 550 5501
jPrarce, Scott L 7EG0 . .78.00]-
Vass, Michele ) 63.75] 63.75| ~
Wilson, David 1775 1715
i, Winale 075 0,75~
!Grand Total - 95.75 5,50 .00 560 63.75 174,00

N
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July 2010 DO Detafl for Golden Stite Mirtial ¢ode 996; vendor codo 2593
$556.00 vendor code 2993

Gsldon Biate Hotual Lifa faaursrse Corpany ?? 5
TRCE BN *
Dy ertad tark Nouts FATY Entynt  Dasctiption
. 3 . 13% F0B.3 cheCY tLAL EOLENETR 4n T3 gad eihar staterr caesh dTaluiary
Fyepao " ts ;'x-:cu; [y slrfmiraval
LR A 1 it S 1 Ly A4 THIAD AjTeErmaLE
8 -dpL-10 " 1 114 tI9.4%  venh FpravEsita

Fd i) (35 194,28 faham sgrecaals
a13Y Aeppsit wakterd

jASRIE 4% 2
19 2% 4 M -3 113 3¢, 15

SERE Tephoyes | R $534.8) : \_ﬁ\)
Qsi Friste 1.02 L1 T Iy | -

16,9967 vendor code 669

..@-ﬁ’.a P

6.25 hours @170.00=$1,062.50

ENMUNB G, EROWN SR Stafe pf Crlifprnty £25%
Atiornay Gereral . DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE
. 12031 SRew, Saorprend, CA, S50H4
Biing loqitent (18 1345009
Summary of Ledal Sarvices Az oty 31, 2010
Clinl Agenoyr  Conseivalion & Liquidation
Client Agency # 03351 ’

Bllitag Constant:  100.04 % |

Frotoasloned Typs: Attarnoy

Rate: $170.00

Arsa of Lave: OV.BATIIID
Hafter Type: Dxnkrupice

MatiseDesedpion Cent Acotrad Lo .
LAZOMSEG1 128 Fremont Garierdl (0OF) sy (37 57 250 o808 500
Mader Yypar ChH chixe
Muterdp . Hoder Dosertptlon ChonfAstiurt Code
S LASOMAN0NH  [AknAte Cormiisioner v. Sopriior Matonsl W k2403 1A+ 009 0 ISy
Malter Tveas GMLTdak
MMy Hatter Danedpilen Cienf Aaount Cods
LAZODPCVOHY NG GOM Y HATIONAL AUTO. e 10 7] "M ¥ T
Mt Tvese Qasartfonindditlon 878
0 IaRLECaEAN CEn Aicourt Godd [ S
70 Innrents Commisontr v, Gotden S i La 1y, Co. [0 623 413 0o 435 s 7
& e : 996 |t g
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Jiily 2010 T¥avel Bxpense Detailfor Golden State Mistual code, 996;

$8,128.42 July g/l - $6,559.97 billed in June for July + $5,439.03 Augnst
1,978.50 July g/l - $1,851.50 bitled in Jun for July

=$7,134.48
Frial Balance { Ledger Comparison - Work With Account Locdger

fewet  Fid | Clme Eorm  Bow Heger Teew 0 T T T )
Dt Ol Mom EF I

: it - '};.;vaf-smp(oyaa

fAccount [ oEa.agaTe.

‘Ledger Tyne 1 A& ' Ganemi Ledger From Date = FFaTmTe
:Ladﬂﬁ'f Typa 2 f—_—-————‘ rom Ot - ?7’?-”?3?6—
;.‘l’ypusul:ladua{ E E:. N .

T Grpostes CrUnposted ‘& A DT ' v

s i et e Satlanzz oy PO Earal Hame 1y
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CONSERVATION 8z LIQUIDATION OFFICB
P.O, Box 26824

San Frandsco, CA 84126-0894

Yol 415.678.5000 Fax: 415.675.5002
WWWLCROIO.Org

Cotober 14, 2010

Golden State Mutual lnsurance Company
1899 West Adams Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 36018-3514

Involce
For services rendered/expense reimbursement for the month
of August 2010;
(document support details on following pages)
Staffing - CLO Employees $  28,36810 v
Department of lnsurance charges 69.50 7~
Department of Justice charges 1,912.50
2,273.50

Trave) Bxpense to GSM offices
Office Supplies and Courier 91.20 ~ ] J :
" Investment Expense 63,67 _ B /

Total $ 33,5113
L

" Please make your remittance payable to “Conservation and Liquidation Office.” If you have any
questions or need additional information, please contact the undersigned. Thank you,

Sincerely,

Regina Aiava
Conservation & Liquidation Office

(415) 676-5083

APPROVED: i Woed lu..Q.\ ' | 9{0/!5 /fﬁ

David B, Wilson, SDIC, Conservator
¢ 0 W
O¥ | k« t’ {‘/}/‘M |
|§§~9§2‘0‘1 ‘ Vi“:}jf" %T. t“\%i
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Attachments to July 2010 Golden State Mutual service billing
August 2010 Direct Hours Detail for Golden Stafe Mutuat code 996:

207.83 hours x $138.9024634=- $28,868.10/

A a~ ¢ D E F G K !
Estate/Pay ID 996 o] .
Month L] A-“‘{l 2010 CLO Total Houvs - By Employee A5 0f8/31/2010
PayPeyiod @an -

t

Suta of YThhys Depi-ID

Employec_nawme | v i1 21 31 3z 42 lGrand Total

Afava, Reglna . 3,25 3.25

Crathers, fennelle - 8OO g.no

feung, Ceclifa 158 1,58
] Llauy, Shaorong 1.00 1.00
1 Minehan, Hay | 1.99 1.30}
! Mojah, Mohammed 100 1.00
} Padway, Cavel 475 475
b Pearce, Seolt 133.00 133.00
¥ Vasy, dichele 15.50 15.50 <
i Wilson, Davi 37.00 37.00
! ¥im, Winnle 1,25 125
} Girand Totad 171,50 473 .00 7.08 1530 267.83
A
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August 2810 DOX Detail for Golden State Mutual code 996: vendar code 2992

$69.50
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Aungust 2010 Travel Expense Detail for Golden State Mutual code 996:
$2,191.50 September accrnal +382.00 September acecrual =$ 2,273,350
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CONSERVATION & L1 QUIDATION OFFICE
P.Q. Box 26894

8an Franclsco, CA 84126-0894
Tel: 416.878.5000 Fax: 418,676.5062
wLcaclo.ong

November 16, 2010

Golden State Mutual Insurance Company
1999 West Adams Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 90018-3514

Invoice

For services rendered/expense reimbursement for the month

of September 2010:
{document support details on following pages)

Staffing ~ CLO Employees 3 41,969.22
Department of Insurance charges ~36.00

Department of Justice ehatrges 3,272.50
Travel Expense to GSM offices 21,705,778
Office Supplies and Courier 50.87
Investment Expense 3.52
Accounting & Audit 76.00
Total § 6704189

Please make your remittance payable fo “Conservation and Liquidation Office.” If you have any
questions or need additional information, please contact the undersigned. Thanik you.

Sincerely,

Regina Alava
Conservation & Liquidation Office

(415) 676.5083

APPROVED: Wf (u@..,__ &/ r‘;:/ W

David B, Wilson, SDIC, Conservator Date

& 70307 tow®
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LAW QFFICES OF

EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG

}’oﬁ‘q‘f\nﬁ?ﬁp zfrmn{?mea A Professional Corporatlon
LAWRENCE ], SONG 777 S. Figueroa Street, Suite 4950
GAIL E. WiSE : Los Angeles, California 90017
ROBYNL IKEHARA . Telephone: (213) 861-7487
SHIVAS. DAVOUDIAN Fax; (213) 8617488

Mauch 23, 2010

VIA U.8. MAIL

Chief Estate Trust Officer
Attention: Scott Pearce

1999 West Adams Blvd.

Los Angeles, California 90018

RE: Invoice #7084 :
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Dear Mr, Pearce:

Enclosed is our bill for fees and expenses incurt wred in the refetenced matfer
tIn ough February 28, 2010, I have reviewed the bill and approve the billing statement, and have
determined that it complies with the Legal Services Agreement entered into regarding this

raatter.
Very truly yours,
MICHAEL R. WEISS
MRW:jbh
Enclosure

GAMGRIMICASES\I0H41 0.ORBIlling\1 22609 Witron - Peb 2010 Billng Cover Latter.doo

) ‘\w



Epstein, Turner & Song
777 S, Flgusroa Sirest
Sulte 4650
Los Angeles, CA 90017
(213} 881-7487
Tax 1D 954673902

Februoary 28, 2010

Invoice# 7084 MRW

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Our file# 204410 00004

Scotl Paarce i .
otilsf Estate Trust Officer Billing through 02/28/2010
1999 Wast Adams Blvd, :
Laos Angeles, CA 80018 . ‘
s ' o F\ ﬁ“ﬁ‘%
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company ‘ *‘g‘f W«
. | -
Balance forward as of invoice dated January 31, 2010 $26,256.89
Payments received since last invoice 26,256.89
Accounts receivable balance carried forward $0.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
02/01/2010 MRW Evaluate signed termination agreement and 0.20 hrs. 59.00

power of attorney from Beaumont landlord,
prepare email to Holloway re Wilson signature

02/01/2010 MRW Evalubte phone message from Macklin re 0.50 hrs.
persons to be interviewed, review GSM
response re information on persons, prepare

: email to Holloway requesting information
02/01/2010 MRW Evaluate email from Linda Theobald at Pitney
' Bowes re lease reduction options; calculate
monthly payment amounts to match to GSM
information; prepare email to Holloway and
‘ Donovan re same

02/01/2010  MRW Review declarations, points and authorities,
notice re EEOC application

02/01/2010 MRW Prepare proposed order re EEOC application 0.60 hrs, 177.00

02/01/2010 MRW Phone conference with David Wilson re 0.20 hrs, 59.00
evaluation of bids '

02/02/2010  MRW Conference at GSM with landlord re parking 3.00 hrs. 885,00
lot issues; conference with Holloway and
Wilson re bid evaluation

02/02/2010 MRW  Prepare letter to West Adams Jandlord with

. rent '

02/02/2010 MRW Review payment of property taxes, prepare 0.20 hys.
email to West Adams landlord with proof of
payment ‘

02/02/2010 MRW Hvaluate email from West Adams landlord re 0,10 hrs. 29.50
parking lot inspection, respond to same ‘

02/02/2010 MRW Conference with RLI re research on 0.25 hus. 73.75

147.50

1.10 hrs, 324.50

1.20 hrs, 354,00

0.25 hrs. 7315

59.00



204410
02/02/2010

02/02/2010

02/02/2010
02/02/2010
02/02/2010
02/02/2010
02/02/2010
02/02/2010
02/03/2010
(2/03/2010
02/03/2610
02/04/2010
02/05/2010
02/05/2010
02/07/2010
02/07/2010
02/07/2010

02/07/2010

02/08/2010

02/08/2010
02/08/2010

02/08/2010

02/08/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
RLI

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

mutualization

Evaluate email from M. Smith re continuance
of status report hearing

Finalize draft of application for approval of
Consent decree, prepare email to Loughlin,
Hairston and Holloway

Bvaluate bids, phone conference with
Hofloway re same '

Evaluate emails from Donovan re information
for City of Chicago

Conference with Robyn re mutualization
Review Notth Carolina Ins. Bid

Evaluate requirements re de-mutualization
Legal research re procedure for
de-mutualization of insurance company,
Prepare letter to Beaumont landlord with Lease
Amendment and rent

Conference at Golden State re evaluation of
bid proposals

Bvaluate lease amendment from Charlofte
landlord

Phone conference with 1A representatives ro
1A bid

Prepare bid selection criteria compliance and
deficiencies memo for Liberty Bankers
Evaluate request for continuance documents
from M. Smith re Status Report hearing
Prepare bid selection eriteria compliance and
deficiencies memo for North Carolina Mutual
Prepare bid selection criteria compliance and
deficiencies memo for Manhattan

Prepare bid selection criferia compliance and
deficiencies memo for Connecticut

Bvaluate Insurance Code insolvency
provisions, cases re mutualization of insolvent
company

Prepare bid selection criteria compliance and
deficiencies memo for IA American

Revise bid selection criteria memos

Prepare email to Holloway with bid selection
criteria memos

Prepare email to Eva Ott at InSource re status
of final invoice

Evaluate Invoice from E, Ott re Insource
Apreement, draft release paragraph to add to
Invoice

Invoice# 7084

0.10 hrs,
0.75 lus,

4.00 hrs.
0.20 hrs,
0.25 hts,
0.50 hrs.
2.20 hrs,
1.40 hrs.
0.30 hrs,
7.50 hts,
0.30 hus.
0.90 hrs,
2.50 hrs.
0.20 hrs,
1.30 hrs,
1.20 hrs.
0.75 hus.

1.40 hrs,

0.80 hrs,

0.50 hrs.
0.20 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.40 hrs,

Page 2

29.50

221.25

1,180.00
59.00
73.75
147.50
649.00
350,00

88.50

2,212.50

88,50
265.50
737.50

59.00
383.50
354.00
221.25

413,00

236,00

147,50
59.00

59.00

118.00



204410-
02/08/2010

02/08/2010

02/08/2010
02/08/2610

02/08/2010
02/09/2010

02/05/2010
02/09/2010

0210972010
02/09/2010

02/06/2010

02/09/2010

02/09/2010

02/09/2010

02/10/2010

02/11/2010
02/11/2010
02/11/2010

02/11/2010

02/11/2010

Instrance Commissioner

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

Evaluate email from M, Smith re Status Repott
hearing; coordinate secretary re same

Prepare for DLSE hearing on R. Cartwright
Evaluate court order from M., Smith

Bvaluate Second Amendment to Lease for
Charlotte property; prepare email fo broker r¢
revisions

Evaluate email from Donovan re alternatives
regarding the mortgage portfolic for IA's bid
Conference with J, Harrington re Labor
Commissioner hearing

Leave message for D. Macklin at Chicago
Human Relations re information requested
from GSM

Evaluate invoice from InSource with telease
language, prepare email to Holloway re
payment

Phone conference with Harrington re
preparation for Labor Commissioner hearing
Bvaluate email from Donovan re bid
discrepancies in IA bid

Prepare for hearing at Oakland labor
commissioner re Cartwright maiter, review
DLSE procedures, outline anticipated
testimony

Prepare email to Holloway re EEOC
settlement application

Revise Second Amendment to Lease for
Charlotte property, prepare email to Holloway
re same

Phone conference with Labor Commissioner
Danny Gee re Childs matter

Labor Comimissioner’s Hearing on R.
Cartwright matter in Oakland; conference with
Holloway et al re TA bid

Phone conference with Holloway re landlord’s
inspection of murals

Phone confetence with B. Ascher re mural

‘inspection

Review and respond to email from Henderson

re same
Bvaluate collection agency agreement;
conference with Holloway re same; leave
message for agency re needed revisions to
comply with California insurance statutes
Conference with Holloway, Peatce, Donovan
and TA representatives re bid review questions;

Invoice# 7084

0.10 hus.
0.75 hrs.
0.10 hrs,
0.50 lus.
(.20 hzs.

0.25 hrs.

" Q.10 hrs.

0.25 hrs,

0,10 hrs.
0.10 hrs,

1.60 lus,

0.10 s,

0.25 his.

0.10 hus,

12.30 hrs,

0.20 hys,
0.25 hrs,
0.10 hrs.

0.40 hrs,

2,70 hrs,

Page 3’

29,50

221.25
29.50
147.50

59.00
73.75

29.50

73.75

29.50
29.50

472,00

29.50

- 7305

29,50

3,628.50

59.00
73.75
29.50

118.00

796.50



204410
02/11/2010

02/11/2010
02/11/2010
02/11/2010

02/11/2010
02/12/2010

02/12/2010
02/12/2010
02/14/2010

02/14/2010
02/15/2010

02/15/2010

02/15/2010
02/16/2010
02/16/2010

02/16/2010
02/16/2010

02/16/2010
02/16/2010
02/16/2010

02/16/2010

02/17/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

Phone conferences with landlord's
representative and attorney re visual inspection
of murals

Prepare email to E. Safaie re visual inspection
of murals

Review and respond to emails with H,
Henderson scheduling the mural visit
Evaluate email from Donovan re errors in bid
criteria memos revise emall to chents
Bvaluate & i
Conference at GSM with landlord's historical

architect and conservators re murals,

‘Phone confemece with Holloway re mural

inspection

Review and respond to erail from Donovan re
sale of 2706 property

Prepare letter to OneSource with final invoice
payment

Further revise Charlotte rent agreement
Phone conference with C. Mulhollin re
collection agreement

Evaluate email from Peter Kane and sale
agreement for Long Beach property; prepate
email to Kane re CAR agreement

Legal Research re Commasswnex'v subpoena
power re g e

Evaluate and revise CAR sale agreement for
Long Beach property

Phone conference with C. Mulhollin re
collection agreement

Review and revise collection agteement
Phone conference with P, Kane's office re
purchase agreement

Phone conference with Donovan re same
Phone conference with J, Winter re
continuance request

Phone conference with ¥, Safaie re film crew
in the parking lot; phone conference with
Holloway re same

Prepare email to C. Mulhollin with revised
collection agreement; prepare comparison
version of revised agreement

Review and revise purchase agreement for
Long Beach property; emails to Donovan and
Jackson; phone conference with same re

Invoice# 7084

0.20 hrs.

0.10 hrs.
0.25 hrs.
0.40 hs,

0.40 s,
3,75 huis,

0.10 brs.
0,10 hra,
0.30 hrs,

0.40 hrs.
0.20 hrs,

0.50 hrs,

0.70 hrs.
0.70 hrs.

0.10 hus.

(.60 hrs,

0.10 hrs.

0.10 hrs,
0.10 hrs,
0.40 hrs,

0.30 hrs.

1.20 hrs,

Page 4

59.00

29.50
7375
118.00

118.00
1,106.25

29.50
29.50
88.50

118.00
39.00

147.50

206.50
206.50
2950

177.00
29.50

29.50
29.50
118.00

88.50

354.00



204410

02/17/2010

02/17/2010

02/18/2010
02/18/2010
02/18/2010

02/18/2010

02/18/2010

02/18/2010

02/18/2010
02/19/2010
02/19/2010
02/19/2010
02/21/2010

02/21/2010
02/21/2010

02/22/2010
02/22/2010

02/22/2010

02/22/2016

0272272010

Instirance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
" MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

revised agreement

Phone conference with D, Macklin at City of
Chicago re settlement offer, prepare email to
Holloway re same

Prepare email to Hollowdy with BEOC
settlement application; prepare email to EEOC
attorney and Hairston re signing settlement
agreement

Prepare email to Holloway with Charotte
Lease amendment

Review and respond to Donovan's questions on
EEOQC settlement

Review and respond to several emails from
EEOC attorney re settlement

Review approval from Wexford of collection
agrecment, prepare email to Holloway with
revised agreement

Phone conference with Holloway re retivement
issue

Phone conferences with Donovan re BEOC
settlement; review and respond to emails re
same

Phone conference with Wilson, Holloway and
1A representatives re bid

Prepare email to Wexford re signed collection
agreement

Prepare email to Charlotte landlord re signed
second amendment to lease

Evaluate emails from P, Kane's office re 2706
property )

Bvaluate email re opening escrow, signed
purchase document, trust deed

Bvaluate Holloway bid recommendation memo
Further prepare application to approve BEOC
agreement

Phone conference with Hairston re settlement
document ’

Bvaluate emails from clients re bid
recommendation

Finalize motion fot order approving EEOC
setflement; compile exhibits, finalize service
list

Phone conferences with Marta Smith re EEOC
settlement, finalizing documents

Phone conference with Holloway re bid
recommendation, assets to remain after
purchase, evaluate assumption estimates

Invoice# 7084

0.20 hrs,
0.30 hrs,
0.10 s,
0.10 hrs,

0.25 hrs,

0.20 s,

.30 hrs,

0.25 his,

1.00 s,
0.20 hrs,
0.20 hus.
0.20 hrs,
0.20 hrs.

0.30 hes.
0.40 hts.

0,10 hrs,
(0,20 s,

1,50 has.

0.30 hs,

0.30 hrs.

Page 5

5%.00

88.50

29.50
29,50
73.75

59.00

88.50

73.75

295.00
59.00
59.00
59.00
59,00

88.50
118.00

25.50
59.00

442.50

88.50

88.50



204410
02/22/2010
02/23/2010

02/23/2010

02/23/2010

02/23/2010
02/23/2010

02/23/2010
02/23/2010
02/23/2010
02/23/2010
02/23/2010
02/23/2010
02/23/2010
02/24/2010
02/24/2010
02/24/2010
02/24/2010
02/24/2010
02/24/2010
02/24/2010

02/24/2010
02/2512010
02/25/2010

02/25/2010

02/25/2010

Insnrance Cormmissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
IMT
MRW

MRW

MRW

Evaluate email from Charlotte broker re
signature page, prepare email to Holloway re
same

Review inswrance code reinsurence plan
approval requirements

Phone conference with D, Wilson, Holloway,
et al re procedures for approval of reinsurance
plan, reinsurance agreement, servicing plan
Phone conference with Robert Nunnally re
same

Phone conference with Marta Smith

Phone conference witht M. Jackson re approval
of 2706 sale agreement

Evaluate emails with Holloway, Pearce re
employment issues

Prepare letter of intent

Evaluate revised TA proposal documents
Prepare emails to Robert Nunnally re TA
proposal

Review and respond to email fiom J,
Harrington re Cartwright matter

Further prepare and revise letter of intent,
email to Nunnally

Phone conference with Joshua re murals
Review Nunnally's revisions to letter of intent,
incorporate revisions and further revise, send
to Nunnally

Finalize lefter of intent and email to clients
Evaluate emails fiom Hom and Joyce re
reinsurance agreements and approvals
Review filed documents re EBOC approval
Evaluate email from Pearce re confidentiality
Review reinsurance regulations from Joyce
Phone conference with Nunnally re letter of
intent, rehabilitation agreements

Review rehabilitation agreements and
documents from Numnally re Golden Eagle
plan and Pacific Standard plan and documents
Review case developments re asset sale and
layoffs; preliminary evaluation of WARN
compliance and BRISA issues

Phone conference with Wilson, et al re next
steps in bid selection confirmation process,
letter of intent

Evaluate retivement plan issues; advice to
employees

Evaluate claim priority of retirement plan

Invoice## 7084

0.10 hrs.

0.50 lus,

0.80 hrs,

0,70 hs.

0.20 hrs.
0.10 hrs,

0.10 hrs,
275 hrs,
0.20 hrs.
0.20 hrs,
0.10 hrs,
1.00 hrs.
0,20 hrs,
0.75 hrs,
0.60 hrs,
0.20 hrs.
0.20 hrs,
0.10 hrs.
0.50 hts,
0.20 hrs.

4.00 hrs.

0.40 hrs.

0.60 hrs.

2.00 his,

3.00 hs.

Page ©

29.50

147.50

236.00

206.50

59.00
29.50

29.50
811.25
59.00
59.00
29.50
295.00
59.00
221.25
177,00
35.00
55.00
29.50
147.50
59.00

1,180.00

118.00

177.00

390.00

885.00



204410.
. 02/25/2010

02/25/2010
02/25/2010

02/25/2010
02/2572010

02/26/2010
02/26/2010

02/26/2010

02/26/2010

02/26/2010
02/26/2010

02/26/2010
02/26/2010

EXPENSES

01/27/2010
01/28/2010
01/28/2010
02/02/2010
02/02/2010
02/03/2010

(2/04/2010

02/10/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

obligation; research bankruptcy priority
Conference with JMT re plan obligations and
advice to employees

Phone conference with Nunnalty ve rehab plan
Phone conference with O'Laughlin re
retirement plan

Phone conference with Wilson re adviee to
employees re retirement plan

Rvaluate emails from Peatce and Fom re

 statutory deposits

Prepare assumption reinsurance agreemoent
Phone conference with Nunnally re
agreements

Evaluate email from Hom re statutory deposit,
evaluate for incorporation info assumption
agreement -

Purther prepare draft of assumption
reinsurance agreement

Bvaluate rehabilitation agreement and plan
Furthe revise and prepaie draft of assumption
reinsurance agreement

Revise and prepare rehabilitation agreement
Draft application for rehabilitation

Attorney service (Golden State Mutual)

Federal Express (Dept. of Industrial Relations)

Federal Express (Dudiey Ventures)

Federal Express (Dudléy Ventures})

Mileage (15 miles @ .44/mile)

Mileage (15 miles @ .44/mile)

Federal Express (Allen Levine Family Trust}

Mileage (50 miles @ .44/mile)

Invoice# 7084

0,75 hrs.

0.75 his,
0.75 hes.

0.50 hrs.
0.20 Hrs,

6,20 hs.
1.50 hus.

0.25 his.

6.75 hrs,

- 075 tus,

1.50 his,

4.50 hys.
0.50 s,

Page 7

221,25

221.25
221.25

147,50
59.00

1,829.00
442.50

. 1375

1,991.25

221.25
442.50

1,327.50
147.50
$34,717.50

36,58
2179
19.83
19.73
660

6.60

1627,

22,00



204410  Insturance Commissioner Invoiceff 7084 Page &

02/10/201¢  Parking 23,93
02/1 (3'/201.0 Airfare 337.40
02/11/2010  Mileage (20 miles @ .44/mile) 8.80
02/22/2010  Federal Express @eputy Attorney General) 15.75
02/28/2610  Photocopy (990 pages @ .10/page) 99.00
02/28/2010  Westlaw 138.23
02/28/2610  Postage 175
02/28/2(}}0 Lexis 13250
$906.76

0.40

116.10

1.40 .

Total professional services $34,717.50
Total expenses incurred $906.76
$35,624.26

Total of new charges for this invoice

Total balance now due $35,624.26 / ];tﬁ'(/{




First

o Fax (213) 250-1197

Los Angeles {213y 250-1 114
Le 3] Directins tofegal  (213) 260-8111 & Fax (213) 250-1197
g Los Angeles (West) {310} 277-5111 o Fax (310) 277-9153
Diract lins fo legal (310) 277-7101 & Fex (310)277-8153
SUPPGI’ t Infand Emplro (951) 779-1110 « Fax (851) 7790100
o San Diego {619) 2319111 & Fax (519) 231-1361
SSI‘V}C@S San Franclsco {415) 626-3111 e Fax (415) 826-5331
. Santa Ane (714} 541-1110 = Fax (714) 6418182
Sacramento {6193 444-5111  « Fax (916)443-3111

FOR MESSENGER USE ONLY web address: firsflegalsuppori.com
CHARGE TO: AUTHORIZATION f REQUESTED BY

Epstain, Turner & Song, P.C.

MRW/MEB, Ext, 113

777 S. Flgueroa St., Sulle 4050 CHARGE REFERENCE
Los Angeles, Callfornla 90017
(213) 861.7487 204-410-04

PICK UP FROM: DELIVER TO:

Abova

TO SEE: Laura Esfrom
PHONE: Above

1999 W, Adams Bivd,
Los Anaeles, CA 90018
TO 8EE: Joe Holloway
PHONE: (323) 731-8271

[] speciaL

(7] Asar (1 Houn

REGULAR (3 to 4 Hours) RETURN Ploces
[ nexy oAy @y y ] MIGHT /WEEKEND SERVICE | Welght

[] Rusti(1 to 2Hours) PIU Time
SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS e
Fo 5%
LEGIBLE SIGNATURE DELTIME | DRIVER GHECK NO. AMOUNT
k| i 1
| 2 2 2

LIABYLITY FOR LOSE OR DAMAGE TO ITEMS LIMITED TO $250.00

MEMBER FIFRGE — CALIFORNIA ASSOCIATION OF PHOTOCOPIERS AND POCESS SERVERS

NATIOHAL ASSOCIATION OF PROFESSIONAL PROCESS SERVCESR
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; Shipment Recelpt

Address Information

Ship to: Ship from:

Donna Kilmartin Michael R, Weiss
Department of Industrial ~ Epstein, Turner & Song, P.C.
Relations

1515 CLAY STSTE 801 777 8. Figueroa Street, Suite

4950

OAKLAND, CA Los Angeles, CA

94612-1463 90017

Us Us .

000-000-0000 2138617487
.Shipping Information

Tracking number: 793224011820
Ship date: 01/28/2010
Estimated shipping charges: 21.79

Package Information

© Service type: Priority Overnight
Package type: FedBx Envelope
Number of packages: 1
Total weight: 1LBS
Declared value: 0.00USD

Special Services:
Pickup/Drop-off; Use an already scheduled pickup at my location

Billing Information

Bill transportation to: Sender
Your reference: 204-410-04
P.O. no.:

Invoice no.:

Department no.:

!‘ Thank you for shipping online with Fadex ShipManager at fadex.com,

Please Note
Fedx vl not ba raspontiofe for sny claim b sxcess of $100 par package, whather the resuft of loss, demags, detsy, nondelivery, misdetivery, or mistndormation, urlass you dociare
a highsr vahis, piry an additions! charge, docurment yout astustloss snd fia g imaly clalm, Unitalons feund s the current Fedix Service Gulde apply. Your right lo recover fiom

FodEx for any fass, hcludiag Intdnalo valus of (he prackags, loss of salos, incoma fnlartst, proft, sitomay's fuss, osly, and other forms of damaga whether direct, Incldental,
thodzed declared vaive. Recovery sannol excoed sclual documanted lass, Madmum forflams of axtraordinary

censequeniist, or spelcal is Bmited 4o the groater of $100 of theau

ke s 500, &7, Jawelry, procliots matals, nogollable § ls and plhsr ltams Bsed i our Service Sulde. Wtten cialms must ba fted within strict Ume Emite; Gonault thy

applieabls Fadfx S ervice Guida for delady. "

Ths astimpled shippiag charge may be difarent lhan the sctus! cherges for your shipment, Oifarsaces may octur bassd on ectus! walght, dimenslons, and other fasters. Consult he
of the FedEx Rats Sheats for deias an how ahipping thiergss sm caltulslud,

applicabls

hitps:/fwww . fedex.com/shipping/html/en//PrintlFrame.himl 1/28/2010



Espafiol | Cuslomer Support | FedEx Locations  Search ' 'Gn

[ A v m s o Y

Package/Envelope .. Frelght ‘;Expa;fited ! Otftce/Print Services st

S!;fp b Tracks Mar:age o " Businass Soluttons »

FedEx Ship Manager® . Logow o
¢lp

My Profils

Prepare Shipment Ship History MyLists
Yeur Shipment Details
From: ) M!CSHAF;\LI. F;'th%?fts& Package type: Fedex Envelope
EPSTE! R -
Sons, e d Plekup/Drop Off: g;a' ::a girgady sehadytad plekup at '
zg;os FIGUEROA ST STE ‘Wolghts 0.20 LBS
Daclared valua: oog UsSD
bgs ANGELES, GA 90017 Shigper account number: 228051538
21386817487 Bl transporiation fo: 2280581538
Courtasy raie quote™ 18.83
To: DENICE MARTINEZ - List ratos:
- gzugi‘.’i;}‘zgg;{?rﬁs Effactive net discount:
Biscounted variable %
SgDENIX. AZ 850042442 Spacial gervices:
BORTHO5523 Shipment Purpose;
Shipmaent type: Exprassy
Tracking no: TOB344054643 Commsrelal/iResidential Status:  Commaercial
Your refarence: 204-440-04
Ship date: - Q12872010
Sarvice type! Standard Overnight

Pizasanola

« * The courtasy rale shown hiere may be diffarent than the aciusl charges for your shipmant, Diffarences may.ocour based on aclual welght,
dlman?io?at, 3nd uther factors, Consislt the applicable Fi ndea Guids or the FedEx Rale Sheets for dalalls on how shippling charges
are coloulated. -

FedEx will not be responsitie for any clalm ln gxcess of $100 per package, whether the result of loss, damage, defay, nan-dallvary,
misdeiivary, or misinformation, unfass you dectare a highor valus, pay an addiional chargs, documant your eclual lose and e o imaly clalm,
Limitatlons found In the cusreni FadEx Sarvica Gulda apply. Your dght 1o racover from FedEx for any loss, Including inlinsle vaiue of the
packegs, s of ssles, Income Inferest, profit, atlorney’s fess, costs, and other forms of damage whether direct, indldental, consequential, or
spacial is imled to the greater of $100 or the authorzed declared value, Recovery cannof excesd aclual documentad loss. Maximum for ffams
of extracrdinary value Is $500, &.4., jawelry, precious melsls, nagoliabls Instruments and other tems listed In our Service Gulde. Written clalms
must ba filed within sidet thme limits; Consull the applicable FedEx Service Guide for delalls,

Globat Home | Srall Busingss Cenfer | Service 1o | AboUl Fedtx | [vasior Relabens | Garoers | ledax.com Terms of Use | Securlly & Privaty | 5ie Map |
This alte I3 protacled by copyright and fradomark laws under US and Intarnafions! law, All dghts raserved.© 1905+ 2010 Fedix



Espafio! | Gustomer Support | FedBx Locatlons  Search .. Go

'Package/Envelope . Frelght  Expodited .| OfflcetPrint Services 5k
Ship + Track b Manage ¢ Business Solutions r
FedEx Ship Manager® Logout e
. elp

Prepare Shipment Ship Hi

story My Lisle

1154 it

Your Shipment Detatls : .

From;: MICHAEL R. WEISS Package typo: FedEx Fnvelopa
. ggﬁ‘g?ig,c TURNER & Plekup/brop OH; .?1;31 ;acr; iadﬁr;ady scheduled plokup at
Z;; oS FIGUEROA ST 9TE Walght: 0.30 LBS
Deciared valie; 0.00 USD
:]gs ANGELES, CA 80017 Shlpper account number: 228051558
2138017407 BlH trangporfation to; 220051538
Courtasy rate quote: 16,73
Yor QENICE MARTINEZ List rates:
gggﬁéxggg%ﬁrﬁs Effective net discount;
Discountad variable %
S};GE’NIX, AZ B50042442 Speclal services:
BO2TE95323 Shipment Pufpﬁsﬁ:
Shlpmant type: Exprass
Tracking no? 798355627830 Commercial/Residantiel Statua:  Commerclal
Yaur reference: 204-410-04
Ehip date: 02/0212610
Service typs: Standard Ovemight

A

Please nole * )
- * The courtesy rate shown hare may ba differont than the sctual charges for your shipment, Differences may occur based on aclual welght,
dimensions, and other factors, Consult the applicebls EadEx Sarvite Guida or the FedEx Rata Sheats for dotails on how shipplng charges

#ra cafculsted, .
FedEx wiil not be responsible for any clalm In excass of $100 por package, whathsr the rasult of loss, demage, defay, non-delivery,

rmisdalivary, or misinformation, unless you declare & higher value, pay on addilonal charge, documant your sctval loss and file a imely clalrm.
Limitations found i the cument FedEx Sarvice Guida apply, Your right lo recover from FadEx for anty foss, Incleding Inidnsle valus of the
package, loss of sales, ncome interest, profi, allomey's foes, coste, and elher forms of damage whether direct, incidental, consaquential, or
spechal Is limitad to the graetaer of $100 or the autharized declared valve, Recovery cannot exceed actual documentad [ozs, Maxinum for fams
of axirsordinary velue Js 3500, e.g., Jewelry, preclous melels, negotiabla Instruments and other ltems Nsted Ia our Service Guido, Wrllten ¢ialms

must ba fled within strict limae limiis; Sonsult the epplicable FedEx Sorvice Gulde for detalls,

Global Homa | Small Busthesa Centor | Servien Info | Aboul FedEx | Investor Rajations | C;zraers ] fedex.com Terms of Use | Security & Privacy | 5ha Map |
This site Is protacted by copyright and trademark lawa under US snd inlarnational law, All ights rescrvod.@ 1995- 2010 FedEx




Espahol | Customer Suppad | FodBx Locations  Search ;_"_ég:;‘

]

i Package/Envelope il Froight i; ‘Expadited || OfficelPrint Sorvicos sl | -
U S PV | SN M AR I

Pl -

Ship » Track » Manage » Business Sofutions »

FedEx Ship Manager® o
alp

Prepare Shipment | Ship History My Lists | Reporls

My Profile

Your Shipment Dotalls
Frem: M!CHA;E;{. % *gﬁlss Packaga typa: FadEx Envalops
EPSTEIN, ER & . u I
SONG. PG, | Plckup/Drop Off: m;al oacg g(l,rgady scheduled plekup st
3T FIBUEROA ST STE Welght: 0.30 188
0
Declared value: 0.00 USD
i}gs ANGELES, CA 90017 “Shipper account number: 226051538
2138617487 Bl transportation to: 226051638
Courtesy rals quatest 18.27
To: ATTN: ALLEN L, LEVINE List rates:
;\g{, %P;LEWNE FAMILY Effactive net dlscount:
Olscounted vartable %
5;%?} WHITE OAK AVE UNIT Spoclal sorvices: Resldentis! defivery
ENCING, CA 913162407 = ShipmontPurgose;
us Shipment type; Exprass
8187887675 CommercialiResidontial Stafus:  Resldentlal
Tracking no: 788383763255
Your referance; 204-410-04
Ship date: O04f2010
Service type: Btandard Overnight
Piease note: -
- * Tha courtesy rale shown here may ba different than the actual charges for your shiprenl. Diffsrences may oocur based on actual weight,
dimens!aic}?s? snd other factors, Consult the epplieabls FedEx Service Guide or tha FedEx Rale Shaets for detalls on how shipping chamges
ere calcutated, .
FadEx will not be responsible for any clalm In excass of $100 per packege, whether tha result of loss, damage, defay, non-delivary,
misdefivary, or misinfarmation, unless you daclare a bigher value, pay an addilonal charge, docurneril your gctual 1083 and fite a Umely clalm,
Limitations found I tha current FedEx Service Gulds apply, Your right 1o recaver from FedEx for any loss, Including intrinale vaive of the
package, loss of sales, income interest, profit, atiorney's fess, cosls, and other forms of damage whether direot, incidentel, conseguantial, or
speclal Is {imited {o the greater of $100 or the awthorzed declared valua. Recovery cannat excead actual documsriled foss, Maximum for items
of exiraordinery value Is $560, 0.g., Jswalry, pracious metals, negotiabls instrumants and other Bams fisled in our Service Gulde, Wrillen claims
must be filed within strict time lmits; Consult the appilcable FedEx Servica Guide for dalalls,
] tvester Rolations | Coreers | fedad.oom Tenms of Use | Security & Brivacy | Site Map |

Glabal Homa [ Small Bustess Center | Seevica Infa | About FedEx
This shte Is protacted by copyright and {rademark laws under US and Infematfonsl law, Al ights reserved.© {895- 2040 FedEx




Judith Hering

Page 1 of2

From: mm@ets!aw.ccm'
Sent:  Tuesday, March 02, 2010 5:53 PM

To: Judith Hering
Subject: Fw: Tickelless Confirmation - WEISS/MICHAEL RICHARD - QDKSTU

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

Trom: "Southwest Airlines” <SouthwestAirlincs@luv.southweét.com>
Date: Mon, 8 Feb 2010 13:52:15 -0800

To: <MRW@ETSLAW.COM> .
Subject: Ticketless Confirmation - WEISS/MICHAEL RICHARD - QDKSTU

Recelpt and Itinerary as of 02/08716 3:52 £M

Conflrmation Number

QDK9TU
Confirmation Date; 02/08/10 ‘ : -
Received: MICHAEL WEISS BY ICBM - Be prepared when you get thorel
Consult Travel Guide for relevant
‘ tips from real travelers.
Passenger Informatioh
Ticket# Explration’

Passenger Name __Account Number

WEISS/MICHAEL RICHARD

: 5262180893139  02/08/11
1 Al travel fnvolving funds from this Gonfimation Number must be completed by the oxplration date,

itinerary
Depart: LOS ANGELES INTL to OAKLAND CA ( Travel Thme: 1 hrs 25 ming }
Date Flight Routing Datalls

"Wed Feb 10 #0422  Depart LOS ANGELES INTL (LAX) at 7:00 AM
' Arrive iIn OAKLAND CA (OAK) at 8:256 AM

Return: OAKLAND GA to LOS ANGELES INTL ( Travel Time: 1 hrs 20 mins )

Date Flight  Routing Detalls

Wed Feb 10 # 1803 Depart OAKLAND CA (OAK) af 4:00 PM
Arrive In LOS ANGELES INTL {LAX) at 5:20 PM

Cost and Payment Summary

Base Fare - . $293.96
+ Exclse Taxes $£22.04
Advertised Fare $316.00
+ Segment Fee $7.40
+ Pagssenger Faclily Fee  $8.00
+ Securlty Fea? $5.00
TFotal Bayment:  ~ $337.40

37212010
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wA% » Shipment Receipt

Address Information
Ship to: Ship frem:
Marta L. Smith Michael R. Weiss

Deputy Attorney General vBpstein, Turner & Song, P.C.
300 S SPRING ST STE 777 S. Figueroa Street, Suite

1702 ' . 4950
LOS ANGELES, CA Los Angeles, CA
900131256 90017
Us Us :
(213) 897-2483 213861748’}"

Shipping Information .
.Tracking number; 798413359753
Ship date: 02/22/2010

" Estimated shipping charges: 15.75

Package Information

Service type: Priority Overnight
Package type: FedEx Envelope
Number of packages: 1

Total weight; I1LBS

Declared vatue: 0.00USD

Special Services:
Pickup/Drop-off: Use an already scheduled pickup at my location

Billing Information

Bill transportation to; Sender
Your reference: 204-410-04
P.O.no.:

Invoice no.:

Department no.; |

Thank you for shipping anline with Fedex ShipManager at fedex.com.

Plense Note

| FadExwik not be rasponsivla for any elsin in axvese of $100 par package, whethar i raxpit of loss, damage, delay, non-dativary, misdsllvary, o misinfoemalion, unlets you detlare
#'higher vahe, pay an additional chorgs, decument your actoal loss and fHie & Umely dlalm, Umitelions fousid ia the curvent FedEx Snrvica Gulde epply, Your ighl to tacover frem
FadEy for any loss, inoluding inlonafe valve of ha package, Jess of salas, noome Inlerest, proft, oliomnay's feos, chsta, nd othior formsa of damage whathor Srach, Lacldanisl,
conssauantal, or apekat it iimiled to the praster of $10G or the suthortzed dectared valus, Recovary eannet svcend atturl documantsd loss. Maintum for flsmy of extaordinary
valus 15 $500, 8.9., Jewalry, pracicus matsls, negotieble Instruments snd oiher Kems fsed In our Serdca Gulds, Wiillen clsims mustbe filad within strct Ume Bmits; Consult the
appiicabls FedEx Senice Gulde for datals,
The estimalad shipplag charge may be dfsrent than S actusl charges for your shipment, Diferences may oceur based on aclual weighl, dimanstons, and ofher factors, Consult e
applicable o the FodEx Rate Shasls for delails on fow shipping charges are tsleviatad,

hitne Hurarw foder comfehinnino/mb/en//PrintTFramea. him1 AT H



Law Firm

EPSTEIN TURNER & SONG
LOS ANGELES, CA 90017

Cllant

Cllent ID:204-410-04
Enter a Client Name:
Enter Address1:
Enter Address?2:

Cily, Stale ZIP

Westlaw Research Charges through 02/28/2010

Included Leqal Research

2i2/2010
213/2010
2772010
2182010
2/15/2010
27232010
2/2512010

Wastlaw Legal Research
Wastlaw Legal Research
Woestlaw Legal Research
Westlaw Legal Research
Westlaw Legal Research
Waesllaw Legal Research
Westiaw Legal Research

Exctuded Logal Research

Enter An Involce Number:
Lisage perfod; 02/01/2010 - 02/28/2010

Standard Charge
$700.50
$547,50
$350,00
$100.00
$161.16
$394.48
$459,60

Sub-total Included Charges

Sub-total Excluded Charges
Sub-totel research Charges
Tax Charge

Total Cliont Charge

Cllanf Charge

$35.69
$27.69
$17.83

$5.09

$8.21
$20.10
$23.42

T $138.23
Cllent Charge
T 0,00
T$138.23
$0.00
S
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Trom: Pearce, Scolt (PearceS@caclo.org)
To: docmurphy703@yahoo.com;

Date: Tue, March 30, 2010 8:34:45 AM
Ce:

Subject: FW: Epstein Turner Invoice

Hey Mutph, here's Wilson's. I'll be sure to get you in the front of this from now ont. I just got

Nunnally's bill.

From: Wifson, David

Sent: Tue 3/30/2010 8:22 AM

To: Holloway, Jog; Pearce, Scott
Ce: Ocamypo, Mary Anne

Subjects RE: Epsteln Turner Involce

I approve the bill for payment.

David B. Wilson

CEO, 8DIC
Conservation and Liquidation Office

495 Market St, 23rd FL
San Francisco, CA 94105

Phone: 415-676-2120
Fax; 415-294-9034
e-mail: wilsond@caclto.org

----- Original Message---—

From: Holloway, Joo

Sent: Tuesday, March 30,2010 2:28 AM
To: Pearce, Scott; Wilson, David

Ce: Ocampo, Mary Amme

Subject: Re: Epstein Turner Involce

Approved

v e A S B A S

Sent using BlackBerry

weae-Original Message-»--

From: Pearce, Scott <PearceS@caclo.org”

To: Wilson, David <W lsonD@caclo.org™; Holloway,
CC: Ocampo, Mary Anne <OcampoM@ceclo.org”
Sent; Mot Mar 29 16:53:24 2010

Subject; Bpstein Turner Invoice

Joe <HollowayJ@caclo.org>

David and Jos!

Attached is Mike's February bill, the numbers tie and the billing is accurate to the support and work we divected hin to do. 1

recommend the bill for payment.

are in agreement T would ask that you yespond affiymatively by email or ofherwise, Given travel schedules, 1

If both of you
get signatures from both of you when you're Bboth back in the office,

infend to support the approval with emails, Mae can

Mae please keep & hard copy of this bill. Thanks.

et O enn AT 2rathha?nd 3/30/2010



Print Page 2 of 2

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
This message and any attachments ate from the Conservation & Liquidation Office and are intended

only for the addressee. Information contained herein is confidential, and may be privileged ot exempt
from disclosure pursuant to applicable federal or state law. This message is not intended as a waiver of
the confidential, privileged or cxempted status of the information transmitted. Unauthorized forwarding,
printing, copying, distribution or use of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful, If
you are not the addressee, please promptly delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery etror

by e-mail or by calling the Conservation & Liquidation Office at (415)676-5000.

£ MM (LI B S AiandnnA s



LAW OBFICES OF

EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG
mg: ASi%TIT;ITRNER A Professional Corpomtion‘
LAWRENCE. SONG 777 S. Figueroa Street, Suite 4950
GAILE, WISE Los Angeles, California 90017
ROBYN L IKEHARA Telephone: (213) 861-7487
SHIVAS. DAYOUDLAN Fax: (213) 861-7488
April 30, 2010
VIA U.S, MAIL

Chief Estate Trust Officer
Attention; Scoit Pearce

1999 West Adams Bivd.

Los Angeles, California 30018

RE: Inveice #7136
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Dear My, Pearce:

Enclosed is our bill for fees and expenses incurred in the referenced matter
through March 31, 2010. I have reviewed the bill and approve the billing statement, and have
determined that it complies with the Legal Services Agreement entered into regarding this

matter,
iy “)\% 'qﬁ Very truly yours,
964tk Moo=
MICHAEL R. WEISS
MRW:jbh
Enclosure

GMGRPUCASES\204- 410 0Dl ng\ 22809 Wilsor - Mur 2050 Billing Cover Lettendoc



Epstein, Turner & Song .
777 8. Flgusroa Streef
Sulte 4950
Los Angeles, CA 80017
{213) 861-7487
Tax 1D 954673902

March 31, 2010

Invoicef 7136 MRW
Our file## 204410 00004

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company . -
Billing through 03/31/2010

Scott Pearce

Chief Estate Trust Officer
1996 Wast Adams Blvd,

. Los Angetes, CA 90018

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Balance forward as of invoice dated  February 28, 2010 $35,624.26
Payments received since last invoice 35,624.26

Accounts receivable balance catried forward

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES '

03/01/2010  JMT  Review pertinent portions of pension plan to 1.00 hrs, 295.00
evaluate impact of merger, sale and early

retirement options
03/01/201¢ MRW Revise assumption and rehabilitation 3.00 hrs. 885.00
agreements; incorporate revisions from
Nunnally; email to clients
03/01/2010 MRW Phone conference with Nunnally re revisions 0.50 hrs. 147,50
to agreements
0.50 hrs, 147.50

03/01/2010 MRW Rvaluate draft court order re rehabilitation plan
from Nunnally
03/01/2010  MRW Prepare court application for approval of
: agreements and plan
03/01/2010 MRW FBvaluate emails from M. Smith re changes to 0.60 hrs, 177.00
agreements, incorporate changes

6,10 hrs. 1,799.50

03/01/2610 MRW Rvaluate emails and documents from Donovan 0.20 hrs, 59.00
re GSM matters, email from Peter Kane;
respond to Donovan emails
03/02/2010  IMT  Memo to MRW re retirement plan 0.40 lus. 118.00
03/02/2010 MRW Evaluate email from Wilson re offective date 0.10 hus, 29.50
03/02/2010 MRW Revise agreements te effective date and 0.50 hrs. 147.50
service agreement references
03/02/2010 MRW Evaluate email from Donovan with revisions 0.30 hus, 88.50
fo agreements
1,740.50

03/02/2016 MRW Further prepare application for court approval, 5.90 hus.
evaluate insurance code and cases re authority

for rehab plans, legal research re same
03/02/2010 MRW EByaluate spreadsheets re asset transfers from 0.30 hrs. 88.50
Jennifer Murphy .



204410
03/02/2010
03/03/2010

03/03/2010
03/03/2010

03/03/2010
03/03/2010

03/03/2010
03/03/2010
03/03/2010
03/03/2010
03/04/2010
03/04/2010
03/04/2010
03/04/2010

03/04/2010
03/04/2010
03/04/2010

03/04/2010

03/05/2010

03/05/2010

03/05/2010
03/05/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

Phone conference with Nunnally re Todd's
revisions to agreements, asset schedules,
claims

Review retirement plan docurments in prep for
PBGC meeting

Phone conference with PBGC representatives
Phone conference with Scott, Todd and
Jenmnifer re Pension Plan

Phone conference with Joe re same

Revise agreements with Todd's revisions, add
revisions re waiver of claims, bid deposit,
claim priority

Further prepare court application

Plone conference with clients re ngreements
Phone conference with Nunnally re strategy ol
agreements

Prepare supplement to Conservator's status
conference report

Phone conference with Darnell Macklin re
Belcher claim ,
Further prepare and revise status repott
supplement

Phone conference with S, Peatce re health
coverage

Further revise rehabilitation and reinsurance
agreements _

Phone conference with Nunnally re revising
agroements; furthet prepare agreements and
email to Nunnally

Evaluate emails from clients, M. Smith re
revisions to status report supplement; revise '
report

Phone conference with clients re revisions to
status report supplement; furthet revise report
and email to Marta Smith

Review and revise agreements after Nunnally's
revisions; email to clients

Phone conferences with D. Macklin at City of
Chicago re Belcher and Grady claims, evaluate
Jetter from Macklin re documents required;
phone conference with Holloway re status of
investigation

Review assumption agreement revisions from
Nunnally

Draft intro and facts for court application
Phone conference with Nunnally ve status of
agreements

Tnvoice##t 7136

Page 2

0.75 s, 22125
0.50 hrs. 14750
0.60 hrs. 17700
(.50 hrs. 147.50
0.20 hrs. 59.00
2.25 hrs. 66375
1.20 hos, 35400
1.00 hus. 205.00
0.60 hrs. 17700
2:80 his, 82600
. 0,25 hrs. 7375
0.75 hrs. 22125
0.10 Ios, 2950
3.00 hrs. 885,00
1.20 hrs. 354.00
0.50 hus. 147.50
1.25 hrs, 368.75
1.00 hrs, 20500
0.40 hrs, 118.00
0.25 hus. 7375
2.40 hrs. T98.00
0.20 hrs. 59.00



204410
03/05/2010
03/05/2010

03/07/2010

03/07/2010
03/08/2010
03/08/2010

03/08/2010
03/08/2010
03/08/2010
03/08/2010

03/09/2610

03/09/2010

03/09/2010
03/09/2010
03/09/2010
03/09/2010
03/09/2010
03/09/2010
03/09/2010
© 03/09/2010

03/09/2010

03/09/2010

03/09/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

Prepare email to clients re same

Brief review of agreement and email from
Joshua Solomon

Revise draft of court application for
rchabilitation plan approval, fact background,
key components of plan, requested orders,
conservator's recommendation and grounds
Evaluate emails from clients re rehab
agreements

Evaluate emails from Donovan re agenda for
meeting with IA American

Revise agreements to incorporate D, Wilson's
revisions

Finalize agreements for sending to IA
American; prepare email to IA American
counsel Greg Morris
Evaluate |

Evalualc Invest: gative Order
Prepare letter to D, Macklin at city of Chxcago ‘
re response to Investlgatwe 01 dex

Phone conference w
prepare email to clienis re same

Evaluate

Phone conference DLSE in Oaldand re status
of hearing decision

Prepare email to clients re same

Review and respond fo email re status report
Coordinate secretary reig

Phone conference with clients and A
Fvaluate email from Nunnally re info on Greg
Morris, evaluate bio on Morris

‘Prepate email to Marta Smith re Supplement to

Status Report, review filed report

Phone conference with Pearce and Donovan re
2706 Long Beach property,

Prepare email to clients with status report
doctments, email to M. Smith re preparation
for hearing

Evaluate emails and letter re request for
extension on sale of Long Beach property
Prepare email to M. Smith re preparation for
statns repott hearing, prepare email to D,

Invoiceft 7136

0.10 hrs.
0.25 hus,

5.50 hrs,

0.20 ts.
0.20 hrs,
0.25 hrs.

0.60 hrs,

0.60 hrs,

0.20 hrs.

0.25 hus.

0.50 hrs.

1.50 hrs.

0.20 hrs.
0.10 hrs,
0.10 hrs.
0.20 hrs.
(.80 hrs.
0.25 hus.
0.20 hrs,
0.40 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.25 hrs.

0.20 hs,

Page 3

29.50
73.75

1,622.50

59.00
59.00
73,75

177,00
177.00
59.00
73.75

147.50

442,50

59,00
29,50
2950
59.00
236.00
73.75
59.00
118,00

59.00

73.75

59.00



204410

03/09/2010

03/09/2010
03/09/2010

03/09/2010

03/10/2010
03/10/2010
03/10/2010
03/10/2010
03/10/2010
03/10/20 1.0
03/10/2010
03/10/2010
03/10/2010
03/10/2010
O3/l 1 1/2‘010
03/11/2010
03/11/2010
03/11/2010
03/11/2010
03/11/2010

03/11/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
JES

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

Wilson re same

Review and respond to email from Donovan re
information needed for City of Chicago
investigation

Prepare email to Donovan re scheduling
conference call on Status Report

Further review and revise court application for
rchabilitaton plan, email to Nunnally
Evaluate and compile documents for
production in response to City of Chicago
Investigative Order, prepare letter to D.
Macklin with City of Chicago

Evaluate hotne office lease option deadlines,
prepare email to Scott re same

Phone conference with Pearce re LA Police
investigation

Prepare calendar re upcoming deadlines for
GSM

Prepare email to clients re Grady complaint
with City of Chicago dismissed

Review revisions from Nunnally for court
application

Phone conferences with LAPD re fraud
investigation

Evaluate Chicago employee list from
Harrington

Evaluate emails from Donovan re 2706
property

Phone conference with Det, Cortez re fraud
investigation ‘

Redaction of privileged information for
documents for production to opposition
Further prepare letter to D, Macklin re City of
Chicago Investigative Order

Rvaluate investigation documents, email to R,
Coleman

Prep for conference call with D. Wilson re
status report

Conference call with D, Wilson and M. Smith
re status report prep

Revise Court Application to mciude revisions
from Nunnally .
Evaluate To Deo list on Golden State from
Pearce

Review email from Pearce re Det. Information;

phone conferences with police department;
leave message for Det, Cottez

Invoice# 7136

0.20 hrs.

0.10 hrs.
1.90 hrs.

1.00 hrs.

0.40 hs.
0.20 hrs,
1.00 hrs.
0.20 hs,
0.25 hrs,
0.50 hus.
0.20 hrs.
0.10 ius,
0.20 hss.
1.25 hrs,
0.25 hrs.
0.50 his.
0,50 his,
0.80 hs.
0.90 hus.
0.20 hrs.

0.25 hrs.

Page 4

59.00

29.50
560.50

295,00

118.00
59.00
295.00
5900
73.75
147.50
59.00
29.50
59.00
187.50
73.75
147.50
147.50
236.60
265.50
59.00

73.75



204410
03/11/2010
03/11/2010

03/12/2010
03/12/2010

03/14/2010
03/14/2010

03/14/2010
03/15/2010

03/15/2010
03/15/2010
03/15/2010
03/15/2010
03/15/2010

03/16/2010

03/16/2010
03/17/2010

03/17/2010
03/17/2010
03/17/2010
03/17/2010
03/18/2010
03/18/2010

03/18/2010
03/18/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

Prepare bill of sale

Review email from M. Smith's office re status
report information

Court - Status Report

Phone conference with M. Smith re Status

"Report and BEOC approval application

Evaluate application to approve EEQC
settlement re Judge Yaffe's notice requirement
Evaluate documents to prepare re Re-notice
Status Report; Prepare email to clients re
Status Report

Further prepare bill of sale

Fvaluate email from M. Smith re filing and
service of declaration for status report; phone
conference with Smith re same

Review and respond to Holloway email re
declaration for status report

Phone conference with Detective Cortez re
fraud investigation; prepare email to Det,
Prepare email to S, Pearce and J. Holloway re
information Det. Cortoz wants for fraud
investigation .

Prepare email fo Det. Cortez

Review and respond to emails from clientsre
COCs and service list for Status Report
declaration; review list

Phone confence with T. Donovan re Status
Report documents

Review email from Holloway re [A
Evaluate¥ wolioy file, compare
signatures; prepare email to T, Donovar re
identification of signatures; prepare email to
Det. Cortez

Phone conference with Donovan re Status
Report, fraud investigation

Draft notice of Status Report hearing
Review documents from clients re retirement

Coordinate secretary re minute order from
March 12 hearing

Review and respond to emails from clients re
fraud imvestigation

Phone conference with Det. Cortez re fraud
investigatin

Review and respond to email from Nunnally
Prepare emails to clients re fraud investigation

Invoice# 7136

1.20 his.
0.10 hus,

5.30 hus.
0.50 hrs.

0.40 hrs,

.50 hus.

0.80 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.10 hrs.

0.40 hus.

0.30 hrs,

.10 hrs.
0.30 lus.

0.20 hrs,

© 0.10 hrs.

1.20 hrs.

0.30 hrs.

0.50 hrs,
0,40 hrs.

10.10 hs.

0,10 hrs.
0.30 hs.

0.10 hrs,
0.20 hrs.

Page 5

354.00
29.50

1,563.50
147.50

118.00

147.50

236,00
59.00
29.50

118.00
88.50
29.50 -
88.50
59.00

12950
154,00

88,50
147.50
118.00

29.50

29.50

88,50

29.50
59.00



204410
03/18/2010

03/18/2010

03/18/2010

03/18/2010
03/18/2010

03/18/2010

03/18/2010

03/18/2010

03/18/2010
03/18/2010

03/15/2010
03/19/2010
03/19/2010
03/19/2010
03/19/2010
03/22/2010
03/22/2010

03/22/2010
03/22/2010

03/22/2010
03/22/2010
03/23/2010

03/23/2010
03/23/20610
03/23/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

Phone conference with Fred at GSM re frand
investigation

Prepare documents for April 28 Status Report
hearing - Notice of Hearing, Wilson
Declaration, Proposed Order, Preof of Service
Phone conference with Judge's Court Cletk re
minute order

Review minute order re Status Report
Coordinate paralegal re preparation of
documents for Status Report hearing

Prepare and respond to emails with M. Smith
re minute order, service of Status Report
documents

Research addresses for proof of service,
evaluate certificate of contribution addresses,
revise spreadshest to eliminate social security
numbers and amounts

Prepare email to Pearce and Donovan with
Status Report documents

Prepare Wilson Declaration re service in
support of application for approval of EEOC
seftlement

Review emails from Donovan re 2706
propeity, prep for application fo approve sale,
prepare email to Donovan re documents
Phone conference with Donovan re 2706
documents

Phone conference with Dottovan re Status
Repott, review email re same

Review part of retirement documents

Email from M. Smith with signed notice
Coordinate production of documents for status
report

Review and respond to emails from M. Smith
re status report documents

Coordinate paralegal re documents to be
copled, preparation of envelopes

Review appraisal report

Phone conference with Donovan re status
report documents

Review purchase and escrow documents
Prepare application for approval of 2706 sale
Phone conference with Nunnally re Civil Code
1457

Rvaluate anti-harassment policy

Compile documents for status repott filing
Bvaluate Civil Code 1547

Invoice# 7136

Page 6

0.20 hrs. 59.00
5.00 hrs. 1,475.00
(.20 Ius, 55.00
0.20 hrs, 59.00
(.25 hrs. 73,75
0.20 hrs, 59.00
0.75 hrs, 22125
0.50 hrs, 147.50
1.00 hrs. 29500
0.40 hrs. 118.00
0.10 hrs. 29.50
0,25 lus, 7375
0.50 hrs. 147.50
(.10 hrs. 29.50
0.25 hrs, 73.75
0.20 hrs. 59.00
0,25 hrs, 73.75
0,50 hrs. 147,50
0.10 hrs. 29.50
0.50 hrs. 147.50
3.90 hrs. 1,150.50
0.20 hrs, ~ 59.00
0.20 hrs. 59.00
0.50 hrs, 147.50
0.20 hrs, 59.00



204410
03/23/2010

03/23/2010
03/23/2010

03/23/2010
03/23/2010

03/23/2010
03/23/2010

03/23/2010
03/23/2010
03/23/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010

03/24/2010
03/24/2010

03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010
03/24/2010

03/24/2010

03/24/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

Review and respond to emails from M. Smith
re filings

Review update from TA

Coordinate clerk re copying of status report
documents and mailing

Coordinate paralegal re preparation of
documents for service re status report

Phone conference with Donovan re appraisal
report for 2706 application

Evaluate Sch. F

Legal research effect of CC 1457; Baer case,
insurance code 1043

Evaluate applications filed in Executive Life re
approval of property sales re 2706 application
Evaluate IA's changes to rehab agreement,
assumption agreement
Bvaluate letter fromy
re litigation

Phone conference with Pearce re rehab
agreement

Phone conference with Nunnally re IA's
revisions to rehab agreement

Phone conference with H, Alexander re CC
1457

Evaluate emails from IA's counsel re CC 1457
meeting ’

Phone conference with Nunnally re TA's 1457
issues

Phone conference with clients re sale issues
and strategy -

Evaluate changes outlined by Nunnally re
rehab agreement :
Futther evaluate CC 1457 issues

Phone conference with Nunnally re 1457 and
review of revisions to rehab agreement
Review and respond to emails from Greg
Morris

Phone conference with Pearce

Hvaluate revisions to Assumption Agreement
Evaluate policy language re dividends,
evaluate dividend formula

Review and coordinate service of status report
documents, coordinate clerk and secretaty re
same and filing

Phone conference with Donovan re litigation
matters

Invoice# 7136

0.25 s,

0.10 hrs,
0.30 hus,

0.75 hrs,
0.30 hrs,

0.20 hrs,
3,50 hts.

0.40 tus.
0.70 Ius.
0.20 hrs.
0.25 hrs.
0.20 hrs,
0.30 hrs.
0.20 hus.
0.50 hus,
0.80 hurs.
0.40 lus.

1.00 hrs,
0.80 hrs.

0.40 his,
0.50 hus.
0.25 hrs.
0.40 hrs.

0.25 hys,

0.20 lus.

Page 7

73.75

29,50
88.50

221,25
88.50

59.00
1,032.50

118.00
200,50
55.00
7375
59.00
88.50
59.00
147.50
236.00
118.00

. 29500
236.00

118.00
147,50

7375
118.00

73.15

59.00



204410

03/25/2010
03/25/2010
03/25/2010

03/25/2010
03/25/2010

03/25/2010
03/25/2.010
03/25/2010
03/25/2010
03/25/2010
03/25/2010

03/25/2010
03/25/2010

03/26/2010
03/26/2010

03/26/2010
03/26/2010

03/26/2010
03/26/2010
03/26/2010

03/26/2010
03/29/2010

03/29/2010
03/29/2010

03/29/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW
MRW

Phone conference with IA re 1457 transaction
Phone conference with Nunnally re same

Phone conference with Pearce re status of
1457 issues, strategy re notice to

" policyholders, dividends

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

SSD
SSD

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

Review and respond to emails from Donovan

Revise rehab agreement, phone conferences

with Nunnally re same

Phone conference with clients re rehab

agreements issues, servicing

Rvaluate cases received from Nunnally re CC

1457 and dividend issues

Prepare email to Patrik re dividend, Hill case;

respond to emails re same

Prepare email to clients re EBOC deolaration,

revise application

Prepare email to Harrington rei

hearing

Respond to status request re fraud

investigation

Conduct legal research re whether a specific

Tnsurance Code trumps application of a more

general Civil Code

Conduct legal research re whether counsel can

be present at appeal hearing of small claims

court

Further prepare application for apploval of

2706 South Streetsale

Prepare memo re rchab agreement issues for

call with JA

Phone conference with 1A re rehab agreoment

Phone conference with Peatce re status of

agteements

Phone conference with Nunnally re rehab

agreement revisions

Review Nunnally's changes to assumptlon

agreement

Review and respond to emails re meeting with

IA

Evaluate email from Pearce re dividend policy

Phone conference with J. Harrington re %8
sisdmall claims action

Phcne conference with Fred re disputed claim

Evaluate email from Davoudian re attorney

can appear at small claims appeal, review rules

Bvaluate order setting appeal, coordinate

secretary re court information

Invoice# 7136

0.50 hus.
0.25 lws,
0.50 hrs.

0.10 hus.

3,00 hos.
1.00 Hus.

1.50 hrs,

0.30 hes,

(.75 s,
.20 s,
0,10 hrs,

0,60 s,
0.20 hrs,

3.50 has,
0.80 hrs.

1.10 hrs.
0.40 hrs.

0.25 hus,
0.60 hrs,
0.10 hrs.

0,20 hrs.
0.30 hrs,

0.20 his.
0.30 hrs,

0.25 hs.

Page 8

147.50
73.75
147.50

2950
885.00

295.00
44250
88.50
22125
59,00
29.50

150.00

50.00

1,032.50
236.00

324.50

- 11800

7375
177.00
29.50

59.00
83.50

59.00
88.5¢

7375



204410
03/29/2010
03/29/2010

03/29/2010
03/29/2610

03/29/2010
03/29/2010
03/29/2010
03/25/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010

03/30/2010
03/30/2010

03/30/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010

03/30/2010

03/30/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010
03/30/2010

03/30/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
RLI

IBH

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

Evaluate revisions to Rehabilitation and
Assumption Agreements, revise agreements,
prepare redline versions

Coordinate clerk re status report invalid
addresses

Coordinate R. Ikihara re research on CC 1457
Phone conference with Pearce re agreements,
phone conferences with Nunnally re same
Phone conference with Nunnally re revisions
to agreements

Review and respond to email from 1A re
agreements

Phone conference with Beverlyn Tidwel re
2706 documents

Legal research re application of specific versus
general statutes.

Prepare response to audit lefter

Phone conference with 1A re agreements
Phone conference with Nunnally and Pearce re
open issues

Further review agreements

Finalize Wilson Declaration re BEOC
application

Bvaluate email from certificate holder, forward
fo clients

Prepate email to Tidwell with declaration for
2706 application _
Prepare letter to 4
investigation
Phone conversation of B

same

Evaluate miemo re general vs specific statute
interpretation, revise; prepare email to IA with
game

Evaluate dividend information and documents
re dividend payments
Phone conference with '
for trustee on fraud matter

Phone conference with Nunnally re bond
information and dividend issues

Prepare email to clients re status of fraud
investigation

Bvaluate email from Greg Morris re divisible
surplus issue in By-Laws

Review email from Greg Motris re policy and
assumption information

gnite, counsel

Invoice# 7136

Page 9

5.50 hus. 1,622.50
0.10 hrs. 29.50
0.20 hus, 59.00
0.25 hrs. 73.75
1.20 hus. 354.06
0.10 hrs, 29.50
0.10 hrs, 29,50
2.20 hrs. 550.00
0.50 hus. 75.00
0.50 hrs, 147.50
0.50 hrs, 147.56
0.25 hrs, 73.75
0.50 hus. 147.50
0.10 hus. 29,50
0.25 hrs. 73.75
0.25 lus, 73.75
0.25 hus, 73.75
0.60 hus, 177.00
0.75 Ius. 221.25
0.25 hs. 73.15
0.30 lus. 88.50
.20 hrs. 5900
0.26 hts. 59.00
0.10 hrs, 29.50



204410
03/30/2010

03/30/2010

03/30/2010
03/31/2010

0373172010
03/31/2010
03/31/2010

03/3172010
03/31/2010

03/31/2010

03/31/2010
03/31/2010

EXPENSES
03/11/2010

03/12/2010
03/18/2010
03/24/2010
03/30/2010
03/31/2010
03/31/2010

03/31/2010

03/31/2010

Insurance Commissioner Invoice#t 7136

MRW Evaluate email fiom Nunnally fo IA re 0.20 hrs.
dividends

MRW Review and respond to email from Fred re 0.20 hrs.
fraud case

MRW Evaluate policy forin list from Donovan 0.10 hrs,

MRW Phone conference with Nunnally re 0.50 his.
preparation for TA call

MRW Evaluate documents, bond information, mutual 0.50 hrs.
policy obligations for A meeting

MRW Further revise assumption and rehab 0.50 hrs.
agreements re exhibits

MRW Phone conference with 0.25 hrs,
supporting demurrets ‘ ’

MRW Phone conference with J. Murphy re retirement 0.10 lus.

MRW Phone conference with IA re revisions to 2.30 lus,
agreements; revise notes re call

MRW Phone conference with Nunnally re same 0.25 hrs,

MRW Evaluate closing schedules from Patrick 0.30 hus,

MRW Prepare Agenda for meeting with clients 0.60 hs.

Federal Bxpress (Chicago Commission of Human Relations)
Parking

Attorney service (Research - LASC)

Attorney service (LASC)

Attorney service (LASC)

Photocopy {16,526 pages @ .10/page)

Westlaw

Postage

Postage for mailing notice of reschedule status report hearing

Page

10
59.00

59.00

29.50
147.50

147.50
147.50
73.75

2950
678.50

73.75
88.50
177.00
$42,769.75

49.54

15,00

75.20

7.50

7.50

1,652.60

97.16

7.32

416.64



Page 11

7136

Invoice#

1ssioner

Insurance Comm:

204410
03/31/2010

50.00

Clerical for mailing nofice of reschedule of status report hearing

Billing Summary

$42,769.75

Total professional services

$2,382.46

4 A 0 e

incurred

Total expenses

$45,152.21

*

+

11§ NVOICS

Total of new charges for t}

+
£
¥
1
L
3
i
H
i
¥
3
1
1
Ed
H
¥

$45,152.21

Total balance now due

_1

AT
A%
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{Immedlata} {immediate) {Within 2 hours) {Filings Only)*
[] same DAY RESEARCH L1 asaprie L] recrFie 1 nexTDAY
(Allovr full day to abtaln) {Within 1 hour) (Withln 3-4 hours) {Fiiings Only)*
[T next oAy RESEARCH *Per Agreomen
{Allow two days to obtaln}
] ene [ 1ssue SUBMIT OTHER:
[T] researcH [ cermiFien FORM Complete by: 5010
COPY REQUEST COPY REQUEST
SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

Please get me a copy of the minute order.

Thank you. Mary Elien Bolton, ext, 113,

75.20




Law Flrm
EPSTEIN TURNER & SONG
LOS ANGELES, CA 80017

Cliant

Cliant 1D:204-410-04

Enter & Cliont Name:

Enter Addrasst;
"Enter Address2;

Clty, State ZIP

Westlaw Resovarch Charges through 03/31/2010

Included Legal Resesarch

3272010

Wesilaw Legal Research

372312010 Westlaw Legal Research
3/25/2010  Westlaw Legal Research
372812010 Waestlaw Legal Research

Exclu

L egal Regearch

Enter An invoice Number:
Usage period: 03/01/2010 - 03/31/2010

tandard Char
357022

$1,180.69
. $460.34
$160.00

Sub-total Included Charges

Bub-tolal Excluded Charges
Sub-total research Charges
Tax Charge

Total Client Charge

. Clent Chargs

$23.38
$48.79
$18.45

$6.56

$97.16

Client Charge
$0.00

$07.18

$0.00

$97.18




204410  Insurance Commissioner Invoice##t 7136 Page 11

03/31/2010 Cle_rical for mailing notice of reschedule of status report hearing 50.00
$2,382.46
JBH : .
0.50 150.00 $75.00
JES ‘
128 160,00 $187.50
JMT
1,40 20500 $413.00
MRW
140.15 265,00 . $41,34425
RLI L 2
2.20 260,00 $660.00 AR
58D
0.80 250,00 $200.00
Billing Summa
Total professional services $42,769.75
Total expenses incwrred $2,382.46
Total of new charges for this invoice $45,152.21
Total baiance now due $45,152.21
ORFP




LAW OFFICES Of

EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG
AN M. A Professlonal Corporaion
ﬁgﬁ&“&’é? sona 777 S. Figueroa Street, Suite 4950
géi& %%{%iﬁ: Los Angeles, ({zfalifomia 90017
Telephone: (213) 861.7487
SHIVA S, DAVOURIAN . Foxs (21 8 6)1-7 pisA
April 30,2010
VIA U.8, MAIL .
Chief Bsiate Trust Cfficer
Attentionr Scott Pearce -
1999 West Adams Blvd,

Los Angeles, California 90018

RE: Inveice #7136
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Dear Mr, Pearce:

. Enclosed is our bill for fees and expenses incurred in the referenced matter
through March 31, 2010, Thave reviewed the bill and approve the billing statement, and have
determined that it complies with the Legal Services Agreement entered into regarding this

matter.
Very truly youts,
W LA
MICHAEL R, WEISS
MRW:jbh

Enclosure
GVGRMICASES\04A10.0NBUg\ 122009 Witron » Mar 2010 Biing Cover Licadoe




DAVID 8, BPSTEIN
JONATHAN M. TURNER
- LAWHEBNCE ], SONG
MICHABL R. WRISS
GAILB. WISE
ROBYNI. IKBHARA

LAW OFFICES OF

EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG
A Professional Corporation
777 8. Figueroa Street, Suite 4950
Los Angeles, California 90017
Telephone: (213) 861-7487

SHIVA 5, DAVOUDIAN Pax: (213) R61-7488

May 27, 2010

" VIAU.S, MAIL

Chief Estate Trust Officer
Attention: Scott Pearce

1999 West Adams Blvd.,

Los Angeles, California 90018

RE: Invoice #7186
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company -

Dear My, Pearce:

Bnclosed is our bill for fees and expenses incurred in the referenced matter
through Aprit 30, 2010. 1 have reviewed the bill and approve the billing statement, and have
determined that it complies with the Legal Services Agreement entered into regarding this

matter,
Very truly yours,

flia ]

MICHAEL R, WEISS

- MRW;jbh

Enclosure
CHUGRPUCASEE 04 $10-04B HIngG52 110 Wiltor - Miy 2019 Billlng Coiver Letter.dos



April 30, 2010

Epstein, Tumer & Song

777 5. Figueroa Shest
Sulte 4850
Los Angeles, CA 90017
(213) 861-7487
Tax 1D’ 954673902

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Scott Pearce

Chief Estate Trust Officer
1999 Wast Adams Bivd, -
Los Angales, CA 80018

Go}dcn State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Balance forward as of invoice dated March 31, 2010 $45,152.21

Payments received since last invoice 45,152.21

Accounis receivable balance carried forward $0.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

04/01/2010 MRW Revise agenda and email to Donovan

04/01/2010 MRW Finalize declaration for Tidwell, phone
conferences with Tidwell re declaration, revise
2706 application, emails to M. Smith, revise
proof of service list

04/01/2010  MRW Review and respond to emails fiom clients re
issues on sale application

04/01/2010  MRW Phone conference with clients re agreements,
open issues with IA and estate

04/01/2010 MRW Review and respond to emails fiom Smith re
2706 application

04/01/2010 MRW Phone conference with Patrik re dividend

. information

04/01/2010 MRW Evaluate letter from cez'tlﬁcate holder

04/01/2010 MRW Prepare email to Nurinally with agency
agreements

04/01/2010 MRW Phone conferences with Donovan

04/01/2010 Evaluate email from Fred Wadibia re messages

W@ review messages, contact her

attorney

04/01/2010 MRW Finalize application for approval of 2706 sale,
compile documents, email Smith re needed
sighature page

04/01/2010 MRW Evaluate actuarial opinion

04/01/2010 MRW Prepare email to clionts with letter from
certificate holder

04/02/2010 MRW Coordinate secretary re documents to M,

Smith, filing of pleadings

Invoicé# 7186
Our file# 204410 00004

Billing through 04/30/2010

e A8 B
LA

s —o—t

s b S

b

0.25 hrs,
1.40 bys.

0.25 hrs.

150 hes.

0.20 s,
0.20 hrs,

0.10 hs.

(.30 hrs.

0.10 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

1.10 hus,

0.20 hrs,
0.10 hus.

0.20 hus,

MRW

73.75
413.00

73.75
442,50
59.00
59.00

29.50
88.50

29.50
59.00
324.50
59.00
29,50

59.00



204410
04/02/2010
04/04/2010
04/04/2010
04/05/2010
04/05/2010

04/05/2010

04/05/2010
04/05/2010
04/05/2010

04/05/2010
04/05/2010

04/06/2010
04/06/2010
04/06/2010
04/06/2010

04/06/2010

04/06/2010
04/06/2010

04/06/2010
04/06/2G10

04/06/2010
04/06/2010
04/07/2010
04/07/2010

04/07/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
- MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

Review agent agreements

Review and revise letter to annuity holders,
email to clients

Bvaluate GSM's articles of incorporation
Phone conference with Numnally re status of
agreements and information on agent
commissions

Evaluate complaint by Iilinois Masonr
Corporation

Evaluate Order Finding No Substantial
Evidence and Dismissal of Belcher City of
Chicago complaint, Investigatory Summary;
prepare email to clients re same

Phone conference with Letwis attorney re stafus
of claim for policy
Phone conference with.
re accountant letter
Evaluate email from Pearce re dividends,
Nunnally's email

Prepare for hearing on EEOC Consent Decree
Prepare email to Greg Monis re timing of
agreements

Court Appearance - Heating on approval of
Consent Decree

Phone conference with Donovan re Court
approval

Phone conference with Pearce re rehab
agreements

Evaluate email and phone call with Donovan
re fraud claim

Prepare emails to EEOC counsel re court
approval and next step for Distriot Court
approval; respond to his email

Evaluate email from M, Smith re court order
not available until Thursday, respond

Prepare letter to auditors re litigation against
GSM

Evaluate email from Wadibia re fraud claim
Bvaluate Pearce email re status of negotiations
with TA

Prepare email to Pearce re Oakland lease
Bvaluate retirement documents

' Review and respond to clients emails re rehab

agrecments

Review and respond to email from Pearce re
Oakland lease, Holloway email

Further evaluate retirement files and

Invoice# 7186

1.00 hrs.
1.00 s,

0.25 hrs,
0.20 hrs,
0.75 s,

0.75 lus,

0.20 lws,

0.10 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.60 hrs.
0.20 Ius,

3.00 hus.
0.10 hrs,
0.25 his,
0.10 hrs,

0.20 hrs,

0.10 hrs.
1.50 has,

0.10 hrs,
0.20 hrs,

" 0,10 hrs.

1.10 hrs,
0.10 hrs,

0.25 hrs,

1.20 hus.

Page 2

295.00
295.00

73,75
59.00
221.25

22125

59.00
29.50

59.00

177.00

59.00
885.00
29.50
73.75
29.50

59.00

29.50
A42.50

29.50
558.00

29.50

324,50

29.50
73.75

354.00



204410

04/07/2010

04/07/2010
04/07/2610

04/07/2010
04/07/2010

04/07/2010
04/07/2010

04/07/2010
(4/07/2010

04/07/2010
04/067/2010
04/07/2010

04/08/2010
04/08/2010

04/08/2010
04/08/2010
04/08/2010
04/08/2010

04/08/2010

04/08/2010

04/08/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

documents

Evaluate IA's changes to rehab agreement and
endorsement; confernece with Nunnally re

same, prepare agenda, email fo clients

Phone conference with Jon Chatalian at PBGC

re status of conservation

FPhone conference with clients re reliab
agreement issues

Review and respond to F. Wadibia's email on
G allmg him, prepare email to Detective,

contact BSEEEFAttoiney

Prepare agenda for IA meeting, phone

conference with Nunnally re agenda, email to

clients

Revise agenda re funcral sales and email fo

clients

Prepare letter to trustee's attorney re

policy

Revise assumption endorsement

Fhone conference with J. Murphy re retirement

files and reserve issues

Prepare memo re same and questions for Alan

Pennington

Coordinate paralegal re employee retirement

files for J. Murphy

Prepare email to attorney for Oakland landlord

re continuing standstill agreement

Evaluate caselaw 1e retirement reserve issues

Phone conference with clicnts and IA re legal

issues '

Phone conference with Certificate holder re

raailings

Evaluate email from certificate holder, forward

to Pearce and Donovan

Bvaluate information from Donovan re pohcy

forms and reinstatement policies

Prepare email to J, Murphy re refirement issues

and questions for actuary Alan Pennington

Phone conference with plaintiff's attorney in

tinois Masonry Corp lawsuit against GSM;

prepare email to Donovan re reason for lawsuit

and need to search if have any interest in

property

Phone conferences with Murphy re retirement

issues

Coordinate documents to Alan Pennington and

J. Munphy; prepare letter to Murphy

Invoice## 7186

2.50 hrs.

0,20 hrs,
1.50 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.50 hrs,

0.10 hrs.
0.25 Ius,

0.90 hrs.
0.75 hus.

0,30 hos.
0.10 his,
0.20 tus,

0.75 hrs,
1.20 hts,

0.20 hrs.
0.10 hrs,
0.20 hs.
0.50 hrs.

0.40 hrs.

0.25 his,

0.30 hus,

Page 3

737.50

59.60
442.50

59.00
147.50

29.50
73,75

265,50
221.25

88.50
29.50
59.00

221.25
354.00

59.00
29.56
59.00
147.50

118,00

73.75

88.50



204410
04/08/2010

04/08/2010

04/08/2010

04/08/2010
04/08/2010
04/08/2010

04/09/2010
04/05/2010

04/09/2010

04/09/2010
04/05/2010

04/09/2010
04/09/2010
04/09/2610
04/09/2010
04/09/2010
04/11/2010
04/11/2010
04/12/2010

04/12/2010

04/12/2010

0471272010
04/12/2010
04/12/20610

04/12/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
JES

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW-

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

Revise Rehab Agreement, Endorsement,
Assumption Agreement

Phone conference with Jack Hom re DOJ
approval process

Bvaluate Assumption Reinsurance Agreement
from TA American, revige agreement, prepate
redline’

Evaluate Service Agreement from JA
American, add revisions to agreement

Phone conference with Pearce re agreements,
meeting with JA American )
Review and compile retired employees files
for attorney and client review

Evatuate Nunnally's revisioins fo agreements
Phone conference with Nunnally re revisions
to agreements and revise agreements

Prepare revisions to agreements

Prepare email to TA with agreements

Revise service agreement, phone conference
with Nunnally re revisions, email to Nunnally
re same

Prepare notice to pohcyholders
Evaiuate letter from: :

Evaluate email and document from counse! for

Illinois Masonry, prepare email to clients
Review and respond to emails with Alan
Pennington

Review and respond to-emails with Hom re
regulatory review

Evaluate TA's revision to payment of agent
commissions, email Patrik re same
Bvaluate Nunnally's email re coinsurance
agreement, respond to same

Preliminary analysis of ERISA preemption
issues arising from separation agreements
Evaluate email from Alan Pennington te
retirement issues

Evaluate Court order

Prepare notice of court order with notice to
interested parties

Coordinate secretary re service and filing of

notice of order

Phone conference with A. Pennington re
retivement issues

BEvaluate retirements issues with J. Tumer,

Invoicet 7186

3.50 hus,
0.20 hrs.

2,00 hrs.

1.50 hrs,
0.50 hrs,
1.25 hus,

0.75 hrs,
0.75 hus,

1.00 hrs.
0.25 s,
2.00 hrs,

1.80 hrs.
0.50 hrs,
0.20 hrs,
0.30 hrs.
0.30 hrs.
0.20 hrs.
6.5{) hrs.
0.40 lus,
0.20 hrs.

0.10 hrs.
0,50 hrs.

0.10 hs.
0.20 hrs,

0.75 hrs.

Page 4
1,032.50

59,00

590,00

442,50
147.50
187.50

221.25
22125

295,00

73.15
380,00

531.00
147.50
59.00
88.50
88.50
58.00
147.50
118.00
59.00

29.50
147,50

29.50
59.00

221.25



204410
04/ 12/20r1 O
04/12/2010
04/12/2010
04/14/2010
04/14/2010
04/14/2010
04/15/2010

04/15/2010
04/15/2010
04/1572010
04/15/2010
04/15/2010
04/15/2010
04/15/2010
04/15/2010
04/15/2010

04/15/2010
04/15/2010

04/16/2010

04/16/2010
04/16/2010

04/18/2010

Insurance Commnissioner

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
- MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

prepare information for review by J. Tutner
Review and respond to Donovan email re
service agreement pricing

Phone conference with Robert re agreements,
revisions to agreements )

Evaluate revised documents fron 1A, prepare
redline versions and email to Nunnally
Evaluate emails from Donovan re 4801
Alemeda Road property and docwments
Evaluate trust documents from IA

Phone conference with Holloway re status of
negotiations, send agreements to Wilson,
prepare email to Wilson with agreements
Review closing schedules, revised schedules
from J. Murphy, phone conference with
Murply re same

Evaluate and revise Interim Reinsurance
Agreement from Nunnally

Phone conference with clients re status of
transaction and open issues

Phone conference with TA and clients re open
issues

Revise agreements per calls with cHents and
IA

Phone conference with Nunnally re revisions
to agreements

Evaluate DOI documents re Ins Code 101 1(0)
approval

Prepare email to clients with revised
agreements

Evaluate emails from Patrik re additional
issues

Prepare email to EEOC attorney with order
approving Consent Decree

Evaluate service mechanics on policyholders
Evaluate notice requirements for approval
application

Evaluate quotes for service of notice of 1A
assumption on policyholders, phone
conference with Myriad Lit Services re same
Evaluate eémails from clients and Nunnally re
standards for service agreement

Evaluate American Title letter and agreement
re sale of property

Revise service agreement, incorporate GSM's
standards and client comments on standards
imto service agreement

Invoiceff 7186

0.10 hys.
0.40 lrs.
0.80 hrs.
0.25 lus,

0,40 his.
0.50 hrs.

0.40 Ius.

1.20 his.
0.75 hss.
0.75 hs.
0.60 hrs.
1.00 lus.
0.25 hrs,
0.20 hrs,
0.10 hrs,
0.20 hrs,

0.20 s,
0.50 hrs.

0.50 hrs.

0.20 hrs.
0.20 hrs.

1.50 hrs.

Page 5

29,50
118,00
236.00 -

7375

118.00
147.50

118.00

354.00
22125
221.25
177.00 |
295,00
73.75
59.00
29.50
59.00

59.00
147.50

147.50

59.00
59.00

442.50



v

204410

04/18/2610

04/19/2010

04/15/2010
04/19/2010

04/19/2010
04/19/2010

04/19/2010
04/19/2010

04/16/2010

04/19/2010

04/19/2010
04/19/2010
04/19/2010
04/19/2010
04/19/2010
04/19/2010
04/20/2010

04/20/2010

04/20/2010

04/20/2010

04/20/2010

04/20/2010

Tnsurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

Prepare email to Nunnally with service
agreement

Bvaluate letter fiom trustee's attorney
disclaiming interest in the:
prepare email to clients re same

Review and respond to email from EEQC
attorney re approval of consent decree
Further revise service agreement, email to
Nunnalty
Phone conference with Fred re olicy
Evaluate Robert's revision to parol evidence
rule

Phone conference with Myriad re cost for
notice to policyholders

Evaluate emails from Patrik re proposals for
agreements

Phone conference with Nunnally re remaining
issues

Phone conference with Nunnally and Pearce re
outstanding remaining issues

Prepare memo re open issues and schedule of
events re agreements

Draft notice of application for approval of
rehab plan

Phone conference with attorney re
policy
Prepare email to clients with service agreement

and request to review GSM's abilities

Prepare email to clients with open issues
memo and schedule

Review and respond to emails from clients re
agreement jssues and negotiation

Evaluate quote from Donovan re service costs,
phone conference re same

Evaluate Labor Commissioner decision 1e
Cartwright and argument that Commissioner
has no jurisdiction
Prepare letter to attorney fory
policy benefits

Phone conference with Nunnally re status of
agreements and deal points, incorporation info
apreements

Further review and revise Rehabilitaiton
Agreement, exhibits, tables

Phone conference with Oakland landlord’s
attorney re extending standstill period, prepare
email to clients re same

Invoice# 7186

Page 6

0.10 hrs. 29.50
0.25 hus, 73,75
0.10 hrs. 29.50
- 1.80 hs. 531,00
0.10 hs. 29.50
0.20 hrs. 59.00
025 s, 73.75
0.20 hrs, 59.00
0.25 lrs. 7375
0.25 hrs. 73.75
0.80 hrs. 236.00
2.80 his, 826.00
0.10 hrs, 29.50
0.10 hrs. 29.50
030 hs, 88.50
0.20 hrs. 59.00
0.25 hrs. 73.75
0.40 hrs. 118.00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
0.30 hrs. 88.50
1.20 hrs. 354,00
0.30 hts. 88.50



204410
04/20/2010

04/20/2010
04/20/2010

04/20/2010

04/20/2010
04/20/2010

04/21/2010
04/21/2010
04/21/2010

04/21/2010
04/21/2010

04/21/2010
0472172010

04/21/2010
04/21/2010
04/21/2010
04/21/2010
" 04/21/2010
04/22/2010
0472212010
04/22/2010
04/22/2010

- 04/22/2010
04/22/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW
. MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
JES

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

Phone conferences with Pearce re agreetnents,
preparation of final versions

Emalis with Matta and Todd re callers
requesting GSM information

Evaluate Nunnally's revised interim
reinsurance agreement

Review and revise rehabilitation agreement,
assumption agreement, service agreement,
interim reinsurance agreement, novation
agreement, assumption endorsement; add
tables of contents

Prepare emails to clients with agreements
Phone conference with EEQC atiomney re
Barringer address for check

Evaluate timing of EREOC settlement payment,
prepare email to clients re same

Prepare email to M. Smith with status report
documents .

Phone conference with Nunnally re
preparation for client meeting '

Phone conference with ¢lents re agreements
Phone conference with Greg Morris re.
agreements and ountstanding issues

Prepare emails to Pafrik re agreements
Coordinate paralegal re documents for clients
in New York

Prepare summary of rehab plan, email to
Pearce ’

Further prepare letter to policyholders and
Court notice of application and orders,
incorporate ordets

Phone conference with Patrik re agreements
Evaluate documenis from title company re sale
of Almeda property

Compilation of agreements to client binders
for use by client

Evaluate emails from Nunnaily re revisions to
niotice and letter to policyholders

Incorporate Nunnally's revisions to notice
documents '

Phone conference with Bd Loughlin re consent
decree signed

Phone conference with S, Pearce re EECO
settlement payment, status of finalizing the
fransactions

Prepare email to Donovan re EEQC seftlement
Phone conference with Nunyally

Invoice# 7186

0.50 hrs,
0.20 hys.
0.75 his.

7.50 lus.

0,30 hrs,
0.10 hrs,

" 0,30 hrs,

0.10 hrs.

0.25 hrs,

1.20 hrs,
0.25 hrs.

0.40 hrs,
0.30 hrs.

0.30 hrs,
5.20 hrs.
0.30 hrs.
0.10 lus,

0.50 hrs,

020 hrs.

0.40 hrs.
0.10 hys.
0.50 lus,

0.10 hrs,
0.50 hrs,

Page 7

147.50
59.00
221.25

2,212.50

88.50
29.50

88.50 .
29.50
73.75

354.00
73.75

118,00
88.50

88.50
1,534.00
88.50
29,50
75.00
59.00
118,00
29.50
147.50

29.50
147.50



204410
04/22/2010

04/22/2010
04/22/2010
04/23/2010
04/23/2010

04/23/2010
04/23/2010

04/23/2010
04/23/2010

04/25/2010

04/25/2010

04/26/2010

04/26/2010

04/26/2010

04/26/2610

04/26/2010

04/26/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MT

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

Review and respond to Greg Morzis’ email re
policy listing and approval process by
departiment, conference with client re same,
forward policy form documents

Prepare letter to Barringer re scttlerment
payment

Conference with clients and TA re agreements,
conference with Peatce re accountings, revise
agroements

Evaluate Nunnally's further changes to Rehab
agreement

Revise notice documents, email to clients
Review DOI materials re regulatory approval
Phone conference with Nunnally and Hom re
regulatory approval

Bvaluate and respond to client emails re notice,
agreements

Prepare ex parte application re notice to
polioyholdets

Revise and prepare declarations for ex parte
application, legal research re notice
requirements, conservation order

Bvaluate Nunnally's email to Hom re rehab
plan overview

Review and analysis pertinent portions of
client files and documents for preparation of
opinion letter re ERISA coverage and
premption issues applicable to GSM special
early retirement package

Evaluate Greg Morris's request re corporate
resotution, revise resolution from Numnally,
send to Greg Morris

Revise and further prepate ex parte
application, notice documents, exhibits to
motion, prepare proposed order, prepare Dept
86 form re notice declaration, prepare letter to
Board of Directors providing notice of ex parte
application, email to clients

Bvaluate emails from Greg Morris re changes
to assumption agteement and assumption
endorsement, respond, phone conferences with
Morris and Nunnally re same

Prepare emails to TA American and clients
with revised assumption agreement and
assumption endorsement

Phone conference with Nunnally re revisions
to assumption agreement

Invvoiceft 7186

(1,30 hrs,

(.40 hrs.

2,90 hus.

0.40 hrs.

0.40 hrs,

0.30 hus.

(.50 hrs.

0.20 hrs.
2.40 lrs.

4,40 hrs,

0.10 lus.

1.00 hrs,

0.60 s,

5.00 hus,

0.75 hts,

0.20 hrs,

0,75 hrs,

Page 8

88.50
118.00
855.50
118.00
118,00

88.50
147,50

59.00
708.00

1,298.00

29.50

295.00

17700

1,475.00

22125

59.00

22125



204410
04/26/2010

04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010

04/27/2010
04/27/201¢

04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010

04/27/2010

04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010
04/27/2010

04/27/2010

04/28/2G10

Insurance Commissioner
‘Prepare email to BEOC attorney re signed

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

IMT

consent decree

Review and respond to email from EEOC
attorney re consent decree signed

Finalize letter to Barringer re FEQC settlement
check

Prepare memo to clients re consent decree

obligations
Evaluate emails re status conference hearing
and § @ appearance

Prepare email to landlord's attorney re
conservation order

Bvaluate changes by IA re rejection of
policies, incorporate changes into agreements,
email to A, conference with Nunnally
Phone conference with landlord's attorney 1e
murals, prepare email to clients re same and
landlord's claim

Prepare email to Greg Morris re notice
hrochure

Prepare email o clients re obligations under
Consent Decree

Review and respond to Patrik's email re
brochure information

Revise ex parte and notice documents,
incorporate Smith's and Wilson's revisions,
respond to Marta's emails re same, respond to
TA’s emails

Prepare for hearing on status report

Phone conference with Marta Smith re status
report hearing

Phone confernece with clients re review of ex
parte motion, notice documents and
agreenients

Revise ex parte, notice documents, phone
conferences with Nuanally re same, email to
clients

Prepare email fo IA and clients 1re agenda for
conference call

Review emails with Donovan re mailing of
notice, phone conference with Donovan and
Pearce re mailing of notice documents,
calculate hearing date

Evaluate letter from EslSBERR attomey,
prepare email to clients re check request for
policy benefits

review GSM harassement policy and related

Invoice# 7186

Page 9

0.10 hrs. 29.50
0.10 hrs, 29.50
0.10 hes, 29.50
0.50 hrs. 147 50
0.20 hrs, 59,00
0.10 hrs. 29,50
0.50 hrs. 147.50
.80 1rs. 236.00
0.10 hus. 29.50
0.50 hs. 147.50
0.10 hus. 29.50
1.40 hrs, 413.00
0.40 hys. 11800
0.25 hus, 7375
2.00 hus, 590,00
2.25 hs, 063.75
0.20 s, 59.00
0.30 hre, 88.50
0.20 hes. 59,00
0.30 hrs. 88.30



204410
04/28/2010

04/28/2010
04/28/2010

04/28/2010

04/28/2010

04/28/2010

04/29/2010
04/29/2010
04/25/2010

04/25/2010

04/29/2010
04/29/2010
04/29/2010

04/25/2010
04/29/2010

04/25/2010
04/30/2010

04/30/2010

04/30/2010

04/30/2010

Insurince Cormunissioner

JMT

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

JBH

MRW
MRW

correspondence; preliminary evaluation of
legal issues raised in client inquiry

HERISA rescarch (statute, pertinent regulations
and case authorities) re preemption issuss
raised with GSM special retirement package
Court appearance on Status Report hearing
Revise notice documents and ex parte re court
instruction to prepare order to show cause
application, incorporate Donovan changes
Phone conference with clients and IA re notice
documents, revisions to agreements, status
Evaluate TA's changs to service agreemen,
evaluate termination provision with service
agreement, prepare email to Nunnally with
opinion on revision

Research court authority for order to show
cause procedure, draft arguments re same,
further revise '
Evaluate JA's marketing letter, prepare email
to Mortis re same

Phone conferences with clients re hold on ex
parte due to research on claims

Review and respond to Morris re timing of
court approval

Coordinate secretary re cancelling ex patte
notice, phone conference to Sith re same,
phone conference with Jandlord's attormey re
same

Phone conference with clients re employment
terminations :
Further revise legal arguments for ex parte and
notice documents, revise proposed order
Phone conference with Patrik and Greg re ex
parte issues

Review board resolution

Finalize and pdf agreements, email to clients
and JA

Phone conference with Nunnally re ex parte
delay, policy issues

Download cases from Westlaw for attorney
review re case preparation

work on legal memo to MRW re ERISA
preemption issues affecting suspension of
early retivement package

Bvaluate legal documents received from
Pearce :

Phone conference with worket's comp attorney

Invoicel# 7186

1.70 hus.

3.90 hrs,
4.10 hrs,

0.80 hs,

0.40 hrs,

4,00 hrs.

0,20 hrs.
0.70 hrs.
0.20 hrs,

0.25 lus.

0.20 hrs.
1.60 hrs,
0.30 hrs.

0.10 hts.
3.00 hrs.

0.30 hrs.
0.20 hrs,

6.00 hrs,

0.30 tus.

0.20 hrs.

Page 10

501.50

1,150.50
1,209.50

236.00

118.00

1,180.00

59,00
206,50
59.00

73.75

59.00
472.00
88.50

29.50
885.00

88.50
30.00

1,770.00

88.50

58.00



204410
04/30/2010

04/30/2010

04/30/2010
04/30/2010
04/30/2010
04/30/2010

EXPENSES

04/02/2010
04/02/2010
04/06/2010
04/08/2010
05108/2010
04/09/2010
04/12/2010
04/13/2010
04/21/2010

04/27/2010

04/28/2010

MRW
application

Filing fee

Attorney service (LASC)

Parking

Federal Express (J. Murphy)

Federal Express (A. ?emlingtou),
Attorney service - Obtain minute order
Attorney service (LASC)

Attorney service (LASC)

Federal Express (J. Holloway)

Federal Express (W. Barringer)

Parking

Phone conference with Nunnally re court

Invoice# 7186

Insurance Commissioner
re declaration, prepare email to Pearce re need
declaration
MRW Court - make sure no one appeared at 0.80 hus.
cancelled ex parte, conference with coutrt clerk
re same
MRW Evaluate lefters of reference for Barringer, 0.25 hrs,
prepare letter to Barvinger sending letters
MRW Review recent versions of agreements ‘ 1.20 hrs,
MRW Phone conference with Greg Motris re same 0.20 hrs.
MRW BEwvaluate marketing letter from IA. 0.10 hrs.
0.20 hus.

Page 11

236.00

73,75

354.00
59.00
29.50
59.00

$45,471.75
40,00

7.50
18.00
13.67
2240
71.85

7.50

7.50
70.93

26.13

18,00



204410  Insurance Commissioner Invoice## 7186 Page 12

04/30/2010  Photocopy (2,312 pages @ .10/page) 231.20
04/30/2010  LexisNexis 132.50
04/30/2010  Westlaw 28.76
04/30/2010  Postage 51.02
$746,96
- 0.20 15000 - .;f., $3000

| 1.78 | tod0. - s20250
,j s BRI 286:00 $2?7390
f 143:75 S 295(;9 7 Gibace 28
ﬁ;limg 'Summaly\ | .

$45,47175

Total professional services

Total expenses incurred $746.96

A 4 L

Total of new charges for this invoice $46,218.71

Total balance now due @ ) AMD (Oé}
T UA ,eﬁw
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' PackagefEnvefope Frolght . Expedited , Office/Print Servicas 3t

' Business Solutions »

. S?ﬂp v “";‘rack r ' r;ﬂ;naée 14

FedEx Ship Manager® ‘ Logoul el
P

My Lists

Reporls My Profile

Prapare Shipmant

At

Ship History

Your Shipment Detalls
From: MiGHAE&. fT!.U WSISS& Ppckage lype: FedEx Envelops
’ EPSTEIN, TURNER .
SoNG. PG, Plekup/Orop Off: rli:}sﬂ :é; glijrgady scheduled pickupal
z;g OS FIGUERCA ST §TE getight: . 3-30 EL}BS
sclared valug: .00 USD
t}gs ANGELES, CA 90017 Shipper account number: 226051538
2138817457 Bill transportation te: 226051538
Courtasy rato quota;® 13.87

for JENNIFER MURPHY List rales:

ggé?ﬁg {fwggﬂUWAt Eftective net discount:
L/
1009 W ADAMS BLVO glsc?u‘nteé ’\{ar{a‘ble %
LOS ANGELES, CA peclal services;
g00183500 Shipment Purpose:
Us Shipmantiype: Express
) {323)419-3844 CommarclaliRosidenttal Status:  Commarclal

Tracking na: 793430045592

Your reforenco: 204-410-D4

Bhip date: 04/08/2010

Service type: Standard Overnlght

Pleaso noto :
. ¥ The courlesy rate shown hare may be diffarent than the actusl charges for your shipment, Differances may ocour based on actual weight,
dimensions, and ottier factora, Consult {he applicabls lde orihe FedEx Rate Shesls for dalalis on how shipping charges

ara ¢alcuisted. .
Fodtx wil not ba responsible for any clafm In excess of 3100 per packags, whatiser the result of foss, demage, delay, non-delivary,
misdelivery, or misinformalion, untags you dedlara a highervalue, pay an additional charge, docurnsnt your aclual loss and file algme!y glatm,
Limitatians faund in the current FadEx Service Gulde spply, Your right to recover from FedEx for any loss, Including Intrinsio velue of the

ackago, loss of sales, incoma interesl, profit, allomey's fees, costs, and cther forms of damage whalher direct, Incldantal, consequential, or
spaclal s imitad 1o the greater of $100 or the aulhodzed declarsd valua, Recovery carinol excesd gelual documantad loss, Maximum for llems
of axiracndinary valua s $500, e.g., Jawelry, preclous metals, negoliable Inslrumenis nnd other llems listed In our Service Guide, Wrilten claims
must bo fled within strict fime Umils; Consult tha epplcable FedEx Barvice Guide for detalls,

Bl Brshiess Cemior | Servica (n10 | Aboit Fe0E | investor Relatians [ Gargars | fedox.com Tarns of Use | Secunty & Prvacy | Site Map |

Glabal Home |
syright and tradamark laws under US and internationa! lavr, All dghls reserved.@ 1985- 2010 FedEx

This site ts profected by oo



Espannf { Customer Suppamt | FedEx Lacations Search

PTIRN

Packago/Envelope  Frelght | Expedited  Office/Print Servicas W
Ship * Track?  Manage » Business Solufions »

FedEx Ship Manager®

My Profile

From: . MICHAEL R. WEISS& Package typs: FedEx Envalops
EPSTEIN, TURNER "
SONG. PG, Plokup/Drop Off: ;J’;a‘ fc(:a ﬁ(llr:ady scheduted plokup at
il
Deciarad value: 0.00 UBD
:jgs ANGELES, OA 80017 Shipper aocount number: 226061638
2138617487 Bil tranaportaiton to: 226061638
Courtasy rate quote;® 2240
To: ALAN PENNINGTON List rates:
g&zgg };Ehrl\'&liﬂgf% R Effective net discount:
Discounted varlabls %
2&1 VIRGINA WAY BTE Speclal services:
N2838-040 Shipmeant Purpose:
BRENTWOOD, TN Shipment type; Bxprogs
?170277642 CommercialiResldentizl Statust  Commerclal
3
{618} 347-3352
Tracking no: 742430987417
Your reforence; 204-410-04
Ship date: 04/08/2010
Service type: Slandard Ovemiphl

Ploase note ;
. * The courtasy rate shown here may ba different than 1he actual charges for your shipmant. Differances may ocsur based on actual walght,
dirnsnsions, and other faciors. Consult the applicable fa or the FedEx Rate Shasis for delalls on how shipping charges

ara catoulated.

FedEx wilf not be ragponsible for any clalm In sxcess of $100 per package, whather the result of loss, damags, delay, nomvdeilvery,
misdslivery, or mislnformation, unlass you daclare a higher value, rs)ay an addltionaf charge, docurment your actual joss end file a Umaly ¢lalm,
Limitatlons faund In the current FedEx Sarvice Gulde apply. Your dght o recover from FadEx for ary 10ss, Including Intrinsic value of the
package, loss of salas, incoma Interast, profit, attornay’s faea, coals, and other forms of damags whether direcd, Incldental, conssquantial, or

spacial ls limited to the graater of $106 or the authorized dedlared value. Recovery cannot excaed actual documented Tosa, Maximum for ltems
of extraordinary vaiue is $500, 8.9., Jawelry, pracious mefals, negoliabls Instruments and other llems listad In our Service Gulde, Written dlalms

must be fHled wilhin strct Hms Umits; Consult tha appiicable FedEx Senics Gulde for delalls,

Global Homo | Smal Basiness Gemer | 5arvics Al | Aboul FEGLX | Investor Relatons | Careers | ledex.com 1efms of Use | Securty & Prvacy | G Mep i
This slte Is protected by copyripht and trademark faws under US and Intemational law, All rights resarved.® 1095- 2010 FadBx



Flrst Los Angeles (213) 260-1111 o Fay (213) 250-1197
Directline folegal  {213) 250-9141 o Fax (213) 250-1197
Legal Los Angeles (Wost) .(310) 277-9111 & Fax (310) 277-9153
Blrect fine {o jagal {310) 277-7101 o Fax (310) 277-9153
Infand Emplre {851) 778-1110 o Fax (§51) 776-0400
Support San Diego (619} 231-8111 e Fax {819) 2311351
0y San Frandlsco (415) 626-3111  » Fax (415) 626-1331
Ser VICEeS Santa Ana (714) 541-4110 © Fax (714) 541.8182
Sacramento (916} 444-5111  » Fax (916) 443-3114
 GOURT FILING/ GoNTRAL NO. OATE 4t
COURT RESEARCH FORM web address: firstlegalsupport.com ‘5/5' o ?// 7
FiRM \ DESTINATION F COURT:
NAME: Epstein, Turner & Song, P.C. .
777 S. Figueroa St., Sulte 4950 Los Angeles Superior Court
Los Angeles, CA 90017 111 N. Hill Street. ROOM 112
Los Angeles, California 90012
PHONE! (513} 861-7487
EAX; (213) 881-7488 DOCUMENTS
ATTY/SECRETARY: /MEB EXT: 113 Minute Order dated 4f8/10
CLIENT MATTER / ATTY, CODE
204-410-04
CASE NO:
BS123005
Short Tille of Case:
HEARING
Insurance Commissioner v, Goiden State |serror: AT DEPY/DIV
Mutual Life Ins. Co, SELF ADDRESSED STAMPED FEE
ENVELOPE (S) ATTACHED ATTACHED: 3

COURT RESEARCH ONDEMAND FILINGS | COURTRUN

['] AsAp RESEARGH I sPecrue £ rushFwe I} samepay
(Immed!aie} {Immadfate) {Within 2 hours) {Fliings Qnly)*

[ ] samE pav RESEARCH 3 ssapriLe C1 recrie NEXTDAY
(Allow full day to oblain} {Within 1 hour) {Within 3-4 howrs) (Filings Only)*

1 nexr bay RESEARCH *Per Agreemant
{Affow two days o ohfain)

[J Fue L] issue ] susmr OTHER:

RESEARCH 7] cermFen [ Form Complele by: o o
COPY REQUEST COPY REQUEST 0

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

Thank you. Matry Ellen Bolton, ext, 113.

Please obtain FROM ROOM 112 a copy of the April 6, 2010 minute order issued by Judge
Yaffe in Department 86 AND EMAIL IT TO ME TODAY at meb@etslaw.com. Also, PLEASE

EMAIL TO MICHAEL R. WEISS AT mmw@etslaw.com.

71.5s”




Espafol § Customer Support | FedEx Lecations  Search - Go

ht "' OfflcelPrint Sarvices it

) ?;a;k.;gaiﬁnvet‘c;}ab T Fralght
) Track v Manage s

PR, e 4o

) éh}p )

R LS

S . e T e e g
fanage » Business Solutions »

Fedkx Ship Manager®
Help

My Proflle -

My Lists

Prepare Shipment Ship History

Mg via 25

Your Shipment Detalis

From: MiCHAEmL RU\QIIEIESRS& Package typo: FodEx Box
EPSTEN, T
SONG, P.C. PlokupiDrop Off: r%;a[:&faz:’r:ady schedlled pletnp el
Daclared value: 0,00 USD
{]gs ANGELES, GA 80017 Shippar account number: 226051538
2138817487 Bill transportation toy 228051638
Courtasy rate quote:* 42,
Yo JOE HOLLOWAY List rates; o (? %
gg&sﬁ ggﬁ rﬁkglsfg ING Ettactive nat discount: 7 v
L
POUGHKEEPSIE, NY gtsﬁ?uintad }faria.ble Y
128016485 pecial services:
Us Shipment Purpose;
(846} 452.4100 Shipmaent type: Expross
GommerclaliResidantisl Status:  Commercial
Tracking no: 798592794635
Your reference; 204-410-D4
Ship data: 04/21/2010
Service typeo: Standard Qvamight

Please nole !
+ * The courtasy rata shawn here may be different than the actual chargas for your shisment, Diffarences may oceur based on actual welght,
dimenslons, and other factors, Consult the applicatie Fedix Sorvice Gide or the FedEx Reto Shesls for detsils on how shipping chames

are calculatad,

FedEx wi not ba responsible for any clalm In excess of $100 per packags, whethar the result of loss, damags, delay, non-deiivery,
misdelivety, or misinformalion, unless you dectare a higher value, pay an addilional charge, documen! your actusl loss and fite a fimaly claim,
Umitaflons found in the current FadEx Sarvice Gulda apply, Your right fo recover from FedEx for any loss, Including Inlinsic vaius of tha
packaga, loss of zales, incomo Interast, profi, atiomey's fees, casts, ant other forms of damage whether direct, Incidental, consequantal, o
spacial {5 ¥mited to the grealer of $100 or the authorized declared value, Recovery cannol excead actual documented losg, Maximiurm for tems
of extraordinary velve is $500, 8.9., Jewelry, practous metals, negolieble Instrumenls and other Homs fisted In our Service Gylde, Writlen clalms

must be filed within sirict ime #mits; Consult the applicable FadEx Sanvice Guida for dotafls,
|Cargers [ Tedex.cam Terms of Use ] Securhy & Privacy | Site Mep |

Globai Home | Small Business Cenler | Sorvice Info | About FedEx | invester Retations
This slte Is protected by copyrght and trademark faws under US and intermationel law. All dghts reserved.@ 1995. 2010 FedEx




Espafiel { Cuslomer Support } Fedix Locations  Search - . Go

" Packago/Envelops Fralght : Expedited OfficePrint Sorvices ¢
Ship ; Track * B ”P\;fénag'é ¥ ) “Bt\rsmln;s; Sn[utlus;rs-rﬁ o

FedEx Ship Manager® Logout "
. -

Prepare Shipment Ship History iy Lists My Profile
Your Shipment Defalis
From: MICHQ% ?UWEES.:& . Package typa: FadEx Envelope
EPSTEIN, TUR
SONG, PC Plckup/Deop Offt sssﬁ ;:r; E:;ady schedulsd plckup at
Z;’;OS FIGUEROA 8T 8TE Woelght: 0,30 L8S
: Doctarad value: 0.00 UsD
‘Sgs ANGELES, GA 90017 Shipper account numbar: 228051538
2438617487 Hilt transportation tor 226051538
g Courtegy rate guote:* 28,13
o : WILLIAM BARRINGER List rateg;
1008 BRETT CT Effactive net dissount:
Dlgcounted varlable %
gg}%‘gﬁ' NG 8pacial services; : Residanital defivery
us Shipment Purpoge: )
B185905208 Shipment typs: Expross
CommerclaliResidential Stafus: Resldenilj
Tracklng no! 798610839105
Your reference: 204-410-04
Ship date: Q2712010
Service type: Standard Ovemight

Pladse note ;
+ * The courtesy rale shown here may be different than the actua) chargas for your shipment. Differences may ocoir basad on actual welght,
dimenslans, ard other factors. Consult the appileable FadEx Service Gulde or the FedEx Rate Sheels for dafalls on how shipping charges

are cakulated,

Fadtix will not be responsible for any claim In excess of $100 fmr pockape, whather the result of loss, damage, delay, non-dalivery,
misdelivery, or misinformation, unlass you declara a higher valus, pay an sddlilonal charge, docurmant your actual foss and fils a fimely claim,
Limitallons found in the current FedEx Service Gulde agply, Your right to recover Iram Fedx for any loss, inefiding Infrnsle valus of e
package, loss of sales, Income interest, profit, atlornay’s fees, cos!s, and other forms of damaga whether dirac, Incldantal, consaquential, or
spactal is mited to tha greater of $100 or the authorized declared value, Recoyery cannot oxcead actual documented loss. Maximum for ltams
of sxiracrdinary value 13 $500, 8.0., fewalry, praclous melals, negotiablo Instruments and ofhor Hems Bsted in our Service Gulte, Wiitten tlalms

must ba filed within strict fime limile; Consult the appllcable FedEx Service Gulda for dotalls,
v RElHOIS | Carears | fedox.sorm Terms of Use | Securlty & Privasy | 56 Map |

Global Homa | Small Busihass Centar | Service Info | About FedEx | investor
This slte {s protacted by copyright and traderark lews under US and hiemationat iaw, All ights reserved.® 1995- 2040 FedEx




Law Firm

EPSTEIN TURNER & SONG
LOS ANGELES, CA 90017

Cliont

Cllent ID:204-410-04
Enter a Cllent Name:
Enter Addrass1:
Enter Address2;

Cly, State ZIP

Enter An Invoice Number:
Usage period; 04/04/2010 - 04/30/2010

© Westlaw Research Charges through 04/30/2010

included Leqal Research

41712010

4712/2010
4/26/2010
4/28/2010
4/29/2010
4/30/2010

Woastlaw Legal Research

Waestlaw Laga! Research
Woaesllaw Legal Research
Westlaw Legal Regsarch
Wesllaw Legal Research
Westlaw Legal Research

Exeluded Legal Ressarech

Standar L)
$28.00
$1,100.45
$98.00

$112.00

$149.40

$44.40

SBub-total Included Charges

Sub-total Excluded Charges
Sub-lotal research Charges
Tax Chaerge

Total Client Charge

Cllent Charge
$0.52

$20.70
$1.83
$2.09

$2.79
$0.83
$28.75
) arge
$0.00
$28.76
$0.00

$28.7¢6




204410  Insurance Commissioner
04/30/2016  Photocopy (2,312 pages @ 10/page}

04/30/12010  LexisNexis
G4/30/2010 Westlaw

04/30/2010  Postage

JBH

0.20
JES
1.75
JMT
8.40
MRW
143.76
gjlging,&@ mary

‘Total professional services
Total expenses incurred

Total of new charges for this invoice

Total balance now due

Invoiceld 7186

160.00
150.00
206.00

205.00

$45,471.75
$746.96

----------------

- $46,218.71

e e o e 8 A e

$45,218.71

+

Page 12
231.20

132.50

2876

51.02

$746.96
$30.00
$262.50

$2,773.00

$42406.26




204410 Insurance Commissioner
04/30/2010  Photocopy (2,312 pages @ .10/page)

04/30/2010  LexisNexis

04/30/2010  Westlaw

04/30/2010  Postage

JBH )

0.20
JES

1.75
JMT

9.40
MRW

143.75
Billing Summary

Total professional services
Total expenses incurred

Total of new charges for this invoice

~

Total balance now due

Invoice# 7186

150.00
160.00
285.00

285,00

$45,471.75
$746.96

----------------

----------------

$46,218.71

Page 12
231.20

132.50

28,76

51.02

$746.,96
$30.00
$262.50

$2,773.00

$42,406,25




204410 losurance Commizsioner Involce# 7226  Page 11

05/25/2010  Attorney servics (LASC) : 7.50
05/31/2010  Photocopy (9,987 pages @ .10/page) . 998.70 i
03/3172010  Postage 274.33
52,2610
A
JMT :
2.40 . 295,00 $708.00 v~
MBRW
108,00 . 266,00 $31,2710.60
RLE
0.80 260,00 $200.00 v
ﬂ .{{-ﬂ S ' .
Total professional services : $32,178.00
Total expenses inourred $2,261.91
Total of new charges for this invoice $34,439.91
JRNVRREARY: 4 PO,
Tatal balance now due $34,439.0 F




May 31, 2010

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Scoft Paarce

Chlef Estate Trust Officer
1998 West Adams Bivd,
Los Angsles, CA 90018

Epstein, Turner & Song

771 8. Figueron Strast
Bulte 4850
Los Angetos, CA 80017
{2131 861.7487
Tex D 95-4673002

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company

Phone conference with Nunnatly and Donovan

Invoice##t 7226
Qur file# 204410
Billing throngh 05/31/2010

/MMM t"w 9‘% \L’Jd "

AN
.00

Balanoe forward as of invoice dated  April 30, 2010 $46,218.71

Payments received sinoe last invoice . 46,218,71

Accounts receivable balance carried forward 30.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

05/03/2010  JMT  Review plan documents; revisions to memo to 0.60 hrs
MRW

05/03/2010  MRW  Phone conference with Ho]loway 1¢ status of 0.25 hrs,
pending death claims

05/03/2010 MRW Revise agreements, email to Patrik 0.50 hrs,

05/03/2010 MRW Phone conference with Pearce re agreements 0.20 fs.
and pending death olaims

05/03/2010  MRW Evaluate J. Tumner's memorandum re carly 0.50 hrs,
retirement plan )

05/03/2010  MRW Evaluate reinsurance list, emaﬂs with Pearce re 0.20 hrs,
same

05/04/2010  JMT  Conference with MRW re ERISA reporting, 1.00 hrs.
filing and disclosure compliance issues; further
review of pertinent case and statutory
authority; supplement memo to address risk
exposure

05/04/2010 MRW Phone conference with clients re issues on 0.70 hrs.
agreements

05/04/2010- MRW Phone conference with Nunnally re same 0.20 hrs,

05/04/2010 MRW Evaluate Nunnally's revisions and emails re 0.70 hrs,
policy Babilities; Revzsc agreements re polzoy
Haibilities

05/04/2010 MRW  Evaluate pending death claim information and 0.20 hrs.
spreadsheet from clients

05/04/2010 MRW  Prepare email to Patrik and Greg re revised 0.30 hrs,
agreements; review response emails

05/04/2010 MRW Evaluate Patrik's email re status of agreements, 0.25 hrs

Ub‘i\‘

L 5

MRW
00004

177.00
73.75

147,50
59.00

147.50
59.00

295.00

206,50
.59.00
206.50
59.00
83.50

7375

v \U‘«@j Q})‘& (

o



204410

- 05/04/2010
05/04/2010

05/04/2010

05/04/2010

05/04/2010

05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010
05/05/2010

05/05/2010
05/06/2010

05/06/2010
05/06/2010
05/06/2010

05/06/2010
05/06/2010

05/06/2010
(5/06/2010

05/06/2010

Insurance Cormmissioner .

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
RLI

RLI
IMT

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

re same )
Phone conference with Holloway re same
Further evaluate issues’re early retirement plan
and ERISA requirements

Prepare notice of no opposition and declaration
for Pearce re application to approve 2706 sale,
prepare revised proposed order

Phone conference with Ed Wilson re status of
Golden State, prepare emat! to clients re same
Phone conference with Pearce re sale of 2706
application, review declaration and signature
from M, Smith, phone conference with Smith's
secretary re same

Prepare letter to
check and interest

Prepare lefter to worket's comp attorney with
declaration

Finalize notice of no opposition and proposed
order re 2706 sale approval

Bvaluate FAQ draft; phone conference with
Donovan re revisions to FAQ draft

Phone conference with Robert re revisions to
FAQ

Evaluate revisions to FAQ

Evaiuate Patrik's email re agreements

Phone conference with Holloway re service
agreement and exhibits

Review novation agreement.

Review assumption endorsement agrpement,
Review GSM harassment policy and related
correspondence in preparation for conference
with MRW

Brief review of ex parte documents and notices
Evaluate and outline dates for filing ex parte
and approval hearing

Phone conference with Donovan re ¢x patte
and hearing approval timing

Bvaluate emails re signing documents

Phone conference with Holloway re strategy
on signing documents

Bvaluate application for approval, start
revisions

Phone conference with Nunnally re strategy
for call withTA

Phone conference with clients and 1A re
agreements

@ attorney with benefits

Invoiceft 7226

0.25 hrs,
0.50 hrs.

1.50 hrs.

0.10 hrs,

0.25 hrs.

0.20 hzs.
0.20 lus,
0.20 hrs,
0.30 hrs.
0.10 hrs,
0.25 hrs.
0.10 hrs,
0.20 hrs.
0.50 hrs,

0.30 hrs.
0,40 hrs.

0.25 hrs.
(.25 hrs,
0.10 hus.

0.20 hrs,
(.20 hrs,

0.70 hs,
0.20 ks,

0.75 hrs.

Page 2

73.75
147.50

442,50

29.50

73.75

59.00
59.00
59,00

88.50

. 29.50

73.75
29.50
58.00

125.00

75.00
118.00

73.75

< 7375

29.50

59.00
59.00

206,50
5%.00

221,25



204410
05/06/2010
05/06/2010
05/06/2010
05/06/2010
05/06/2010
05/07/2010

05/07/2010

05/07/2010
05/07/2010
05/07/2010
05/07/2010
05/07/2010
05/07/2010

05/07/2010
05/10/2010

05/10/2 10
05/10/2010
05/10/2010
05/10/2010

05/10/2010

05/10/2010

05/10/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
IMT

MRW

MRW

- MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

Invoice#
Finalize agreements, compile exhibits in pdfs,
finalize tables, prepare email to clients and IA
1o same

Bvaluate IA's revised Tetter to policyholders,
respond

Phone conference with Holloway re service
expenses

Phone conference with Nunnally re revisions
to agreements after call with clients and JA
Evaluate MM invoice from Todd
Conferences with MRW re revisions to
Harassment policy; compliance with EECC
consent decree

Evaluate harassment paolicy, conferences with
I Turner re same, revise policy, phone
conferences with Donovan re same, evalnate
obligation under consent decree

Review emails from Mortis re signatures,
respond, forward signatures to clients
Review and respond to emails with M, Smith

.T¢ eX parte

Prepare email to A, Pennington re ERISA
issues

Respond to Morris's emails re signaturos
Roview status of {ilinois Masonry case,
prepare emails to Todd and plaintiff's counsel
re SaMe .

Review and revise ox parte application, edit
application for hearing on May 12

Prepare for 2706 hearing

Court - hearing on application for approval of
2706 sale

Phone conference with T, Donovan re 2706
sale

Review and respond to email from D: Wilson
e ¢x parte :

Phone conference with G. Morris re Novation
Agreement

Prepare emai] to Wilson and Patrik re
Novation Agreement

Further prepare ex parte documents, with
notice, exhibits, declarations; prepare email to
clients re same :

Phone conferences with clients re revisions {0
ex parte documents, emails with M. Smith re
same, revise .
Prepare signed final versions of rchabilitation

7226 Page 3
3.00 ks, 885.00
0.20 hrs, 59.00
0.10 hrs. 29.50
6.20 hrs. 59.00
0.10 hrs, 29.50
0.40 hrs. 118,00
1,00 hrs. 295,00
0.30 hrs. 88.50
0,20 hrs. 50.00
0.20 hrs, 59.00
0.10 hrs, 29.50
0.30 hrs. 88.50
1,80 hrs. 531.00
0.30 hes. 88.50
370 hes.  1,091.50
0.10 hrs. 29,50
0.20 hrs, 59.00
0.10 hrs. 29,50
0.20 hus. 59.00
2.00 hrs, 590,00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
1.00 hrs. 29500



204410

05/10/2010

05/10/2010
05/10/2010

05/10/2010
05/11/2010

05/1 172010

05/11/2010
- 05/11/2010

05/12/2010
05/1212010

05/12/2010
05/12/2010

05/12/2010
05/12/2010

05/12/2010
05/12/2010
05/12/2010
05/12/2010
05/12/2010

05/12/2010

05/12/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

agreement, assumption agreement and service
agreement, with exhibits; email to clients and
TA .
Coordinate sceretary re certified copy of order,
conference with secretary re same, prepare
email to clients re delay in getting order
Finalize letter re ex parte notice

Phone conference with L. Von Bschen re ex
parte notice and mural status

Finalize ex parte papers

Prepare harassment policy and consent decree |

documents, prepare email to client re same
Finalize ex parte motion and documents;
ooordinate secretary re documents

Revise ex parte proposed order

Review case authorities for ex parte, prepare
for hearing

Court hearing on ex parte

Bvaluate letter and memo from Harrington re
EEOC documents, phone conferences with S,
Pearce, phone conference with Harrington re
same

Finalize notice of OSC pleading and letter,
email to Donovan

Evaluate emails re 2706 sale closing, phone
conference with Donovan re same

Prepare notice of entry of order fo show cause
Prepare notice of entry of Order approving
2706 sale )

Evaluate couort issues re getfing ordey re
approval of status report, further coordinate
secretary

Evaluate email from Charlotte property re
CAM charges, forward to client; review and
respond to emails re same

Evaluate court order re status report, service
requirements; phone conference with Pearce re
service of COC holders; email client with

_order

Prepare notice of entry of Order re Status
Report, email to Smith re same, finalize
Prepare email to clients and IA re ex parte
approved and order

Prepare part of service list for Application to
approve rehabilitation plan, contact PBGC
Phone conference with Holloway re retention
bonus plans, Evaluate retention plans from

Invoice# 7226

0.20 hrs.

0,20 hes,
0.20 hrs,

0.60 hrs.
0.40 hrs.

0.90 hs,

0.25 ts.
0.75 his.

3.50 hrs.
0.40 hrs,

0.75 hus.
0.20 hrs.

0.70 hrs.
0.60 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.20 hrs.

0.30 hrs.

D.75 hrs,
0.20 hrs,
0.10 hrs,

0.40 hrs,

Page 4

59.00

59.00
©59.00

177.00
118.00

265.50

7375
22123

1,032.50
118.00

221.25
5900

206.50
177.00

39.00
59.00
88.50
221.25
59.00

29.50

118,00



204410
05/12/2010

05/12/2010
05/12/2010

05/13/2010

05/13/2010
05/13/2010
05/13/2010

05/13/2010

05713/2010

05/14/2010
05/14/2010
05/14/2010
05/14/2010
05/17/2010
05/17/2016
05/17/2010
05/17/2010

05/1712010
05/17/2010
05/17/2010

05/17/2010
05/17/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

Holloway, prepare email to Holloway re same
Phone conference with clients re strategy on
enforcement of seitlement agreement
Coordinate secretary re notice of ordets
Evaluate email from J, Murphy re charlotte
lease, phone conference with Murphy re same
Phone conference with Oakland landlord's
attorney re second Qakland lease standstill
agreement, prepare agreement, prepare email
to Landlord's attoimey with agreement, prepare
email to clients with agreement

Review West Adams lease re option, review
and respond to J. Murphy email re check
Review proof of notice of OSC, phone
conference with Todd re same

Coordinate secretary re service of status report
order on COC holders

Evaluate proof of letter to interested persons,
and emails re same, review emails from clients
re same

Prepare application for approval of
rehabilitation plan

Phone conference with Nunnally re court
application

Evaluate email from Oakland landlord's
attorney with signed agreement

Review proof of notice documents, prepare
email to Donovan re same

Prepare Wilson declaration for court approval
application, prepare Holloway declaration,
review Coutt application .

Review and revise Holloway declaration
Review and revise Wilson declaration
Prepare email to Morris re conference call -
Phone conferences with J. Murphy re assets
and liabilities

Further prepare court application for approval
of Rehabilitation Plan, incorporate evidence
cites into application, revise declarations,
email to client

Prepare Guindon declaration, email Guindon
re information for declaration

Review emails from Pearce re completion of
court application, phone conference with
Pearce re same

Prepare proposed order for court application
Review and respond to Morris' emails re

Invoicelt 7226

0.20 hrs,

0.20 hus,
0.10 hrs.

0.75 hrs.

0.20 hrs.
(.20 hrs,
0.25 hrs,

0.25 hrs.

3.00 hrs.
0.30 hrs.
0.10 hrs.
0.2G hrs.
5.50 hrs,
1.00 hrs,

0.50 hrs.
0.20 hrs.

0.30 hrs.

4.60 hrs.

0.60 hrs.

0.2G hrs,

1.20 hrs.
0.20 hrs.

Page §

359.00

59.00
25.50

22125

39.00
59.00
7375

73.75

885,00
88.50
29.50
59.00

1,622.50

295.00

147.50
59.00
83.50

1,357.00
177.00
59.00

354,00
39.00



204410
035/17/2010
03/18/2010
05/18/2010

05/18/2010
05/18/2010

05/18/2010

05/18/2010

05/18/2010
05/18/2010

05/18/2010
05/18/2010

05/18/2010

05/18/2010
05/19/2010

05/19/2010
05/19/2010

05/19/2010
05/19/2010
05/19/2010

05/19/2010
05/19/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

-MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

Invoice#
policy forms

Evaluate emails re Coudray property, prepare
ematl re deed in lieu of foreclosure

Phone conference with JA American re policy
forms, state approvals of assumption

Phone conference with Nunnally re same
Purther evaluate GSM's inferest in Ilinois
property, prepare email to Illinois counsel re
same

Phone conference with clients re application
and website

Revise application, Wilson, Holloway,
Proposed Order; incorporate revisions from
Pearce, Wilson, Holloway and Nunnally into
documents, prepare exhibits, revise balance
sheet, email clients with documents

Phone conference with Jennifer Murphy re
changes fo numbers

Phone conference with Holloway re same
Revise assumption endorsement; Emails to
Patrik with revised assumption endorsement
Prepare Guindon declaration

Prcpare letter to landlord re exercise of optlon,
review first amendment to lease

Evaluate Final Order in Condemnation
Prepare proof of service for mailing company
Further prepare Conservator's application and
documents for filing and posting on website;
prepare application, table of contents,
proposed order

Prepare declarations of Donovan, Weiss and
Carver

Prepare exhibits and finalize Wilson
declaration, Holloway declaration
Conferences with Donovan re revisions to
declarations, revise declarations, prepare with
exhibits

Phone conference with Todd re cerified copy
of 2706 Order, prepare letter to Bscrow
company 16 same '

Phone conference with Todd re certified copy
of 2706 Order, prepare letter to Escrow
company re same

Prepare tables of contents for website
Prepare proof of service and list of
Commissioners for setvice, review list of
commissioners re addresses |

7226 Page 6
0.25 hrs. 73.75
0.50 hrs, 147.50
0.20 hrs. 59.00
0.20 hrs. 59.00

0,80 hrs. 236.00
5.50 hrs. 1,622.50
0.20 hs. 59.00
0.20 hrs. 59,00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
0.80 hrs, 236,00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
0.20 hrs, 59.00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
3.50 hrs. 1,032.50
2.50 hrs. 737.50
0.75 hus. 221.25
1.00 hrs. 295,00
0.40 hrs, 118.00
0.40 hrs. 118.00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
1.20 hrs, 354.00
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0571912010

05/19/2010

05/20/2010

05/20/2010
0512072010

05/20/2010

05/20/2010
03/20/2010
05/20/2010
05/21/2010

05/21/£2010
05/21/2010

05/21/2010

05/21/2010

05/21/2010

05/21/2010

05/21/2010

05/24/2010
05/24/2010

05/24/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW

Confirm exhibit pdf and application pdfs,
review pdfs of all documenst

Prepare emails to clients with pdfs of
pleadings and exhibits

Finalize application documents, declarations of
Donovan, Wilson and Carver, documents for
website, revise summmary for website, questions
and answers, coordinate documents for
website, add new MUDET Novation
Agreement to filing and website documents
Coordinate conservator's application for filing
Phone conference with E, Safaie re option,
prepare and respond to email from landlord's
attomey re same and application

Further prepare and revise proofs of service for
notice documents and documents to Insurance
Commissioners

Phone confernece with Marta Smith re
application

Review and respond to email from PBGC
attorney re status of rehab

Phone conference with Alan Pennington re
retirement plan

Phone conferences with Holloway re D&O
insurance and approval by state

Phone conference with Nunnaily

Phone conferences with Greg Morris 1e
approvals by states and California

Review and respond to email re D&Q
insurance coverage

Phone conferences with Jack Hom and Rafael
Gutierrez re approval by California; evaluate
documents needed; review documents and
Insurance website for 1011(c) filing

Review retumed COC mailings, prepate list,
coordinate sending notice documents to new
addresses

Coordinate mailing of documents to insurance
commissioner and employees and others
Review signed agreement with Qakland
landlord, prepare emails to Oakland {andlord
afforney and clients with signed agreement
Prepare application and checklist for

‘regulatory filing with California DOI

Phone conferences with Donovan re service on
mortgage loan; coordinate secretary
Phone conferences with Donovan re service of

Invoice#t 7226

1.50 hus. 442.50
0.50 hrs. 147.50
620 brs,  1,829.00
1.20 hrs, 354.00
0,40 hrs. 118.00
1.00 s, 295.00
0.20 hrs. 59.00
0.20 hrs. 59.00
0.25 hrs, 775
030 hss, 88.50
0.30 hus. 88.50
0.25 hrs. 73,75
0.10 hss. 29.50
1.00 hrs. 295.00
1.20 s, 354.00
0.50 hrs. 147.50
0.25 hrs. 7375
120 hys. 354,00
0.30 rs. 88.50
0.40 hrs, 118.00

Page 7
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05/25/2010

05/25/2010

0522772010
05/27/2010
05/27/2010
05/2772010
05/27/2010
05/27/2010
05/27/2010
05/28/2010

05/28/2010

05/28/2010

05/26/2010

EXPENSES
04/28/2010

04/28/2010
04/28/2010
04/28/2010
04/28/2010

04/28/2010

Insurance Commissioner

MRW

MRW

MRW
MRW
MRW
MRW

MRW
MRW

MRW

MRW

MRW

COC holders; review spreadsheet, emai! to
secretary with instructions

Coordinate service and review proof of service
on loan holders, revise, coordinate secretary
Coordinate service and review proof of service
on coinsurance companies, prepare proof of
service

Phone conference with Valerie Sarfaty re

101 lc application

Phone conference with Pearce re DOI approval
application and employment issues at company
Phone conference with Holloway re DOI
approval application

Prepare application for DOl approval

Prepare application for DOI approval

Phone conference with Holloway re layoff
issues

Review emails from Donovan re 2706 property
and mailings

Evaluate emails from Pearce, Holloway r¢

" empioyee payment

Evaluate financial documents from J, Murphy
for regulatory submission; prepare email to
Murphy re annual statement

Further prepare application for regulatory
approval

Prepare letter to Valerie Sarfaty re application
and requested information

Pederal Express (Verdun Arnaud)

Federal Express (Gene Hale)

Federal Bxpress (James Harrison)

Federal Bxpress (L. Heard-Davis)

Federal Express (Larkin Teasley)

Federal Express (F. Wadibia)

Invoice# 7226

0.25 hrs.

.50 s,

0.25 hrs.
(.40 hrs.
0.20 hrs.
0.40 hrs.
- 3.50 hrs,

0.20 hrs.
0.10 hrs.
0.20 hrs,

0.60 hrs.

1.30 hrs,

2.00 brs,

Page 8

73,75

147.50

73.75
118.00
59.00
118.00
1,032.50
59.60
29.50
59.00

177.00

383.50

596,00

$32,178.00

16.35%
13,67 4
26.13%"
(635~
16.35

16.35 +~



204410
04/28/2010

04/28/2010

04/29/2010

04/30/2010

04/30/2010

05/04/2010

05/05/2010

05/10/2010

05/10/2010
05/10/2010
05/10/2010
05/10/2010

05/10/2010

05/10/2010

05/10/2010

05/10/2010

Insurance Commissioner

Federal Express (L, Van Eschen)
Federal Express (R. Dobbin)
Federal Express

Federal Express (W, Barringer) '
Federal Express

Pederal Express

Attorney service (LASC)
Federal Express (Ronald Dorbin)

Federal Express (James Harrison)

.Federal Express (L. Heard-Davis)

Federal Express (L. Teasley)
Federal Bxpress (F. Wadibia)

Federal Express (Verdun Arnaud)

Federal Express (Gene Hale)

Federal Express (L. Von Eschen)

Parking

Page 9
13.67¢

Invoice# 7226
26,13
43.34 7
26.1377
9.38
9.52
7.50
37.50 v
26,50+
16.58 »~

16.58.

16.58 v~

13.87»

N
poI
Uséli__‘.bﬁ'
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05/10/2010

05/11/2010
05/11/2010
05/11/2010
05/12/2010
05/12/2010
05/13/2010
05/14/2010
(?5/ 19/2010
05/20/2010
05/20/2010
05/21/2010

052572010

05/25/2010

05/25/2010

05/25/2010

Insurance Commissioner

Attomey service (Obtain minute order)

Filing fee

Attorney service (Obtain certified copy of minute prder)
Attorney service (LASC)

Parking

Attorney service (Certified copy of minute order)

Attorney service (LASC)

Attorney service (Obtain certified copy of minute order)
Federal Express {Dudley ventures)

Federf;l Expreés (Chicago Title)

Attorney service (LASC)

Attorney service (LAS é)

Federal Express {Alhar Enterprise)
Federal Express (Southern Financial Like)
Federal Express {(Swiss Reinsurance)

Federal Bxpress (Optimum Reinsurance)

Invoice# 7226 Page 10

50.55 d

40.00
7715
7.50

18.00

47.58
750 =

26.50 7

23787

2378 ¢

21330




204410  Insurance Comissioner
05/25/2010  Attorney service (LASC)

05/31/2010  Photocopy (9,987 pages @ .10/page)

05/31/2010  Postage

JMT
240
MRW
108.00
RU
0.80

Billing Suthmary

Totai professional services
" Total expenses incurred

Total of new charges for this invoice

Total balance now due

Invoiceff 7226 Page 11

750
998.70 ff
27433
$2,261.91
A
29600 $708.00
2085.00 $31,270.00
250.00 $200.00
$32,178,00
$2,261.91
$34,439.91
........ £

$34,439.91
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Dezlared value: .06 USh
gs ANGELES, CA 80017 Shippet account number; 226051538
S1asair4ay BHl tranteportation tor 2280514538 .
Courtesy rafe quote* 13.67
To: GENEHALE List rates:
Effeative net discount:
gi%w?egﬁbo BEACH Discounted varisila %
GARDENA, CA 002473627 Special services:
us ¥ Shipmunt Purpose:
{213) 861-7487 Shipmanttype: Express
CommarclaliRosidentis] Status;  Commerclal
Tracking no: 703402010871
Your refarancs! 204-410-04
Ship date: 0452802010
Sorvige type: Standard Gvarnight
et

Plaasn nola ;
. * The courtesy rata shown hers may be different thar the g:tual chargas for your shipmanl, Differencas may octur based on actual waight,
FedEx Sorvies Guida

dimensions, gnd other factors, Consull the applicable or the FedEx Rale Shests {or delalls on how shipping chargas
are calculated,

FedEx wil not be responsible for say cialm In axceso of $ 100 par packags, whethar the result of loss, damage, delay, non-delvary,
misdelivery, or misinformation, uniess you dadare a higher value, pay an sddllional chamge, documeal your actusl o3s and fla a limsly clslm,
Limitalions found In the current FedEx Service Guide apply. Your nght lo recover from Fediix for any (033, Including atdasic volua of the
package, loss ol sales, income inferest, profit, allorney's fens, costs, and other farms of damage whather direct, incldaatal, consaquenlist, or
spaciat fs Ymled 1o the greater of $100 or the authorized dutfared vaiue. Recovery cannot exceed aclual dogumonted foss, Maximum for Hems
of exteaordinary valua Is $500, a.4., jowelry, precfous melals, negotiabie inslrurents and othar llems fisted In our Sarvice Gultle, Wilten tlalms
must ba fitad within strict tme limdts; Consult the applicabia FedEx Serdes Guide for dotalls,

G55 Home | S BUSIESS L8Per | SECy Inio | ADOW Fedbs | lnvestor Retlions | Lareors | fadox.com 1erms of Use | SBEOTY & Prvacy { Sio Map §
‘Tiits slie 1a protecied by copysight and tradomad lews under US end intemational Jaw, Al fights resorved.© T895- 2040 FedEx




Espahal { Customer Support § FedEx Locations  Search Go

Package/Envelepe Frelght Expadited OfficelPrint Survices %

P Y T

Ship » Track » Manage + Busin;'szs So!uﬁfms H

FedEx Ship Manager® Logon "
eip

My Profila

Prepare Shipmen! Ship History

Your Shipment Dotalls

From: Fg;%{;%ﬁbl; !j'r!U‘«:Sgga Package type: FedEx Envalope
SONG, P.C. PickupiDrop Oft e e tag 0y schaduled plkup o
:;gos FIGUERDA 8T STE Welghts 0.30 LBS
- Deglared value: 0.00 USD
b‘;s ANGELES, CA J0017 Shipper sscount number: 228061538
2iseatragy Bl transpaortation lo? 278051538
Courtosy rate quoter* 2043 3
Tor JAMES C HARRISON List ratey:
3785 BHERBROGK GT Effaciive net discount:
Discotunied variable %
g&%ﬁ?ﬁspﬁ‘ﬂ“' GA Specinl servicos: Rugldeniial delivery
us Shinmunt Purposet
(212} 8817487 Shipment iype: Exprass
Commaorglal/Residentiat Status:  Rosidents
Tracking no: 793482883262
Your reforence: 204-410-04
Ship date: 04128/120 10
Service typa; Standard Ovarnight

Plense note } )
, *Tha courlasy rle shewn hare may ba diferent than the actual charges for your shipment. Diffarancas may oceur based on acluel welght,
dimenslons, and other faclors, Consult the applichble of the FedEx Rate Shuels for detalls en how shipping charges

are calculated.

Fedgx will not be responsivie for any clalnt In excoss of $100 per packags, whether tha rasull of loss, damage, delay, non-allvery,
misdelivery, or misinformation, unlesg you duciare 3 higher valus, gay on eddilianat chargs, documant your acluat loss and file a imsly clalm,
Limitatlons found In the curant FedEx Sarvice Guids apply, Your dght to recovar from Fed€x for any joes, Including Inldngle value of the
package, koss of sales, Incomne Inlerest, profit, silomey's faus, costs, and othor forms of damage whethae diract, ingidenial, consequential, or
speclat [a fimited 10 tha greats? of $100 or the authorized declarad value, Recovary cannot oxcead aclual documented loss, Maximum for tiems

of extraordingry value Is $500, a.0., Jewelry, pracious matals, negotiable insiruments snd other tarms fisted tn our Service Gulde, Whitten clalms
must ba filed within strdct fme Krits; Cengsull the applicabls Fedbx Service Guida for dutsfls. :

Glabai Hama | Smal BUSKAss Contar | Sarvica N[0 | Abowd FeIEx | tnmsta: Retations | Caraors | ledex 2om Terms ol Usa | Seciny & Prvaty 1 Sle Map |
This slle is predecied by copydght aid rademark laws under US and intemational law, All rights teverved.© 1983- 2010 FedEx -



Egpailol | Gust Support } FedEx Lotal Search Go
Package/Envelops Fralght Expedited OfficelPrint Servicos
Shig » Track » Manags + o Businoss Solutlons »

FFediEx Ship Manager® Logout

Help

Propsra Shipmeant

Ship Bistory

My Lists

My Profile

Your Shipment Datalls

From: MICHAEL R, WEISS Patkage typy; FadEx Envgiopa

ggﬁgﬁiﬁb TURNER & PlckupfDrop Off: Usa; an ﬂlready stheduled plekup st
« F L my lscation
:;;05 FIGUBROA ST STE Welght: 0.30 L85
' Deciarad vahia; 000 USD
LOS AMNGELES, GA 1 '
ug G 1 GA 50017 Shipper account number: 25051538
2138817487 Bilt teangportation to: 220051538
Courtasy rate quole: 16.35

To: M3 LONEAR W HEARD- Listroten:

DAVIS Effestive not discount:
Dheounted verable %

;%‘ggﬁ%”ﬁm AVE Spaclal sovicen: Residontiat dalivery
p0azi1024 * Shipment Purposa:
us Shipment type: Exprags
{213) 861-7487 CommerciaifResidenital Status:  Residentlul

Tracking no? 703432608758

Your referance: 2044 10.04

Bhip dater 04/2812010

Service type; Standard Ovemipht

sre ¢alculatad,

dimenslons, shd othar factors. Consull the applicadle

Plaasa nota ¢
. * The coutlasy rate shown hare may be difforent fian the sctual charges for your shioment. Biffgrances may ostur based on aciual waight,
EedEx Sondea Gulde

ot the FodEx Rata Sheets for datails on how shipping charges

FedEx will ol be rasponsible for any dalm In excess of $100 per packags, whather (he result of Yoss, damage, delay, non-dellvary,
misdelivary, or misinformation, unless you daciara 3 higher valug, pay an additlonal charge, documant your selual lose end file » Umely claim,
Limitatons found In the current FedEx Servica Gulde apply. Your vighl to recover fram FedEx for sny loss, Inciuding intrinsie valus of the .
packags, loss of sales, Incoma Interast, profii, altornay’s fees, costs, and iher forme of damoga whethar diract, incldental, consequantial, or
spectal Is limited fo the greater o7 $100 o the suthodzed dedared value, Recovery cannot exceed acluat documented loss, Maxlnum for flems
of axirsordinary valug la $500, e.4., Jowalry, precious melals, negatiable Instruments and other itams lstad b aur Servics Guide, Wiillen clatms

must be Blad within strict time limits; Congult tha spplicable FedEx Senvics Quide for delails,

Glotst Hone [ ol Sussess Canter | Service [nfo | About FodEx | ivastor Relations | Careers | ledextom Terms of Uso | Secuply & Pnvacy | Stabhup {
‘This sila is protecled by copyright and irademark laws under US and intamalionat law, All Agivls teserved © 1O0B- 2040 Fadix




Espatol § Customer Sugport } FedEx Locebony  Seaich Go

Package/Envelope Fralght Expoditad OffteeiPrint Servicas %
Ship » Trac? H ﬁanaga + “Businoss Solutong +

FedEx Ship Manager®

toaoul
Help

Prepara Shipmen! Ship Histary Rupofts My Profife

Your Shipment Detalls

. * The courlesy rate shown here may
dimenslons, and oiher attars, Consull the epplicable

asra coltulated.
FadEx wil not ba responstale for ary ciaim In excess of $103 per packags, whether the ro

misdefvary, or misinformation, unless you declara a Higher vatue,

package, loss of gatey, lncome Interest, profit, altomsy's faes, tosts,
speciat i limited (o the greaterof $100 or the sutharized dedared valva, Recovery

of extraordinary vatue s $500; e.g.,
st bo filed wathin sirict ime mits; Cansull the nppiicatia FadEx Service Gulda for datalls.

Litiiations Touad In the currert FedEx Survica Gulde apply. Yaur fight lo recovar from FedEx for any lass,
gnd other forms of damage whalher direct, Incldenial, consequenlla), o

cannot excaed agtual documented loss, Maximum for items
Jowelry; pracious metals, negotfabls Instruments and olher lterns listed i our Service Gulde, Writlan cieims

From; MICHAEL R, WEISE Package typs: FadEx Envelope
§gﬁg&|§gumm & Plskuplorop Off: t.la;aI ::a ggsadyschadulzd plekup at
777 S FIGUEROA ST STE g a0 tes "
nataced valua: 0.00 USD
Efés ANGELES, CA B001T Shippur account numbort 226051538
2136817487 Bl transpartetion to: 226051538
Gourtesy rate guofe:? 18.35
Yo: LARKIN TEASLEY List rates;
. 4583 DONMILAGRO DR ’ Effective net dissoint:
¥
Lo ANGELES, CA glscnuntod \:arlaihla %
B00DAZ851 naclal services: Restdantral deftvery
s Shipment Purpose!
{213} 861-7487 Shipment fyper Express
Commerchai/Rosidenilal Status:  Realdentisl
Tracking ho: 793407724314
Your reference: 204-410-04
Ship date: 0412812010
Servicatype: Slangiard Ovemight
Ploase nole ; -
be diffsrant Tran the sclual charges for your shipment, Diffarences may octur based on actus] welght,

orthe FedEx Raie Shaots for detalis on how shipping chisrges

st of oas, damags, delay, noo-delivery,
v an edditionat charge, documen] your aciual oss snd fila & firnply clalin,
Inetuding inlrinslo value of the

Thig site Is protacled by copyright and tedamerk laws yndar US and Intern

iaber fiome | Smak Busness Cenar | sendce 1nk | Avcut Fedix | Invesior Retll TCaroqrs | fedex com Terms of Use | Secindy & Prvacy t Ste Map]
ationsd law, All dghts reserved.® 1865 2010 FedEx




Espafic? | Customes Suppoit] FedBa Localiong  Search Go

Package/Envelope Eraight Expedited OfficelPrint Sarvices %

Ship » Track» Manaé:r Businass Selutions *

FedEx 8hip Manage:® Loaet
Help

Prepare Shiprsnl Ship History  J| My Lists Repots MyProfls
Your Shipment Datalls
From: 2&;%!;2% ?U‘:EIS:& Pachage typa: FadEx Envelopa
1N, d
SONG, P.C. Pickupforop O o ssheduied pickup
I;;os FIGUERDA ST STE Welght: 030 LS
Doclerad value; 000 USD
bgs ANGELES, GA 00017 Shippar accountnumbsr: 228051538
2538617487 8l transporiation tor 226051538
Courlusy rale quote:® -13.8
To! FREDERICK E WADIBIA List ratest &
Elective not discount:
11260 OVERLAND AVE Biscounted varlable %
APT 114 Special services:
CULVER CITY, CA 80230 Po ;
us - Shipment Purposa:
{213) BE 17487 Shipmont type: Express
ComrrroteiaURealdantlal Status:  Caommercial
Tracking nor Ta3dp2 767332
Your reforenca: 204-410-04
Ship date: 0472812010
Servics type: Standard Ovemight
Ploass note 1 .
. * The courtesy rale shewn hara iriay be different than tha aclsl charges for your shipment. Differences may oceur basad on aclual welght,
dimensions, and ofher factors. Consull the applicable FadEx Service Gukla or the FodEx Rate Sheets for delalis on how shipping charges
are caltulated.
FeoEx wi notba responsible for sry ¢laim In excass of $100 per packege, whather the rysull of oss, damage, delay, nondallvory,
misdelivery, or misinformation, unlass you declare a higher value, pay an acditlonst charye, document your ackuat loss and file a gmely clsim,
LimEtations found n the current FedEx Service Gukia apply, Your fight o recaver fom FedEx for any loss, Incitding intdnslo valua of the
packogs, loss of sales, Income inlerest, profit, altorney’s fees, coals, and othat forms of damege whather dlregt, incidents’, consequenifal, o
spavialis Irnited to the greater of $100 or the authorized dacixred valie, Racovery eannol sxceed aciusl dacumentad loss, Maximum for tems
of extraoeginary value 1s $500, 0.0, Jawnlry, precious melals, negotable instrumenty and olher flama listed In our S ervice Gulds, Wiitlan clalms
mwst ba fled within stded B Umils; Consult tha applicable FedEx Servies Gulde for detatls,
Biier ] Servica (o | ABGH FEdEx | invesior Relstons | Catesrs | fedex.com Tarms of Uso | Secunty & Privecy 15Re Map |

Giaval Homa | Smial Business ©

Tris site I protacled by copyright snd rademark laws under US and Intemational taw, Al dghts resarved.© 1996 2010 FedEx



Espanol § Custemer Suppoit ! FedEx Locations  Searth | Go

Package/Eavelope Fralght Expadited OfficelPrint Servicos ¥
Shipt Track » Manago ¥ Business Solutions »

FedEx Ship Manager® ‘ Logout
Halp

Prapare Stipmant Ship History My Lists

Your Shipment Detalls

From: MIGHAFL R. WEESS Package typa: FadEx Envelops
ggﬁg g.. éum R& Plckup/rop OH: gs;al b gi::‘ady sthaduled pickip
zg 03 FIGUEROA ST 8YE ‘é‘ez"""d ; .80 188
sctared vaiue 9,00 USD
: h%s ANGELES, CA 80017 Silpper stoount number: 226054538
2438817487 a1 transportation to; 228051538
Courtasy rate quote™ 1367
o LISA VON ESCHEN List rates:
ABELSON HERRONLLP Ettactive net dlscount!
?3208 GRAND AVE STE Discountsd variable %
Lf)s ANOBLES, CA Spocinl services:
900711545 Shipment Purpose:
us Shipment type: Express
{2133 402-1900 CommerciaVResidantial Status:  Cammerclal
Tracking no: 703492610188
Your reference! 204-410.04
Ship date: 04/28/2010
Service type! Standard Ovemiphi

Pleasanate !
. * The courasy rle shown hare may be differant than the aclual charges for your shkipment, Dffatances may oocur based on ecluel walght,

dimanslons, and other factors, Coneuit the applicable FedEx Servica Guide or the FedEx Rale Sheats for dotalls on how shipping charges

ere caley'siad, .
£edEx wii riot ba responsitite for any clalm in excass of $100 per package, whether the resull of loss, damage, delay, non-deitvary,
rrisdalivary, of misinformation, Untess you datlara a higher valus, pay sn tdittons! charge, document your aclusl loss and fils 8 tirnely clalm,
Limitations fotund In the current FedEx Service Guide apply, Your right to recover frorm FedBx for any loss, ncluding Intdnsic value of the

package, Jaes of sales, income Interast, profi, altomey's feas, costs, snd othar forms of damage whather direst, incldenial, consequential, or
apecial la Imited to fhe groater of $100 or the authorized declared valus, Recavery caanol oxcesd selual docurnanted oss, Maxdimum for ltems
of exirpoidinary value Is $500, e.g., jowelry, praclous metals, negobsbla nsirnsments and other llems listed i our Service Guids, Wiitlsn clalms
st be filed wihia slict tme #mits: Corsult the appiicable Fedtx Bervica Guide for datalls,

Elanyl Homa | Smal Bamness Ganter | Sorvecs flo T Aot Touln | ineerior Relabons | Cpresrs | fedaz.com 16ms of Use | Seeunly & Pavacy | Sig bap |
This sha is protected by copyright and trademark tews under US and intamatlonai faw. Al dghts ressrved.@ 1995, 2010 Fedix



Espahal | Customor Suppart § FedEx Lotations  Sesrch Ga

PackagolEnvelopo Fralght Expadiied OftlcaiPriat Sorvices ¥

2w e w e

Ship ¥ Track ¥ Manage » " Business S;lut[ons '

FedEx Ship Manager® Lopout
Help

Prapare Shepment Ship History My Lisiy My Profig

Yeur Shipmant Detalls

From: gé%l;h'% %\;JE&SF?& Package type! FedEx Envelope
SONGE, Ay M Plekup/Drop Off: g:ﬁ :z; ;‘I;ﬂeady schexuled plokug at
z;gf FIGUERQA STSTE Welght: 0.0 Lag

Declared value: b.on USOH
L s
Ugs ANGELES, GA 80017 Shipper secount aumbern 220051508
2138617487 BIY transportation to; 226051838

Courtesy rrte quotar® 2?;35 V4

o RONALD R-DOBBIN List ratos: P 3

2730 MORGAN LN Effactive nel discount! ;Z' t
Discounted vatiable %

bgVEROCK' PA 150387234 Speciai sarvitas:

(213) B 1-TAAT Shipment Purposst
Shipmenttype: Expross

Commsrelslfitosidantlal Siatus:  Commerciz!

Tracking not 798814459618

Your refergnce: 204-410-04

Ship date: 04/2812040

Sapvite type! Stancard Ovamight
Please nots !

| . * The courlasy rate shown here may ba different thian the aclual chazges (or your shipmenl, Diferences may accur based on ecluat welght,
drmenslons,egnd tiher factora, Consull the applicable £ ice Guids o ihe FadEx Rate Shasts for delalis on kow shipping changes
ara cakulated,
ull of toss, dermagy, deatay, noadelivery,

FedBx wil not be reaponsibla for any detm in excesa of $100 per packsge, whathar tha res
rrusdstivery, o misnformation, Unlass you deslare a Klighar veluo, pay an sdtitionss charge, document your atiuat 1059 and e o Umely clalm,
Uimialions found In (hé current FedEx Seivice Gulde apply, Your fight lo rocover from FedEx for any loss, inclirding intdnsic value of the
packege, ks of sales, incoma interest, profit, alfornay’s feas, custs, sad other forms of damaga whather direct, Incldaniat, consagquantisl, of
spedial 13 fimited 1o the greatar of $100 orthe aulhorzed declarad value, Recovely cannot excead actua! documented loss, Maxtmum for lems
of txkaodinary value 15 5500, 8.5, jewelry, proclous matats, nagolisble Instruments and olher fiems sted In qur Service Guide. Wrillen clalms

rust ba filed withi sirdat lima limils; Consul the applicable FedEx Sarvics Gulds for datalls.

Aboul FedEx | mvesior Raletions | Garaors | jedaxtom 1 erms of Use ] Secweity & Privacy ] So Man |
Taws padsr US snd Intemationa! law, All riphig reserved § 1995 2010 FodEx

.

Govni Helng | Gmas Busyiess Genter { Service kvt |
This sita Is proleciad by copyright and trademark



Detalled Results . PentacFrisndly Get Link

Page 2 of 2

Halp

{Enter racking number

; Detafled Rosulla Nolificalions

Sighed for by: LESTROM

Shipmant Dates Degtinstion
Shipdata 3t Apr28, 2010 LOS ANGELES, CA
Deljvery date 3 Apr 30, 2010 10:00 AM Slanalure Proolof Defivery

Tracking no.. 406118791304 Select thne format: f2H | 244 " Emal potifications
Delivered SRR PR SRR, RUIR .
fnilated  Pickedup  Infransit  Delivered .
. Oellvarad

Shipment Travel History

Shipment Facls _ Halp
Service type Prioity Pak Dallvered to ReceplionistFeont Desk
Weight 1.0thsl5 kg Reforence 788071448981 8/PER SHPR/PER
TRACE
tnvolos number 708614483818/PER SHPRIPER
TRAG
Halp

Selact time zone: [Locsl Scan Time ~]

All shipmant Trave! sctivity is dlsprayed In focal time for the location

Date/Tima Activity {ncatlon Detalls
Apr 30, 2010 $C00AM Doliversd LOS ANGELES, CA

Apr 30, 2010 8:45 AM On FedEx vehlale for dellvary LOS ANGELES, CA

Apr 30, 2010 7149 AM Atiocal FedEx facility LOS ANGELES, CA

Apt 30, 2010 446 AN Atdast sort facility LOS ANGELES, CA

Apr 30, 2010 2:59 AM Oaparted FedEx locallon MEMPHIS, TN

Apt 30, 2010 1115 AM Anived st FadEx location MEMPHIS, TN

Apr 29, 2010 8235 PM $.eft FedEx origin facillty FORT WASHINGTON, PA
Apr 20, 2040 1:40 PN Shipment infarmation sent to FedEy ’
Apr 29, 2010 2:15 PM Plekad up FORT WASHINGTON, PA

Glooat Home | Smatl Busmass Center | Sermca Tnts § About FedEn | fnvestor Ralatons | Ceraets | fedex.com Tarms of Use | Privacy Polcy [ $ie Mao
Fhis slla i protacted by copyaght and tademark laws vnder US and International law. Al rights reserved. © 1955 2010 FedEx

v

hltp:l{fedex.comlTrackinngctail?snmmy&ascendﬁheadem1&c!ientiype*—"dotcom&snbﬁo&cnuy__c... 6/6/2010



Espubol | Customer Suppod ¢ Fedtx Locations  Search Go

PackagelEnvelope Froight Expadiied Office/Print Services

Ship » Track » Manage » Business Sojutions »

FFedEx Ship Manager® Logout ol
eip

Pragara Shipment Ship Histoey My Profils

Your Shipment Detalls
from: g;%ﬂg;zl. ?u‘axsgg& Package typo: FadEx Envelops
TEIN,
80N, PG, PlekupiDrop OIf gl;al::afgﬁm Scheled pickap &
:;;08 FIGUEROA 8T STE Welght: 0.90 185
Detterad valus: 0,00 USD
hgs ANGELES, CA 80017 Stipper account number; 228051838
2138847487 Bt traneportation to; 208051538
. Courteny rete quate:* 2643 v~
Tot WILLIAM BARRINGER {ist rates:
1008 BRETT €T Effectiva not discovnt:
Diseounted vadatle %
gs%ga"&?& NG Special services: Rusldential delivery
us Shipment Furposor
31850495296 Shipmont type: Exprass
CommerclaiReshientlal $latuy!  Residentis!
Tracking not 79622206777
Your reference: 20441004
Ship date: 0473012010
Sarvice typs: Standard Ovarnight
Pleass note ! '
. * The couriesy tale shown hiero may ba diferant than he actus! chargos for your shipment, Differances may oceur based on sctual waight,
dimensions, asd othar feclors, Consull the appliceble FedEx Servica Guide or the FedEx Rots Sheals for delalis on how shipping charges
ara calouiated. .
Fadtix wh not ba responsible for any claim In excess of $100 per packoge, whether the rasult of loss, demage, delay, nen-delivery,
rmisdalivery, or misioformation, Unlsss you declare a higher value, pay an addilfonal charga, document your sctual 1059 and file & timaly clalm,
{ImBations found In the current FedEx Sarvice Gulde apply. Yourright to secover from FedEx for eny loss, including Intrnsic value of the
packaps, loss of sales, Income Inferast, profit, allomey's fees, cotls, and uther forrs of damage whether ditect, Incldenta), consequantlal, or
spacial{s fimited 1o the graater of $100 ar the suthorized deciared valus, Recovary cannol exceed ackus! dpcumented foss. Maximum for flems
of axtraordinary valus Is $500, a.q., jevaky, precious matels, negotiable Instruments and othar ters Hsled in aur Servica Guide, Wrillen cislms
must be filed within stict time fimits; Consult the applicable FadEx Servico Guida tor delalls, .
Tervice Inta | AboU! FetEr | Hvastor Ralavons | Carears | ledex cam 1 arens of Usn { Searry & Fovacy [ Ste Mag |

Tiiooai Home § o Busimess Center |

This site 15 protected by copyright and trademark faws under US and Internationai Taw, All rights reserved @ 1685. 2010 FodEx



Eapaficd | Cuslomer Support | FodEx Localong  Search Go *

PaskagelEnvalops Fralght Expodited OfficelPrint Services ¥
Ship ¥ Track ¥ Manage » Business Solutlons »

FedEx Ship Manager® Lo00m
Help

Prepare Shipment Ship History My Lists My Profis

iy

Your Shipment Detalls

From: gé%i:rcé% };BWELBRS& Package typs! Fedex Envelopa
RN {
SONG. P.C. Pickup/Drop Off; e il schaduled pickup 3l
77 d‘.l FIGUEROA ST ETE Waight 030 L9
495
Declared value: 6,00 USD
{}%S ANGELES, GA 90017 SWipper account iumbef: 226051538
213BB174BT Bl transpotiation tor 228051538
Caurtesy rate quoter® Zy /
Tot RONALD R DOBHIN {1zt rates: 3 7 j" O
7730 MORGAN LN Effective nat discount; v
Discounted variable % R
;JEVEROGK. PA 100387234 Spacial sarvices:
2138617487 Shlpment Purpose:
Shipment type; Exprass
Tracking not 7035208393423 Commerclal/Residential Stolus;  Commercish
Your referanca: 204-410-04
Ship date! 051012010
Servicetypet Standend Qvernight

Pieasa noto :
. * Tha courtasy rale: shown here may ba glfarant than the acluz! charges for your shipmanl, Difrences may occur hased on aclual walght,

Srnansions, and olher factars, Consult he applicable FedEx Senvica Gulde or the FedEx Rele Sheets for delalls on bow shippling charges
arg eatoulntad,

FadEx wii not ba responsible for any clalm In axcess of $400 por package, whether ihe result of foss, damage, dalay, non-delivery,
misdelivery, ormisinformation, upless you declare 2 highor valus, pay an sdditionsl charge, documnent your acluailoss snd fla 2 tmaly celm,
LUnitallons found in the current FedEx Servica Guida apply, Your dghl to tavover from FedEx for any toss, Including Intdnsic value of ihe
packogs, loss of sales, incorne interast, profi, allornay's ass, costs, and other forms of damage whather direct, Incldintal, consequantisl, or
specialis mitad fo the greater of $160 or the sulhofized dadared valug, Racovery cannot sxcoed aciyal documented loss. Maximum for llems
of extraordinary vatue Is $600, a.g., Jawelry, preclous matals, negotiabta instruments and ofher lems fsled in our Service Gulds. Witlen claims
mmust be fled wihin strlet tima Hmils; Consult the applicatle FedEx Service Gulde for details,

Giobal Home] Sma ButHisss Center | Sarvice tnfo | About FodEx | Imvastor Remuans | Gareers | [eder,com Terms of Uag | Security & Favacy | Sae Fiop |
This site {s protecid by copyright and tradermark laws vadar LS and Inlemnational faw. All rights teserved,® 1895 2010 FedEx



Expadol | Gustomer Suppart | FedEy Localiom,  Searth Go

Package/Envelops Fraight Expadited OHlcelPrint Seivices 3

Ship » Track ¢ Manags + Business Solutions ¥
FedEx Ship Manager® Logout
Holp
Prapare Shipment | Ship Histary My Profils
Your Shipmont Detalls
From: M!GP.:_AEL R, WEISS Package typa: FedEx Envelopa
A =1
ggi (SIEQTURN R & PlckupiDrop Off: g;a !;;’a gﬁ:ady schedulad plckup al
gg 65 FIGUEROA ST 8TE Welght: 0,30 LBS
Declered value: 060 USD
b?ss ANGELES, GA w0017 Shipper aceount numbar: 226051538
2138817487 Bl tranisportation lo: 226051538
Courtesy rata guote:” 2850
T JAMES C HARRISON Listratess
3788 SHERBROOK GT EHzctive nat discount:
Olscounted varlzhls %
COLLEGE PARK, GA Spsclal services] Raskdanifal delivery
303481446
Us Shipment Purposar
2138817487 Shigment type: Express
CommerclaliRestdontial Stalus:  Resklantial
Tracking no: 793528307313 )
Yaur raference: 204-410.04
Ship date; 05/10/2610 .
Service type: Standard Cvarnight

Please note ¢
« * The courtasy rate shown hete may bs diffarant than the actual changes for your shipment, Difaronces may occur based on aelual welght,
dintensions, and othar faclors, Consult the applicable EadEx Servics Gulde or the FadEx Rete Sheels for delals on how shipping charges
are calculated.

FedEx wit not ba responsible for any clalm Jn excess of $100 per packays, whether the rasult of toss, damage, defay, non-detivary,
misdaivary. or misinformation, untess you declars a higher vale, pay sn addional charge, document your acluel joss and fila a Emely clalm,
Limitations found in tha current FadEx Servica Guide apply. Your fght fo meover from FedEx for any loss, including Infrnsic vatue of the
packags, oss of salas, income Inlecest, profit, attomay’s fess, cosls, and other forms of damaga whether direct, InGidentsl, consequential, or
spacial i mlled to tha grester of $100 or the suthorized declared value. Recovery cannot exceed acival documented loss. Maximum for flems
of extrasondinaty value is 3500, a.g., jewelry, praclovs metals, nagotlable Insteuments and other Hame tisted in our Senvice Gulde, Wiitlen claims
must ba Hed within strict fime Bmils; Consult the spplicable FedEx Sarvicas Gulde for delalls,

GHebal Hone | Simal Busingss Center | SRANGE |nid | Abolf FadEy § Invesior Retatons { Coreers | tedox com Texms of Use | Sequriy & Favacy [ Ste flant
Thig ghte Is prolested by copydghl and frademark faws under US end intemationat faw, All ights reserved.© 1805- 2010 FedEx




Espanel | Cusomar Supbont | FedEx Locstions  Search Go

Package/Envelops Fretght Expedited OffleelPrint Services b 4
Ship ¥ Track ¥ Manage ¢ Business Solutions *

FedEx Ship Manager® Logou!
Help

Prapata Shipmoat l| Ship History Reparls My Profite
Your Shipment Detalls .
From: I\EAFI,%#&% ?U \*‘{SES& Packags typet FadEx Envelopo
A RE . .
SONG, F.C. : Plokup(Drop Off: se on siready schoduled pickip 3
:;gos FIGUEROA ST STE Wﬂlﬂh“ , 0.30 Las
Datlarad valua: 800 USD
GELE 7
b%s ANGELES, CA. 8001 Shipper account number: 226051838
. 2135817467 Bifl frunmportation o1 228051538
Courtesy rate quote:* 1858 o/
To: MS LONEAR W HEARD- List rates:
DAVIS Effective net discount:
Discounted variably % .
4800 LINCOLNSHIRE AVE Spectal sarvicas: Ragldenital delvery
BUENA PARK, CA .
05241021 . Stipmont Purpesé: .
us Shipment type: Exprass
2138617487 CominarclalfResidontlal Statuw:  Residentlat
Tracking no? 193528309728
Your toference; 204-410-04
Ship date: 051072010
Setvice typs! Srandarnd Overnight
Plgasanole ; .
, *Tho courtesy rate shown here may ba different than the sclual chargas for your shipment. Diferances may occur basad on actvef welghl,
timensions, and other faslors. Consull the applicabie’ FerEx Sarvea Gulus of the FedEx Rate Shonts for detafis on how shipping charyes
are cakculsled, .
FedEx vl not be responsibie for any olalm in excass of $100 per packags, whether the resuit of loss, damags, defay, non-dalivery,
vsdalivary, of misinfommation, unlass you deciara a higharvalue, pay an addillensl charge, docurment yous actunt toss and fla @ timely dalim,
Limitations found in the currant FadEx Sarvice Gulde apply. Your dght 1o recovar from FedEx for any loss, Induding Intrinsta valua of the
package, loss of eales, Incoma Intecast, profit, atlomay's fees, costs, and other forms of damage wheiher direct, Incidentaf, consequentlal, or
spaciat (s limited to tha greater of 3100 vr the euthortzad daciared value. Recovary cannal excaed actial documented lopa, Maxioem Rz lems
ol axitasrdinary valun I3 $500. 0.g., jowelry, pracious rmetals, negodabls nstrumants and other ftems isted In our Service Guids, Writien clalms
must ba filed withn stdct time hmils; Conaull ha sppicabla FadEx Sorvice Guide for defalls,
Cional lnme § Gnial Busmesk Center § Sernce Trfe § Dol FRaEx ] Investor Helatons | Caraars § lodex.tom ‘!"a:ms of Gen | Gactinly & Prdvaty 1 Sith Map

This sita Is protecled by copyright and trademark faws vnder US and Intemational faw. All Hights resarved & 1995- 2010 FedEx



. Eopaited | Costomer Suppon} RadExlocntions Search Go

PackagefEnvelope Frolaht Expedited Otttpo/Print Services %
Ship » Track b Manage ¥ Businays Soluttons

FedEx Ship Manager® Leggut Help

Prapare Stupmenl Ship History My Lists My Profite
Your Shipment Detalis
Frop: g;%%‘;‘% ?.U g&g&:& Prckage type: FedEx Envelope
SONG, .C. Plekupfop Off; g:?:clgg:ady scheduled plckp o
:;;}Sf IGUERQA BT 8TE Welght: 0.30 LBS
Daclared valie: 000 USD
‘,3?35 ANGELES, CA 50017 Shippar secoent nymbsr; 228051535
2438817467 Bl transportation fo! 2268051538
{ourtesy rate gupte” 16.56
To: LARKIN TEASLEY List rates; -
EHective net discount:
4581 DON MILAGRO DR Dlscounted varabla %
%%%ELES. CA Spaclal servicos: Rasidantlal Cafhery
us Shipment Purposs!
21336847487 Shipmentype Exprasy
Commerciot/Residenttal Statust  Residontlal
Tracking not 793528401412 ' .
Your reference! 201441004
ghip dats: Q8102010
Sarvice type: Stangerd Cvarnight

Plause noto 3
.* Tha courlesy rate shown here may ba diffarent than the acival chitges for your shipment, Differences may oogur based on actizal walght,

" dimensions, and other faciors, Consull the appiicabls FadEx Senvcn Ouide or the FedEs Hate Sheals for detslis on how shipplng chaeges

are caictipled,
FadEx Wit nod ba responsitie for any elalm in excess of $100 pes packaps, whisther the rosul of lose, damsaga, dalay, non-delivery,
misdsfivery, or misinformalion, unfess you daciara a highar vaiue, pay an sdditlonal charge, documant yout atiual loss v Ra e limely claim.

timitatlons Found in the cutrant FedEx Servioe Gulda apply. Your rght to recover from FedEx for any toss, including intansle valua of the
packagy, loss of galys, incoms Intarast, profil, allorpay’s faes, costs, ard other forms of damage whether direct, incidentef, consequentiel, or
special Is Imited 1o the preater of 3100 or the suthorized daclsred vae, Recovery cannot excesd scival documenled loss, Maximum for itamy
of exirsordinary value Js $500, e.0., jawalry, preclous matals, negotiabie lstrments and other Items fisted In our Service Guide. Writtan clalms

must be flled within strct tima Emits; Consul the applicabls FedEx Sunvice Gulde for detals,

¢ 1 lousk.com 1erms of Use | oenitty & Prascy | Site Kog ¢

Ciobal Homa | Srad BOEINees Lenler | aervca 1010 ] About FedEx | invesior Ratatons | Careo
Al rights reserved © 1095- 2010 FedEx

Tals sita Is pratecied by copydght and tradarmark laws under U5 end Intemavional faw,



£spanol { Custortsr Suptot s Fedbx Locstions  Seatch Ga

Packagel/Envelops Eralght Expedited OfflcelPrint Servicas 8
Ship Track » Manage » Business Soluflons +

FedEx Ship Manager® Loagu! et
olp

Prepate Shiprmient Ship Hiatary My Lisis My Profila
Your Shipment Datalls
From; MICHAEL R WEISS Package type: . FedEx Envalops
' H R&
o P.'c. RNE PlckupiDrop OH: g:‘a! :c;; ;g:sdy schediled pickup al
Zg;os FIOUEROA ST 83TE Welght: 530 L85
Deotared value: Q.00 USh
bgs ANGELES, GA S0017 Shipper account sumber: 220051538
21368817447 Bl transporation to; . 226051528 /
_ Gourtasy rale quate:* 387 / 5 g’
To! FREDERICK E WADIBIA List rates: G-
: Effactive net discount:
11260 OVERLAND AVE, Discounted varable %
EULVER OITY, GA 90230 Spaclal services:
us ' Shipmant Purpose!
{213) 8811487 Shipment type! Expross
CommercialfResidenital Status:  Commarclal
Tracking no; 793528407155
Your reference: 204-410-04
Ship date! 0511012010
Gorvice type: Standard Qvernight
Pleassnote ¢
. * Tha couriesy rate shovn hore may be diffsrent than Lhe actual chodges for your shipment. Difarances may occur based on atlual walgh,
dimensions, and ofher factors, Consult the applicable FedfxServcs, Em or e FadEx Rate Shests for delsils on how shipping charges
atg calculated,
FodEx will not ba responsible farany clalm In excess of $100 per package, whather the rasoll of loss, damags, delay, non-detivery,
fiisdalivary, ormisinformation, unlas you decisre a highor value, pay 8n addifional charge, docurmant your aclual lozs and filg @ timgly claim.
Limitations found In the current FedEx Servica Gulda apply, Your right tu recover from FedEx for any ias8, Including intrnsic value of the
packngs, loss of salas, incoma Interast, profll, atiorney's facs, costs, gnd other fosms of dsmage whather direst, Incidental, consequaniial, of
spect! is livited 1o the greafer of 3100 or the authordzed daclarad value, Recovery cannol excead actual documanied loss. Mexlrum lor lems
of extraordinary valye Is $500, €.9., Jawelry, preclous melals, negoliebla Instruments and sther flems Tisted In our Servite Guide, Writlen claims
must pe filed wikin strict e lmits; Consult the applicable FedEx Service Gulda lor datalls,
Jtivasior Relanone | Gafears | 1208% com TBIMS of Use | Securdy & Prvaey 1 Sne idap

CiiaGaIHome Smal Busmess Center { vervice tafo ] About FedEx|
This st |3 prolected by copyrght end trademark laws under US snd intemstional law, A1 rights rosarved.© 1095- 2010 FedEx




' Esnant! | Customer Suppo f FodEx Locations Searcn as

packagelEnvelope Fraight Expodied OfficaiPrint Sorvices ¥
Ship s Track ¥ Manage ? Business Soludions »

FedEx Ship Manager® Logout
Help

Prapars Shipmant Ship History My Lsls

Your Shipment Detalls
From: KHCHAEL R, WSISS Packarge type: FedEx Envelops
ggggﬂ:ig- CT.UR ER & Plckup/Orop Offs ‘.,J;B; :c“a gg:ady schedtted plekup 3t
:;;DS FIGUERDA ST 8TE Welght: 030 LBS
Declared valus: 0,00 USD
bgs ANGELES, GA 86017 Shipper asoountnumbar 226051836
2138817447 Bt tranxportation {o 216051638
Coutlasy rate quote’ 1858
To! VERDUN &, ARNAUD Listrates:
Effeciive net distount:
251 Z&ENOOWER AVE Discountod variable %
;SOSZTT 1(;»§LES, A Speclal services: Rasidantlal defivery
us Shipment Purpoye:
2138617487 Shipment type: Express
CommarcialiResidential Statua:  Residental
Traoking ne: 7UB8503T4238
Your relorence! 204-410.08
Ship date: 054012010
Servive type: Standard Overmight

Ploase note !
. % Tha courtasy rale shown here may bo different than (he scius! charges for your shipmenl. Differences may oteyr based on sctual welght,

dimensions, and other factors, Consul the applicablo FedEx Sepace Gudy of the FodEx Rata Sheets for detalls on how shipping charges
are caltulated,

FadEx wil nol ba responsibis for any tlsim In excess of $100 pas packags, whoeiher the rasull of loss, datnags, delay, non-tativary,
misdabvery, of misinformation, unless you daclare & higher vatue, pay 8n addittonal charge, doctment your aciual fosg aad filo s fmely dalm,
Lumitations found It the current FedEx Service Guide apply, Your Aght to recover from FedEx for any 1oss, indludlag Intdnsle valus of the
packsge, loss of salss, Incoms Intarest, prafll, allomey’s feas, costs, knd tlher forms of damage whether diredt, Incidental, consaqueatial, o
specinl Is imited lo tha grealer of 5100 or tha aulhorized declarad valua, Recovery cannot sxceed actual dosumented loss. Maxdmum forttems
of extracrcinary valua ls $500, a.g,, Jewely, precious matals, negotisble instumenls and other ffoms listad n our Service Gulda, Willten clalms
wus! be Hed within stict lime #mils; Consull tha applicable FedEx Service Guide for dutalls,

Vrotal Hene § Smail Busness Cenler I Sanace o | Abol FedEx | invssia: Faistmn [ 76818 ] feoaA com Tarms of e | Secunty & Pavacy | Ste hapi
This sita Is protesiad by copyright and tredemark laws undse US and Infernational law. All sighls reserved.© 1998- 2010 FedEx



Expofiot [ Gusistier Suppoft ) FedBs tocations  SEEN Go

Packagel/Envelope Fraight Expadited DificelPrint Services ¥
Ship ¥ Track + Hznhage » PBusiness Soluttons »

FedEx Ship Manager® Leasst
Halp

Reports My Profile

Prapura Shismant Ship History My Lisls

Your Shipmant Details

From: Eﬁé%@%&. P;'U gﬁ?ﬂ'&& Package typs: FadEx Envolope
SONS, B, Pickup/Dron Off: fli;el g& g:;:ady sehadulad plekug at
};g: FIGUEROA ST STE Welghty 030 LBS
Dectarad valus! 0.00 USD
7
;}gs ANGELES, CA 8001 Shippar aceount numbar: 226051538
2435847487 Bilf ransportation to: 22805538
Gourtesy rate quotar 1387
To! GENE HALE List rates:
Effestive net (lacount
;?.L%\g‘?ﬁe?ﬁozum BEACH Discounted variable %
GARDENA, CA 502473627 Special servizas:
us Shipment Purpose;
2138617487 Shipmunt typo: Express
CommerclaliRestdential Status:  Commaerclat
Tracking no: 798850379468
Your rafprence: 20441004
SHip date: 05711022010
Harvice type! Standard Overnight
Please aote :
, *'fha coustasy rete shown hare may ba different Than the aciusl chames for your shipment, Differences may occyr based on actual weolkght,
dimensions, and othar faclors, Coasull the applicable F of the EadBx Rale Shaels for deiells on how shipping charges
arg calcuintled,
FedEx wil not ba responstile for any clalm in excess of $100 per package, whether the rasull of foss, damags, dalay, non-dolivery,

misdeltvery, or misinformation, urless you daciare a higher value, pay an edditonal chargs, document yout acivat loss end fe a timely ciam,
Limitations found in the current FadEx Service Gulde apply. Your fght to recover from FadEx for any lass, Including intrinsic valun of the
packags, [oss of ales, incoma inferest, profil, sltorney's feas, costs, and other {orens of damage whebhar direct, Incidsntal, consequantlal, o
spacial 1a fimited to tha grealar of 100 af the suthicized detiared valus, Recovery canaot axcesd aclual documonted loss. Maxmun for tlems
of extroordinary value is $500, e.g., jowelry, practaus matals, negolable lnstuments and othar Hlems ¥sted In our Servica Gulde. Wiitlen claims

must bo Riad within strct llae fimils; Constil the appheable FadEx Sewvics Gulde for datalls,
VGils 1ARD |

e TSt BuriaEs Genter | serace Iro | Aboul FedEs Hnvwsior FoolAlons | apers | Index.com Tarms of Usg ! Secutny & Privacy

Ghonet Ho
This stie fs protacied by copyright anhtt {rademark laws under US and intsmatonal taw, All dghis tesarved,® 1995. 2010 FedEx



Espadel | Cosiomar Suppan 1 FedEx Lotations  Seaich Go

Package/Envelope Frelght =~ Expodited OHicelPrint Services ¥

Ship » Track » Manage 1 Business Solutions
FedEx Ship Manager® Lonaut
Help
Prapans Shipment Ship History My Lists Ruports My Frofile
Your Shipment Detalls
From: . é&;g};gﬁs. ?U gsgfa Package type: FedEx Envelopt
SONG, P.C. Pickip/Drop Off o ¥ Fhedled pckup !
:;;93 FIGUERGA 8T STE gjﬂ?hud ! algg basi
1 sctarad valie; 0.
iﬁgs ANGELES, GA 90017 Shipper atcount numben 278051538
2138847487 Biit transportaiton to: 226061538
Gourtesy rate quotas’ 1387
Te: LISAVOM ESCHEN List rates:
ABELSON HERRONLLP Effective net dlscount:
?ggos GRAND AVE 8TE Discounted varlabis %
LOS ANGELES, OA Spaclsl servicas;
90AT11549 ShipmantPurpese;
us Shipaent typs: ) Exprass
2134021900 CammarclaiResldenilal Status:  Commerciaf
Tracking ne; 7H8B50395759
Your reforance: 20441004
Shin date: o008
Service typu! Standard Overnlght
pinasge noto :
. * 'The courlasy rate shown hers may ba dilfarent than the atlual chargesfor your shipment, Differances may occur based on actual welght,
dimenaions, znd cther faglors, Conaull the applicabls wde or the FedEx Rats Sheats for detalls on how shipping charges
are calcuiatad. :
FadEx will nof o rasponsibie for any tlatm In excess of $160 per patkage, whather the resull of loss, domaga, delay, nondalivery,
resdelivery, or misinformadtion, unless you Seclara a higher vakse, pay en edditonat charge, document your sctyal luss and fils & Bmely clalm,
Limifiations found tn the cument Fed€x Servca Guikle apply, Your rght Lo recover from FedEx for any loss, Including Intdnsle value of lha
packags, Ioss of sales, lncorra inlerest, proli, altorey’s feas, costs, and other forms of demage whather direct, Incldental, consequeantial, or
spatlal lg Trmltec to tho greater of $100 or the suthorzed dodiared valus, Racovery cannot exceed acival documanted loss, Maxtmum for flems
ol eutracrdinary valua 15 $500, e.g. Jawelry, precious melals, nepoliabia Instruments and other tems fistod In our Sernvice Bulde. Wellen claims
must ba ad within stic! Hima fmils: Consull the spplicable FodEx Sarvite Gulde for delefls.

Giotel Home 1 Dmah Buswiass LeAMT | SErsce WHo | About FerlEx | investar Fefalions | Gataers | lotes conl Tarms of Usn | Secunty § Privacy | Sus dfaps
This site Is protecied by copyrght ant trademark laws under US snd Infemational taw, All rights reserved. O 1985~ 2010 FadEx



% Kirst Los Angeles (213) 250-1111 o Fax (213) 250-1187
Directiing lofagal  (213) 250-8111  » Fax (213) 260-1187
Legal Los Angsles (West) (310) 2779141 © Fax (310} 277-9153
- Dlirectlinelolegal  {310) 277-7101 o Fax {310) 277-9153 -
inland Emgpire (951} 7794110« Fax (951) 779-0100
Suppgrt San Diaga (819) 231-8141 e Fax {819) 231-1361
- 8an Franclsco {445} 628-3111 o Fax (415) §26-1331
Services Sante Ans (A 541-1110  « Fax (T14) 541.8182
Sacramenio {918} 444-5111 o Fax {916) 443-3111
COURT FILING | GONTROL NO. DATE: 5112110
COURT RESEARCH FORM web address: firstegalsupport.eom
FIRM DESTINATION / COURT:,
NAME: Epstein, Turner & Song, P.G. .
777 §. Figueroa St., Sulte 4950 %ﬁj i"gg;f;“s:el-‘ff for Court
Los Angeles, CA 90017 : :
9 Los Angeles, California 90012
PHONE: (943} 861-7487
FAX:  (213) B61-7488 DOCUMENTS
ATTY [ SECRETARY: /MEB EXT: 113 | Minute Order dated 5/10/10
| CLIENT MATTER [ ATTY, CODE : :
204-410-04
GASE NO:
BS123006
Short Title of Case; 1 HEARING
~ Insurance Commissioner v. Golden State  jsev F‘OR: AT DEPTION 59, |
Mutual Life Ins, Co. [} SELFADDRESSED STAWPED  FEE
ENVELQPE (S} ATTACHED ATTACHED; $

Tﬁank you, Mary Ellen Bolton, ext. 113

Please obtain a CERTIFIED COPY of the minute order Issued by Judge Yaffe on
PLEASE NOTE THE ORDER IS LOCKED IN SCANN

COURT RESEARCH ON DEMAND FILINGS COURT RUN

ASAP RESEARCH 1 seecrie [J rusmrie [ samepay
(Immadials) {immediate) {Within 2 hours} (Filings Onlyy*
SAME DAY RESEARCH [ asaprue ] recrie NEXTDAY'
(Allow ful day to oblain) (Within 1 hour) {Wilkin 3-4 hours} {Filings Onlyy

7] next DAY RESEARCH spar Agresment
{Allow two days fo obtaln}

1 ene [ rssue [ susmr OTHER:

[] researcH [ cermipen 1 rorm Complele bY: gyycren

| GOPY REQUEST COPY REQUEST
SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS: '

4/28/10.

ING AT THE PRESENT TIME.




. .
e First Los Angeles (243) 2504141« Fox (213} 2604197
~ Directiine lolegaf  (213)260-8111 e Fax (213)260-1197

Le g al Los Angeles (West) (310) 277-0111 & Fax (310} 2779155
Direct In to legal  (310)277.7101 » Fax (310 271-9153
niand Empirs (957) 7704110« Fax (957) 778-0100
S “pport San Disge {819) 231-9111  » Fax {619} 231.12364
o San Francisco (#15) 8263111 » Fax (415) 626-1331
-Services Santa Ana (T14) SA11110 o Pox (714) 541-8162
Sacramento (918) 444.-5111 o Fax (316) 443:3411
COURT FILING / CONTROL NO. OATE g142110
C'Oi_jRT RESEARCH FORM web addrass: frstiegalsupport.com
FIRM DESTINATION/ COURT:
NAME: Epsteln, Turner & Song, P.C. Los Angeles Supetior Court
777 5. Flgueroa 8t, Sultas 4950 S upen
g 111 N. Hilf Street,

Los Angeles, 8001
os Angeles, CA 80017 Los Angeles, California 80012

PHONE! (213) 861-7487

FAX (213) 861-7488 DOCUMENTS
ATTY I SECRETARY: /MEB ext: 113 Minute Order dated 4/28/10
CLIENT MATTER J ATYY. CODE
204-410-04
CASE ROy
B3423005
Short Title of Case:
. s HEARING .
Insurance Commissioner v. Golden State | seTFoRr: AT o DEPTIDIV
Mutual Life ns. Co. SELF ADDRESSED STAMPED  FEE
ENVELOPE (S) ATTACHED ATTACHED: §

E

COURT RESEARCH ON DEMAND FILINGS COURT RUN
] asapresearch 7] specene 3 rusHeie [} samepay
{immediate} {immediato} {Within 2 hours} (Fitings Only)*
{T] samE DAY RESEARCH ASAP FILE ] rearue NEXTDAY
(Aftow full day to obtaln) {Within 1 hour} {Within 3-4 hours} {Flitngs Only)*
NEXT DAY RESEARCH *Por Agreemen
{Allow fwo days to obtain)
[ eue ] ssue SUBMIT OTHER:
RESEARCH ™ oertiFiED 1 rorm Complete BY: g140r4
COPY REQUEST COPY REQUEST

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:
Please obtain a copy of the minute order issued by Judge Yaffe on 4/28/10. THE ORDER 1S

NOT IN THE COURTROCM.
Thank you. Mary Ellen Bolton, ext. 113.




2 First

Los Angeles {213y 250-1111

+ Fax (213) 2801187

Drectline folegal  {213) 250-9111  » Fax{213)260.1197
Lega] Los Angsles (West) {310y 2779111 o Fax{310) 2779153
Dlrectiine fo legal {310 277-7101 o Fax {310} 277.9153
intand Empire {851) 7784190 s Fax (951} 7780100
Suppﬂrt San Dlego (619) 2319111 o Fax (619) 2311381
s San Franclsco (415)826-3115 v Fax (416) 626-1331
: Services Santa Ana (74415411190 o Fax (714) 5416182
Secramento {916} 444-5111 o Fax {18} 443-3111
COURT FILING | CONTROL NO. CATE: 5144110
QOURT RESEARCH FORM web address: frsliegalsupporloom ‘
DESTINATION ! COURT;

FIRM

NAME: Epstein, Turner & Song, P.C,
717 S. Flgusroa St., Sulte 4950
Los Angeles, CA 90017

PHONE! (213) 861.7487

FAX:" (213) 861-7488

ATTY ! SECRETARY: /MES ExT: 113

Los Angsles Superior Court
111 N. Hill Street,
Los Angeles, California 80012

DOCUMENTS

Order Authorlzing Conservator to Sell Real
Property Located at 2706 East South Street In

CLIENT MATTER fATTY. CODE
204-440-04 Long Beach
CASE NO:
BS123006
Short Titla of Case: HEARING
insurance Commissloner v, Golden State | serFor: AT DEPTIDIV
Mutual Life Ins. Co, [[] SELFAODRESSEDSTAMPED  FEE
ENVELOPE (8} ATTACHED ATTACHED: 8
. 8 [} b » , - -, a [
COURT RESEARCH ON DEMAND FILINGS COURT RUN
{1 Asap RESEARCH [T} specrie I rushrie ] samepay
(immadiate} {immetiats) {Whhin 2 hours) {Fillngs Cnly}*
[} sAME DAY RESEARCH ASAP FILE [ reaFie 1 nextoay
(Aiow full day lo oblain} {Withir 4 hour} {Within 34 hours} (Flilngs Only})*
[} wex pAy RESEARCH *per Agreatment,
{Aliow two days fo obtaln)

[ ene 7 issue 1 svamrr OTHER:
[7] researcH CERTIFIED 7 rorm Complete bY: g0p110
COPY REQUEST COPY REQUEST

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

Please obtain a certified copy of the attached order.

Thank you. Mary Ellen Bolton, ext. 113.

&l G




Espatol { Customer Suppoit | FedEx Locating  Search Go

Packags/Envaiope Fraight Expadited OlfleaiPrint Services 3¢
Ship Track v Manage ? Buslnoss Solutlons +
FedEx Ship Manager® Legout
Halp

Propata Shipment Ship History My Liste My Profite

Your Shipment Detalls
Frony MIC}{A% ?U WS!ES;?& Paokagu type! FodEx Envetopa
EPSTEIN, TUR
SONG. P.G. PlekupiOrop Ot {li;: ::a ?g:ady schiedulad pickup at
:;;03 FIGUERCA ST 8T8 Walght: 0.30 LBS
) Dustared value; .00 ush
{',039 ANGELES, GA 80017 Shipper sooount numboer, 226081638
21358617487 Bil transportation lo; 2200515
. Cotrtesy rle quale;® 2011
To ESSIE SAFAIE {15t raten:
OUBLEY VENTURES © Eftective net discount:
g?ri?g gM‘-B"GK RO Dlscounted vanabls %
PHOEND, AZ 850184413 Spacial services;
us ' Shipment Purpose;
{602} 468-9400 Shiprent typa: Expross
Gommerclzi/Restdential S1atus:  Commerclal
[ Tracking ne: 7686804581450
Your relerence: 204-410:04
Ship date; O5/18/2010
Serviea typo: Standard Cveright
Plaase note ;
. * The courtesy rate shown hers may be diferent than the Adual eharges for yaur shipmont. Diferences may occut basad on actual walkpre,
dimanslons, ard other factors, Consuit the sppicable FedEx Sorvics Gulifle or tha FedEx Rele Sheats for delalls on how shipping charges
gra calculated.
FadEx will noi be tesponsible for any clalm bn excess of $100 per peckage, whother the rasult of Woss, damuge, delay, condelvary,
mrisgafivary, of misinformation, unless you declara a ‘higher valug, pay an additional charge, decument your actuat joss and file o tmely claim.
Limitattons found In the currant FedEx Sorvice Guids upply. Your righl to recover frorn FedEx for any loss, Including intdnsie valua of the
puckage, Jossof satas, Incoma Interest, proflt, allomay's feas, cosis, and othar forms of darmage whether direct, Incidental, contequentlal, or
spactal Is imited to the greater of $100 or the authofzad dedared vaiue, Recovery sannot axceed aciual dooumanted loss, Madmum for flems
of extraordinary valus I3 $500, a.g., jawslry, precious metals, negoliable strimenls and ather floms fisled In our Sarvice Guide, Wrilten cla'ms
must bo fHadt witlin strict time fimils; Consull the applicsble FodEx Servics Gulds lor datalls,
Gorvion Tifo | ADOUL FEdix | Invasiar Reishons | Caroers | Iedax.com 1emms of Use | Secunty & Pavacy 1 She Map |

Glohal Homa | Sl Husiass Gemer |
Tnis site Ia prolaciad by copydght end rademark taws uhder US snd tntarnational taw, All riphis reserved.® 1085- 2010 FedBx



Esoatied { Customer Support | FedEx Lecalons  Searcn

Go

o
PackagefEnvelops Frelght Expadited OfficelPrint Services %
Ship » Track ¢ Munage Busiress Solutions »
FedEx Ship Manager® Logout
Help

My Lists

Prapana Shipment Ship History

Limitalions Tound I the current FedEx Service Guide apply. Your
packags, foss of yales,
spedial 1s imited to he grealer
of exirgondinary valus Is $500,
must b fiied wiinin st tma lmits; Consult

Your Shipment Detalls -
 From: ' g}l%%gg& R.uvgg!sg& Patkaga typa: FadEx Envelope
TURNE \ Use on alteady scheduled plskup 8l
SONG, B.C PlekupfOrop Off: my tacation ¥ plesup
;;;0-‘3 FIGUEROA ST STE Walghtt 036 LBS
Deotared valuo! 000 USD
bgﬁ ANGELES, GA 90017 Shipper account ntimbar; 220051538
138817487 Bl transpoctation to: 2268051638
. Ceurtesy rale quoter’ 13.87 /
Yo CARQL DRAPER List ratos;
?ﬁgﬁgg‘}?&& Effaniive net discount:
CERRITOS, GA 807030625 ’s’;’;’“g:;‘;:fv‘::::"“ %
5620505510 Shipmunt Pyrpose;
Shipment typet Express
Tracking no: 7935602247714 CommoraialiRestdantial Statust  Commorchal
Your relefenca: 204-410-04
Ship dale! 05/20/2010
Service typa: Standard Overight
Plaasanota :
. * The courlesy rate showr heramay be diferent Ihan {he sclual charges for your shipment, Differencas may cocur based on aclusl welght,
dimensions, gnd ofmer fzclors. Consul! he appteabla FodSx Sanwce Budp or the FedEx Rate Sheets for detalls on how shipping charges
are calcutaled, -
FedEx wiif not ba rasponsible for eny <falm in excess of 5100 gar package, whethar tha rasull of losy, damags, datay, non-deflvary,
misdalivary, of misinformation, unlass you declsm a highar value, '?ay sh additionat chame, document your sotual loss and file a bmely claim,
bl to recover from FodEx lor any toss, Including irnsic veloa of the

Incoma Interest, profi, atlornsy's fees, cosls, and che
of $100 or thes authorized daclared value, Recove
... Jawelry, precious matals, nagotiable insiruments and
the applicabls FedEx Service Guide for datalis.

t forms of damege whether direc!, Incldents!, consequant(al, or
7y cannol excead aclugl documented loss. Madmum for ltams
olhat Herns fisted In sur Service Guide. Wrillen ciaims

Gluval Homg |

Ths sita fs prolacied by copyrighl and tradarnark Jaws under US and Interstional faw.

Emall Busmaess Cemar | Serwea Inta | About FedEx TTrvGsion Rolations | Careuts | Indet.tom Temms ol Ute ) Secutty & Prvacy [ Sils Map |

A% fhle roserved © 1805- 2010 FedEx



» Fax (243} 2601107

P il F i}f St Los Angelas {213) 250-1141
Ditsctline lo legal  (213) 260-01141  « Fax (213} 250-1197
Legal Los Angelas (West) (310} 277-9111  « Fax {210} 217-0153
Dlrectine folagal (310} 277-7101 e Fax (310) 277-8153
Intand Eraplre {951} 779-1110  « Fax{851) 779-0100
Sﬂppgrt Sen Disge (6518) 231-8111 < Fax (619} 2311361
e Sen Frenglseo (418) 6263111« Fax (415} 6261394
Services Santa Ana (718) 6411110 o Fox (714) 541-8182
Sacramsnlo (916) 444-5111 o Fax{§16) 4433111
COURT FILING / CONTROL NO. OATE! w2010
COURT RESEARCH FORM web address: firstlegalsupport.com 5/6 "/ / _&;ﬁ
FIRM DESTYINATION ! COURY:
NAME: Epsteln, Turner & Song, P.C. |
777 S. Flglieroa St., Suite 4850 %‘ﬁ ?I“%%fgfeﬁef for Court
Los Angeles, CA 90017 : . :
v Los Angeles, Callfornia 90012
PHONE: (313) 861-7487
FAX: (213} 861-7488 DOGUMENTS
ATTY [ SECRETARY: /MEB EXT: 113 SEE ATTACHMENT
CLIENT MATTER / ATTY. CODE
204-410.04
CASE NO:
BS123005
Short Tifle of Case;
HEARING
Insurance Commissioner v, Golden State | serror: AT DEPTIONV
Mutual Life Ins. Co, SELF ADDRESSED STAMPED FEE
ENVELOPE (5) ATTACHED ATTACHED: ¢ VA

COURT RUN

COURT RESEARCH ON DEMAND FILINGS.

[T asap researcH ‘3 specrie I71 rusHFiE SAMEDAY
{irunedials) - {immedlate) {Within 2 hours} (Filings Only}y*
SAME DAY RESEARGH ASAP FiLE (] rec Lk NEXTDAY
{Allow Tull day (o oblain) (within 1 hour} {Within 3-4 hours} {Fllings Only)*

] nexT DAY RESEARCH *Par Agreament
{Aliow two days lo obtaln}

FILE [ 1ssue SUBMIT OTHER:

] researcH [T cermirien [ rorm Complete bY: g0
COPY REQUEST coPyY REQUEST ,

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS:

Please flle the attached documents and return conformed coples of the caption pages and a
"racelved"” copy of the proposed ordsr TODAY,

Thank you. Mary Ellen Bolton, ext. 113,




tspano | Customer uppen } FedEx Locations  Soarch Go

Package/Envalope Fral?;ht éxped!ted OfflgelPrint Services ¥

R i T T T T -y e

Ship » Track s Manage + " Business Sotui!o?:s ¥

FedEx Ship Manager® wesou
Halp

Prapare Skipment Ship Higkory Raporls

Your Shipment Detalls

Fram: }ég%{;ﬁ\iﬁé. ?U wszss& Punkage type! FodEx Envelops
E RNER
SONG, P, Plckup/Drop Off: g;s I:cna Eag:ady scheduled glckup at
I;;Os FIGUEROASTSTE Weight: 03 L8s
Dnciarad valuot 0,00 USO
N
\1}38 ANGELES, BA 00017 Shipperactoimtnumbsrs . 226051338
2138817487 Blil transportation to; 226051538
Gourtosy rata unter® i
Te: GO CAROL L FELD st ratie: 4
ALMAR ENTERPRISESING  Effective nef dlscount: 26 307
2550 MASSACHUSETTS Dlstounted variable %
AVE NW Bpocial servicen:
WASHINGTON, DC 20008 *
us Shipment Purpose!
{713) 8817487 . Shlpmaent type: Expross
QommorciziiResidenila! Status:  Commarclal
fracking no: To3576540425
Your refersnce; 204:410-04
Ship date: 0572612010
Borvice typs: Standard Qvernight
Please note &
. * Tha covrlesy rate shown Jerg may ba differant then The actua) chatges for your shipmant, Ditferences may ocour based on acuat walght,
dimansions, and oiher lactors, Consuft the applicable EedEx Servicaliukle of the FedEx Rale Sheets for datalls on how shipping chatges
are cakulatad,
FadEx vl not ba rasponshole for any clalm in excess of $100 per package, whother the resull of loss, damage, dotay, nan-<leivery,

or mislnformation, yntess you doclare a higher value, pay an additions! charge, document your aciusl loss and Kla & kimely cialm,
1 the currant FadEx Sarvice Gulde apply. Your night (6 recover from FedEx for any 1055, Induding intrinsic valus of the
Tacorne Intarest, profd, allomey's fess, costs, and ulher forms of damage whather dirse!, Inckantal, consequentiat, of
speciat is limited fo the greatar of $100 or the muthorized deciared value, Recovery cannot oxcaed actue! documented Jose. Maximum for Hams
of extraordinary vale Is $500, e.g., jewelry, procious motols, nogatiabls instrumants and othar flems isted fn our Service Qulde, Writtan ¢iaims

roust b fad wihin siict imo limlts; Consult the applicabla FedEx Sotvica Gulde for dofalis.

rlsdelivery,
Limitations found
package, sossof sules,

Global Hora | Small Busingss Lenter [ Survice tnfo ] About FolEx | tnvastor Relations { Careers | fadex.com Tarms of Usy | Seculy & Prvacy § Site Map |
This ulte Is protecied by eopyright end tragamark lews Under US and intematisnal law. All dghts reserved.® 1095- 2010 FedEx



1]

Espaiw! | Customer Sepport | FedEx Locatone  Search fel]

OtficatPrint Services 3
Businass Sc:lu!!ohs 3

Frelght Expeditod

-t o

Packagel/Envelope
Manags + .

Shilp ¥ Track »

FedEx Ship Manager®

iy Profile

Prapace Shipment Ship Histary

Yaur Shipment Detalis
From: M!%I::g% REJWE!S:& Packege typa: FutEx Envetaps
Ef TURNE
SONG. N PlekupiDrap Of: :i;et :; gg:ady schaduled plekug at
g;ﬂs FIGLUEROA 5T STE Wolght: 0.3 LBS
Doclared value: 0.00 USD
0 Ll
bss ANGELES, GA 50017 Shipper secount number: . 225051638
2138047487 Bl transportation to; 226051638
Courtesy rats quots:* 78 /S
Te: DAVID WAKELY, List rales:
PRESIDENT Effactive net discount:
SOUTHERN FINANCIAL Discounted vartsble %
LIFE IN5 €O Special services:
518 LAKEVIEW RD VILLA 2 e P
CLEARWATER, FL, 33750 Shipmont Pucpose:
us Stlpment typa: Exprass
(213) B&1.7457 CommerclaUResidential Statug;  Commerclal
Tracking not 798695074160
Your referanto; 204.410-04
Ship dutes 0572572010
Samvicn ype: Standard Overnighl
Plaase nole ! ‘
.*'Tha courlaty rate shown heors may be diffarent Sian the actual charges for your stipment, Differances may tctur based on aclurl walght,
dimansions, and olhar faclora. Consult the applicable s or e FadEx Rale Sheels for detalls on how shipping charges
ara caleulated, .
EadEx whil not bs responsible for any clalm ln gxcess of 5100 per packags, whethet the rasult of loss, damage, dalay, non-dellvary,
misdeiivery, or nlsinformafion, unless you daciare a higher valus, pay an additlonal charge, dosumant your sciual loss end filg a Emely slaim.
Limitallons found I the curreni Fedfx Servica Guida apply, Your sight 1o racovar from FadEx for any Joss, Incuding Intringle value of the
o, los of sales, income lnterasl, proft, etiornay's faes, costs, and othar farms of damage whathar direct, incldental, consequential, or
spaclal Is limited 1o tha grester of §100 or the avthorized dedated value, Recovary cannot excesd rolual documented foss. Meximurator flemy
of extracrdnary value Is $500, ey, Jewsiry, preclous melals, negotiable Instruments and other lame fisled In our Sorvice Gulde, Written clatms
prust ba Rlad within strict fime Nmits; Consult the applicatie FedEx Service Guids for details.
Ciiobal Frome T Srasd Dosinoss Canter | Service injg [ Abott Earfiin Tinvostor Ralatons | Gareera | Tocox.com Jermy of Us6 | Gecuniy & Pavacy | Site Map |
Al rights resgrved © 1938- 2010 FedEx

This st fa protecied by copyrght and tracamark fswe under US and intamativnal taw.



Etpatal | Custonwer Support | Fodia Lotatione Search o

Package/Envelape Frelght m&xpedited OiflcelPrint Bervices X

-t e = - . e o, P T |

Ship » Traok + Mam:;e v Business Snl&tio‘:ss »

FedEx Ship Manager® Logout -
p

Prapare Shipment Ship History

Your Shipment Datalis

From: MICHAEL R, WEISS Package typs: FadEx Envalope
§S§T§isb ‘l"URNER & PlokupfOrop Off: x;e‘ :cr; gg:ady scheduled phekup at
;;;bs FIGUEROA 8T STE Walght: 0.3 LAY
Dictared vatue: €.00 UsD
bgs ANGELES, GA 50017 Shipper aecount numben; 22805153
2138817407 Bl transpartation to) 228051533
Courtosy rate quoter* 8.8 A
“fo: DIANA THULIN List ratest
gwgg ggﬁgmw EH{sctive ns} dlzcount:
. ¥
175 KING ST g}f;‘;;’}“m’:::m "
ARMONK, NY 10504 *
us Shipment Purpose:
{213} 861-7487 Shipmont typa Exprozs
CommerclaffResidontiat Status:  Commaercial
Tracking nio; 798090074208
Your reference: 204-410-04
$hip date; 5252010
Servica type: Standard Cvemalght
1

Plaase note @
. * The covrtesy rate shown hese may be diffarent than the aglual chargas for your shipment, Difarencas may occur based on aclual welght,
FagEx fiendco Guily

dimansions, and oiher faciors, Consult the spplicable of the FedBx Rate Sheets for detalis on how shipping charges
ara calculated.

FedEx will nol ba responsible forany clalm in pxcess of $100 per package, whather the resull of foss, demage, delay, non-dalivary,
misdsllvaty, ormisinformalion, unlsss you declars a higher valuse, pay an additional charge, documant your acluat loss and fifo & imely clalin,
Limilations found Inthe cument FedEx Sarvice Guide apply. Your right to recaver from FedEx for any toss, including intrinsls value of the
packags, loss of agies, Income inferest, profit, altomey's faes, costs, and othar fomms of damage whéthor ditect, Incidenial, consequential, o
spoolat Is Tmited o the graater of $100 or the authorzed dedlared value. Recovery cannot excaed actual documantad logs, Maximum for itams
of extraordinary valye is $500, o.9., Iowalry, praclous melals, negotiable hstrumants and ofher itams Hsled In our Service Guide, Wiilign clalms

must be filed within strict fime fmils; Consult the applicable FadEx Servics Guide for datalls,

Giobial Home | Sinaf Busness Center | Servics nfo | Aboud FedEx [ Investor Relaboas | Carasrs | fegex.com Tarms of Use | Sacutity & Privacy | SRe idop ]
Thiz sita is profected by copyrght and irademark Taws ynder US and Intemational law, AY righls reserved.@ 1895- 2010 FedEx




FedEx Ship Manager®

Esponol § Customer Suppor | FodEx Locallons  Search

Package/nvelepe
Ship » Traok »

Froight Expedited

L

Manage »

Go

Otflce/Print Services s

Busi;wss ﬁntuﬂons [

v
Logou! Holp

Prepara Shipman

Your Shipmant Detalls

Ship History

My Lisis

Raporis

My Profila

From: MICHAEL R, WEISS Package typa! FedEx Envelops
ESENTUMERE ey ot Uty e oup o
777 5 FIGUERDA BT.8TE Welght: 0 § 188
#950 neclara.d valuat 0'00 Use
1 t \
hgs ANGELES, CA 80017 $hipper secount number: 226051538
2138817487 8l transportation to; 226051638
) Courtesy rate quote:” 2133
Yo: GARY BEDWELL VP WSTN Ust rates:
8 STHN REGIONS Effactiva net discount:
gﬂl{;ﬁg%gggsuwncs Discountad varfabla %
3434 FAIRMOUNY 8T Spocial sgrvices:
DALLAS, TX 75213 Shipmont Purpose:
us Shipmant type: Expross
{213} 8B1-7487 CommergialfResidentinl Status:  Commerclal
Tracking not TeBOOBOTAZAY
Your refereats! 204-410-04
Ship date: 05252010
Service type Standard Ovemight

Plagso nole §
ara cakviated.
timitations fo

of exiracrdbyary velua Is $500,
must ba fied within striet time

. * The courjesy rets shawn hete may
dimensions, and othar fuctors. Consul

FadEx wiil not ba responsible for any clakn n exeass of $100 par packags,

misdelivery, orrisinfonnstion, selass you declare a higher vatue, pay an sdditional charge,
und I tha current FedEx Service Gulde apply. Your Hght fo recaver frorn FedEx for any loss, Indluding Inlinsis va
and other lorms of damage whethar dirsct, Incldental, consequeatial, or

sred vakia. Recovary cannot exceed actua) documanted loss, Maximum for fleme
nagotiable nslruments snd othar Hems listed i our Service Guide, Wiltten daims

ts; Conssll the applicable FedEx Sarvics Bulds for datals,

package, loss of sajes, income Interest, profi, sllommay's fass, costs,
spocialis limfled lo the graater of § 100 of the autharized ded

. Jowelry, preclous metals,

b diffarant thars the achiat charges Jor your shipment. Diferencas may occut bazed on selust welght,
| the appilcable Fadtx Servica Guide of ihe FedEx Rale Shests for datalls on how shipping chatges -

whather tha rasuil of foss, damage, dalay, nomdelivery,
documant your aclual lass and fila a timely dalm,

s of tha

ot Tiome | Smist Busiei Center| Sorvica Thio | Aboul Fegbz | Iavestor R
“This site 3 protacted by copyright and fradermark faws under US and tnfemation

Satony | GATears  feden.cam 1 emng of Usa | Security & Privacy| Sie Mepi
ol taw, Al rights reserved.© 1995. 2010 FedEx




B T

Esordary Customar Supood [ FadExtomtams Search Go

Packageinysiope Frilght Expodited OtficalPiint Servicos
Ship » Yragksy i&lamg':' ™ Business Solutions >

FedEx Ship Managor® Logavt
Help

1y Prolie

Ship Histary

Propocs Shiprwent

E Your Shipment Detalls
From: glgﬁéﬁt ?.UW&!::& Paskags typs: " FedEx Envelopa I
(e A
SGNG.[:& RN FiekupfOrap Oth g;’l:;:‘g:m? schedied pickup 31 i
I;? $ PIGUEROA 8T $TE Vatghts 049 LBS f
Duelarod vijuns 0.00 USD
{-,33”‘"35‘"“’ CA souiy Shipper ascountnumbet: 206051838
2138817487 BET {epnsportatian tas 228051538 .
Sourtesy rate uofa” FRE: 1 i
Yor FREDERICK & WADIBIA Linstrates: .
Eftectva natdlscount: ﬂ
;L%,G?&VERUNQ AYE Discountsd variubls % C—'{U‘“‘Q‘ w/as
Spacisi services:
ggLVER CITY, GA 90230 Shipment Fuspose: ! c 3 5’4 - 5
(213185 1.7487 Shipmmant type; xpress
CommarciaMsstdential Glatus:  Commetcinl fk"
=} Yracking ot Yols2raTedz
Your taletenco! 04441004
1 | Ship dais; 0418010
; Sesvice iypsr Btagdned Overnighl .
3

Pleags nots $
- * Tha couriesy rete showa hom may ba siffeden (hen the scival céutgs Yot your shiprant. Cilferancas may occur based oo aciual weighl,

2 dimensians, and other fectors, Consult the eppitatle PedFx So iz o the PedEx Rale Sheats for daialdy ar howr shipping charges
ala sakitaiey,

FedEx will 0ot be rasaonsioie Tor any olzkn in axcass o $100 nat package, whelher the pesadl of Joss, damag, dalay, nom-dethery,
elsdalivaty, of misintomation, unlass you dociare & Wohar valus, pay 2n addillens] chane, document your aclual losk and e s timaly claire.
Lintitations faund & the curent FedEx Sanden Gukte apply. Your dght o recovar foam FoaBx oy wny ToBs, iNCuding Inténsly valye of the

ee

vagkage, kst of $3%0s, Incoms Intacs|, profll, atlornsy's fees, costs, und ciher lorme of Samoge whethor direct, incidantet, cansequental, or
snocial fs imXed 16 the grastar of $100 or the authorfrad daclired valis, Recovery cannol sxdsed sctual docymented fogs, Madmum lor Humy
of exiraordinary valve is $300, 8.9, jewelry, preclous metals, negatiabl belruments and ofher ems Tsied In our Service Guids, Writlan dlalms
st b Fied within stact lene limis; Consdl tha appitcable Fedty Sorvia Guids for datala, -

Gordl GG | SHow DUSADYS CEMET | SEIYKe 10 | ABIUA FROER | LAreTior EEIBLGNT| Catents | Jaracom Teimd o Uia | Hncury & Preaty 1 5ew b T
Taig wie 1 projocted by copyright g trademark Tews under LS snd tntematonal fow, A7 dgnts raserved © 1905 2040 Bedx




B

N [Minvelee Dats \| Account Number \  Page

invoine Mumber
May 07, 226

7-081-89958

A
e

s 4
» FuskSurchargs - FedExbas eppliod ¢ el surcharga of 7008 ta th

« Dlstance Based Pricing, Yons 2
« Packaye Oebvered to Raciplant Adoiess - Refanss Autherind

G, i
is shipmant

Automation INET %v feciplent

Trackiag 1§} 793482698758 MICHAEL BRVE!SS MSLONFAR W HEARD-DAVIS

Sarvica Typa Fadix Standard Overnight EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG, P.C. 4300 LINCOLNSHIRE AVE

Packags Type FedEx Envelops 717 SAIGLUERDA ST STE 4450 BUENA PARK CA 30821 US

Zane el LOS ANGELES CA 90017 US

fackagos 1

Frated Wolght N/A Transportation Charge 1410

Deliverad Apr 28, 20101324 " Aulomstion Borgs Discount + 074

Sve Area AZ . Discount ~1.18

Signed by sna abiove Rasidental Dativery : 150

Fadix Use (ROCOLOHNG200/02 Fuel Surcharga 107
i3 31635

Tatul Charge

N S Pel

il

TP
“i’g_;%%%’
i

e B Rt

R

4 i

MRS R R P gl
o Fuel Surebarge - Fedex hae spplied # fuwl surehargs of 2.00% to this shipment,
= Ulstance Sasod Prickny, Zone ¢
Automation INET Sender Begipfont
Tracking 0 7924313 MICHAEL ROWEISS CARKIN TEASLEY
Service Type FadFx Standard Quarnight EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG, P.C, 4581 DON MILAGRO DR
Packaye Type fathx Envelope 117 $FIGUERDA 8T STE 4350 L0S ANGELES CA 90008 t15
Zona i7] . LOS ANGELES CA $0017 US
Packages 1
" Ratad Woight N/A Transportation Chatge
Dativerad Apri9, 20101253 Fuwl Surcherge .
Sve Area At Autamation Bonus Clveount
Signed by LYEASLEY Hesidental Dalivary
Fodlx Use DOOXN00/0000200/,. Digsoum :
usy

Totaf Cliarge

1 [HE g Ak L
gLt b Al T 2 EAR

> Fuel Surchurge - FedEx haw sppllod 3 el surchorge ¢f 2.00% to thig shipmoat

+  Afutire delvery was requested.

= Distance Bosed Pricing, Zore 2

+  Istattempl Apr 29,2010 8L 1036 AM,

+ Undelverablie Packaga,

Automation INET Sender Bevipfomy

Treckny {0 793492167832 MICHAEL R, WEISS FREQERICK EWADIBIA

Sewvice Type FodEx Stundard Gvarnight EPSTEIN, YURNER & SONG, P.C. 11260 QVEREAND AVE

Packago Typs FadEx Envelops 711 S FIGUEROA ST STE 4050 CULVERCITYCA 90830 US

Zons oz LOS ANGELES CA suGir US

Packagss 1

Raled Waight WA Trantporiation Sheargs amn

Belivered Apr 30, 2010 1053 Fuot Surcharge 1.07

Sve Area At ’ Residentlal Delivory 50

FedEx Use QO00ODCOAD0E00/ 14 Discount 118
Automation Bonys Discount 074
Total Charge usp $1635

F N 3 Bpelnpith i foflotacafty g

5 i et §
Flh

ik adoyasi BT i R 4 R ST .
«  Fus! Surcharge « Fodfx has applied 2 fuel surcherge of 700% to this shipment.
« Distatte Hused Pricing, Zone 2

Automation INET Sondat fincfplont

Tracking 1 Ta3482810388 MICHAEL R.WNEISS LISA VON ESCHEN

Servica Type FedEx Standard Ovarnlgin EPSTEIN, TUANER & SONG, PL. ABELSON HERRON (L

Package Type FotlEx Envelape 177 S FHGUERDA 8T STE 4960 333 § GRAND AVE STE 1557

Zooe 062 LOS ANGELES CA.50017 US LOS ANGELES CA 90071 US

Packayas 1

Hetad Weight N/A Teansportation Churge . 1470
Continuad on next page

o2rer vl

LRI



invoice Number \ [ TnwoiceDate \| Account Number N Py
7-081-93958 May 07, 2010 2260-5153-8 Gaty

Tracking iD; 406118791394 continued
Dafiverad Apr 30,2010 1000 Automuton Bontis Hagount : 225
Sve Arsa A2 fuef Surcherge . 203
Signad by LESTROM Discount 248
Fodix Usa SONOGR0GO/NNE 8L, Yotal thargo
i 4 ORI IR

) T
.mm» ) & m AR A R R i ! !"-‘l{: "'il

_ = FuelSurcherga \FucBxhas spphed # fuel surchiarge of 1.00% to this shipmant. .
+ [Distenos Basod Pricing, Zonw 2
Automation CAFE Sender Raoiplent
Tracking HI L1667 1674072 HHRA STATION MICHAEL R WEISS
Sarvice Type FedEx Expross Saver FEBERAL EXPRESS ERSTEIN, TURNER & SONG.P.G
Package Type FodEx, Envelops 12000 S, PRAIRIE AVE 711 S FIGUERDA ST #4960
Zons oz HAWTHORNE GA 90250 US LO5 ANGELES CA 99017 U8 ~
Packagas t
Natad Walght NfA Transportation Charas 0,75
Delivored May 04, 2010 10.06 Discount” - .49
Sve Aroa A2 Automation Bonug Discount (.48
Signed by LESTRON Fue] Surcharge 061
FadEx lse POONOD0BO00820/. Yotal Charge . ysh 8978
Recipient Subtotal Ush $52.72

Yotal FedEx Express UsH $353.01



fnvoice Number [ Inveice Date Acésunti\iumber N Pags
7-089-88590 May 14,2010 2260-5153-8 Gefb

Tracking 1D: 798850374238 continyed

Rated Welght KA . Trensportation Charge
Dolvarad Bay 11, 70100952 Rocidantis Dellvary

Svo Aran At Fus} Surcharge

Signad by $0a shova Automation Benus Discount
FodEx Usa 000DAA0C0B000200/02 Piscaunt,

i

Preltaeidls
+ FuglSure
«  {istsnce Bused Priclig, Zono 2

Attornation INET Sendey * Eoelplen(

Tracking 1D 708850579468 MICHAEL B, WEISS GENE HALE

Setvico Typa fadEx Standard Dvemight , EPSTEIN, FURNER 8 SGNB, P.C, . 1876 W HEDONDO BEACH 01VD STE

Patkaga Typs FadEx Envalopa 737 S FIGUERDA ST STE4950 GARDENA CA 90247 US

Zong 1] 10§ ANGELES CA 90017 {5

Packagas ¥

Rated Weight MA Transportation Charge N ) 14.72

Delivared May 11,2010 12:04 Autsmation Bonus Biscount -0.74

Sve Ara Al Fusl Surcharge 103
" Signad by LIENGER Biscount

Total Charge

FedEx Use

T2

EE0

4

AFRIEOHIHpRRE R
+ PueiSurchsrgs -FadExh
v Distanon Based Prichy, Zane 2

, SR R .: R e
o) surcharge of BEDR 1o thiv shipme

'ty

Autbrraton INET Sender Reciplent
Tracking 19 F9BAS03ITES . MICHAEL 5. WEISS LISA VO ESCHEN
Sarvics Typa FodEx Standard Overalght EPSTEIN, TURNER & SONG,P.C. ABELSONHERRON LLP
Package Type FadEx Envelops Tr¥ SFIGUERDA ST STE 4950 333 § GRAND AVE STE {550
Zons 0% {05 ANGELES CA 90017 US LOS ANGELES CA 90071 U8
Packagas 1
Ratad Waight MY Transportation Charge LN
Delivered May §1,2010 1328 Discount . -1.18
Sve Aren A Awtomation Bonus Discount 474
Slgnad by LTORBATT Funl Surcharge . 108
FadExUsa BOOR0BG0000M00L., Total Gharge Hsh $1387
Shipper Subtotal ush $174.57
o e i ’%@m}%ﬁ%@%‘@*
il S S %‘a@%@%ﬁ a5

£ MDA
#ppited u fusl surcharge of B.50% o this 1 shipmeat.

. Fu[Smr;hsruo -FmiExhl;
v Distence Besed Priciag, Zone 1
Autamation CAFE Sondar Recinfom
Yracking 1D 440362334677 sheun henry MICHEAL WEISS
Satvice Type FadEx Expross Savar FadEx EPSTEIN TURNER & SONG PO
Package Type Customer Packaging 18135 5. Main St 777 SFIGUERCA ST #9050
Zona o GARDENACA 90248 US LOS ANGELES CA 90017 US
Packages H
Rated Waight, 1.01bs, 0.5 kgt Transportstion Charge ] a7
* Dullvered May 08, 2010 T34 Automation Bonus Dlscount 049
Sve Arag At Discourt 448
Sigrod by LESTREL Fuol Surcharga . 075
FadEx Use Coon00000/5007 1671, Yotal Chamge yso 5457
Recipient Subtotal Ush $0.52
Total FedEx Express usp $184.09

L3RS



it Sexvices, [nc

EPSTEIN TUANER & SONG
777 §. FIGUEROA 5T.

SULTE 4950
LOS ANGELES, CA 50017

£SnlY Fmﬂmég fou
Flle 749286

Low-Sngeles, OA Q00758286

mmice

BILLING QUESTIONS €A
BILLING DEPT(213)402v91}13
PAYHENT QUESTIONS Cath
PAYMENT DEFY(Z).Z?}%OI-QGO?

3 iy b DAC

11284 . 1127628 5/15/10 404 74

e “fﬁs’é?fx’&‘\ﬁfﬁi‘w D L T S PR O R TR

TAX 10 34-2003879

e U L et e R BT R S :
§£12/16 4635554 § ARS | LASC-LOS ANGELES EPSTEIN TURMER & SONG Base ch '
: 151 MORTH BILL STREET 777 5. FYGUERUA STREET mesearch 5.7
RESEARCH-ASAP LOS ANGELES CA 50012 LOS ANGELES <A 90017 Fuel Chge ! 3.20
| callar: MARY ELLEN 8, Adv/wit Ck 25.00
case No,i BS12300% * case Title: INSURANCE COMMISSION chack chg 2.50 100,70
mirst ohatin a cerrif $ed copy of tha minyg
Signed: CATAINED/FXD/ROR Ref: 204-410-04
E 1 . )
$/13/10 | 2134884 ) CsV EPSTELN TURNER & SONG LASC~LDS ANGELES Bise Chg 7.5Q 7.50
777 5. FIGUERDA STREET 11 NORTH HILL STREET
COURT SERVILE LOS ANGELES €A 90027 LOS ANGELES CA 90012
caller: MARY ELLEH 8,
Case do,; bx123005 case Titles Tnserance copmission
. - RTRH COHFORMS DM RUN
! signad: FILED DR6/ROR pefi 204-410-04
Invoice Amoumt: 345.74
Fees Advanced: 59.60
Total Amount Duel 404,74
L Wikt 404,74
PYToY ; {

o INVOIOE PAYMENTDUE UPON. RECEIDT



EPSTEIN TURNER & SONG

777 8. FIgUEilOA 5Y.
SUITE 485
LOS ANGELES, CA 90012

Realf Paymomts ta;

i, 8, Legal Flanagarmnt Servives, fae,
Fife 749288 '

Low Angolow, LA BOGFE-9266

BILLING QUESTIONS CALL:
BILLING smcmmz-soxa
PAYMENT QUESTT

PAYMERT aﬁr"rczia)«}z 9307

TAX Ib# _34-2003879
5/21/10 1 3 Cf sy EPSTEIN TURNER & SO0NG LASC-1.05 ANGELES sase Chg 1 .50 ¢ 7.50
777 . FIGUEROA STREET 111 RORTH HYLL STREEY
COURY SERVIE LOS_ANGELES CA 80 LOS ANGELES CA S0012 |
' Caller: MARV ELLEN 8, ¥
case No.! 85123005 Casa Title: INSURANCE COMMISSION
Fneicoworm/aawm
stgned: FILED DB6/ROK kaf: 204-430-04
H
¢ ]
H ; ' ]
. : ' 4 i
.
EFRVOTICE PAYENT-DUE- BP0 N RECEXPY




EXHIBIT 5



*

Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

Yrsori

ok
@Wﬂi tﬁ w”\‘.v

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110
‘Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
‘ 4172010 10479
BILLTO
Golden State Mutual Life Insurpnce Co
Contraci §2010-7809
Asin: Joseph Holloway )
1999 West Adams Blvd.
Loz Angeles, CA 90018 ?{9 ’W%
ir v - r
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
54035-004 Geperal
DATE SERVICE TYPE ) OESCRIPTION HOURS T RATE | AMOUNT
322612010 § $405.001 R Munnally § Catl with Mr. Weiss prior to conferenge call G 25000 2500
32672010 1 5405-001 R Nuanally | Confercnee catl wiith other side and Mr. Welss about decumentatfon 1 25000 250.00
3726r2010 | $405-001 R Wunnally | Calt with Mr, Weiss about need for revisions 0.0] 250.00 1500
3/26/201D { 5405-081 R Nunaally | Revise rolnsurance spreement ) 13} 25000 3560
32912010 | $405-001 R Munnally | Conferense with Mr, Weiss regarding revisions to the documents 1{ 25000 250.00
373072010 § 5405-00) I Nunnally | Analysis of redilte and call with Me. Weiss prior 10 conference oail 031 25000 1500
33042010 { 5465-001 R Nunnally - | Call with other side regaeding dosument and foliow up call with Mr. 23000 250,00
Weiss . [
+ 330220101 3405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Ms, Murphy regarding bond 0.2] 250,00 50.00
33072010 | 5405.001 R Nuneally | Anadysis of dividend malerials and ¢-mail regarding the spne to Mr 051 250.00 §25.60
Guinon .
3312010 | S405-008 B Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss 1o prepare for the conference call 021 250.00 50.00
313142010 § 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with 1A and Mr. Welss regarding agresments 2f 15000 sto.nn
3312016 | $405-001 R Nunnally | Follow up call with Mr. Weiss after the main eall 02] 15000 50.00
Total Legal Services . 6,615 60
Reimb Group
 3/317201¢ Fadex - 02/24/10 . 5836 58.36
3312010 3 pages topled @ .10 per page - Mareh 2019 630 ¢3¢
W¥e2010 Confarentt cali « 03/2510 38.52 3852
IR0 Conference calt - 03/26/10 6534 65.34
331204 Conferonce caff - B3/30/10 5,77 2877
37312010 Canference call ~ 033140 2.7 127.727
Total Reitnbursable Expenscs 316.06
Thank you for your busiuess, N\ f
Total $6,941.06 “
{\r oy o )| Payments/Credits $0.00
Phone # Fax # ' : \)(f .
' ek Balance Due $6.941.06
972-840-9080 972-840-6575 = ‘gﬁ £
Page2 4 lc\i 9

s -t o




Page 1 of 1

[€3 You forwarded this message on 4/30/2010 8:52 AM,
Fromi: Holloway, Joa

Sant: Fri4/30/2010 8:35 AM

To: Pearce, Scott; Wilson, David
Ce:
Subject: RE: Wisener Nunnally March
Attachmants:

Approved

From: Pearce, Scott

Sent: Fri 4/30/2010 8:17 AM

To: Wilson, David; Holloway, Joa
Subject: FW: Wisener Nunnally March

Please use this emall to consider my request below. Please disregard the prior as | falled to clean off some
prior emalis. My apologies for the redo.

&P

From: Pearce, Stott

Sent: Fri 4/30/2010 8:11 AM

To: Holloway, Joe; Wiison, David
Subject: Wisener Nunnally March

Altached please find Robert Nunnally's March involce for services rendered o the Golden State estate. | have
reviewed the bill and checked the math, The time and expense is consistent with our direction and specific
needs fo the assumption transaction with 1A American. | have aproved te involoe and | recommend your

approval i pay the bill,
if you wish to discuss this bill please let me know,

Scott

£ 7 4 ATk 14 4 4 i b by g g S ¢ e i Sy 3

https://mail.caclo.org/exchange/PearceS/Inbox/RE: %20 Wisener%20Nunnally%20March.E... 4/30/2010




Wiscner * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110
Garland, TX 75041 DATE | INVOICE#
412172010 10479
BILETO
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Co.
Contract #2010-7809
Attn: Jeseph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
5405-001 General
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS | RATE | AMOUNT
37172010 15405-001 R Nunually | Draft order approving rehabilitation 1.9¢ 25600 475.00
3/1/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss regarding revislons to agreement 0.5F 25000 125.00
3/172010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Draft revisions to agreement 071 250.00 175.00
3/1/2010 |5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Wilson regarding case developments and  press rciease 021 25000 50.00
37272010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Callwith Mr, Weiss regarding plan comments 0.7{ 250,00 17500
3/3/2010 }5405-001 R Nunaally | Conference calf with CLO feam, Mr. Weiss and Ms, Sinith regardmg 0.8{ 250,00 200.00
S changes {0 rehabilitation agreement dociments
3/3/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Telephone call with Mr. Weiss régarding further changes to-plan 041 25000 100.00
documents ta implentent results of conference call .
3472010 |5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss 0.5 25000 125,00
3/4/2010 §5405-001 R Nunnally {Revise plan documents 171 25000 425,00
3/4/2010 {5405-001 R Nunnally [ Analysis of stafus report and ¢ mail regardmg seme 02{ 25000 50.00
3/5/2010 |5405-001 R Nunnally |Revise agreements 1] 25000 250.00
3/10/2010 | 5405-001 R Nuanally | Revise the rehsbilitation application L1} 25000 275.00
3/18/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally |E mall to Mr. Weiss regarding agreement status 0.1} 25000 25.00
3/23/2010 | 5405-001 R Nurnnally | Analysis of Section 1457 and call with Mr. Weiss; ¢ mail authority to 0.5} 25000 125.00
Mr, Weiss
3/24/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of the rehabilitation pla and draft inble L6} 250.00 400,00
3/24/2010 | 5405-601 R Nunnally {Call with CLO team and Mr, Welss 061 25000 150.00
3/24/2010 | 5405.001 R Nunnatly | Follow up cells with Mr, Weiss 037 25000 75.00
372472010 | 5405-001 R Nunmnally |Analysls of revislons to the reinsurance agreement 0.4y 250,00 25.00
3/24/2010 { 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of the dividend Issue 11 250,00 250,00
344442010 ] 5405001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Peatcs regarding dividends 0.1 25000 25,00
3/25/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunually ] Analysis of revisions to agreement 02 25000 50,00
3/2572010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with TA and Mr. Welss 0.5] 250,00 125.00
3/25/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Welss regarding revisions 137 25000 325.00
3/25/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of Section 1043 nuances/binding effect of plan 1.5 25000 37500
3725/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with CLO regarding plan negotintions 1} 250.00 250.00
3/26/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of revisions to reinsurance agreetnent 017 25000 2500
Thank you for your businsss.
St ,. - Total
Payments/Credits
Phone # Fax #
Balance Due
972-840-9080 972-840-6575
Page 1




Wisgener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Envaice

625 W. Centerville Road, Suite 110 -
Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
472172010 10479
BILLTO
Golden State Muluat Life Insurance Co,
Contract #2010-7809
Atin: Joseph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
5405-001 General
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS | RATE | AMQUNT
3/26/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally { Call with Mr. Weiss prior to conference call 0.1] 25000 2500
326/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Conference call with other side and Mr. Welss about documentation 1 25000 250.00
3/26/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally § Call with Mr, Welss about need for revistons 017 250,00 25.00
3/26/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally { Revise reinsurance agreement 131 250.00 325.00
3/29/2010 | 5405001 R Nunnally | Conference with Mr. Welss regarding revisions to the documents 1] 250,00 250.00
3/30/2010 | 5405-C01 R Nuunally {Analysis of redline and call with Mr, Weiss prior to conference call 03] 2500¢ 75.00
330/2010 1 5405-001 R Nunnally [ Call with other side regarding document and foliow up call with Mr, 1] 250.00 23000
Welss
3/30/2010 | 5403-001 R Nunnstly § Call with Ms. Murphy regarding boad 02] 25000 50,00
3/30/2010 | 5405-00% R Nunnally [ Analysis of dividend materials and e-mail regarding the same to Mr. 0.3 25000 125.00
Guinon
3/31/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Weliss to prepara for the conference call 02 250?00 50.00
3/31/2010 §5405-001 R Nunnially | Call with JA and Mr, Welss regarding agreeinents 21 25000 500.00
3/31/2010 { 5405-001 R Nunnally | Follow up call with My, Weiss after the main cali 0.2] 250600 50.00
Total Legat Services 6,625.00
Reimb Group
3312010 Fedex - §2/24/10 58.36 58.36
373172010 3 pages copled @ .10 per page - March 2010 030 0.30
313172010 Conference ¢cali - 03/25/10 3852 38.52
3/3i/2010 Conference call - (3/26/10 6534 65.34
33172010 Cenfercuce call - 83/30/10 2577 5.1
313172010 Conferénce cafl - 03/31/10 12277 12777
Total Reimbursable Expenses 315,06
&9
kY ?] he
Thank you for your business. \]
: . Total $6,941.06 )
' Payments/Credits $0.00
Phone # Fax # :
— - Balance Due $6,941.06
572-840-5080 972-840-6575
Page 2




558, .

T0d7244157 FEDEXH 708471400200 1-800-622.1 (47
. £405.001 90017
TO; Epstaln, Tumer & Song CA
FROM: Belinda Jones T804 .
~  00f PRIORITY PKG BLB AWB708421400200
YOUR FEDEX GUSTOM DISCOUNT 18 $5.10 . .,

. Conlinudd on noxt page




Remote UL :Department ID Management

fo6

http://192.168.10.64/L. j?FIag‘—‘IniL Data&SeciD=0&Passwd=0&P..

8

AT T

o

[901 10 1002

Last Updated :04/0172010 07,03:04

Print TolalPage Limlis

Selest  Departmenti
- — oo »

& ® 5142001 0 0 0 0
' @ 5143001 0 0 0 0
& & 5144001 175 175 62 0

s ® 5200001 0 0 0 0

@ ® 5300001 0 0 0 0

@ @ M 0 0 0 0

15 @ 5400001 0 0 0 0

73 ® 5400002 0 0 0 0

@ 5400003 0 0 0 0

i @& 5401001 0 0 0 0

®m ® 5403001 0 0 0 0

L ® 5404001 L 8 8 0

m e Gz 42 42 0 0

4/1/2010 7:59 AW,




involes Number: 775469

. Mar § Apr Amt Apr$ ‘I‘o(af
udio Confereicing o R T T . !
- Conferénce Minkmum Adjustment Charges .~~~ =% 7" 0060 T @ $0.00 " 5000
Phone Minutes TTTTTTHES $2422 0 $0.00  §u422
" TotalTax $154 $0.00 $15.7
Teresa HollffeldTotal]l " — 7 $257. 4ef—“‘ e $6.00 $257.40
Audlo Conferencing .
March 25,2010 10:23 AM - 10:57 AM Duration {Minutes): 145
Description honie Dial Gut_Jolnod aff f— Duration ___Cos}
8023215533 023215623 N 0:23 AM HG:63 AM 30, A
B728400080 0728406080 N 0:24 AN 10:67 AM 33 8.25!
804735540 H04735540 N 0:2¢ AM 10,57 AM 29 _ 8725
P13BB17494 2138617494 N 10:30 AM 0:57 AM 27 .75
035267307 5030257307 N 10:31 AM A0:57 A 76 6.5
Texas State Tax $2.27
S ] SN Yota 145 T $38.59
| Audio Conferencing ‘ Biling Cods: 5405001 -
March™ 28, 2010 10:66 AM - 12:00 PM Duration (Minutes): 246
- Besoriptlon Phone lalGuf Holned Lefl Baralon Cosd]
}723408080 B728400080 N HO:56 AM 2:00 PM 84 $16.00
"B037174B41 3037174841 N _ 4055 A Z00P 516,50
04735540 4804735540 N 11:01 AM 12,00 PM 60 $16.0C
1405458025 3180058025 DT AM 12:00 £M 0 $15.00
Texas Sfals Tax 3.84
S Tota 24 $55.34
Audlo Gonferencing Biffing Code: 5405001
March 30, 2010 10:28 AM - $0:54 AM . Duration {Minutes): 97
esctipfion, . Phone Dtai Out oi ad Left [ Duration Cost
WS?SO? 3038257307 128 AM 0:54 AN 2 £8.50
728409080 o BT28406080 \ 10:30 AM (1063 A 2 8,00
2138517494 21386817494 N _10:31 AM 10:53 AM %‘“ 5.7
804735540 AB04735540 10:37 AM 10:54 AM Z $6.00
Taxas Slale Tax i $1.52
Tota o9 $25,77
Audlo Conferencing Billing Code: 5405004
March 3%, 2010 02:27 PM - 04:28 PM Duration (Minutes): 481
ascription hone Diaf Out Uolned oft \ Ouratln Cost
0185985286 81859952986 N C02 ZlﬁM 4:21 PM 4 28.50
4804735540 4804735540 N o228 P 4:28 PM 120 3006
9726402080 728408080 N 02:2 PM C4:28 PM . 120 30,00
036257307 gapas7aoy N 02:30 PM 4:28 PM 11 20,75
188958026 8160958025 4:2G PM 4:28 PM .00
oxas State Tax $1.5.
S Tota 481 ﬂg.].??’l

Questions? Call 1-800-878-7328

PagaSot?

# March 2010



Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P. H
y ¥ Gold, Invoice
625 W. Centerville Road, Suite 110
Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
5/5/2010 0626
BILLTO .
| Goiden State Mulual Life Insurance Co,
Contract #2010-7809
Attne Josegh Holtoway
1999 West Adnms Blvd,
l.os Angeles, CA 30018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
340500 Cenurat
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS | RAYTE AMOUNT
42972610 { 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysls efrevision 1o the service agreement and e mail to Mr, Welss 0 25000 25.00
about this tople
4/30/2080:} 5405-001 R Nunnslly | Draft Holloway declaratlon supporting rehab motlon ii 235000 25000
4/30/2010 | 5403-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Weiss regarding the documents G 25000 25.00
Total Legal Services . 6,995,50
Reimb Group
473012010 13 pages copled @0 .10 per page - Aprli 2010 1.3¢ 1,30
413072010 Conferenco call « 04223710 19.76 1976
Total Relmbursable Bxpenses . 2106
1% -‘\‘é!i ‘)-J
L
(7 e
T
M‘(/ﬁt - *
L W M T Wi /e
Al ¢ BVoE A
v M i
A apy tofined ME AT
Y S ) Q {H T Affwe e B
Lol WK A - | o | P

Fhank you for your business,

A

oA
‘S?,!Mb.!‘ﬁ_/ 4 {°

Payments/Crodits

$0.00

Phone # Fax #

Balance Due

5701656

972-340-6575

972-840-9080




Wisener * Nunnially * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110 -
Garland, TX 75041 DATE | INVOICE#
s/19/2010 10526
BILLTO
Golden Stats Mutual Life Insurance Co.
Contract #20{0-7509
Attn: Joscph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
5405-001 General
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS | RATE | AMOUNT
4/1/201¢ §5405-001 R Nunnally |Call with CLO team regarding rebab agreements 1.1} 25000 275.00
4/1/2010. } 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Ms. Murphy and Golden Stafe employee regarding the 0.4] 25000 100,00
‘ dividend calculations
4/212010 {5405-001 R Nunnally {Revise dividend letter : 0.i] 25000 25.60
4/2/2010 {5405-001 R Nuneally | Call witk CLO and IA o 0.5) 25000 125.00
4/2/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunmally | Follow up call with Scott and Tedd x 0.5] 25000 125.00
47212010 §5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of policy fanguage and divisible surplus Issucs 15] 25000¢ 375.00
4/2/2010 }5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Ms. Murphy and Ms. Green regarding dividends 02] 250,00 56.00
4/2/2010 [5405-00% R Nynnafly |Follow up e mail to Scott and Todd regarding dividend caleulation 0.15§ 25000 37.50
4£2/2010 | 5405-001 R Numnally | Analysis of agent's agreements 0.1} 25000 25.00
47212010 | 5405-001 R Numnaily {Revise letter to bardship/withdrawal applicents 0.2} 25000 50.00
47512010 15405-001 R Nunnally | Calf with Mr. Weiss regarding the deal status 0.}y 25000 25.00
4/5/201¢ {5405-001 R Nunnally | Draft e mail to Mr. Pearce re: dividends 01] 250,00 25.00
47112010 | 5405-601 R Nunnally { Analysis of the plan changes 0.1] 25000 25.00
41112010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally }Call with Mr, Weiss regarding the plan changes 0.2 25000 50.00
4/7/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Conference call regarding the rehabifitation plan with CLO personnel LS} 25000 375.00
47772010 } 5405-001 R Nunnally | Follow up calt with Mr, Weiss regarding corinissions 0.5] 25000 125,00
4/8/2010 |5405-001 R Nunnally | Call regarding documents with CLO team and Mr, Weiss 1{ 25000 250.00
4/9/2010 | 5405-00]1 R Nunnally | Revise-assumption sgreement 0.5] 250.00 125.00
4192010 15405001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Welss regarding the documents 0.5] 25000 125,00
4/9/2010 {35405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of service agreement 02§ 250.00 50.00
4/9£2010 15405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss regarding service agreement 041 250,00 100.00
419720101 5405-001 R Nunnatly | Call with Mr. Wilson regarding colnsurance and upcoming negotiation 041 25000 100.00
4/11/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Revise co Insurance 061 25000 150.00
471172010 | 3405-001 R Nunnally {Draft & mail to Mr, Welss vegarding co-Insurance 0.1 25000 2500
4/11/2010 { 5405-001 R Nunnally { Revise notlce 03] 25000 75.00
4/12/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Welss vegarding agreement, Call with Mr, Weiss and Mz, 031 25000 75.00
Hofloway regarding notice
4/15/2010 { §405-001 R Numnelly | Conference calls with CLO and with bidder regarding documentation 1,51 250,00 375.00
Thank you for your business, .
: - Total
Payments/Credits
Phone # Fax #
: Balance Due

972-840-3080

972-840-6575

Page 1




Wisener * Nuntally * Gold, L.L.P. Invoice

625 W. Centerville Road, Suite 110
DATE INVOIGE #

Garland, TX 75041

571972010 10626
BILLTO
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Co.
Contract #2010-7809
At Joseph Holloway
1999 West Adarns Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
5405-001 i General
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS ! RATE | AMOUNT
4/15/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally { Draft interim reinsurante agreement 1f 25000 250,00
4/15/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss to revise and finalize agreements 0.5] - 250,00 125,00
4/19/2010 § 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis and revision of agreements 051 250,00 125.00
4/19/2010 1 5405-601 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Welss and then with Mr, Weiss and Mr, Pearce regarding 04] 25000 100.00
: . : agreements ‘
4/19/2010 | 5405-00F R Nunnally |Revise the memorandum regarding open fssues 621 250.00 30.00
0.3] 25000 75.00

4/20/2010 { 5405-001 R Nunnally | Revise reinsurance agreement
4/20/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss regarding finallzation of agreements 021 250,00 50.00
14} 25000 350.00

4721/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Conference call regarding the rehabilitation documents
0.1 25000 25.00

4/2112010 { 5405-001 R Nunnally | mail and calt with Mr, Hom regarding Friday conference call

4/21/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Weiss regarding documents 0.2] 250,00 50.00
4/22/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnafly | Calls with CLO and bidder and then with Mr, Welss regarding the 1.5 250,00 375.60

rehabilitation plan .
4/22/2010 | 5405-00t R Nunaally | Draft revisions to the notices 0.3] 25000 75.00
4/22/2010 § 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Weiss regarding the notice document - 0.1] 25000 25.00
4/23/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Draft revisions to rehabs plan 0.2] 25600 50.00
472372010 1 5405-001 R Nunnally {Call with Mr, Hom and Mr, Welss regarding rehab plan 041 25000 100.00
413372010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally 1 Call with Mr, Welss abent drafts and transmission of dratts - Q1] 25000 25.00
4/23/2030 | 5405-801 R Nunnally | Draft Wilson declaration 0.97 25000 235.00
4/23/2010 | 5405-001 X Lawrence | Revisions to Wilson Declaration 0.6] 18000 108.00
4/26/2010 } 5405-001 R Nunnally | Draft revisions to ex parte notice 04) 23000 100,00
4/26/2030 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Calf with Mr, Welss regarding thning and changes in language re: . 021 25000 50.00
rehab notice and section 5.3 .
4/27/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Conference call witht CLO team and Mr, Weiss . 21 25000 500.06
#/27/2010 | 5405-601 R Nunnally | Follow up call with Mr, Welss regarding documents 021 250.00 50.00
4/28/2010 [ 5405-001 R Nunnally | Revise refnsiraince agreoment 1} 25000 250.00
4/28/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally jRevise ex patte notice : 821 25000 50,00
412812010 | 5405-001 R Nunnelly | Call regarding form of apreements 0.8] 25000 200.00
4/28/2010 15405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Welss regarding notice documents 02] 25000 S0.00
Thank you for your business.
oty Total
, Payments/Credits
Phone # Fax# A
Balance Due
972-840-9080 972-840.6575
Paga 2




Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

625 W. Centerville Road, Suite 110 -
Garland, TX 75041°  ~ DATE INVOICE #
571972010 10626
BILLTO
Golden State Mutnaf Life Insurance Co.
Contract #2010-7809
Attn: Joseph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
5405-001 Geneal
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS | RATE | AMOUNT
4292010 §5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of revision to the service agreement and ¢ mail to Mr, Welss o1 23000 25,00
. shout this topie
4/30/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally {Draft Holloway declaration supporting rehab motion 1} 25000 250,60
43012016 { 5405-001 R Nunsally | Call with Mr, Welss regarding the dosuments 041 250061 - 25.00
Total Legal Services 6,995,50
Reiinb Group ‘
4/30/2610 13 pages copled @ .10 per page < April 2010 130 130
4f30/2010 Conference cali - 04/23/10 19.76 19.76
2t.06

Total Reitmbutsable Expenses

1
L

T Whe Ae/ey
M{ﬁﬁ&wﬁw
VE 1
FoL | PAMATS

&

Thank you for your business.

Total szms.slq_f 16

Phone #

Fax#

972-840-9080

972-840-6575

‘Page 3

Payments/Credits $0.00

Balance Due $7,016.56

Fi
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Invoice Numi‘:er: 777889

ay Amt May $ Total
kS R
. : : §
Conference Minlmunt Adjustent Charges 1 $0.00 [ $0.00 0.0
Phone Minules, 73 $18.25 0 50,00 $18.2
| . Total Tax $151 $0.0 $1.51
i Terosa Holffleld Total] ~ - . $1978 T T $§0.00, §i6.78
Audio Conferencing : Bllling Code: 77777
Aprll 23, 2010 ' 0257 PM - 03:27 PM ) Duration {Minutes): 73
esg(ipflon Phone - Tal O Polnied - Lefl Duraiony ____ Cosf
728409080 B728400080 57 P 03:27 PY ‘3 574
169770762 86770782 N 00 PM Z8F 2 8.
185985298 85995285 N 10 P 3:27 17 34,75
exas Stale Tax : . : . 114!
arfand Clfy Tax ) 3 C.3g
: P NSO ISR MO 7 ORI - W [}
Teresa Holiffold's Bllilng Code Summary _
filng Coda__ Bervice . ey, 1 Quantity Cost
Faded Audlo Conf. Fhons Minutes i 13 $18.35
I Fay 4,54 -
i - Bllling Code 77777 Total $16.76
- Total Tax:] $1.51
T Teresa Hollfleld's Bllling Godes Total $19.78
s
5
Questions? Cafl 1-800-878-7228 " pagasofs’ " o 30 April 2010

-
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Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, 1.L.P.

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110
Garland, TX 75041

BiLL TO

Gulden State Mutual Life Insutance Co
Contraet #2010-7809

Atn; Joseph Holloway

1999 West Adams Bivd

Los Angeles, CA 90018

invoice

INVOICE #

DATE
636/20(0 10753

TERMS CLIENT NUMBER
3uc on receipt 540500
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
51332810 10 prges copled @ , 10 per page - May 2010 100 1.00

Thank you {or your business.

Total $1,751 6

e

Phone # Fax#

973-840-9080 972-340-6575

Retainer Applled  nw

$1,751.00

Balance Due




+

Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

"625 W. Centetville Road, Suite 110 '
Garland, TX 75041 - DATE INVOICE #
6/30/2010 {0753
BILLYO
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Co.
Contract #2010-7809
Attn; Joseph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd. R
Los Angeles, CA 90018
TERMS CLIENT NUMBER
Due on receipt 5405-001
DATE SERVICE TYPE ‘DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
5/3/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunn... { Revision of Wilson declaration 8.3 250.00 75.00
5/3/2010 {5405-001 R Nunn... | Revision of Holloway declaration 0t 250,00 2500
5732010 {5405-001 R Nummn.., | Analysis 6f final dratt of documents 0.5 250,00 125.60
50472010 §5405-001 R Nunn.., | Analysis of the death clalins Issue sampling -] T 250,00 25.00
5/4/2010  §5405-001 R'Nunm... | Conference callwith CLO team and Mr. Weiss regarding 0.5 25000 125,00
rpreement and status.
5/4/2010  [5405-001 R Nunn... | Draft revisions in the documenits {o deal with the déath | 0.2 250,00 50.00
claims {ssue .
57412010 | 5405-001 R Nunm... | Call with Mr. Wedss regarding the agreciment revislons to 01 250.00 2500
be made
5/4/2010  §5405-001 R Nunn,.. } Call with Mr, Weiss and with Mr. Welss and Mr. 0.2 250.00 50.00
' Donovan regarding agrecment timing
575/2050  5405-00) R Nunn... { Draft revisions to the Q and A seript and assoclated 1.3 250.00 32500
e-msils
5/6/2010 |5405-001 R Nunn... | Conference call regarding rehab matters with CLO 1 250,00 250.00
5/6/2010  15405-001 R Nunn... | Analysis of 1A Ietter 0.1 250.00 25,00
57772010 | 5405-001 R Nunn... |Revise letterand Q and A a5 250,00 125.00
571272010 {5405-001 R Nuag... | Call with Mr. Welss regarding the rehabiiitanon notice 02 250,00 50.00
hearing and revisions he will do to the motion
571472010 | 5405-001 R Nunn... | Revise application 0.3 250.00 125.00
5/14/2010 15405-001 R Nunn.,, | Call with Mr. Weiss regarding finalizing app and order 0.2 250.60 50.00
S/172010 | 5405-001 R Nunn,., { Draft e mail to Mr. Weiss regarding publication notice 0.t 256.00 2500
S718/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunn... | Revise application and declarations 07 250,00 175.00
572072010 | 5405061 R Nunn... | Analysis of websitc materials and draft ¢ mail to Mr. 0.1 250.00 25.00
' Weiss regarding these materials
5/2372010 | 5405-001 R Nuon.., | Call with Mr, Weiss regarding hearing matters and 0.2 250,060 50,00
confacts from clalmants _
5/21/2010 [5405-001 R Nusn... | Call with Mr. Pearce about upcoming heating 0.4 25000 2500
Totel Legal Services 1,750.00
Thank you for your business. S ’ :
: C Total -
Retainer Applied

Pherie #

Fax #

972-840-5080

972-840-6575

Page 1

Balance Due
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Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

625 W. Centerville Road, Suite 110
Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
6302010 10753
BILLTO
Golden State Mutua! Life Insorance Co.
" 1 Contract #2010-7809
Attre: Joseph Holloway
199% West Adams Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA. 90018
TERMS CLIENT NUMBER
Due on recelpt 5405-001
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
5/31/2010 10 pages copied @ .10 per page - May 2010 1.00 1.09
: T e oo 4 [ned
T e ’
Thank you for your business.
Total $1,751.00
Retainer Applied " $0.00
Phone # Fax# -
Balance Due $1,751.00
972-840-9080 972-840-6575
Page 2
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Wisener ¥ Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P. [ nvb ice

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110
Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
712812010 109412
BILLTO
Calden State Mutual Lifs Insurance Co.
Conlact #2010.7809
Altn: Joseph Holloway
1999 Wes1 Adams Bivd,
Los Angoles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
" 5405-001 Gendral
| oaTE | sERvicE TvPE | DESCRIPTION HOURS | RATE | AMOUNT
Total Reimbursable Expensey £89.50
V:d: ";‘f o
L *s}..wm?
g1 2 lg
Thank you for your business, )
Total $3,589.50
Payments/Credits $6.00

Phone # Fax# ' .
' Balance Due $3,589.50

972-840-9080 972.840-6575




* Wisener Nunnaﬂy * Gold, L.L.P. BHVGE ce

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110
Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
7/28/2010 10912
BILLTC
Golden Siate Mutual Lie Insurance Co,
Coniract #2010-7809
Attn: Joseph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd,
Los Angeles, CA 90018
CLIENT NUMBER QL!ENT MATTER NAME
5405-001 General
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION HOURS T RATE § AMOUNT
6/10/2016¢ | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Pesrce regarding status 0.1} 25000 25.00
6/10/2010 1 5405-001 R Nunnally | Dreaft e mal regarding letter to court by ex employees 021 250,00 5000
6/14/2010 1 5405-001 R Nunaaily | Call with CLO regarding objection letter ' 0.5] 25000 125,00
6/14/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnafly | Anaiysis of employee materialy 0.2} 250.00 50.00
6/14/2010 | 3405-001 R Nunnatly | Call with Mr, Welss regarding oblections and reply 057 250,00 125.00
6/15/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of employee group life policles ' 93] 25000 7500
6/15/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunaally | Revise reply 021 250460 50.00
6/15/2010 | 5405-00] R Numnally [ Call with Mr. Weiss regarding reply 0.7] 25000 175.00
6/15/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunanally | Further revisions to reply 821 250.06 50,00
6/16/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Attend telephonic conferetice regarding motion 0.5] 25000 125.0%
6/1672010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally |Revise reply 0.1} 25000 25.00
6/16/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr, Welss regarding reply 01f 250.00 2500
6/16/2010 | 5405-061 R Nunnally | Analysls of further revislons to reply and ¢ mail accepting same 02l 25000 50.00
[ 6/16/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnaily | Analysis of the relusurance trealy 021 256,00 50.00
6/17/2010 § 5405.001 R Nunaily | Attend call with CLO personnel and A regarding teply 067 25060 15080
& l7!29i0 5405-001 R Nunnally | Call with Mr. Welss regarding issues for reply 01| 25000 25.00
6/1713010 § 5405-001 R Nunnally | Analysis of reply 0.1 25000 25.00
672212010 1 5405-001 R Nunnatly | Analysis of complaint from policyholder and call with Mr, Weiss 02] 25000 50.00
regarding this maiter
6/23/2010 | 5405-001 R Nunnally | Travel to Los Angeles; billed at 1/2 time 1.5} 25000 37500
672372010 | 5405-001 R Nunnaily | Meeting with Mr, Weiss regarding hearing 071 25000 175.00
8/24/2010 { 5405.001 R Nunnally | Meet with clents prior to hearing; attend hearlng and discuss result of 297 25000 72500
hearing with clients .
6/24/2010 § 5405-001 R Nunually. [Flight to Dallas billed at 1/2 time as client courlesy L5} 25000 375.00
Total Legal Services T ' 2,900.00
Relmb Group .
6/30/2010 American Alrlines - 06/23/10 - 06/24/10 DFW/Los Angeles/DFW for 689.40 689.40
R, Nomnally .
63072010 1 page copied @ .10 - June 2010 8.10 0.10
Thank you for your business. .
LT : . Total
Payments/Credits
Phona # Fax#
Balance Due
972-840-9080 972-840-6575
Page 1




" Wisener * Nunnally * Gold, L.L.P.

Invoice

625 W, Centerville Road, Suite 110 :
Garland, TX 75041 DATE INVOICE #
' 742872010 10812
BILLTO
Golden State Mutual Lifa Insurance Co,
Contract #2010-7809
Attn: Joseph Holloway
1999 West Adams Blvd.
Los Angeles, CA 50018
CLIENT NUMBER CLIENT MATTER NAME
5405-601 General
DATE SERVICE TYPE DESCRIPTION: HOURS | RATE | AMOUNT
Total Reimbursable Expenses 689,50
Thank you for your business,
you sy Total $3,589.50
Payments/Credits $0.00

Phone # Fax'#

§72-840-9080 972-840-6575

Balance Due

$3,585.50

Page 2




Reservations - Book Flight - View Itinerary

[ R

Americanilrliines'

https:/Avww, as.convre.

5105

ic?onfprintReservation.do?location=Navi gd...

Note: This is not your recelpt. You wili be receiving your itinerary confirmation aleng with your recelpt soon.
You may printyour itinerary & Recelpt directly from AA.com once the status is updated from "Purchased” to

"Tickefed".
Ressarvation Defalls
Record Locater Status Reseyvation Name
KMBBDP Purchased - DFWILAX
Your record focator Is your reservation Juss 14, 2010 You can nama your
confirmation number and will be needed o - resarvation so it's saslerto
retrieve or refarence your reservation, tocate when you refumn to
AA.com (a.g. Quarterly
Meating).
Your .Etlne rary
Carrlor Fiight | Peparting Arriving Cabhin Seats
Number ";T
. ooking
CHy Date & Time | Clty Date & Time Code
A, 433 | DFWDallas/ | Jun 23,2010 | LAX Los Jun 23, 2019 | Economy
AMERICAN FortWorth  {01:25PM | Angeles 02:30 PM Vv unassigned
AIRLINES :
A E
AA, sass | LAXLos Jun 24,2010 | DEW Dallas! | Jun 24, 2010 | _SConOmY
AMERICAN Angeles 04:20 PM | FortWorth | 09:25 PM W 15A
ARLINES
Your Notiflcations
Contact Notiflcation Summary Aactlons
: Enabled
Fars Summary
Average Fare per Person - 868,60 USD
Passsnger Type Used in’ Fare per Person Additional Taxes and Fess { Total Prige
Pricing per Porson .
1 Adult £68.00 USD 21.40USD 689,40 USD
Total Price 689.40 USD

Summary Detalis

Credit Card Information

6/11/2010 4:02 PM
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EXHIBIT 6



KANE CORPORATION

Jduly 12, 2010

Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company, in Conservation
1998 West Adams Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 90018

Atin: .Jos Holloway
On-Site Supervisor for the Conservator

For professional setvices re: Real Estate Related Services Assoclated with the
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
June 1, 2010 through June 30, 2010

684.75 hours @ $250.00 (Principal - PRI) $18,187.50
36.50 hours @ $149.00 (Sr, Project Coordinafor - SPC) $5,438.50
$21,828.00
Additional charges and out-of-pocket expenses: {breakdown atlached): $1.241.49
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $22,867 .49
o C(,{)W’lAP [ et
jar. mamie oA [M'Eé"““ ’ \,, B ﬁ’t P&

/WJ e Witk
lefians T (st
bestpned. T Ml0E

iif} 67 SELBY LANE, SUITE 100, ATHERTON, CALIFORNIA 94027-3926 (650) 369-9100 FAX (650) 369- 91%? - W d«



KANE CORPORATION

BREAKDOWN OF AIR AND TRAVEL EXPENSES

FOR SERVIGES RENDERED GOLDEN STATE MUTUAL LIFE
INSURANCE COMPANY, IN CONSERVATION

JUNE 1, 2010 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2010

PRINCIPAL
L s R TR ‘-.-.).\gg G ‘n. : = TTRTI qe ¢ ATE 1
JUNE 1 -2, 2010 (LOS ANGELES, CA) 31340 118404, 13580 | 7873 60.00 897
JUNE 6, 2010 (LOS ANGELES, CA) 156.70 | 167.03 52,23 50.17 28.50 15,95
___TOTALS]_470.10 | 341.04 ] 188.03 | 128.90] 8850 24.92

TOTAL AMOUNT: $1,241.48




July 12, 2010

Golden State Mutuat Life lnsurance
Company, in Conservation
1999 Wes! Adams Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 80018
Atin: Joe Holloway, On-Site Supervisor

Professional Services

6/1/2010 PRI

5PC

6/2/2010 PRI

SPC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to on site at Company headguarters working on
valuations of all REQ propettes including but not limited to research of
comparables, several calls {o local real estate professionals, discussions
with client, several telephona conversations with Michells re; same; review
and revision of comparable analysis and REQ Summary report,

Wark oh Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Compary Assignment
Including but not Jimited to work on valuation analysis of REO properties
including but not iimited to calls with client, calls with local real estate
professionals, discussions with Peter, research on wely; preparation of
draft tenant letters fo Winston-Salem tenants; review of Long Beach
settlement statement; revisions to REO summary report; preparation of
comparables worksheets,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
inchuding but hot fimited to on site at Company headquarters working on
valuations of ali REO properties including but not limited to research of
comparables, several calls to local real estate professionals, discussions
with cltent, several telephane conversations with Michelle re: same; review
and revision of comparable analysis and REQ Summary report; work on
Cccupant to Vacate Letter re: Winston Salem Bullding; forward to counsel
for review; email to Medora of GSM requesting contact information for

District Offices.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to continued work on REQO valuation analysis
including but not limited to discussions with local real estate brokers

Hours

9.00

4.00

9.50

5.50



July 12, 2010

Page

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

6/3/2010 PRI

SPC

6/4/2010 PRI

6/7/2010 PRI

6/6/2010 PRI

SPC

(Chicago, Vallejo & Detroit); research and preparation of comparable
analysis spreadsheets; dlscusstons with Peter re: same; review of draft
letter to tenants re: Winston-Salem property.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to preparation on and sending of communications
to Medora Chellin of GSMLIC re: Detroit, Mi property tenant relocation,
communications with client re; recommendations for GSM Art and
Corporate artifacts - Leslie Hindman, Chicago, IL; response from client to
make the call to Hindman; preparation and sending of GSM lelterhead to
client, response from Medora Chetlin re: GSM District Office contacts,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussion with Peler re: due diligence and
sale of business to A Insurance company; discussions with Peter re:
BPO's and REQ valuaiion analysis; editing of lstter to tenants at
Winston-Salem properly; review of communications from client re:
Houston sale - Buyer having trouble finding financing; discussion with
Peter re; his meeting with Medora; call to Advance Weight l.oss Center
(confirming not Detroit property) review of prefiminary reciplent list for art
collection RFP; research re: same; preparation of letterhead for
Winston-Salem tenant letters, review of contact person list provided by

Medora.

Woark on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Corpany Assignment
including but not imited to work on REO properiy comparables; review
and edit of REQ Summary spreadsheef, |

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assigniment
including but not limited to review of REQ Summary
spreadshest/compararables analysis,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to scanning and sending of Receipt of Keys sheet
signed by 2706 E South Street Long Beach, CA buyer, forward to client.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

including but not limited to receipt of keys by Buyer and discusston with

Peter re: closing.

Hours

3,75

3.75

3.00

-1.50

0.25

0.25



July 12, 2010

Page 3

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation '
Hours

6/9/2010 PRI

SPC

6/10/2010 PRI

6M11/201¢ PRI

SpPC

Work on Goiden State Muiual Life Insurance Company Assignment 8.00

including but not limited to on site af Headquarters in LA; review and
revise REO Summary Spreadsheet; forward to clients; forwarding of
Letterhead to GSM, communications to Michelle requestmg Master
Morlgage Portiollo spreadsheet review of same; research re; loans in
default - Springer and Coudray; client request fo prepare Overview of
Mortgage Portfolio Report for cllent's mesting with |1A American.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 3.50

Inciuding but not imited to revision of REO spreadsheet with BPO and
valuation analysls; discussion with Peter re; cllent's inquiry re; Ghicago
valuation against book value; research re: same; emailing to Peter our

iatest mortgage report.

Work on Golden State Muiuat Life Insurance Company Assignment 1.78

including but not limited fo review of communications from client re;
telephone conversation with Candice at ELAT properties re; request to
record property under different name - review of Notary Acknowledgment
Form and Corrected Grant Deed; response to client to refer request to
Carol Draper at Chicago Titls who s famfflar with transaction; receipt and
review of GSM frial balance for Loan Portfolio sent from client; response to

client,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 4.00

including but not limited to work on Master Mortgage Portfollo; discussion
with Michelle re: same, review of response from client to Candfce
Margareth and Ray Globari re: 2706 E South Street, Long Beach - settie
matter with Carol Draper; response from Candice; review of
communications to client from Broker Gerald Womack re; 4801 Almeda
Road, Houston, TX; sending of revised Morigage Portfollo and research
of "Watch List assels" and sending of same to client in preparation for

mestings with 1A next week,

Work on Golden State Mulual Life Insuranse Company Assignment 4.50

including but not limited {0 review of communilcations from client re: Long
Beach - Buyer request fo record property In a different name and
discussion with Peter re: response thereto; review of GSM Mortgage Trial
Balance sheet as of 5/31/10 - updating of master report; discussion with

Petler re: revisions therefo,



July 12, 2010

Page

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

6/11/2010 SPC

SPC

6/14/2010 PRI

5PC

6/15/2010 SPC

PRI

6/16/2010 PRI

Wark on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to update from Houston Buyer - still looking for

financing.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussion with Peter re: walch list pictorial;

coordination and review of same.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Coropany Assignment
including but not fimited to discussion with Michelle re: telephone
conversation with client re:"Watch List" assets; call to counsel; call to Coe
Fields re; Winston Salem building - tenants/best way to communication
vacancy notice - Flelds will speak with tenants, letter to be drafted to
tenants will be sent out next week; preparation on and sending of
communications 1o client re; same; response from client inquiring about
seclrity deposits; emall to Coe Fields re: earller conversation, request for
proper tenant contact names and information re: security deposits;

response from client,

Work on Galden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to discusslon with Peter re: his conversation with
Coe Flelds re: Winslon-Salem property; research and confirmation of
tenants in building: email to client of Information; preparation of draft email
to Cos Flelds re; termination of tenancias of tenants at building;
discussions with Peter re: same.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Gompany Assignmant
Including but not limited to revisions to REO comparable spreadsheels;

discussion with Peter re; Houston fransaction.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Gompany Assignment
including but not fimited to communications to client ret IA meeting,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to request for further clarification on valuation
varlance CVM vs Carrying Value for Chicago; review and forward research
materials to client: discuss with Michelle; EM to client with attachments;

similar concem ra: Detroit, Ml

4

Hours

0.26

0.50

4.60

2.50

1.00

0.25

1.76
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Page

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Gonservation

6/17/2010 PRI

6/22/2010 PRI

SPC

SPC

SPC

.6/23/2010 SPC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re: his
conversation with Broker Gerald Womack - Spirit of Texas pass on loan,
expecting commitment letter from a different bank; sending of
communications to Coe Fields inquiring about how discussions went with
tenants/proper contact names lo address Notice to Vacate letter.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslignment
Including but not limited to review of communications from client re: loan
001-52440 purchase Interest; response re; history of building impairment;
telephone conversation with client re: same,; telephone conversation with
Coe Flekds re; Winston Salem bullding - Vacancy Letter, receipt of tenant
list/phone numbers sent by Fields; rasponse to Flelds; drafting of Notice to
Vacate letter; discusslons with Michelle re; same; forward to cllent,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re:
request for assumption of loan #001-52440 and communication fo tenant
of property re: loan #001-52549; discussion with Peter re: same, revision

of database.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life fnsurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of backup offer sent by G Womack re:

Houston property.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to review of tenant Iist provided by Coe Flelds re:
Winston-Salem property; review and revislons of leffer to tenants,
discussion with Peler re: same; discussion with client and sending of

fenant letters,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not fimited to review of letfers being sent to tenants re:
Winston-Salem; review of communications from client re; interested
parly(les) interested in assuming loan #52440; review of note; telephone
conversation with client re: same; discussion with Peter re: first right of

refusal on loans,

Hours

0.75

4.00

126

0.25

2.50

1.00
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Page

Guolden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Conservation

6/23/2010 PRI

6/2472010 PRI

6/25/2010 PRI

SPC

PRI

6/28/2010 PRI

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
Including but not limited to review of communications from client re: Loan
001-82440 Promissory Nole; response fo clients; review of Vacancy
Latters sent out foday; communications sent from client to Keith, Murray
and Patrick re: Marcus and Millichap interest in assuming ioan 52440,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life tnsurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re: OSC
Hearing - approved; response {6 ¢lient; review of documents re: 4801

Houston.

Work on Goiden State Mutual Life ihsurance Company Assigniment
Including but not limited to call from interested party(ies) Dion Laurent re:
4801 Aimeda Road property, 4576 RL Thornton Freeway, Dallas property,
sending of communications re: same; call to client re: discussion with
Laurent - verbal offer $675,000; review of communications from client fo
Womack re: 4801 Almeda lending; review of Womack response to ciient -
Spirit Bank taking second look af loan; email fo clients re: same.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not iimited to review of communications from cllent re;
Houston property transaction (Womack), discussion with Peter re: his calt
with another interested party(ies) D. Laurent and also to client,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussion with Michelle re; Houston property,
review of comparables; sending of communications to interested party(ies)

Dion Lauren; sending of marketing material.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Compahy Assignment
including but not fimited to several communications from client re: 4801
Almeda sale - Gerald has until 8/30 to get loan commilment;
communications from client re: same - wilt send Broker emall today,;
several communications from client re: Springer Loan - 801 E Redondo,
Inglewood, CA,; research re; same; forward Propetly Profile to client -
transferred to Jil Hill on June 4, 2010; communications from client re:
Fspinosa loan - may be paid off; communications from cllent - Promissory

6

Hours

1.00

0.78

3.00

0.50

0.75

3.00
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Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Conservation

6/28/2010 SPC

SPC

6/29/2610 PRI

SPC

SPC

6/30/2010 PRI

notelletter from Kelth to Ms, Randall attached.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited {o communications from client re: status of sale -
buyer needs more time for financing; naw offer coming in from ancther

interested party{ies) re: Houston,

Work on Golden State Mulual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not Hmited {o review of communications from cllent re;
Spinger loan - borrower’s wife trying to finance property to purchase;
rosearch re: property and discovery that fitle of property has transferred by
Borrower to wife {Hil); emailing of information to cilent; discusslon with
Petor re; same; review of Espinosa loan payoff request; revigion to master
mortgage database; review of documents re; Springer foreciosure,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited fo review of communication from client re: 901 E.
Redondo, Inglewood, CA fransfer of property; telephone conversation with
First American Title Insurance Company re; same; review of Deed /
Foreclosure Notice sent from First American Title Company,; sending of
communications to clfents re: same, review of Chicago Title Property
Profile Report sent to client; receipt and review of Interspousal Grant Deed
and Foreclosure Activity Report; forward fo client; several communications
from clients re: discussion with tenant Dee Washington of Neighbor for
Better Nelghborhoods re: Winsfon Saiem Properfy - desires an extension,
lease terhy: 3/8/10 - 8/8/10.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited fo review of loan document re: Springer;
calculation of pre-payment penally; discussion with Peter re: same; review
of communications from client re: foreciosure sfatus; sending of properly

proflie to cllenl.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications re: vacation of

tenants at Winston-Salem, NC property.

Work on Goiden Stale Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited te communications from Gerald Womack to client
- should have answer today; email from cllent re: Coudray loan - trustee

Hours

0.50

2.50

3.50

0.50

0.25

0,75

e UMM s iy
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July 12, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Conservation
Hours
sale 7/18/10 at 11:30am at San Luls Ohispo Courthouse.
6/30/2010 SPC  Work on Golden State Mutua! Life Insurance Company Assignment 1.28
including but not limited to review of communications re: Houston sale to
. Churchwell, Springer documents, Courd eray trustee sale; memos 1o file
~ and tckiing of dates,
SPC Work on Golden State Muttial Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.25
including but not limited to communication and calendaring of trustee sale
re: Coudray.
Amount
$21,626.00

For professional services rendered 101,25
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Viviana Puebla

Southwest Arlines {Southwest.t\iriines@lu{r.southwest.com}

From:

Sent: Friday, May 28, 2010 10:35 AM

To: Peter Kane

Subject: Ticketless Conflrmation - KANE/PETER C - QECQRI

8 PT84 wRler
KO24723 nthd
0 corpnb i,

g o
SQUTHWESKQOM'

Recelpt and Winerary as of 65/26/10 12;35 PM

Confirmatlon Date; 05/28/10 Bo prepared when you gst there]
ved: PETE N :
Recolved: WN/PETER C KANE BY ICBM Consult Traval Gulde for relevant

fips from real travelers.

g :§ JFW%’@‘ Yotk FOTRE ; o
Dafe . Filght Routing Detaiis
Tug Jun 04 #0178  Depart SAN JOSE CA (SJC) at 8:36 AM

Arriye In BURB

ANK CA (BUR) at 9:35 A _
SETm

L)

Base Fara S 1.4
+ Excise Taxes $20.36
Advertised Fare $202.00
+ Segment Fee $7.40
+ Passenger Facllity Fee  $9.00
+ Seclirlty Fee' $5.00
Total Payment; $313.40

Security Fes Is the govemment-
imposed September 11ih Securily Fea.

Current payment(s)
05/28/40 Ticket Exchange ¥




OMN

Wk

OMNI LOS ANGELES HOTEL
251 SOUTH OLIVE STREET
LOSANGELES  CA 90012
Tele-213-617-3300  Fax~213-617-3309 Room Number: 4531
Daily Rate: 135
KANE, PETER Room Type: kp
GOV?anent No. of Guests! 170
67 SELBY LN
Atheton ______ CA 94027 — A :
ARRIVAL | DEPARTURE | CREDIT CARD [RATE CODE  |MKT GROUP'  |ACCOUNT
OO0 08020 GOVT GOV 16900618148 _
DATE | ROOM NO. || BESCRIPTION . &~ .. - | REFERENCE. AMOUNT
06/01110 1631 PARKING 05-731 $30.00
cor0tHe 1531 ROOM CHARGE #1534 KANE, PETER $135.00
08/01/10 - 15631 COCCUPANCY TAX QCCUPANCY TAX $10.04
06/02/10 1531. MASTER CARD MASTER CARD ($184.01)
TOTAL DUE: $0.00

ASH  3-8563



HOLLYWOOD-BURBANK AP

RR 179236245
PETER

KANE

VENTCLE: 01198 /7880701
1ONTHX  LIC: CA  6LKIOSL

FUELY 8/0 OUT 8/8 IN
L TCOPr 77694 -USAA

RES: E75819765A5 /GOWL /F
COMPLETED BY: 2247 /CABURIL

RENTED: BURBANK ALRPORT
RENTAL: aa/0i/10 16:30
RETURN: @8/02/19 18:46

PLAN IN:
PLAN OUT:

MILES IN: 3225
MILES OUT: 3378
WMILES DRIVEN: 47

Gove
Gov1

DAYS 24 SO0 S DAY, §
SUBTOTAL. i1
CONCESSION FEE RECOVERY T$
Ch TOURISH ASSESSMENT $
Lo DECLINED
I8 DECLINED
PAI, PEC BECLINED

CUST. FAC CHG-

$
INCREASED VEM LIC RECOVERY FEE Ti

TAX 9.758% ON 111.44
HET DUE .
PAID BY

TR-X HILES
HILES ALLORED
MILES CHARGED

RATE CLASS: F

HOW WAS YOUR EXPERIENCE?
WE'D LIKE YOUR FEEDBACK,
¢

1) Call 1-300-278-1595, or
Visit WWW.HERYZSURVEY,COM

2) Enter Access Coder  @1182"

A
2% Toke Briaf 4 Ouastion Survav

THANK YOI FOR RENTING FROM

HERTZ

027/ > 7/ I

— L

~

e e e g beten of e L e et

JHE . 70 WES PR

SEN JOSE L ATRPORY
1701-AIRPORT-BLV0-SUTTE-91801
SN JOSE, CA 58113

4BG-441-5570 &
o 1DeASs TERH 10:aH80431768 "
PR TYPE: KASTERCARD
ACCREMNT 4
YOTAL AMOURT $
BPYROVAL OROEr  G85HI$y 2 TSTAN) frddat

CUSTOMER COPY

.

£0.00

P NP TE Pt

.

.

« HORLD O11.°828
- ALY N SAN FERH
BURBANK

-t

916248080

5 1818481

D

‘s

05/82/2818 6143129 PH 5718

46/1P
IHYOICE 184222

AUTH 88-942038 AEF 921 26934
SODRGHHEHRR

]
THENE vou

PUHPHID
it
PRICE/GAL
FIEL TOTAL

CRIND Credit

Total = 50,97
8,97



KRR R SRR bR ok

) :%*******mgqstumer fopy *
; . . ; - ZREFS LI LITE LN TS
y The Pramium Experience y %-;«% PRk

P

el fpail € plaza Store
' ?ﬁméﬁg‘é.53}§§3r23§ STE R2B The 28th Strest Cafe
Los Angeles, CA 80071 2827 South Hoover St :
(213) 628-4000 . Los Agga]es, Ch- 90067
. 13-748- ‘
HDSTS TUINKIES 158 F 2829
Hnnngpgﬁggp%gﬁggéEs ¥'g§ E
%%mmmw%m' :mw; Date: v -08/02/10
BR‘\' HOTAX > 24 1Y 0,"} T]mB: 2:08 PH»-_‘
Sarver: 129, Allyssa

Order: -4,°- 54952

wweE 18 O

CASH '
Card Type; Visa/ue
Total nunher of items sold =5 Card Ha:
“““““““““““““““““““““““ Purchases: 3 51.97
S Tim 510
CASHIER HNME: Drly . g 9P
10015 RERTSTER:003 CASHIER:0017 ég
%@%ﬁm& TUTLN010 21:28:24 Total: § ¥V
T o s s
i
Famina!! Californ 1 agree to pay the ahove tatal amount
x, according to.the card issuer agreement,
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Viviana Puebla

Southwest Alrlines [SouthwestAlrlines@tuv.southwest.comj

From:

Sent: Tuesday, June 08, 2010 10:11 AM

To: Pster Kana

Subject: Ticketless Confirmation - KANE/PETER C - QXB3S8

R 6 -

(Speras
S UT‘HWES’I'.&‘»OM’

Recolpt and [tnerary as of 05100710 12:14 PN

Confirmation Date: 06/04/10
Recelved: WN/PETER C KANE BY ICBM Bo prepared when you get therel
Consult Travel Guide for refevant

fips from real fravelars.

- pasgengar Name - . "Explratios
06/G4111

KANE/PETER G

;;7, RIRY Tt i
to BURBANK CA - ( Travef Time: 1 irs.)
Date Fiight  Routing Detalls

Tue Jun 08 #1334 Depart SAN JOSE CA (SJC) at 1:00 PM
. ... Afivein BURBANK CA (BUR) al 2:00 PM
Return: BURBANK CA o SAN JOSE CA: (-Trayel Time: 1 -rs.5 minis }
Date Flight  Routfing Details

Wed Jun 09 £3677  Depart BURBANK CA (BUR) at 5:55 PM
Arrive in SAN JOSE GA (SJC) at 7:00 PM

IESsEamIRA RS TN ES

Base Fare $271.684

+ Excise Taxes $20.36

Advertisod Fare $292.00

+ Segment Fee $7.40

+ Passenger Faclilty Fee  $8.00

+ Securily Fee' $5.00

Total Payment: $313.40 /.1 . ¥\ St D

Securlty Foe Is the govemmant-
Imposed Septembar 11th Securily Fea,

Current payment(s)
06/08/10 Ticket Exchange




iMNI LOS ANGELES HOTEL
51 SOUTH OLIVE STREET

08 ANGELES
ele- 213-617-3300

ANE, PETER

7 SELBY LN
therton

5/08/10  0B/0SM0

8110 1748
08110 1746
0810 1748
010 1748

CA 90012
Fax- 213-617-3399

CA 94027

PARKING

ROOM CHARGE
OCCUPANCY TAX
MASTER CARD

Yy

i —— 4 A= 4w b rme @

»

1746
249
DDNOC
170
BAR4 BAR4 18900616018
08222 $30.00
#1748 KANE, PETER $249,00
QCCUPANGCY TAX $35.08
MASTER CARD {$314.08)
) 2r-
4157.03

TOTAL DUE: $0.00
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EXIt : 20:00 0s/00710 Lang # 5g | .- :
Length o Stay: 1 4.

h. 42 mn.
License plate : ¢y 5B8MN568

5" PH 134?

HOLLYHOOD-BURBANK AP

RR 183120943

wms xm
i1 Y
Cashier: 050 Shirt: gp7e SEQH 48635 I.‘,m{;,qaggg,gg st g 031
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HCS BURBANK LLC
BOB HOPE AIRPORT
7627 Hollywood Hay
Burbank, CA 91505
(818) 972-1331

Server: LORNA Gﬁfgg{gﬂgg
Fast Cfosefi ' :
fussis: 0 470494
: .79
Frift Salad ;
4,
Subtotal g
Tax : -
Total \
5.2

HAVE A RICE FLIGHT,
{COME AGAIN} THANK YOU

b}

3
i}
4

T
**************%**t***%***************
3 Customar {opy *

**#**#***********#********%**#**—t#*

The 28th Street cafe
2§2? Soirth Hogver St,
Las Angelss, C4, 80007

213-746-2929

Date: © - garmeng
, Time: 2:21 py
4 Barvaer: 128, Allyssa
Ordar: 58424
Description: Tabls ¥ 1
Card Type: Visa/Mo
Avpr Code: 043918
Purchases: $ 38.91
Tip: o
y _‘[/ U
Total; R 4 .
KANE/PETER

I agree to pay the above total amount
acoording to the card issuer agresment ,



T KANE CORPORATION

August 16, 2010

R
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation i D
1999 West Adams Boulevard O .mﬁ
Laos Angeles, CA 80018 ;

Attn: Joe Holloway
On-Site Supervisor for the Conservator

For professional services re; Real Estate Refated Services Associated with the
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Consetvation
July 1, 2010 through July 31, 201C:

: e
45.75 hours @ $250.00 (Principal - PRI) $11,437.50

12.00 hours @ $149.00 (Sr. Project Coordinator - SPC}) $1,788,C0 s
$13,225.50
Fast Signs - Dallas, TX (For Sale by Owner Sign & Installation) $129.85
Additional charges and out-of-packet expenses: {breakdown attached): $483.25
. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE; $13,838.60 7
A Di&losmony |
Wiy S - SAte
Digrued” gfice C uAva Re/iewebW
W 1SSuEs ’Bwv iz hoawts
| | Me WL
Uoie) g0 mc pneamerr, T
(wu ) | flecomnend f ¢
Mg B
pael. - e
ﬁvf’ﬂm -T/c Tane ?/‘33

i} 67 SELBY LANE, SUITE 100, ATHERTON, CALIFORNIA 24027-3926 (650) 369-9100 FAX (650) 369-9106



August 16, 2010

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance
Company, In Conservation
1989 West Adams Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA 80018
Alin: Jos Holloway, On-Site Supervisor

Professional Services

71212010 SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

PRI

7162010 PRI

8PC

71772010 PRI

71872010 PRI

Including but not limited to review of termination hotice sent by G.Womack
re: Houston transaction; confirmation of amount placed in escrow, review
of listing agreament; call fo client; discusslons with Peter re; response to

client inquiry,

Work ot Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of Commercial Coniract Termination
Notloe sent by client; edits to Termination Notice; forward to client; review
of 4801 Almeda Road, Houston, TX Purchase and Sales Agreement and
Amendments; discussions with Michelle re: same; telephone conversation

with client.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to several communications with client re: 4801
Almeda Road, Houston, TX - communications to Gerald Womack re:
counter offer; response to client re: edits to communication to Womack;
review of communications from effent to Wormnack re: same with

Commerciat Contract Terminalion Notice.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Hisurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of draft communications to client re:
termination notice and counter to AK Capital; discussion with Peter re:

same,

Work on Golden State Mutuaf Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to communications from client re: conversation

with Gerald Womak.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from Womack
Development staff to client with signed Commercial Contract Termination

Hours

175

3.50

200

0.50

0.25

275



August 18, 2010

Page 2

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Conhservation
A Hours

7/812010 SPC

7/9/2010 SPC

PRI

7/12/2040 PRI

8pC

71372010 PRI

SPC

7/14/2010 PRI

Notice and Eamnest Money contract aftached; forward o David Wilson to
sign; review of fully executed documents sent to client; telephona
conversation with clients re; pricing of 4801 Almeda Rd; review of
communications from cllent re: buyer firm at $575K; review of draft email

o Broker from client,

Work on Golden State Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.75

including but not limited to review of communications re: Houston -
rermination notice to Strade Churchwell, 2nd offer to he submitted;
discussion with client re: response to G.Womack re: Letter Of intent.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.25

including but not llmited to review of communications from client to
Womack re: 4801 Almeda,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Inhsurance Company Assignment 0.50

including but not limiled to review of communications sent by client to
Broker, Gerald Womack re: Houston propetty.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.50

including but not limited to review of several communications from clients
re; AK Capital (Buyer) offer at $585K, request for asbestos report.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.25

including but not limited to review of communications from client re: AK
Capital offer.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Comparty Assignment .75

including but not fimiled to communications from client re: Loopnet
inquirles; review of response/Loopnet report sent to client from Michetle,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.50

including but not limited to research and response to client re: loopnet
leads inquiry.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Instrance Company Assignment 1.75

including but not limited to communications from Gerald Womack fo clfent
re: 4801 Almeda Road, Houston, TX - properly showing today, review of
several communications from clients re: 825 Capitolio Way, San Luis
Obispo - Coudray loan; review of communications fo client re! AK Capltal,



August 16, 2010

Page

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Gompany, in Conservation

7/14/2010 8PC

spe

711912010 PRI

712012010 SPC

7/21/2010 PRI

SPC

742212010 PRI

LLC / members.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications re: showing of
Houston property by Gerard Womack; discussion with Peler re! same,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

- includirig but not limited to cammunication from client re: Coudray update

- Borrower may file Bankrutpey, research and response to client's inquiry
re; AK Capital.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assigniment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with cllent, discussion
with staff re; signage of 4801 Almeda Road, Houston, TX; sending of
communications with client re: 4801 Almeda Road, Houston, TX - sign
Installation this week; discussion with client re: Gourdray foreclosure and

next steps.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not Jimited to review of communications re: sign for Houston
property; call to Fastsigns re: status of sign placement; review of

communications re: foreclosure - Coudray; discussion with Peter re. same.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to communications from client re: his
conversation with Walter Brown re: closure plan for district offices;
discussion with Michelle re: her conversation with client re!
valuation/disposition reports and status of new REQO - San Luis Obispo;
review of communications from client re. same.

Work on Golden State Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assighment
including but not fimited to communications to and from cfient re: sign
installation at Houston property; review and telephone conversation with

client re; REC disposition plan,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of response from Keith Murray to client
re: 825 Capitolio Way, San Luls Obispo - will arrange to get keys,
communications with Keith - Coudray will mall keys / needs ons week to
vacate; coordination with Kelth to re-key, sign, and take pictures of

3

- Hours

0.50

- 2.25

2.00

0.50

2,00

075

5.00



August 16, 2010

Golden Siate Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

7/23/2010 PRI

71262010 PRI

SPC

712712010 PRI

sPC

Page

]

property: review of comimunications from slaff re: 4801 Almeda sign
placement / banner quote; receipt and review of Trustee’s Deed Upon

- Sate sent by client; telephons conversation with Mark Coudray re: meeting

tomorrow [7/23] at property; sending of communications re: same; forward
to client; response from client; communications from cflent to Womack -
remove signage on 4801 Almeada Road, Houston, TX / defer interested
party(ies) to Kane; forward email from FastSigns re: banner on bullding

removed,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to visit to REQ property 825 Capitolio Way, San
Luis Obispo, CA - meeting with Mark Coudray; Inspection of and taking
pictures of properly; re-keying of property; work on 7 day Lease
Agreement; discussion with Interested party(ies); telephone conversation
with client re: same; review of communications from clients; sending of
communications and plotures to ¢lients re; property visit review of
communications from Coudray to interested party(ies) Steve McCarty;
sending of communications to McCarly re: contact information.

Work on Golden State Mulual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited fo calls with Interested party(ies) re; Houston;
sending of information; preparation of commercial short term lease for

- San Luis Obispo propertly, discussion with Michelle re: site visit;

communications with Interested parly(ies) re: San Luis Obispo.

Work on Goiden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications and discusslon with
Peter re; Wurnover of Sat Luls Oblspo property; marketing of property;

review of short term lease.

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to communications from client re: recelpt of San
Luis Obispo property keys; communications to interested party(ies) Phan
re: Houston; telephone conversation with Interested pariy{les) Tim Barnes
re: San Luis Obispo; sending of communications re: same; several
telephone conversations with interested pary(ies) re: Houston and San

- Luls Obispo properties,

Work on Golden Stale Mutual Life Ihsurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussion with Peter re; his call with Tim
Barnes re: San Lufs Obispo properly and Impending offer,

4

Hours

10.00

4.50

1.50

3.00

0.25
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August 16, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Conservation :
' Hours

7/26/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Cornpany Assignment 3.50

including but not fimited to to calls with interested party(ies} re: San Lufs
Oblspo propetly; review of offers and Lelter Of Intent; forward to client;
saveral discussions with client re: same; discussions with Michelle re:
same; telephone conversation with Interested party(les) Clarence re:

Houstan,

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 1.00

including but not limited to review of communications from interested
party(ies) re; Houston property; addition of information to database;
telephone conversation with cfient re; San Luis Obisp property - offers

received.

7/29/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Campany Assignment 3.00

including but not limited to  discussions with interested party(les) re:
Houston and San Luis Obispo properties; review and responding fo
communications from brokers re: offers for properly; discussions with

client re: same,

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 1.00
including but not limited to review of communications from interested ‘
party{ies) Malt Quaglino; addition to interested party(les) list; discussion

with client re: next steps {call with Murray Brown of 1A); discussion with
Peter.

7730/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.75

including but not limited to call to interested party(ies] Pastor Zachary
Glover re: 4801 Almeda Road, Houston, TX! telephone conversation with
interested party(ies) re; 825 Capifolio Way, San Luis Obispo, CA; sending

of communications re; same,

0.28

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from client to
Murray Brown re: San Luis Obispo property - expressions of purchase

interest.

For professicnal services rendered
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FASTSIGNS B .
invoice: P 15340

DOWNTOWM
Fastsighs Downtown
813 Dallas
Houston, TX 77002
Phone 713.228.7446
Fax. 713.228.3922
Emall; 318@fastsigns.com

Customer: Kane Corporation

ph: (650} 369-9100

Contack: Viviang Puebla

Description:  ALUM signs for building

Sales Person:

Cleric Nayana Parikh Email: vp@kanecorp.com

| | Product | aty [stdes | HxW | unitCost | | item Total |

1 Aluminum 040 1 1 24x36 . $96.28 $98.26
Color; one color taxt on White :
Description:  Aluminum 040, .

Text: For Sale By Owner X
Golden State Mutual Life insurance Compahy, In Consarvation

Please Calt 7
2 24x36FRANE 1 1 0x0 $30.00 $30.00
Coior; None on BLACK
Dascription:  24"x36" Angle fron Frame
Payments Received (thank you)
Bate Amount  Payment Method racking Number
TIR20/2010  B32:21AM w $128.85 MasterCard
Total Payments: $129.85
Other Payments: - Ordﬁred: 7H512610 12‘:49304PM
Shipping Notes: Form of Payment / Amount / Initials “ g:ilgfed: 7?13%01100 1:2333121’\&: et
Plcked Up: 7i2172010 11:04:085M
Line ltem Totaf; $126.26
Discount: £6.31
Subtofal: $119.05
Taxes: $9.90
Totat; 129,85
Notaes: i
Total Payments: $129.86
Balance Due: $0.00

Payment In full s due upon placing order
ATTN; Viviaha Puebia CUSTOM SIGNS ARE NON-REFUNDABLE

Kane Corporation
g{esggy Lane Recalved/Acceptod By:
! 7

Atherton, CA 94027 ‘
Sign & Graphlc Solutions Made Simple,

SYSTEMEASTSIGHS CRYSTAL tnvofcell
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Account, 157979741

Quality Suites (CAT02) . Dator 712310
1631 Monterey St, Room: 256 LscR
San Luls Oblspo, GA 93401 Auivat Date: 7122110
. (806) 541-5001 Departure Date:  7/23/10
BY cueioE Worels gnewland@qualtysultessio.com - Gheck In Time: 7122110 10:57 PM
Check Qut Time:  7/23/40 7:06 AM
Kane, Potar . Rewards Program 1D;
87 Selby Lana #100 . You were checkad out by  wisto.ca702
Atharton, CA 84027 Youwere checked in by:  arodge.ca702
' Total Balance Dus:  0.00

.
E ¢

<Post Batd, L BRI an e e e T A R ArioutE ]
2210 Room Gharge #266 Kane, Petar 130,00
n2ane State Tax 13.00
T22110 Othér Tax 2480
7123110 iester Card {145.60)

Room Charge 130.00
Siale Fax 13.00
Other Tax 260
Magter Card {145.80)

Thly vale Is eligible for partner rawards. 1f Ihis rate Is chrmged, you Balance Dye:. 0.00

mpy no longer e erditiad o parlner rewards. 3

#payment by credit sord, | agree fo pay e above tofal chargs amotnt

seoording to tha cerd Issuer agraement,

X

el AT
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— KANE CORPORATION

i

August 18, 2010

@/lb’d)q

,,,,, L

Golden State Mutua! Life Insurance Company, in Condervation { i
1999 West Adams Boulevard ( 01 SEP e

Los Angeles, CA 80018 ™
Attn: Joe Holloway ;)
On-Slte Supervisor for the Conservator R TRRTT

For professional gervices re; Real Estale Relaled Services Associated with !he
Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company, in Conservation
July 1, 2010 through July 31, 2010:

45,75 hours @ $250.00 {Principal - PRI) $1 1,437.5&';
12.00 hours @ $149.00 {Sr. Project Coordinator « SPC). $1.788.00 -
. . $1,3,22§.50
Fast Signs - Dallas, TX (For Bale by Owner Sfgn & Installation) $129.85 )
Additlonal charges and out-of-pocket expenses: (breakdown attached): 83,25
.. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $13,838.60
flex DisFedes . s
| Win §>“W ~ Sl .
| DiSTIA” (e Ortepoar L HAE Redand e
TR [55ues : B fie Act P
gﬂ somp 4 TE Wik tefes
s flgo ne Mashe, T
(u»;w E)QI;WM‘E) _ IQ/Y“ ‘ [tf’ fle Commerdd Pafipert &
[}) @] 40 Me  BAd . J-f""'(
Sufhar mr/c mmmw «g/'z *

8 67 SELBY LANE, SUITE 100, ATHERTON, CALIFORNIA 94027-3926 (650) 369- 9100 FAX (650) 369-9106




KANE CORPORATION

September 17, 2010

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

1899 West Adams Boulevard
{ os Angeles, CA 90018
Attn: Joe Holloway
On-Site Supervisor for the Conservator

For nrofessionat services re: Real Estate Related Services Assoclated with the
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
August 1, 2010 through August 31, 2010;

69.75 hours @ $250. ob’(mrncrpal PRI) $17.437.50
31.75 hours @ $148, Uof(ér Project Coordinator - SPC) , $4,730.75
$22.168.25

$936.10

Additional charges and out-of-pocket expenses: {breakdown attached):
$23,104.35

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:
C) - Yo ¥ (w) f

{s |
‘%’ | fﬁf 3y~ 021 T HAE ﬁ%&bﬁ? e
Bl £ AWk
visr fue M:swﬁm S B it WLM“]
CM ﬂw R !}f&\{&(/ 6!3 M’g

E%f{/@d W %rSECSM f YesStye SLo /> (4:99‘ ;uga‘wtm
Covrmiusd WV OV Duslosmon fuan. | K
o [* 7 ]b

sl DéTicr Cuosue (LN,

il 67 SELBY LANE, SUITE 100, ATHERTON, CALIFORNIA 94027-3926 (630) 369-9100 FAX (650) 369-9106



KANE GORPORATION

BREAKDOWN OF AIR AND TRAVEL EXPENSES

FOR SERVICES RENOERED GOLDEN STATE MUTUAL LIFE
INSURANGE COMPANY, IN CONSERVATION

AUGUST 1, 2010 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2010

PRINCIPAL
o :i..\ ‘: I ,n - 2 ; } z -\\- _&':N 5% 5 t% «wﬁ”\ ’,_}) .14 r ' 1 __-g h e 1 E1 ‘.’i‘ n TR &
AUGUST 18 - 20, 2010 31340 | 311.28] 45104 | 61829 B7.00M 1178
TOTALS] 31340 | 311281 151.04 | 6182 87.00 11.7¢

TOTAL AMOUNT: $938.10

©




September 17, 2610

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance
Company, in Conservation
16899 West Adams Boulevard
L.os Angeles, CA 90018
Alin: Joe Holloway, On-Site Supervisor

Profassional Services

8/2/12010 PRI

SPC

8/3/2010 PRI

SPC

SPC

Work on Golden State Mutuaf Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not Imited to review of several communications from client
re: 4801 Almeda Road listing/pricing/counter; review of MJ response to
client; discussion with Michelle re: same; raview of Letter Of intent from
Wormack: telephone conversation with Inferested party{ies) Harold Hanes
re: Houston; telephone conversation with interested party(ies) Mare re:
Houston; research of proposed Buyer Kidney Assoclates; review of

counter.
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not iimited fo telephone conversation with interested
party(ies) and emalling of information to same (H.Hains); review of Letter
Of Intent received from Kidney Assoclations, research re: same;
preparation of proposed response to Buyer; discussions with cllent;
discussions with Peter; review of ofher communications and documents
re: same,

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mulual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re:
communications from Womack re: counter offer: sommunications with
interested party{les) Talbart Davis.re: Houston; review of intarested .
party{ies) Inquiry - Wade. '
HOUSTON

Work on Old Standard Life Insurance Compary Assignment including but
not fimited to discussion with client re: response to offer from G.Womack;
discussion with Pater re: same; review of communications from broker.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to research and review of GSiM art collection for
sale: discussion with Peter re; possible intarested party(les).

MISC

Hours

4,00

3.75

1.25

09.50

0.25



Page 2

September 17, 2010
Golden State Multual Life Insurance Company, In Conservation
Hours

8/3/2010 SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.50

ncluding but not limited to review of information for sending to additional
Interested party(ies) (T. Davis, G Wade); addition of Information to

database.
HOUSTON

8/4/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutua| Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imiled to call to interested party(ies) Matt Quiglino;

. telephone conversation with client re: 825 Capitolio Way, San Luis QObispo
re: status on offers; communications to Mark Coudray re: status of
clean-up;

SAN LUIS OBISPO

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from Borrower and
client; discussion with Peter re; cleaning up of property.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assighment
including but not limited to discussion with cllent re; district office clostire
plans; discussion with Peter re: same,

MISC

SPC Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussion with Peter re: his call with interested
party(ies) Yvonne Benner; coordination and showing of her client the
property; review of communications to and from client re: same.

HOUSTON

8512010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment review
of communications to Medora Chetlin from counsel re: Interested
party(ies) Yvonne Bonnet/ separation from formal refationship with Gerald
Womack; telephone conversation with interested party(ies) Yvonne
Bonner - Inqulry re: elevator in building, sending of communications to-
Medora re: coordinating property showing; communications to interesled
party(les) - no elevator; telephone conversation with interested party(les)
Douglas Wright re: 4801 Almeda Road; response from cllent re:
discussion with Medors,

HOQUSTON

8/9/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not Jimited to communications with GSM re: 4801 Almeda
Road property showing today,
HOUSTON

PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Gompany Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re:
Capitolio purchase interest;review of communications from client re:

4.00

0.25

0.50

0.76

3.25

.75

1.00
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September 17, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

8/9/2010 8PC

‘.
B O

SPC

SpC

SPC

PRI

SPC

B8/10/2010 PRI

photos from Coudray.
SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not ltmited to review of communications from Mark Coudray
re: status of cleanup; review of communications re: request {0 prepare
Purchase and Sales Agreement for current interested party(les}
{H.Lashlee); discussions with Peter and cllent re! same.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re;
showing of property, determination of local contact, determination of who
has keys; review of emails from Interested party{ies) and addition of
contact information to database; coordination of showing of property
including but not fimited to telephone conversation with Medora re: local
contact; telephone conversation with Larry King; telephone conversation
with Yvonne Bonner re; confirmation.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assighment
including but not fimited to work with Peter to develop disposition plan and
district office closure plan; several telephone conversations with client re:
same; preparation of summiary report.

MISC

Work on Golden Stale Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
inciuding but not limited to telephone conversations with client re:
preparation of Purchase and Sales Agreement.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to call to client re; district office closure plam
didcussion with Michelle rd; same.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
inciuding but not fimited to work with Michelle to develop disposition plan
and district office closure plan; several telephone conversations with client;
re\gew and revisions of summary teport.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited call to Mark Coudray re: 825 Capitalio; call fo
interested party(ies) Mait Quagline, call to Broker Tim Barnes re:
interested party(les) Hal Lashlee offer; preparation on counter for
Houston property; communications from Mark Coudray; review, save and
resizing of photos from Coudray; response to Coudray; forward photos to

Hours

1.25

0.76

276

0.50

0.75

2,00

7.50
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Septamber 17, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

8/10/2010 SPC

SPC

SPC

8/11/2010 PRI

SPC

PRI

81212010 PRI

client: communications to client re: refmburserent of dump fee fo
Coudray; draft of Purchase and Sales Agreement for 826 Capliolio Way,

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to assist and review of Purchase and Sales
Agreement; discussions with Peter re same,

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not timited to sending of information to Interested party{les)
re: property.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to review and discussion with Peter re: pictures
from Borrower confirming clean up of property.

SAN LUIS OBISPO :

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to several communications from client re; Ban
Luis Obispo - commision, property ready for showing, reimburse Coudray;
research of property management companies for San Lufs Obispa; callto
Coudray ; several communications to client re: same; review of
communications from client to Murray re: San Luis Obispo interested
party(ies) Tim Barnes.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to work with Peter re: disposition strategy and
office closure reports; research re: local brokers and janitorial vendors;
communications and several telephone conversations with client re; same;

revisions as requested by client.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to work with Michells re: disposition strategy and
office closure reports; research re: local brokers and {anitorial vendors;
communications and several telephone conversations with client re; same;
revislons as requested by slient,

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
inchuding but not fimited to review of communications from client to
Womack re: Kidney Associates, PLLC counter offer,

HOUSTON

4

Hours

1.25

0.26

0.25

2.76

3.26

3.00

1.76
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September 17, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation

8/12/2010 SPC

SPC

acr st agpbad e

e

PRI

8/13/2010 PRI

PRI

8/14/2010 SPC

PRI

8/15/2010 PRI

Work on Gelden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assighment
fncluding but not limited {0 review of client's response to Kidney
Associates counter offer; discussion with Peter re; same; review of

counter offer,
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life nsurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of Disirict Office Clostre & Disposition
Recommendations prepared by client; suggested revisions thereto,
several lglephone conversations with Peter and client re: same.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not Emited to work on District office closure plan and asset
disposition strategy.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignhment
including buf not fimited to several communications with client re: SLO
property.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with interestad
party{ies) Kevin Riles re: Houston; sending of information to Riles; edit
LoopNet fisting price,

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review and discussion with client re: disposition
strategy and district office closure plans; discusston with Peter re: same
and alternatives (Bulk Porifolio Sale, FSB Owner, Separate Listings,
Portiollo Auction); telephone conversations with Peter re: same,

MIsC '

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assigniment
Incluging but not limited to review and discussion with clfent re: disposition
strategy and district office closure plans; discussion with Michelle re:
same and alternatives {(Bulk Porifalic Sale, FSB Owner, Separate Listings,
Portfolic Auction}, .
MISC

Work on Golden State Mulual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to work on Purchase and Sales Agreement;
forward to Broker Tim Bames, :

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Hours

0.50

278

1.78

1.00

0.75

1.25

1.25

1.25



Page 6

September 17, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
: Hours

8/16/2010 PR!- Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 2.75

including but not imited to call from inferested party(les) Gary Wade re:
4804 Almeda - offer $5K; sending of communications o Wade, call to
client re: same; call to Houston Office re: showing of properly to Wade.

HOUSTON

PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

.. . - Wincluding but hot limited to communications from Tim Barnes re: San Luis

g Obispo; communications from Matt Quagline - no dumpsters on property,
response o Quaglino; receipt and review of signed Purchase and Sales
Agreement sent from Barnes; forward (o client.
SAN LUIS OBISPO

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but tot limited to review of executed Purchase and Sales

Agreament, )
SAN LUIS OBISPO

/1712010 PRI Work on Goiden State Mutua! Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not Timited to review of draft communications from client; call
from Tim Barnes of Apex, Broker of Interested patly(ies) Hal Lashlee re:
San Luis Obispo; call to client; review of communications from client re:
District Office Janitorial vendors - 30 day termination notice; review of
response from Matt Quaglino re: possible interested party(ies) Tom Maino.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

PRI Work on Goiden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to raview of communications from Gerald to
Womack re: Churchweil financing; telephohe conversation with Womack;
communications to Womack re; same; forward to client,

HOUSTCN

:SPC Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but notdimited to telephone conversation with client re; overview
«+ * of offers for property; strategy on rioving forward; telephone conversation .
with Peter and G.Womack re: Churchwell offer and financing with Post
Oak Bank, preparation and review of email to G.Womack summarizing
conversatfon.
HOUSTON

SPC Workon Go'lden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to review of closure checklists and janitorial
contacts provided by client,

MISC

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from broker (Matt
Quaglino) recommending interested party(ies) (Maino Family), review of
communications from Tim Barnes re: sales transaction; discussion with

1.25

0.25

3
]

3.75

1.60

1.00

0.25

0.75



September 17, 2010

Page

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, In Conservation

8/18/2010 PRI

SPC

SPC

8/19/2010 PRI

SPC

SPC

8/20/2010 PRI

Peler re: same.
SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Gompany Assignment
including but pot imitad to on site at Headquarters in LA; communications
with client re: Purchase and Sales Agreement execulion coordination;
telephone conversation with cllent re: same; communications from Gerald
Womack re: Churchwel financing; draft of response te Gerald, forward fo
cllent; sending of Information to interested party(ies) John re: Houston
property.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to coordination of gefting Purchase and Sales
Agreement signed by both parties; research and sending of fitle company
contact information to Peter.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutua! Life insurance Company Assignment
inclding but not limited to review of communications from G.Womack re;

 status of Churchwell financing; emall to John Coscla, interested parly(ies)

of infarmation.
HOLISTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assigniment
including but not limited to on site at Headquarters; review of ediled Asset
Disposition List sent by Michelle; discussion with Michelle re: same;
meetings with client; review of REO files,

MISC ’

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to coordination of signing of Purchase and Sales

Agreament by Buyer,
SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to preparation and revisions {o disposition
strategy report - target values; discussions with Peter re! same,

MISC

Wark on Golden State Mutual Lifs insurance Company Assigniment
Including but not limited to on site at Headquarters; telephone
conversation with interested party(ies) Marcus-Davis re: Houston property;
sending of Information to interested parfy(ies); communications with
interested party(ies) Richard Chen re: Houston,

HOUSTON

Hours .

575

0.50

0.25

8.00

0.25

1.50

1.75
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September 17, 2610
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Consetvation

8/20/2010 PRI

i PRI

SPC

5PCG

8/23/2010 PRI

SPC

8pC

8/25/2010 PRI

Work on Galden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to ¢all from interested party(ies) Yvonne re; 4801
Almeda Road, Houston, TX; sending of communications re: same to
interested party(ies); forward to client; response from client - District office
closura 10/1; communications from client inquiring if Womack has a key to
4801 Almeda Road; response to client.

HQUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to receipl and review of Purchase and Sales
Agreement from Interested party(les) Hal Lashlee; telephone conversation
with Tim Barnes re: Purchase and Sales Agreement recelpt.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to addition of contact information to database re:
interested party(les); communications from G, Womack re: Churchwell

financing status,
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
inciuding but not imited to email to client re: recelpt of Purchase and
Sales Agreement exacuted by Buyer.

SAN LUis OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with interested
partyties} Dr, Whitmire; meeting with client re: signing of Purchase and
Sales Agreement re: San Luis Obispo properly: preparation of
communications re: same; forward to Tim Bames;

telephone conversation with Beth Bevan of Fidelity National Title Company.

SAN LUIS OBISPO -

Work'on Goiden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to addition of Ro Whitmore, interested party(ies)

to database.
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to telephone conversation with Beth Bevans re:

confirmation of opening of escrow and deposits made by Buyer and

timelines.
SAN LUIS OBISPO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to calls with interested party(fes) and sending of

information,
HOUSTON

Hours

1.00

1.00

0.50

0.25

3.00

0.25

0.50

0.25
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September 17, 2010 .
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
BOUI’S

8/25/2010 SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignmént 0.50

including but not limited to telephone conversation with Tim Barnes and
Jennifer re: opening of escrow, ordering of preliminary title report; reviewof
communications to tftle company re: same. )

SAN LUIS OBISPO

+BA26/2010 PRI Work on Golden Stafe Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assignment:
o Including but not limited to review of communications from Michelle to
™ cllent re: San Luis Obispo - $25,000 dapostted 8/23 by Hal Lashlee;
recelpt and review of important dates sent by Beth Bevan of Fidelity
Nationat Title Company.
SAN LUIS OBISPO

8/27/2010 PRl Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to telephone conversatlon with interested
party(ies) Mrs. Johnson re; Houston; sending of information.

HOUSTON

- 8/30/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
‘ including but pot fimited o telephone conversation with Jennifer of Apex
. Properties re: San Luis Qbispo; recelpt and review of Naturat Hazard
Disclosure Report and Preliminary Report from Beth Bevan of Fidelity
National Tltle Company; communications from client; sending of
communications to Keith of GSM; récelpt and review of Trustee’s Deed
upon Sale for San Luls Obispoe; forward to Title Company.

SAN LUIS OBISPO

SPC Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
inéliiding but not limited o telephone conversation with Jennifer re:
request to turn on utilities at property for Buyer's inspections; telephone
conversation with client re: request for TSG; discussion with Peter re:
same; review of PTR and disclosute reparts,

SAN LUIS OBISPO

0.25

0.50

2.00

1,75

Amount
101.50 $22,168.25

For professional services rendered




Viviana Puebla _
From: Southwest Alrlines [SouttwvestA%anas@luv.southwest.oom}
Sent: Tuesday, August 17,.2010 6:08 PM

To: Pater Kane

Subjact! Ticketless Confirmation - KANE/PETER C - DIXIQL

ik = BESUS AJRAC RN : . Eﬁﬁm A Cars ,
KANE/PETER C 5262319727190 08f17/11
o Where o Stay

-

1 Ajf travel Invoiving funds from this Confirmation Number must be completed by the
expiration date.

Growse Al Holels

Nomeh A iy AR et

Dapatt SAN JOSE CA (SJC) at 6:30 AM Yhat To Do
Wed Aug 18 0295 xrive tn BURBANK CA (BU) at 7:30 AW R e

‘ (moymwEgTiGoM:)
Depart BURBANK CA {BUR} at 5:30 PM
ThuAug 19 3452 prrive in SAN JOSE CA (SIC) at 6135 PM _ Teavel Guldy
'c‘lqe!s{v E-rmali
{m ity
Base Fare $271.62 mﬁ%&s
+ Bxcise Taxes $20.38 .
Adverilsed Fare $292.00 CLEK " SRV
+ Segment Fee $7.40 “Stgn Up Hoy
4 Passenger Facility Charge $9,40 DL, Pl P AP
+ Securlty Fee® $5.00 Gut Powarded
Total Payment $313.40 - ;
Cufrent payment(s)
08/17/10 Mastercend §4$313.40

2 gecunity Fee Is the government-imposed Septernber 1ith Security Fee, L1 o ‘“ o I




‘Viviana Puebla

L S R P R RN
From: Southwest Alrlines [SouthwestAirlines@!uv.snuthwestcom]

Sent: Thursday, August 19, 2010 £:31 AM

To: Paler Kane .

Subject: Tickefless Confirmation - KANE/PETER C - DIXIGQL

Btpirationt ]
it 08/17/11
1k travel Thvalving funds from this Confirmation Number must be completed by the i}%‘ ereto Siﬁlh

Browse ALD

¢ RS s R LI

expiration date.

F o prowse AllHotels
PR A TR NIRRT
What To Po

)

i

i (EouTIwERT oM
Base Fare $135.82
+ Exclse Taxes $10.18 © L Tyl Guldo
Advertiged Fare $146.00 T
+ Segment Fee $3.70 Weekly Eomall
+ Passenger Facility Charge $4,50 A
+ Security Fee? $2.50 : NEVER MISS
Total P € $156.70 .
otal Paymen . .
_ CLIBK "t SAVE
Current payment(s)
o Hanlp New

08/19/10 Ticket Exchange 08 i

2 gecurity Fee Is the government-imposed September 11th Security Fee, _Get Rewarded |

suthwest Alriines. All travel invelving funds from this Confirmation

Valld only on S

Numbar must be completed by the axpiration date, Effectiva January 28, 2011, unused i e

travel funds may only be appiled toward the purchase of future travef for the individual oarn Morg

named on the ticket. Any change to this Itnerary may resuit In a fare increase, i SRS
Travel Tins




5195 HlowerSt

Los Angeles, CA 90017
P:213.623.9%04
F:213.614.8010

Sfatement Date  O8/20/10

- ~ 11:20:50AM

" Peter Kane f\r{ival Date‘ 9&!18/10‘
i . ) Departure Date | 08/20/10
AL B ... Account# . 125409
| ’ R “Room#' 414
P o »
{ | DATE DESCRIPTION ' / A4 -CHARGES CREDITS

08/18/10 | 3rd Party Merchants-Room # 414 Tl s1800

08/18/10 Room Tax-Room # 414 $17.64

08/18/16 Service Charge--Add-On $12.00

08/19/10 | 3rd Party Morchants--Room # 414 ' S © $126.00
i | 08/19/10 Room Tax-Room # 414 $17.64
“losnono | Serice Charge-Add-On $12.00
-1 08/20/10 MG - MasterCard--P:0312 AUTH&EE {$311.28)
{
: ’ 3%“
;

notwiived and agees to be held pessonally liable I&P‘Bﬁé’hé@ e $0.00

" Jagpee that my Hability for this bl iy
i the cvent that the Todioated peaon,
or the Full amouat of these chasges.

SIGNATURE

L ]
- - *
v
4

company or associion fiils to gay foe say pact




THE HERTZ CORPORATION
Phonsat B00~654-4323F

Faxt .
Hob} Wi haxts.com

Diract All Inquiriea To:
THE HERTEZ CORPORATION
PO BOX 28120
ORLAHONA CITY, OK 73126-0120

FETEN KAMK

KANE CORPORATION

§7 BELEY IN S18 100
ATHERTON, CA 94027-392¢

RENTAL REFRRENCE
Rantal Rgxesment No: 5471264345

neservation ID: ‘B83919243A1

MISCELLANEOUS INFORMATION
CC AUTH: 010128 DATE: 2010/08/20 AMT:
CC hOTH: 024858 DATE: 2010/08/18 AMI:

pirect All Imquiries Tol

THE HERTZ CORPORATION

PG HOX 26120 -

OKLANCHA, CITY, O 73126~0120
UNITED STATES

vhened BOO~654~4173

Taor: .
Web: wuw, hertz,com

Page 1 of 1

"3 PRINY

10.00
231,00

et Bt T T fonnalnfTIotai IPand TnUiew.isn

Rrontal Agreamant No: 541264345
Invoive Date: 08/26/2000
Documant 990001231134
Renten: PETER KRAKE
Account No.: e ;
COP No.: 7694

COP Nanet USAA

RENTAL DETAILS

Rute Plant IM: CRL our: CRL
Rented Ont 08/18/2010 09:00  LOCE 110211
BURBANK, CA
Returned on: 08/26/25610 11:59  LOC# 110211
BURBAWK, CA
Cux Dasariptiont STR TOWNCAR GKKNOL1%
Veh, Wo.: 5860770
CAR CLASS Cherged: F MILERGE In: 12,618
Rented: I out: 12,5835
Rawoerved: F Driven: &3
RENTAL CHARGES
DAYS 28 56,00 112,00
SUBTOTAL 112.0¢
CONCESSION FEE RECOVERY 12.43
Ch TOURISH EFEE 3,92
VERICLE LYCENSKE FEE ¢.51
CUSTOMER FACILITY CHARGE ic,00
TAE 5,758 12.18
AMOUNT BUE 151.04 08D

THANK YOU FOR BERTING FROM HERTE

ALL CHARGES HAVE BREN BILLRD 20 TOUR ACCOUNT.

AMOUNT BILLED TO ACCOUNT:

151,04 USD

8/23/2010



833 %+ Flouer

4 98/19,°10 B5104
éééé 2 331001

or&-tag ling tit
Ak

r;:

&Eh ’21131 W{ “'gf—‘” w1502
fﬂm@m eu{szlﬁ i 'Tof:;m _— 211,60
% a‘ﬂ!\if’fﬁ}%: a8 o .. ﬁll:jﬁ@
gEie . T
L wgholta;ed:'m . Sub Totg' #11.00
. HE Tk You +e Dat er:a?r-tijsgate
K vy Fysaninas pom f .
! X ,,
I masren
|

\

/,___/—"_' * g
ot ) ' ) Q“’ﬁ.c’ %
- Be @ ¥ 5EY Bdguq
5% gsg o0 B%2
8z g z &
g v 8 nZER 5
b --.:g;::"
2g 583 fgi
%w HEEN 8 g??‘n& ’g
=& g85as 8.0
: e¥32E B3
&g zEs
8= '
i "
?I'H

e



%!dm. Flower

Server 88/2i3/18 ii1:2%
KZDIST Alsmye
mso:lm.. rikina tkt

%\uw\.ﬂ 18 uw -

/2818 3136 -

ThAY p wsi. 511,08
%1i.88
$i1.88
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KANE CORPORATION

October 27, 2010

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
1699 West Adams Boulevard
Los Angales, CA 80018

Attn: Joe Holloway
On-Site Supervisor for the Conservator

For professional services re: Reaf Estate Related Services Asscciated with the
Golden State Mufual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
September 1, 2010 through Septemher 30, 2010

81,75 hours @ $250,00 (Principal - PRI) £20,437.50

34.25 hours @ $149.00 (Sr. Froject Coordinator - SPC) $5,103.25

$25,540.75

Additional charges and out-of-pocket expenses: {breakdown attached). $4,414.84
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: ‘ $29,955.59

Bue [ i bt lny o |
/(MtthW{MLW O\L“l'@ F"?a g Hﬁﬁﬂﬁ“w‘f
1t W 4193 "‘fn ﬂecw"e‘?
g,jwa /u{w!q | B 4t f (4

| v
Jif 67 SELBY LANE, SUITE 100, ATHERTON, CALIFORNIA 94027-3926 (650) 369-9100 FAX (650) 369-9106 f (1,[]

S F0309-0-RW -1/
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October 27, 2010

Golden State Mulual Life Insurance
Company, in Conservation
1999 West Adams Boulsvard
Los Angeles, CA 80018
Attr: Joe Holloway, On-Site Supervisor

Professional Services

9/1/2010 SPC

9/2/2010 PRI

PRI

SPC

91712010 SPG

SPC

9/8/2010 SPC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of communications from client re:
district office closures,

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual-Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited fo telephone conversation with Strode Churchwell
re: purchase of Houston property; discussion with Michelle re: same;
communication fo client; call with clfent.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to extensive call with client re; averview of 1A
pulrchase and next steps.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslghment
including but not fimited to telephone conversation with Strede Churchwsll
and Peter re: status of obtaining financing.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to coordination of travel for Peter's site visits fo alf
GSM REQ properties.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to additlon of Stephen Le, interasted party(ies) lo
contact database; discussion with Peter re: information to send him.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to continued coordination of Peter's travel for
on-site visits to REO properties; telephone conversation with Walter
Brown re; offer on Rocky Mount; review and revision to REQ database,

MISC

Hours

0.25

2.00

1.00

0.50

2.25

0.50

1.25



Qctober 27, 2010

. Page 2

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
Hours

8/0/2010 PRI

SPC

9/10/2010 SPC

PRI

9111/2010 PRI

9/13f2010 PRI

SPC

SPC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assighment 0.75

including but not limited to review of communications from client re;
district office closures and disposition plan; discussion with Michelle re:
same; response to client.

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.50

* Including but not limited to review of communications from client re:

district office closures and disposition plan; discusslon with Peler re:
same, response to clisnt,
MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assigniment
including but not limited to preparation for and telephone conversation
with client re: termination of Insurance on property - request to contact (A
to confirm they are aware; telephone conversation with Valerie Fournler
re: same; telephone conversation with Sophla Patseas re! information
regarding property; call with Peter re: sams; sormmunications from client
re{: same and responses thersto, .
MISC

Work on Golden State Mulual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited ta telephone conversation with Michelie re: her
call with client re: termination of insurance on property; review of
communications from client re: same and responses therelo,

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with Jonah Walston re:
Rocky Mount; review of Letter Of Intent; scheduling of meeting.

1.50

0.50

0.76

ROCKY MOUNT

Work on Geldenh State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to on site at Houston property - meeting with staff
at building; speaking to real estate professionals; touring of property,
visiting adjacent properties and comparables.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.25
including but not fimited to review of communications from J. Walston re;

purchase of Rocky Mount property.

ROCKY MOUNT

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to discussion with Peter re: his touring of the
property, meetings with staff and brokers, making of notes, research re:

8.00

1.75
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October 27, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
' Hours

adjacent property owners and comparabies.
HOUSTON

9/14/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to on site at Houston property - meetings with
real estate professionals; touring of property, discussions with interesled
party{ies).

HOUSTON

PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussions with interesled party{ies); sale
negotiations with Pastor Fraser; discussion with Michelle re: property
history; research and review of comparables; emall to schedule meeting.

CHICAGO

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to emailing of information re: property to Peter;

! research re: same.

: HOUSTON

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Gompany Assighment
including but not limited to discussion with Peter re: property history;
research and review of comparables.

CHICAGO

'9/15/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
: including but not limited to on site at Dallas property - meeting with staff at
building; speaking fo real estate professionals; touring of property; visiting
adjacent properties and comparakles; meeting with brokers; discussion
with adjacent property owner (Estrada Concrete) re: Interest in building.

DALLAS

PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to emails to Kevin Riles, interested party(ies) and
sending of information.

HOUSTON

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Gompany Assignment
including but not timited to review of communications re: final walkthru
and discussion with Peter re; district office closures.

MISC

;
. SPC Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with Peter re; his

touring of the Dallas property; research ve: adjacent properly owners;
preparation of notes with important contacts, addition of information into
database; review of plctures.,

DALLAS

500

2.25

0.50

1,50

8.7%

0.50

0.26

2.00
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Page 4

Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
. ours

9/15/2010 SPC

9M6/2010 PRI

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.25

including but not fimited to addition of iK. Riles,interested parly(ies)
contact Information to database, .
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to on site visit of property, meetings with local real
estate brokers - Greg Trout of Henry S. Miller, Jason Byrne; discussions.

4.00

. with adjacent property owner; taking of pictures; telephone conversation

SPC

9/20/2010 PRI

PRI

SPC

SPG

SPC

SPC

with Michelle re: drafting of communication for Estrada Gonstruction,

interested party(fes).
DALLAS

Waork on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not imited to telephone conversation with Peter re: his visit
to property and drafting of offer to Estrada Construction {expressed
interest in property).

DALLAS

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 8.00
including but not imited to on site touring of property, meetings with focal

real estate brokers (M.Gwyn); taking pictures of property; discusslons with

adiacent properly owners; telephone conversation with Michelle re: same,

WINSTON SALEM

Work on Golden State Mutua! Life Insurance Company A#signment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with interested

party(ies) Sam Stewart; email of information.
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to several telephone conversations with Peter ra;
his site visit to property; Inputting of contact information into datahase,

WINSTON SALEM
Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment 0.25
including but not limited to addition of interested party(ies) Information to

contact sheet,
HOUSTON

0.50

0.50

0.76

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assigniment 0.75
including but not limited to telephone conversation with Peter re: his call
with J. Walston; research re: Arvelle Moore - recommended broker,
ROCKY MOUNT o
1,00

Work on Golden State Mutuat Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to several telephone conversations with Peter re;
his on site touring of property; meetings with local real estate brokers
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QOctober 27, 2010
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, in Conservation
Hours

{M.Gwyn); addition of information into spreadsheet.,
WINSTON SALEM

£/24/2010 PRl Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to on site tour of property; meeting with Jonah
Walston: discussion with local brokers, taking of pictures, telephione
conversation with Michelle; emails to client re purchase offer, felephone
convarsation with Medora re same; review of BPO's,
ROCKY MOUNT

PRI Work on Goiden State Mutual Life surance Company Assignment
including but not limited fo  downloading and sending of pictures to client;
review of listing agreemeant for Mike Gwyn.

WINSTON SALEM

PRI Work on Golden State Mutuatl Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to  coordination of meeting with Pastor Fraser,
interested party.

CHICAGO

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with Peter re! his
meeting with brokers; emailing of information abtained about the properly
from other brokers,

ROCKY MOUNT

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to scheduling of showing of property with Mr. R,
Chen, Interested pariy{les}.
HOUSTON

SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to review of pictures; review of listing agreement
from Mike Gwyn; discussion with Peter re; same.

WINSTON SALEM

8/22/2010 PRl Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignhment
. including but not limited to on site touring of property, taking photos,
meeting with brokers' meeting with Pastor Fraser,
CHICAGO '

PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Compatty Assignment
inciuding but not limited to downloading, organizing and sending of

pictures to client,
ROCKY MOUNT

PRI Work on Golden State.Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to communications from Richard Chen re: touring
of properly; request for more information; telephone conversation with

8.00

0.50

0.25

1.00

0.25

0.75

8.00 °

0.50

1.00
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972212010 SPC

SPC

SPC

9/23/2010 PRI

PRI

SPC

SPC

9/24/2010 PRI

Gerald Womack; call to Sandra Willlams.,
HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to several telephone conversations with Peter re:

his on site vislt of property,
GHICAGO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

including but not fimited to review and organization of pictures of property.

ROCKY MOUNT

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to communications from R.Chen, Interested
party(fes) re: his touring of the properly and his request for additional
information about the property.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Campany Assignment
including but not limited to communication with client re: glass repair,
telephone conversation with Michelle re: same; lelephone conversation
with local broker re; marketing of properly.

DALLAS

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to on site touring of property, taking of pictures,
meetings with staff, discusslons with local realtors; several telephone
conversations with Michelle re: same; preparation of notes emalling of
information to broker, Mark Taliey,

DETROIT

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to review of communications with cllent re: glass
repalrs; telephone conversation witii Peter and response thereto.

DALLAS

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not fimited to telephone conversation with Peter re: his on
site visit of the property, meeting with realtors; preparation of notes,
contact information for addition to REO Summary information Report,

DETROIT

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Comparty Assignment
including but not limited to communication from Richard Chen, interested
party(ies) , response to his questions regarding the property.
HOUSTON _

Hours

0.25

0.25

0.26

0.50

6.00

0.25

1.25

0.50
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8/24f2010 SPC

SPC

9/27/2010 PRI

”

PRI

PRI

PRI

SPC

9/28/2010 PRI

PRI

PRI

‘properties - disposition strategy goi

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to discussion with Peter re: his calls with Carla
Vaugh and sale of properly.

CHICAGO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to organization of pictures.

MisC

‘Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

including but not limited to telephone conversation with Mark Talley re:
listing of property; communications re: same.
DETROIT

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
Including but not limited to telephane conversation with client re: REC
overview; discussion with Michelte and revislon of REQ database.

MISC

Work sh Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to telephone conversatiornr with M.Meyers,

interested party(ies).
HOUSTON

Waork on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with Jonah Walston re:

purchase of the property.
ROCKY MOUNT :

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment

including but not limited o telephone conversation with client and Peter re:

REO overview- knowledge obtained from Peter's sile visits of all
ng forward; revisions of REO database

- gddition of information, etc. ’
MISC

Work on Golden State Mittual Life Instirance Company Assignment
Including but not limited to email to interested party(les) Perry Kyles.

HOUSTON

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to sending of photos of site visit to client.

DALLAS .

Work on Golden State Mutual [ife Insurance Company Assighment
including but not limited to telephorie onversation with client re: REO
disposition report.

MISC

Houts

0.25

0.25

0.60

1.60

0.50

0.60

- 3.00

0.25

0.25

0.25
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9/28/2010 PRI

PRI

PRI

PRI

PRI

PRI

SPC

SPC

SPC

SPC

Work oh Golden State Mulual Life Insurance Company Assigriment
including but not limited to review of draft Purchase and Sales Agreement;
tetephone conversation with Jonah Walston re: same. '

ROCKY MOUNT

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to telephone conversation with K.Lioyd and
scheduling of tour of property; communications to Larry King re: same.

HOUSTON

Work o Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of property listing agreement and
sending to client,

DALLAS

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not imited to calls to broker re: listing agreement,

CHICAGO

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Compaty Assignment
including but not fimited to review of listing agreemant.
BETROIT | :

Work on Golden State Mutual Lifs Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of article re: burming of building on
property across the street from property (Strode Churchwall's); discussion
with cllent re: same,

HOUSTON ,

Work on Golden State Mutual Life insurance Company Assignment
Including but not limited to telephone conversation with client re; REQ
overview and disposition plan; revision to analysis,

MISC

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review of draft Purchase and Sales Agreement,

ROCKY MOUNT '

Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Asslgnment
including but notlimited to review of listing agreament,
DALLAS . .

Work on Golden State Mulual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to review and research of Strode Churchwell's
retail space being bured; discussion with Peter re: same and sending of
link to arlicle, discussion with Peter re: listing of property.

HOUSTON

8

Hours

0.50

0.50

0.25

0.26

0.25

0.50

1.00

0.50

O.2§

0.50
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9/28/2010 SPC  Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurane

Page

e Company Assignment

including but not limited to addition of Jim McElroy, interested party(les),

contact Information on contact sheet,
DALLAS

829/2010 PRI Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insuranc

e Company Assighment

including but hot limited to telephone conversatior: with James McElroy,

interested party(les) re: Daflas property.
DALLAS

9/30/2010 SPC Work on Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company Assignment
including but not limited to preparation of GSM REOQ Disposltion Report
including but not fimited to research for contact information for brokers;
review of listing agreements; discussicns with Peter re: valuations; review
of flles; preparation for and conference call with client re; same and district
office closures, review of documents, organization and flling; severa
telephone conversations with inlerested party{fes) re: properties,

MISC
PRI Work on Goiden State Mutual Life Insuranc

@ Compahy Assignment

including but not limited to calls with interested party(les) and negotiations

re: sale of the REO properties; calis with afl

listing brokers requesting

comparable information and listing agreements; review of documents re:
same; review of disposition report and revistons thereto; strategizing of

disposition of REQ; preparation for and con
discussions with Michelle re: same.
MISC

For profésslonal services rendered

ference cali with client; several

g

Hours

0.25

0.50

7.50

8.00

Amount

116.00

$25,540.75




Michelle Jackson

Southwest Airiines jSouthwastairines@luv.southwest.com]

Fram:
Sent: Saturday, September 04, 2010 8:22 AM

To: Peter Kane

Subject; Ticketless Confirmation - KANE/PETER ¢ - DK7ISH

{|Pddsenger(ay
¢ KANE/PETER C

Fewa:

'5(»‘\ e

5262123063440

" os/04sit

rﬁdf travel involving funds from this Confirmation Number must be compieted by the

explration date.

: ij(:} * ’ {«i‘} LN o el
: J
' [Base Fare $240.93
5: + Excise Taxes $18.07
‘indvertised Fara $259.00 o
B T
. [oin TS
"4 Segment Fee $3.70 £
;+ Passenger Faclity Charge $4.50
1+ Becurlty Fee? $2.50
f{Tots] Paymunt $269.70 P H
. A2
Cumrent payment{s} . . L}
09/04/10 Mastercard ¥ w5 $269,70
Secority Fee ls the government-'rmpa:sed Septembér 11th Security Fee,
I
. L]

#ngﬂ

dSun Sep 12 0695

i

o gt :nfeigfﬁaﬂiﬂw

'u

P ‘; w.nmg Ho.di_-‘--mr' : g '
d}“m'aalg{% l;ﬁ wﬁ ‘}ir% ‘ﬁ% o

Depart OAKLAND CA (OAK) at 3.46 PM

Arrive In HOUSTON HOBBY (HOU} at 9:25 PM
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HHSHOST

HAX EAT
DAKLAND IHTERNATIO§A£ AIRPCRT

. B27T SOKUKLA

uuuuu
nnnnn
R
A vy e
"o
-
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-
-

e

- P

- -
-
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-
-

I SAND CHIX PULLED  g.4g "

ﬁyrre 8.48
OTATD S4
I CKE BTL PRU§§ 20

ror 2,99
Tax 1AL 12.48
ST 13 ; o

BECB@g A FAN OF HHSHOST
0K FACEROOK,

oLAN IN: Gove
ot GVl

HOUSTON HORBY AP

RR M53980194
PETER

¥o1
KANE
VEMICLE! G3695 /1669027
Toiue  Lic: TX BIINIGH

FUELy &8 OUT /8 ™
o) 4} 77854 ~USA

RESS 8610030585 / GV /G
COUPLETED BY: 93185 /THHONZS
RENTED:  HKRUST $TON HoBBY A/P
REHTAL. ag/12 /19 21154
TuR: 09715719 971 30
RETURNED: FousTon HoaY AP

RATE CRASS: €

PLIH
HILES TH: 1343 TR-X HILES
HILES QUTE 1255 MILES ALLOWED
WILES DRIVEN: 58 HILES CHARGED
DAYS 39§ sy,40 7/ DAY § 160.47
SLBTOTAL i ]
cwcessiou $EE RECOVERY ki3 17 92
DECLINED
xs DECLIRED
pAt, PEC otc;zusn
NERGY SURCHA CHARGE g 1,08
VERICLE LICENSE cosT s:covm 4,88
TAY 15.000% ON 184.2 § 7.8 ¥
$ pas il

HET DAE
pamp By W

How WAS YOUR !!PSME}ICE?

WE'D LIKE VOUR FEEQHA E
1y vieit i HERTZSURVEY. SO0

[3) gnter hccess Codel 21607

3) Take Bricf 4 Question Survey E

THANK YOU FOR REHTING FROM



v raw

‘Dlontet

Luby’s
Oallas #13 (221)

214—337‘0444

B i

s Chack # 1650894
a
13:30:52 DB/15/2010

1 Thrae Vegoteble Plate 5,59
1 Mashed Potate
1 Green Beans
1 Squash
1 ¥iite Roli

1 No Orf
1 Fried Chicken Ly Ann 7.69
i gabbasta

1 Corn
1 ¥hite Roll
1 Icad Tea Sweet 2,19
1 Rosst Chicken Lu Ann 7.69

1 Corn
1 Tossad Saiad

1 White Roil
1 Iced Ton Swest 2.19
Travl Subtotal 25,35

- T )

Subtota) 28.85
Sales Yax  2.09

P Ao b o

Please pay this anount
Total 27 .44

RDine In

------------

Power Maals
Honday - Friday
All Oay

$5,99 / §6.99

uuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuu

e

/

3/16/2010 C 850

T e P oo T ota T TNy SRR TP p———
FTOESIEDTECT Lt o =

Coffer o Post
Check: 400784

Server: Dix
Terminal,
g, . PR 13 kg n b d docta bt o
Regu?ar Bheck
.1 Ly Coffee 3,25
1 Cinnanon Roll 2.75
Subtotal 5,00
Tax 0.5
Total .50
Gratuity e e s 2
Total -
Room Number
Print Nams
Signature




TH W M OSSR ee e debmrar s R e s s

DALLAS-FT WORTH AP g
RR 575599102 #01
PETER

KANE

VEHICLE: Q1898 /149359270
IeGHRX  LIC: TX  BM2a769
FUEL: &78 OUT &/8 IN
CoPy 77694 -USAA

RES: FRG1BI0RELE /1836 /
COMPLETED BY: 2114 /TXDFW22

RENTED) DALLAS LOVE FIELD
RENTAL; ¢9/15/1¢ 11:00
RETURNT @9/18/10 15132
RETURNED: DALLAS-FT WORTH AP .

PLAN IN: 13561 RATE CLASS: C
PLAN otrry 18561

HILES IN: 18741 TR-X MILES
HILES QUT: 18558 MILES ALLOWED
HILES DRIVEN: 183 MILES CHARGED

oAYS &3 S1L00 /DAY $ 102,

SUBTOTAL T+ 1e2.08
CONCESSTON FEE RECOVERY b JE YT
Low DECLINED

LIs PECLINED

PAT, PEC DECLINED

ERERGY SURCHARGE i I X
VEHICLE LICENSE COST RECOVERY Y& 3.2
TAX 15,000% ON 118,02 3 17,
HET DUE % s

PAID BY MC

BOW BAS YOUR EXPERYENCEY
WE'D LIKE YOUR FEEDBACK,

1) Call 1-800-278-1595, or
Visit S HERTZSURVEY, COH

2) Enter Access Code: 91602
3) Toke Gricf 4 Question Survey

THANK YOU FOR RENTIMG FROM

HERTZ

LHET  SEE Ry

PEET'S COFFEE
HOBBY AIRPL
HOUSTON, )

#OTQ7 N

I
"1 Hp COFFE DAY 2.2
_ TaX ToTL .19

TOTAL 2.44

. CASH 10.00

R CHA“GE ?156
ftane  CSHR

0137 08:00 SEP 15710 W/SHot P

I ¢ REPRINT 4% REPRINT 34¥
o, e , 57542145503

SHELL
2701 ESTER RD
IRVING s TR
75036

09/16/2010 04:17:35 PY 354784281
s MASTERCARD

“TIOICE 634147
AUTH 054008

PUNPE - 2
REGULAR ‘Gz*‘gég
PRICE/BAL :

FUEL TOTAL $ 6.5

-

Subtotal = ¢ 26.25
Tax = $ ©.00

s4% REPRINT w&k REPRINT &b REPRINT ¥#¥

e

Totalz= § 8.5
§ 2

L3

EEE%EPRIHT £% REPRINT st REPRINY #43
You couldve earned 5% with the Shell

MastarCard! Apply today at
1-888-935-4161,

£k REPRINT %bx REPRINT $4s REPRINT %kt




Date: 9en22'10 08,
Card ;’ype: Hastop cagg 320

g Acct e .
: fars enty ey BOJANGLES
: ASE . ag
. ggnosafey: ;xmwaamzssaa .. Rni?htgglg,ang?ggm
- &1 : 918} 286~
Auth Code: 049515 ' W bojangTesedu. con
. Lheck 3489
Gl Servers 223 i - -
r'.f'::* (‘: ] ' Tota) -~ - 6. 68 ghec}( g{}? '
‘ vpe alo
Tip: «  Swiped 181
Totals Front Ca Counter 8
T Card TypeTrans
Aot i :
§f€§5§?;§;‘-;"""~"*""“"‘“‘“‘“““" Trans ﬁ;stgrcard
ratuity Kot Included 2 Exp KX
acaanan 0, 2Y aboto tota] Netion i
agresient Y card {ssusp .
4 Customer Cony e Sa '] e 8.20
Sign
T AGREE TD PAY TOTAL AMOUNT
ACCORDING TO CARD ISSUER AGKT
(MERCHANT AGHT IF CREDIT VCHR)
Herchant Copy
Themk you! Ceme Back Again Soon!
Betome & Fanll]
facebook ,con/Bojangleskaleighurhan
HHMSHOST

GOOSE ISLAKD
CHICAGD 773.686,6180

{096 Teresa

T T e bt e .y

e i e T

EAT IN
} 88 JMBO VIENNA N 3.99
1 COKE BTL 200z 2,39
SUBTDTAL 5,38
TAX .77

AHOURTY .18
G f XX/XX
7.15




Shastz §356

4519 W Wendover fsn;

Grasnsho rp, X
336v855~8398”t 2

eaded @ $2.549
Volunm: © 2. o83 ot

Gag Total: s e
Total ggsr:‘
0925 I

09/21/2010 1631641

Steak "n Shoke Ho: 2702701

Order: 350516 PTY: 1
Mape: Danika R 971972010 10:35:53 PY

SubYotal 6.37
Tax 0.49
Grotulty 2.50
Total §.3

Hagler Cor Ending:5246  Bnount 9.36
Exp:NIT EXP AuihCode: 087063
Tssued To: KANE/PETER

AFHENERREAARERLCH RN RS RRAERUARRE R A RARL R
$/2 Price Hsppy Hourll!
Shekes and Dricks
Weekdoys 2-4 PH and now 2-4 AH}
2-4 A4 valid at 24 hour jotatlong
EAXERORRNERNI NG R AR AT A RN REERIRR
THANK YOU FOR VISITING
Tell Us About Your Experliente

{-B77-STK-H-GHK (1-877-785-674%)

To contac? thiz store
Cajl (336)218-0807

1

Custoner Copy /

MACKS HARY
7526 HNIORTDALE Bbgg
KNIOHTDALE, He 275
919-266—1509

sognotzuich-91 ..

HACHS mna;léggv 5
i

7526 US %z‘“’ e

~ gHEGHTTR

ﬂﬁSTERCRgg

HE/PETY

gﬁ?ﬂg— po noti 98926
pATE 69721710 15185
punp 4 o7

pRODULT UiLD

e spifURL ¥ fauias
gaLLONS 2 . 12.532
pPRECE/G: v ?.ﬁﬂs‘
FUEL SALE § 48,

ol GOULD HAVE SRUED
up T0 iﬁ‘i éﬁ*} |
By USI >
HARATRON NASTER EAAD

THANK YOU
HAUE B HICE DAY
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CHICAGO OHARE AP

KRR 579285490 #91
PETER
KANE
VERICLE: Gzzasf asmﬁ
M R (S 246492
Fugts &/8 OUT s/s m
cop: 77694 -1
€5t 536114.’.8893 < X
COMPLE 1EW BYS S nwanw %

RETURNED: CHICAGY P
PLAN TH? cRL RATE CLAsS: ¢
P R e
HILES TN 3g35 TR-X HILES Q

11E5 OUT: 3g64 MR ES ALY owel R
uiEs o I T HikES HARGER
DAYS 10 % 69,00 / DAY 4 e
UETOTAL ) G904
Lo pECLINED ooy
LIb mmsn

yit ntct,mr:

crt./\n ¢ /vt s 117
TAX A1 SRS nt [ 3 B
HEY DUE $ =Y

palD WY H

FOW WAS TOUK b P Wt AL
Wt 1 TR YEnIR $HEINTATE.

1) call 1 gy 2R TS, O
yisit W& 'um'susvw Lo

1) Tuhe B el ¢ e § damy Sy

%
7y Enter Avouss Cork? a7rol %

!NAN!Q you FOR RENTIHG RO

ERTZ

DEALER

WA
UgNENsxs)r{hn

"‘ xe oy

e!uth .
g
‘ate 0O/
ﬁgmﬁsﬂﬂ(";ﬁf]ﬁor, EE
Hmp

Gal!oﬁs Regular

Price/Gal " 1.949
Fuel Sale ":g ggg

THanK v
cHoos ;m, s R
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THE HERTZ CORPORATION
Phong: b d F TR
FauXi .
Wk A LT B O
Direct All Inquirias Tor

THE HERTZ CORPORATION

PO ROX 26120

ORLAKOHA CITY, OK 73126-0120

PETER KANE

KANE CORPORALION

5% SELBY LW STE 140
ATHERTON, CA 940273326

RENTAL REFERENCE

Rental Agreement No: 577625566
Raesaxvation ID: £8610563640
Spaciul BilL Infol PLAT

MISCELLANECUS INFORMATION
€C AUTH: 033083 DATE: 2010/0%/22 AHT:

Bireck ALl Inquirdios To:
THE HERTZ GCORPORATION
PO BOM 26120
QRLAHCOMA CITY,
UNITED 3TATES

OK T3128-0120

REFRINT

¥63.00

< PRNT
Rental Agneament No: 577625506
Involce Date: 09/722/2040
Docunent; S70001405930
Rentex;
Ascount No.:
CUP No.: 776894
COP Name: USAD
RENTAL DETAILS
Rate Plan; IH: BTDR QUTY STOR
Ranted Oni D9/18/2010 12:00 LOCE 186811

GREENSBORO, NC
0972272010 06111
GREENSBORO, NC

Ratuxned On! LOC# laegil

tar Desoripiion: /L HALIBY 2Z.40 2877200
veh. No.: 2528527
CAR CLASS Charged: C MILEAGE In: 0
Ronted: F out: 198
Regazvad; € Drivent 11
RENTAL CHARGES
bAYS ig 315.4% 106,07
SURTOTAL 106,47
DISCOUNT 10.30% ~10.68
SUBRTCTAL 45.02
COHCESSTUN FEE RECOVERY i0.80
VEHICLE LICEUGE FEB ¢.68
TAX * 14.50% 15.56
AMOUNT DUE 122.86 U8D

THANK YOU POR RENTING FROM HERTE

ALL CHARGES HAVE BEEN BILLED 7O YOUR AJNCOUNT.

.

10/20/2010 3:40 PM




Hyatt Place Greenshoro
- : Sep 22, 2010
ﬁHYATT PLACE 1619 Stantey Road P 368 am
Greenshoro, NC 27407
Telephone: (336)852-1443  Fax: {336)854-9339
PETER KANE Falio # 138720
' Room Nunther: 302
are Rate: $58.00
Pay Method: BC5246
Atrival Date: Sunday, September 19, 2010 :
Daparture Date: Wednesday, September 22, 2010
Member #: Noue Entered
informatiorn: GET CLUB CODE OR USE GR15985
Deto’ | " Ubopartment , | v - i Referenoa: i - ] veuher  [Roori| Dt T, Credt.
9/19/2010 [Room postings Auto Posted 302 $98.00
T 8118/2010 {State Sates Tax Auto Posted 302 $7.60
9M19/2010 j0ce Tax ~ Stals [Auto Postad 02 $5.68
9/20/2010 |Room postings Auto Posted 02 $98.00
8/20/2010 {State Sales Tax Aulo Posted 302 $7.60
9120/2010 |Occ Tax - Stale [Atrlo Posted 02 $5.80 .
-} 9121/2010 [Laundry guast laundry 82110 302 $21.20
9/21/2010 [Tax-Sales guest faundry T1924410 392 $1.64
8/21/2010 | Gallery Food Food 4377 302 $8.50
82472010 | Tex-Sales Tax A3TT 202 $0.66
W2H2040 [Gallery Food Food PEPPER JACK CHEESE 43177 nz | $0.50
92172010 { Tax-Sales Tax 43177 . < 1)'4 $0.04;
9/2472010 {Gallery Food Food 43177 302 $2.00
9212010 [Tax-Sales Tax 43177 302 $0.16
9121712010 |Room postings Auto Posted 302 $98,00
$/24/2040 1Slale Sales Tax Auto Posted 302 $7.60
972172010 |Qce Tax - Stale Auto Posted . 302 £6.88
Tex Summary
| agree that my tability for all charges Is nol walved,
§ accapt delivery of The Wall Street Journal M-F (Gold Pasaport and VIP reoms only), If gt:é?l—gffg gggg
refused, a refund of $1 Wik b provided. Tex-Sales $2.50
Stgnaluro Balance: $369.14
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Potor Kane Ao pLh Lot FOx
From; . UNITED-CONFIRMATIONGUNITED . COM
Sant; Waednesday, Seplember 08, 2010 11:02 AM
To! Pater iane: PETER.KANE@ME.COM
Subjsct: Your United fiight confirmation - Seplember 22, 2010 - GreensborofHigh Polnt to Chicago
L —— ]
{x g > Print reservation
Contirmation # Ssw1og > iew tinerary
> EasyCheck-in Online
Flight info
Wed, Sop 22, 2010GresnsborofHigh Palnt, NG (GSO)[[Eh!cago. 3. (ORD}
Flight Depart Arriva Cabln Seals
@ GSO 07:18 AM ORD 08:10 AM Economy (U) 03B
alled 7424 Wed, Sep 22, 2010 Wad, Sep 22, 2010

Operated by United Exprasa/golst Alriines

Equipment: Bombardler CRJ-700 | Duration:4h 82m | Non-stop | Fara code: UACKN
Traveled miles:580 | Award miles:690 | No Meat Servies

Check-in information
Ploagé nole that valid, gevemnment-lasued photo Identification must be prasanted at check-,
uestad an Unfimiled Domgstic Upgrade on your behalf,

Because you are a valued Mileage Plus Premler Executlve mamber, we have reg
Please chack back in My reservations 72 hours before your scheduled departure 1o leaen If your upgrade has been conflrmed,

Review
Namie Fratuont flyer Tickat Para(s} Addiﬂonaa!n cﬁﬁ:: subtot:§;§

- 162113223411 350.00USD 8.20USD  368.20 USD

PETER KANE ; :
oacire Flight data complate Review
Pleas review the fare rniles for this inerany,
Fats folal 356,20 USD
Purchase summary
Product Crodit card: Rocaipt Price
S5W196 356.20 USD

Tickat price
Ticket total; 356.20 USD

{tinerary total
Grand total: 356,20 USD

Billing / Delivery information

PETER C KANE
87 SELBY LANE SUITE 100 ATHERTON CA 04027-3928 USA
Book your hotel
Location Dates of slay Hotel Rafing Price
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Peter Kane N
From: UNITEDR-CONFIRMATION@UNITED,COM
Sent; Wednesday, September 08, 2010 11:05 AM
To: Pater Kane;, PETER.KANE@ME.COM
Subject; Your United flight conflrmation - September 22, 2010 - Chicago fo Defroit
o
53] % . > Print reservation
Gonftmation # 870600 >-ievtnera
> EagyCheck-in Online
Flight info
Wad, $op 22, 2616Chtcago, IL {ORD) @Jatrott, Mt (DTW)
Flight Dopart Artive Cabin Sosts
ORD 04:40 PM DTW 07:00 PM Economy (W} 128
led 6811 Wed, Sep 22,2010 Wad, Sep 22, 2010

COpaerated by; United Express/skywest Alriinas

Equibment; Bombardler CRJ-T00 | Duration:Th 20m | Non-stop | Fare code: WATAKN
Traveled milae:235 | Award milles;238 | No Mea) Sewvica

Checkin information

Please note that valid, governmentssued photo identification musl be presented at check-in.
we have requesiad an Unlimited Domestic Upgrade on your behalf,

Bacausa you are a valued Misage Plus Premier Execulive member,
Plaass check back In My reservations 72 hours bafore your schedulad deparfure 16 learn I your upgrade has been confirmed.

Review
Name Froquentfiyer  Ticket Fate(s) A dItIon! (ax0s wbmif};‘;

PETER KANE ek s 0i62113222207 93.00USD 10.70 USD  103.70 USD
E‘3 scure Flight data complete Reviaw

Flease review the [ate rileg for this linerary,

Fare fotal 103,70 USD

Purchase summary
Product Crodit card: , Roceipt Price
#4nstercard xx STOB0C 103,70 USD
Tieket total 103,70 USD

Tickst price

itinerary total:
Grand total: 103.70 USD

Billing / Delivery information

PETER G KANE
67 SELBY LANE SUITE {00 ATHERTON CA 94027-3826 USA

Book your hotel
Locatlon Dates of stay Hotel Rating Price




I ot | N |
[T ] [Room 1443 |
67 SELBY LN (e !
r i 152,10
C;t; ’E 100 JS— fAeiv " 09/22/10 WED ]
A tate E
% rERTON T Thioaraoos ' [Bemrws gop3/10 THU i
: Pont Type
¥ (¢ 50) 369-9100 10 ! — ¥ cCARD |
[Accmmt . ]
D/TE | PESCRIPTION CHARGER/CREDIT] | DATE DESCRIPTION CHARGE/CREDIT]
05722 I[VALET PARKING 15.00 If any dspect of your afay did not exceed oxpectations, please
0422 |DISCOUNT ROOM 162,10 contact Anir Blatiner st QUALITYDTTRU@HYATT.COM (3\1338
oniy2 [*MICH USE TAX 9,13 We appjreciate you using Hyatt Regency Ddarborn,
oy 22 FCONY FACLTY TAX 7.61
05727 FCONV BURBAU TAX 3.04
22 PEXCISETAX 1.52
0023 B -188.40

MASTERCARD

chargeg:

P} ase temit to:

Heatt Regency Deatbom
. ). Box 843566
D.iasTX 75284

Custon

¥ e afcount {C300007092}) will B credifs
* indicates an incligible charge.

Custonter Service Number: 1-888-863-302¢
ler Service Bmail: NA.CUSTOMBRBIERVICE@HYATT.

¥

LCOM

N

8
g,

Tagres ihat my Habiliy fer tils &
evens that the Indivated porson,

St mature

amonaf of these eharges.

afl dx not walved and { agree to be held parsonally lnble e the
company or assoclalon falls fo pay for any gort or the full




It



Lv Detot 3133
| Nazlo- " Ac Dweryss
Michelle Jackson . | Ly MVW 58S

A Oale. §13]

UNITED-CONFIRMATION@UNITED.COM

From:

Sant: Wednesday, September 08, 2010 10:50 AM

To: Peler Kane; PETER. KANE@ME.COM

Subject: : Your United flight confirmation - September 23, 2010 - Detrolt to Oakland

WUNITED |
i United > Print reservation ﬁ' 0. H@
Confirmation # S4LQG4 , yjjqy itinerary )

. > EasyCheck-in Online

Tiugbs orge

Thu, Sep 23, 2010Detroft, ML{DTW)  Oakland, CA (QAK)

Flight Depart Arrive Cahin Seate
#¥United 6687 DTW 03:33 P DEN 04:45 PM Economy (T} 038
& R LTINS S

Operated by: United Expressisikywest Aldinest « -ir7

Equipment: Bombardier CRJ-700 | Duration:3h 12m | Nen-stop | Fara coda: TATCS
: Traveled milaxi 1123 | Award mites: 1,123 ] No Meal Service

DEN 06:36 PM OAK 08:31.PM Economy (T} OTA

e epak oo

#nited 0021

ERERATA G I A

Equipmant: Altbus A320 | Duration;2h 36m | Non-stop | Fare code: TATCS
Traveled milesi957 | Award mlles;857 | No Mest Service

Check-tn Information

Please nole Ihat valid, govarnmentissired photo ientification must be presented af check.in.
Yecause you are a valued Miteage Plus Premier Executive member, we have requested an Unfimited Domestia Upgrads on your behalf,

Please check Back In My reservations 72 hours before your scheduled depariure lo leam If your upgrade has bean confirmed,

T e
LR C R

Name Frequent fiyer  Ticket Fare(s} Addttfnnaalu d“‘;ﬁ: s ubtoti&?)
PETER KANE 0162113221818 149.00USD 2140 USD 17040 USD
1 Swcurs Flight data complele Review
TR o farerulag oy 1y denwy
Fara lofak 170.40 USD
B R S S I DTS TERY
Prodict Cradit card: Recelpt Prica
Ticket price S4LQG4 17040 USD
Ticket total 170.40 USD

tinerary total
Grand total: 170.40 USD

2 * g . & At
E T N e A LT ot
‘:5‘. P R 218 et

PETER C KANE : <
67 SELBY LANE SUITE 100 ATHERTON OA 04027-3028 USA




BEYROIT Mevag 4
RR 579 704226
PETER

KANE

Yehitop e,
0TSy

¥e1

Mireg IN; 7756
Mgy atrry Ha ol
HILES DRrvey, 45

DAys ig g

SUBTorA T
CONCES S 1oy FEE tcoveny T
LW r DECLThED

OECLINED
FEC BECLINED ' .
secd Sy ¢ 8,991, T}

;2 27

FUEL &
EMERGY SURCHARGE
YEHTIC ¢ LiCENse cosr RECOVERY
AX 3.000% o @,15
NET pug
PAID gy He

HoW g YOUR EXCENTENCEy
¥E'D Lyxp Youy FEEDOACY,

L dany L-500.279_154. o
Visiy W HERTZSURVEY ¢y

23 Entep Accass Codas
3) Take Brier 4 Quastioy Survay R 9114
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Last Name First Name Follo Paga
Korte Peler 1 1
Street Roum
67 Sefby Ln 2621

Rata
Ste 100
City State llf Arclval
Atherlon CA 940273928 091510 Wed

) Dapartus
1 O8/16/1Q Thy
Bonts Typa '
Account
[DATE |DESCRIPHON [ AMOQUNT] JDATE TDESCRIFTION | AMOUNT|
09/15 Gues{ Room 188,10
G815 City Oceupancy Tax 8% 16.93
0915 Slate Occupancy Tax 6% 11,29
OHI5 Parking Vatet 19.00
09/18 Parking Soles Tax B.25% 157
015 HMaster Cant «236.89
Tusal 0.00

WE HOPE YOU EHJOYED YOUR STAY WITH US!

VE ARE COMMITTED TO PROVIDING YOU WITH A COMFORTADLE AND

ENIOYABLE STAY. WE WELCOME YOUR FEEOBACK, PLEASE CONTACT USAT

GUALITYDFWRDehHYRTYT.COM.
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[ACCOUNT ACTIVITY (CONTINUED)

Daleof

Transacton Merchant Nama ot Traneaclion Dd




¥ a emd b ty———— ® Y
- o—
- ——
o —— i

fﬂrﬂ

tumtoner CoY
Morntana
festatrant

1454 £ Wy 3T,
tranbury, TX 76043
(@17)573-2500

pata 09/16/19 g, -
card Hugber i
gheck i~ 614343

uaference Hurber 017638
Asount .80

)
s ... 2
7o

fokalt o

L3 I v tguiial

Paradies Birport Shops - DALLAS
DALLAS-E#[ CORIH INTERNAT(OHAL AIRIORI
BALEAS, TEXAS

TOBERLONE 3.50Z BRR  Z1931% w002

<4 99 13
SHBYOIAL - 199
T, 3 4
T TOTAL 85,90
+ {ASH 500
Y CHANGE L
NS ¢ K. JRES

09/1gs3010 My, 47pp S R S T

IFwk Yoo fir e aq 2

The %arndfs . wg
Dnlias-F1, Were « We wured 47 ot
CELERRATING S0 Lelka® 13

Y

"r




Buy ip Insuratica

for sy oo e 396 50

T ey pLEHGRESE T T LT e R AT 2 R RN - ¢
i Hiiber) Cily Datlo & Time Clty Time b G
J s850 [Miami INTeRNTNL]  SUY 195EP ea%ggg?ﬁo 9:36 PM w
$ OPERATED 8Y AMERICAN EAGLE
Amedican Alfllnes Food Faor
Petor Kane FF#: JY0zdgn Economy Purchase

i gt

[T

C i L
SNOMBER
DL N LY

Paymant ifer Master i Yk

© e e
i

You have purchased a NON-REFUNDABLE fare. The lilnarary musl be tancaled bafora the ticketed dapartvrs tine of te firs! inused
coupon or the licket has fio value, 1 the fare allows changes, 2 fee may be assessed for changes and restciions may apply,

Electronie Hokets are NOT TRANSFERABLE. Tickets with
quastions regarding our refund policy, pleass visit X

To change your resarvation, please call 1-800-433-7300 and refer o your record locator,
Chack-In imes vdll vary by depwiture localion. In order fo delerming the ime you nead lo chack-ln at the akperl. please vish

Wiy as. l .

nontesirictive fates & valid for one year from orlging] dale of lssue. ¥you have
e ’

A summary of Tarms and Condiffons of Travel 15 aveflablo by selecting the Conditions of Cardaga button belay,

g”r il 8.8 e T At bbb ot

Lowest Fare

Buarames oy at Adcom

NRID; 48216825465007 14215128000

JEi

AmericanAirlines

S8 e

Wl dinae w2 it vor et

Tris e-mul addreas is non-selumabls and does md acoommndate cerflss,
If yeu have & cusforner servics sum please Sostan AS

Rt




{.as1 N I B
flastins [Pt ! ke s z
F?’?S l [Raom 2922 i
i ELBY LN l fRe 969,10 !
Cfm 100 . {Amval - g9r12/10 SUN l
A} ial
X rERTON VeA Vhiozriozs | : [ o715/10 WED ]
Bosure
! (650) 3699100 | :,\ : [ CCARD :
AXIXX
DATE [ DESCRIPTION CHARGE/CRED]T] [DATE | DESCRIPTION CHARGE/CREDIT]
4912 {TMOBILE WIFL 9,99 09/14 FSTATE OCC TX 6% 16.15
G912 PFINTRNT SALES TX B2 0914 PFCITY OCC TX 7% 18.84
09712 \IDISCOUNT ROOM 26%.18 09/14 PFCNTY OCCTX 2% 5.8
00/12 FSTATE OCCTX 6% 16,15 09/14 **SPORTTAX 2% 5.38
0912 #CITY QCCTX 7% 13.84 09/14 [VALET PARKING 27,08
09712 PCNTY OCCTX 2% 5.38 09/15 [TMOBILE ADJ +19.98
09/t2 [¥*SPORT TAX 2% §.38 09/15 FINTRNT SALES TX -1.65
09/12 [VALET PARKING 27,06 0/1s (8 ExXX/XX -1241.46
09/13 SHULA'S - LUNCH oast | L
0913 [SHULA'S-DINNER . Zgﬁ.sa A [Tl Due T 00
09/13 IDISCOUNT ROOM soe.10 1 i
09713 PSTATE OCC TX 6% o SueRlsTTITISIRICARD 5 67040880015
L 00113 [*)CITY OCC TX 7% S LT - s S
OWI13 **CNTY OCCTX 2% 5,38 - Your apcount (C300007052) will be creditdd for afl cligible
| 09/13 [**SPORT TAX 2% 5.38 charges: * indicates an incligible charge,
- 09113 [VALET PARKING 27.68
[ 09/14 [IMOBILE WIFL 9.593 Contac} us: conyumera(Tairshourh@hyail.cdm or 713.375.4600
' 09/14 FINTRNT SALES TX 82 { aceepl delivery of The Wall Strest Joural M-F ( Gold Passpott,
| 0914 IGUEST LAUNDRY 31,39 and VI rooms only). I refused, a refund ¢f 31 will be provided
0%/14 [SHULA'S - LUNCH 13.50 ’
09/14 {SHULA'S-DINNER 60,61 Billingjinquiries: Call Customer Service at #05.912.4126 or email
04 IDISCOUNT ROOM 265,10

1 ogree that vy lnbility: for phis bitt iv not wetived wicd Fageee o S i porsounte Habie o the

wmdins gf thire chnrges,

event dial the Indicntod geesnn, company oy wsociation fidlx &y pay fhr vy part ur the idl




Michelle Jackson

Fromy Southwest Alriines [Soulhwast}\!rlines@luv.southwest.com]
Sent: Saturday, September 04, 2010 8:26 AM

Tor Peoter Kane

Subject: Tickefless Confirmation - KANE/PETER C - DVBISK

. lﬁj iR I " )

[Pamyeniaresy L o

. * All travel [nvolvin
expiration date,

ed Sep 15 0016

g funds from this Connrmatlon Number must be campieted by tha

Depsrt HOUSTON HOBBY (HOU} at 10500 AM
Arrive In DALLAS LOVE FIELD (DAL) at 10:55 AM

T
89/04/11

5262123063855

b

3

rfﬁ}

s

R R T A .-

-’ :’ o

Base Fare

+ Excise Taxes

134 Segment Fee
+ Passenger Faciilty Charge

+ Security Fee?

jTotal Payment

C’f} AN
Current payment(s)
05/04/10 Mastercand X
Securlty Fee Is the government-lImposed September 1ith Security Fee.
Tl
. - . Ll .

$118.20

$101.40

3$7.680

$109.00

$3.70
$3.00

32,50




EXHIBIT 7



! _
FEER t -
- Invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. " Company 1D Invoice Number  Invoice Date

Ultimale Staffing Services « Ledgent 278321 12543856 10/22/2010

Adams & Martin Group . Brangh; 02V 7?aﬂ Frs‘niigcomlé
. ; mashoels Aitse

Bill To: . Att

Conservation & Liguidation Office Human Resources
Atin; Human Resources -

425 Market Strest

Sufte 2300
San Frangcisco, CA 94105

Weak

Ending Name Wage Type Hours _ Rate Amount

10172010 Nocon, Susan
Regular _~7 1800 67.50 1,215.00

' 996.83005 ,
D S LAE070 Wyndy Wakenmed f

Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by
Golden State Mutualf

i
|
|

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 10/28/2010

AN
Subtotal | 1.215.00
Plus Sales Tax | 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount ' 0.00
if paymant la made before 11712510, please pay 1,215.00
If paymant Is made after 11/12/10, please pay ! 1,287.90
REMIT TO;
Dapt 8761 ,
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0633164 , ~ {0
Thark you for your business! ' ( l ( v
For bliting questions, please call: (714) 939-5089 - ' Page 9 of $

10/28/2010 11:52:22 AM
11/24/2010 11:21:10 AM




2) &

gltimate LemGeENT AEAMS&MER‘@S

SYAFIIMO SEIVICES

To chengs the dellvery
wix ool mathod of your check,
PO, BOX 11067 please cantact your
DRANGE, CA 82858-8167 branch affice.
Lo L
Assignment #
Ermployee [D e
s

Nams Syes I\[U toN

A

Company Name _CONSEPIATION & LIQUIOATION OFt1er

Report to _MOANED MUJAL]

CHECK ONE

C1 This is not my first waek on 8 naw sssignment and ey

[ This i3 my first week op 8 new assignmant or with 8 new
supervisor, My Ambassedor Timeegrd Supplement 13 attached.

Arnbassadar Supplement has baen turnad ln for this asslgnment.

{3 Other

ENTER ACTUAS, HOURS WORKED IMINUS LUNCHITOTHE NEAREST 1/4 HOUR.
PLEASE WHITE LEGIBLY TO AVOID ERRORS N FAOCESSING YOUR PAYCHECK.

ime | Yime
Date | Time | Out n Tims | Heg. | OT T
Vorksd} tn  {luneb}|funchd} Out | Hours § Hoors | Hours
Mon cangis
Rl b

Wed (10,051 i@enilnde |15l 4 4s] b D

T 1o.04 Q% Yt Il fiyg] 0

i hoaelgele= |- oo ffo

Sat

Sun
Week-Ending Total .
eerortn fie IHouwrs  USs 1 =t

{ cartly ol | worlfed ths hours shown on this carg on tho days
indicated and that this card has been cartifiad by & persan that |

baliave 15 an authorfzad represantative of the ;?tomer.

Statfing Associate Sigasture /ﬂ”‘/m'

As the Custamar's sulliorzed representative, | certify that the
stafting sssociate’s hours shown on this time shest are correst and
that the work was parforniad setisfactoridly. | also confirm the
Customer's sgrasment to the terms stated on the revarsa sithe of

Custompr Slgnature

thig form,
/

/&

s

TERMS OF SALE

Hoth Stafting Companias, LR dta Ultirate Staliing Servcas, Ledgent, and
Atfams & Martin Group & haraafter fofnrsed 1o 83 tho “Cotnpany” Extept
28 madfisg sepamiely in witing, thesa tarms goveen Curslomor's complitod
and fulure tempnioty sMplymont sssignments, Customer inchados o
subskdisiius, affifatos. and portnors, Cuslomsy, hwough fte suthedhed
raprasentstve, cartiffes that the staffing assoclats’s hows shawn oo
Hsmer tmo sheet are comect snd that the wotk wax parfoomed
satlehoetorily, Also, Custnmsr shat nodly the Compary immedistoly of tie
eomploton or terminatlon of & stafling sssociaie’s sasiyament,

e Compsay tharges on 8 vooldy basis and Involces a8 payeble vpon
Toceigt. Al bunukts 10 Customer (0.9, gteisntcas, fren odentatin, ele)
are I et only whan wa b roouived payment within 10 days from the
dale showa it the ive'ce, Customsr shall promptly pay tha Company
frogices, lule faw charges of 8% snd finance chaiges of 1.5% per manth
and ol collection fwes, attornay's fees snd court cosis on of unpaid

baltnces,

Cusiomer sprans that it wiinol snizust stafiing assocates wil unstiended
praralses, cash, chacks, keva, orediy catds, merchandiso, confidantd! o¢
wada necrat Talounation, negotiabla ingl or cther vahuabl

withoist the awprass priorwiinsa pormission of the Compaay and then valy
under the Compony's dicegt supaivisfo and cantrol, srd that it wif nod
requast of permit any statiing wssoclate o use any vehitte of mathintng
requidinse of evnershin, in connsction with The parformence of serdies
fof Cusismer, withaid the Gompany's agaeess prlor vaittan pemilislon, All
chiims snd costs sssodatad VAl actn ar omisslons of the Compny's
stalling sssociatos arisihg from monobaervance of this section shal be

Custormer's snsponsblig,

Customar wil hold the Company fathiess from sl clalrs snd costs adsing
undyr occupational safaly of hesith tawy with raspect to the Company's
sialing sssoclales assipotd 10 if, The Company iy not responsili for fidolity
hand calms net raparted to them by Cuslomer in wiiting vithin 30 digsaher

OLCUTIONCS,

Customer aginas ot 1o Wty or fadkestly cause o parmlt any slaffing
assotiais ssigned 10 Customer by the Company to Trangler la another
ariity's payicl, of 1o parfrm services for Custoenar white on tho payrellof
any person or fiem othet than the Company durtag the tesm of the stalfing
pasociale’s assignmant to Gustomer snd for 385 days after such
sssignmant ends, o¢  emplay &y person rofavad to Cuslomer by the
Company, villin & fime pefiod of 365 days subsequent 1o said reforal,
vithout the Company's sxpmss written parmission. if Customer viclstes
this narsgraph, then Customer shall pay 10 the Company 4 Jea i the
arnount of 30% of the stelling associate’s annualizad compansation, plos
#ll eosts of eclisclion ahdior refmbursemant for all ieazonsble aterey's
fias Ivcurred to enfores Its dohis hensunder. *Treaster* Incfudes, bulis net
firndusd to: empioving the persan direcily; puichasing the parton's Services
ay 8 Tempotary, payroliod of Inssed smpliwes of an onganissiion othe than
the Company for subsintlally the sams werk sssigament; oblaleing the
parson's services theounh any independent contracley, agenty, faclity
stafiing of cansulting relationsidy; or arranging, supgusting, andersing,
factiating, or soquiaseing In the parsen’s employment of reciuitrant by
saothar organkzation, whather o not tha person s fater assigned 10

Customiorn

H Customes hires dimsily onto N8 own payroll, o angeges 3¢ on indepandant
contractor, ¥ Sleffing associate ator the stalling sssaciate tas worked #t
Custoroar’s facility for st loast 720 howrs in sy 12month patlod, with no
twagk In service, the Company shall walve sny placemant foe, convertion
fos, or Goidsted damages, provided by Cusiomer has pald to the
ompany oll Tnveiced amounts Tor such staffiag assochta, In the event thal
Customer hires o ergages us 2t Independeat contmtier smy statiiag +
assoctale plior o such 720-hotr fistiod, Customer shall pay lo tha
Company & fes clcytated Bl 1% par thousand of the anrus¥red salary of
the gmploves, us to 30%, fyss any  Gross Mg puid to dste on 1l

assignment,

Yout sccaptanics of rafersls from Tha Company congtitutes you agreemant
viith o {e9 pchaduls,

Gross Many'n lu dafined 8% the 581 Fiato loas the Pay Ante + Powrdd Costa
Ueduesl wnd stete tavas, Worker's Compencation evpenses pa'dl and
miscellansous employss banalil comts) for tha time the stafing assochle
workie st Customar

YER02%8




invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P, Company ID Invalce Number  Involce Date
Uitimate Staffing Services + Ledgent 28321 12648475 10/28/2010
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 02U San Francisco U

Bill To: Attn:

Conservation & Liquidation Office Toni Sanchez

Attn: Toni Sanchez

P.C. Box 26894

Conservation & Liquidation Office
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

e

Wesk .
Ending Namy Wage Typs Hours _Rate Amount
102412010 Dacker, Justin !
' Regulsr — 3800 21.88 787,68
. 10/24/2040  Helmle, Brian .
¥ Reguiar “"“"*5" 35.25 '21.88 ) 774.27
2188 . 187.68

Regular / 38,00

/ 1012412010 Shockley, Jonathan

996.63005
N 11082000 Hyaks Wakemmed

Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by
Golden State Mutual,

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Afan 11/2/2010

>,

’ Subtotal \ 2,346.83
Plus Sales Tax 0.00

Sales Taxable Amount 0.00

If payment is made bofore 11/19/10, please pay 2,348.83

2,487.43

i payment is made after 11/19/10, ploass pay

REMITTO: -

Dept 8781
Los Angelas, CA 90084-8781

FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!

For biling quastions, pleese calk (714) §39.5998

. . Page 1 of 1
- 11/2/2010 11:39:50 AM
- 11/24/2010 11:21:09 AM
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)
ultimate Lem@iu'r m&m

FTURES SHAVIETS

' Ta change the delive
e oas. . mulho&gaf your choo?'
0. BUX 11087 plosss contaet your
CRANGE, CA 928502157 branch offfey,

Assignmant #

Emp:ayae 10 s o
Namea \\.’é""lr-‘ &ec{gpr K

Company Name Lo
Regrort to

- CHECK ONE
{3 This I8 oy 11288 WaoX 01 & AW s3sigmtnant or with & naw
w onﬁw%ﬂmbaeaoﬁor?ﬁnmrd Supplomont is shteched.
Ea Is not my finst week on 8 niny sasignmeint snd oy

ssador Sugplement has Beantumedin fofihis ass%anmen!.

1
EHTER ACTUAL HOURSWORKED RAIHUS LUNCH) YO THE SRAREST 14 HOUR,
WWWUMJ\WWOMN mocm PRYCHECK

Pate | Tior *vaﬂ‘ “l'ﬂm Tino I!w. o:z oy,
¢ iwaras] I jiuddflana)] Dut | Hoe | Hiee | Mo
wton |14 | By s g 195251 G
we |14q | Quitrslnvies| 8
wea |1%p| Bu (Vs (v V] §

8

¥

Thu '%'_! Bea) 4298 L9098
%z Bw| - | - |z
8t a
Sun

Weok-Ending Total 3, g —

Date: /8 #2531 24C (Houry

1 cortify thut I woiked the hours shown on this cerd on the days
indiceted and that this cand hos been ceritfiod by 8 parson thet |

Polavo I3 an authorized rap:usanm%o of the Customan
Au(bamdﬁrsmnlmm,r}

Au the Customar's suthorizod roprosentative, | parify that the
stalfing axsoziate’s hours ashown on (Rl time shest are coroet end
that the work was parfocmod sstisfactacdly. §eiso vonlm the
Customyr'e sgrosment 10 The terms stated on the 1evrse side of

thig form. WW/ .
Customer Slynatury W .

* ACOUNTING DEPY.

®




A,
(™ [
ulg\ngte‘ LE%NT m&ﬂm

-

FUEFRS CErnde
. * Yo thango the delivary
ViR ove ' mothad of your chaok,
ED. BOX 11057 pluase wg?:ot ywr
ORANGE, CA 820568157 bronch offfoe,
Asslgnment # ; .
Empiloysa 1D . |

Name ‘Er_mm_ﬁfi[mjs‘q__.ﬁ’:’
Company Name 2o C; L« ¢Lo
Chievic. Tolwgon .

Report to 2

- CHECK ONE
O This fo ¥ ﬂmtweok on & BEwW assRIAmont or with e new
: My Atnbassador Timesard Supplomont ls sttached.

Oqhiss s nutmvrmvmk Oy & e sasignrent anc my
Ambessador Supnlement hos beentumed In farthls assimem!.

£ Other .
EXTER ACTUN, VOUASWOTKED BAIRUS LUNCITTO THE FAREST 1 ICUA.
PLEASE WRITE N PROCESSING YOUR PYEHECK.

LEGILY TO.AVOID ERADAS

e 1 e .
= 1 Usle } Thoe § Out n Tima § Ao § QX 15 4
* {wekid] o [llumBILusR)! Out § Hows § Hours | Hours

mon 1134 ) Berfoydeizcsa dus] §
b ter il Ay iy
wod Iiod o Il rzane] &
N e R 7 A0

R AT Rl /

Wagmdma Total ot

Datogfg _Z./;QI_LQ Hours

{ cortify that lwhedmahoumehownomhlswdonthedm
nkestod and that this ¢ard has besn cortiffed by a pmon Wt

bollevo s on eutherized represe ﬁve of the
Amhamdor Signeture, ~

As tha Qustomers xm}mﬁx«d reprasanteiive, 1 cerlify that the

sisfting dsvdcinte’s hours shwm on thig timg sheet o comect and
that the worcway pertformed salisfactorly, 1elso confim the

&momr% sptevmont to the tarms sletedomhe rovarse sids of

Customar Blgnature '
- ACGGUNTING DEPT.




D @

glitimate LeoGENT

FEAFAVA RANLCES

" To chenge the delivory
YER S
mathod of your chotk,
RO, BOX 11057 please eoglunt your
CRANGE, CA 928888187 broneh offica.

Assignment # :

Emgk;;eeib . - 3753 . .
Neme Jo vATH Ahj ShocklEY
Company Nama
flsport to

1 Thia ia sy first woek on 8 new assinment of with o now
upsrvisos My AmbsesedarTimesard Supploment la sttathed,
£ This Is trot my frat waok on o new sasignment end oy
Ambsssador Supplement has been‘tumed inforthis sesipnmant

3 Other .

EMTE ACTUAL HOUMS WORKED GAINUS LUNCHI TO THE HEARESY 14 HOUR
PUEASS WRUTE LEGIRLY 10 AVRID EARDRSIN PROCESSRG YOUR PAYCHECK.

Yo | Thme '
oy | o7

Date [ Toca § Ot | W § Vi | g
Worted] In  lLonch)itanty Hours | Hows § rours

3]
mon 19,21 B Jlesieaodey @
o (0GRS R e 2 ot I
wed ko by IH4Sar3pung B
o | 9 hedsliaeaptlih 8
Fjofs 3 VK

8Sun )

Waeok-Ernd Totsl .

Datey IJEE}_{ 2 & 0 Hours 3“0

{ cartiy thet | worked (he hourr shown on this cand on the deys

ndicated and thet this cond has baen cortiffsd i e pw?sa:mi
1

boevo 1s on cuihorized raprea W

Ambassador Qtgnature -.,) L -

As the Customer's suthorited caprasontetie, | canty thatthe
ataffing avsorinte’ hours shivwn on thir time sheot tra corroct and

it the work was petformed sulisfouborly. 1size conflm the
Customer's agreement 1 the tems stated on the ravirss ¢ide of

e Py
Customer Slgnsture !

* ACCOUNTING DEPT,

N R T

[=0LDEN STATE INS +0Lo

36k




inveoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Cormspany 1D involce Number  involce Date
28321 12548345 11/05/2010

Ultimate Siaffing Services * Ledgent
Adams & Marlin Group Branch: 02U San Francisco U

' Attr:

Bl To:
Toni Sanchez .

Conservation & Liquidation Office
Attn; Tonl Sanchez

P.O, Box 26894 .
Conservation & Liquidation Office
San Francisco, CA 94126-0804

Waok
Ending Nameo Wago Type Haurs Rate Amotnt
10/31/2010  Heimls, Brian )
Regular TT——3 38,00 21.88 78768
S 10/3142010 Shocklay, Jonalhan .
. 21.88 787.68

Regular / 38.00

996.63005
N 11782070 Mypals Hlabommed
Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010

to be processed and paid by
‘Golden State Mutual,

vy re - ¥

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/3/2010

S

Sublotal T~ 1,675.36

Plus Sales Tax 0.00

Sales Taxable Amount 0.6

If payment is made befors 11/26/10, please pay - 1,575.38

. I payment s made after 14/26/10, please pay 1,660.88

REMIT TO: |
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 80084-8761 '
FIN #33-0633164 o
17
Thank you for your business! \ \\
For billing questions, please csll: (714) 539-5659 - i fage 1 of 1

11/9/2010 11:09:18 AM

11/24/2010 11:21:08 AM
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- A @
s yltimate LeoceNT Kﬁm
. BTAHERS LTRYICHA oy
- To change tha defivery
VR b0 ’ mathod of your ohe
RO, BOX 11057 : oy oobtast o
ORANGE, CA 826588157 branch offlos.
Ass'rggmant #_ .
T Employee 1D 8 -
Nome ‘_@tf?ﬁu !’;ﬁ-/%l? . N
Compeny Nama '
Report to
CHECK ONE

£3 This Iy iy firat wook on 0 now osalgnmant or Wit s.now
simarvisor, My Ambaseador Thmacand Supplomonit Is stiethed,
£ This I not my fitel woek on & now sasignmant end sy *

or Supplomaent has beentymad In fofthls sseignmant.

T Other . .
N .
TIos mal :
Dats | Tate | Out M fTme | Reg § OF | BT
Warad| B jes{Bumhl] Out § Hetws ] Houm | Heus R
Man ib/gy?& 15 1IR3 4N 3_’: .
mo 1954 7 Wy s eu] & '
wad [0 o fitysinzdesss| o
Th. | AR L MiRadses '8
7 2| 5 (nediemlugsl g
Sat o
Sun ' o
Woek-Ending Total I e Ml
w%mim& Hours

Toertity that | worked the hours shown on thls sard.on the doys
Indlogted and thot this card has boon cortiffod by & poresn thot |

beliove Ia en suthorzed rapresentative %
Awbassador Slgnature c"%’ / .
Az thio Customar’s atthortad reprosgntative, { canily thet e
stutfing sesociate’s hours shovn on this time shaet sre comredt snd

that the wark waz patformsd satisfactorlly, §slso eondinm the
Customer’s egroement 1o the loams stated on the reverse elde ¢f

this form, , g
Customar Signatire W :

* ACCOUNTING DEPT.




3 Ny
G |
ultimate Leo GEnT ADAMS SMARTIN

SEALL LR HIEFIIN

To chungs the dalivery

b mathott of yout chask,
RO, BOX 11057 soants SOATICT YOUT
ORANGE, CA 92866-8187 wranth office.
Assignment # _—
Employes R o g

RSSO N MM-'
Name , i‘ anai L\ﬂ;) Shoc K_]El’i -

S, _//

Cormpany Name
Regort 1o Susqnl A ¢ O A
3 CHECK ONE ]

{ 1'This iz my first woak on & new agsignmeant of with & new
supervisar My Ambassador Fimecard Supplement Is attached.
){ﬂﬂs 15 not my Hest waok on 8 naw essignment s ey
"Ainbassador Supplanent has baan wrned In for this asslgnmient.
TEONNOT oo o s e s s s s mart e T R

TERIGRACTUAL HEAIHSWOTKED ks | ORCRITO YHE REAREST 114 {HOLUR.
PLEASTWRITE EEGIBYY 10 AVUD il a1 PROCHSSIUVOUR PAYCHECK

ety

Tims | Toe

Date } Tims | Qot w | Time | Mep § OF ot
vornd] s fllunchi {lunshit] Out | Hours Houm | Howrs

Man ¢ litshiado & ]

g frysipean 571 8
wed | |8 iRy Sl 1|
Tha a3y 51 3

| Sat

ORI oy ol

sun /
Wasale-Endl Total s

Date: ]"}_élljo Hours 3{; il

1 centily that Fworked the hous shown on thfs card on tho days

indicaed ant that this card hes bean corified by o pomen that 1
batiove Is bn suthorized represe of t 41,

Ambassador Signatute,_

As tha Customers suthorkad agruaentnlivu. 1 cortily H{at
slaffing associate’s hours shogn on s img sheat e Sorect snd
that tha work was petfarmed fistactoilly. 1 afsy contitrn ihe
Customar’s agieement 1o the terms atated on tho roverse side of
this {arm.

Customar Signature |




Invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID Invoice Number  Involce Date
Ultimate Staffing Services + Ledgent 28321 12549357 11/05/2010
Adams & Martin Group / Branch: 02/ San Franclsco U
Batch # 119930

Bill To: Attn: Doc# 78319

Consewation & Liquidation Office . Toni Sanchez

Attry. Tonl Sanchez Regina had obtained Scott Pearce's approval signaturs on this
P.0. Box 26694 invoice copy on 11/23/10 in Golden State Mutual's office and

Consenvation & Liguidation Office  ghg gaig it is okay to pay this Invoice. The invoice copy (with
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894  Seou's approval signature) will be scanned into ImageRight on
11/24/10 when she brings it back to the CLO office.

Week

Ending Name Wage Typa Hours Rate T Amount

21.88 43760 4

/ 10/312010 Dackgr. Justin

Regular ‘ 20.00

/ —
I . .
096.63005.A131 . T LE20N0 Myjndss Madamonse

Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by
Golden State Mutual.

Per Regina on 11/22/2010, the check will be issued by CLO. |
INVOICE MEETS CONTRACT TERM AND CAP - Alan Gandhi - 11/22/2010

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/9/2010

i
Subtotal . 437.60
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment Is made bofore 11/26/10, please pay 437.60
If payment Is mads after 11/26/10, please pay 463,86
REMIT TO:
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!

For billing questions, please call; (714) 939-59489 Page 1 of 1
11/9/2010 11:09:22 AM
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gltimate repoenT M&MQ ]

AN ety

. To changy the dd
whones Toathed ot your choch | 3
RO, BOX 11057 plasse pontant your |
ORANGE, C'A P28388157 bmmh offlca‘ . 4
Asslmmnt ¥ 3
Employes ID : . :
Hame Jushin Decler - -
Company Name _Colden sinte dw%va/
Raport t6 .

D ¥hiaie wukonc Py gasignmant or with p v
$worv$somgm AmbaseadorTimassard Bupploment iz sttachiad,
L7 This b3 not my tiret wask on a newy s34lpnment and iy
Ambasusider Supploment hae hoantumted in for this tnﬂamnnm.

!Z!Othar
emmmm&m%mmmnmm%mm
T | Thw ; *
oty | Tima | <ut M ["Time § Reg § OV 1% 4
Woked| 1o itz |functd] Out §Houre { Howrs | Hovme
: Mon |"As|Bieeiinglinisles]
; e [Pd]Bioo|dvsi it wesl & :
' wed [22|8i00| < |~ Lize| ¢
Tho [4g] -
%
Qat |40 ' _
Wunk-Endlne Total "
I /.a-—-——'““;r— Date: /072571 ¢ IHours 201 <
T cartify that ] worked the kouns shown on this card on the deyy

l ineioetod and Biet B cand hee baun ceriffod by 8 peraos thet |
bhaliave la an suthiorisd represontstive of the Customer,

Andrapsadur Blgnatuee, {

As tha Customars suthodzed reprossntetivg, oty that the
siaffag associats’s homahawn on vl tires shaet #re consot dnd
that the work was pesformed salisftodly. 1680 otnfiva the
Qustomers egrosansnt to the terms sirted on the severse side of

this form, Mohammed Mojabl +
L Customer Blgma : : W
{ "FOCOUNTING DEPT:




Batch # 119896 invoice

o Doc# 78290
8 ¥
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company iD invoice Number  [nvolce Date
Ultimate Staffing Services * Ledgent 278321 12547608 11/05/2010 #
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 02U San Francisco U
Timeshesis Attachod
Bil To: Attn:

Conservation & Liguidation Office Human Resources

Attn: Human Resources
425 Market Street

Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 94106

Week . '
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rate Amount

/ 10/31/2010  Nocon, Susan |
Regular _ / 36.00 67.50 2,430.00

/

996.63005 996.63005.A131

N 71782070 Mgaks; Wodswmed

Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by

Golden State Mutual,
Per Regina on 11/22/2010, the check will be issued by CLO,
INVOICE MEETS CONTRACT TERM AND CAP - Alan Gandhi - 11/22/2010

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/16/2010

——

Subtotal TS 43000
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
if paymant Is made before 11/26/10, please pay - 2,430,00
If payment is made after 11/26/10, please pay 2,575.80
REMIT TO:
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 20084-8761
FIN #33-0833164

Thank you for your business]

For billing questions, please call: (714) 938-5959 Page 1 of 1
11/15/2010 11:31:41 AM
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Yo cisngn the delivery
bt muthod of yous check, ¢
N6, BOX 15057 plares sontact your '
OGRANGE, CA 020504167 branch affice.
* Assignment it : —

Emp!oyas (D
Namoi&_MI?dmﬂ B cﬂ};

Company Name CONSaL 194 8 LG DaTICA

Repon to _HtOMMED MUAB]

CHECK ONE ’
1 1 THs s oy Tirsh wesk on A nowr sssignmont of vith & now
supardsor. My AmbessadarTimeeard Supplemant s sftachad.
T i This Is not oy Tt woak o 8 new sasipament st my
Ambaasudor Suppinntont 1w Baes tarssed In for his sssighmont,

10 QUIEE o e e s s s b i i Bt +

LHTTR ACTIAL BOURSWORKED AINUS lﬂbﬂiﬂﬂ THU REARCSE 14 HOUR,
FERASE WHITE LEREIY Y0 AV EFCIOES I PROCESSHIO YOI PAYCRECK.

Tine § T
Sata { T | Ol In } Time
Widad| s tanchi] Jswehi| OO0

Mon &s i Jedtlaadibgg
A
Wod '%4 § o W) eggyr
vho Mg Roa Wyr iy

Fef 2 or (1P ‘
e ot 1= Vel | .

Sat

ot | oY
Hours | Havre

Fu
—\1’?. ST ES

Bun
a e | Totai ETRAr I
T corth lworkod t?m hotirs shown on thl cird on the days

ndicatad aud that YWY card Jiss bean canilisd by & poreon tisd | . .
hakmen I8 an suihorized repltagumative of

Ambsssador Slgsatura, ey e i i et ik ke e mmen

As the Cuulomers suthefizad reprosaniativy, 1 oantily that the
sisfilng sssoalote’s hiours shown on this Ume shast are cotroct ik
1hat the work was performed votisfactonly. | also conflens tha
%rﬂiamar‘n Egrouaieit 1o tho teems srerad off Iha raverso slde of
this foran,

Customter 8fghaturs | L AMI VT e

il il ket ] L
e LT

|

11/15/2010 11:31:42 AM |




Invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID invoice Number  Involce Date
Ultimate Staffing Services * Ledgent 702613 125650353 1111212010
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 01U Cenlury Clty U
Batch #119897
Bl To: Attn: Doc# 78291

Conservation & Liquidation Office Toni Sanchez

Attn; Tonl Sanchez
PO Box 26894
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Week :
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rate Amount

14/07/2010  Watlls, Niya

Regular 40.00 22,50 900.00
/ / T

996.63005 996.63005.A131

N 82000 Wyl Hlakommed
Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by
Golden State Mutual.

Per Regina on 11/22/2010, the check will be issued by CLO.
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/16/2010

" INVOICE MEETS CONTRACT TERM AND CAP - Alan Gandhi - 11/22/2010

~
Subtotaf S 0000
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment is mads before 12/3/10, please pay 900.00
if payment is made after 12/3/10, please pay 854.00
REMIT TO:
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0833164
Thank you for your business!
For billing questions, please call: {714) 939-5599 Page 1 of 1

1171572010 11:31:43 AM
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ultimate LEDGLNT Avavs&MARTIN

PTG TR L R

oy To change the delivary
¥Heoy mathod of yout check,
PO, BOX 11057 please contsct your
ORANGE, CA 928588157 branch offieo.
Assignment #

Employee 1D " oy .
Name \.\ﬂ\‘ LMJQ‘ TS <

O an =] F/ L‘“O N
o S AN, NOCHN)

+ 1 This Is my First waek on a new assignatent o with a new
supervisar, My Ambaga edorTimecard Supplemant is sitsched,
| Thig Is not my first wask on & new assignment and my
Arbassador Supplement has beon wraed In for this assignment.
[ { Othet ...

CHTER ALTUAL HOLIRS WORRER (MINUS LUNG T THE NEAREST W4 HOUR,
Py TASE WATTE | EGIBLVTOARID EMROBY 1 PACICESSING YOAIR PAYCHECK.

Tine | Tiaw
Time | FHeg. § OT .Y,

Date | Tima
Haurs § Hours | Hours

Cut a
Worked iy |ilunchl p{Lunch)

won 1] Bog (144 \ 22044 8
Too_If 00 |14, 1280 £
wed /200 |8 12845 ©
o Bl P S €
m {15 Sog |hd) et 45 &

Sat

Slth /
Waslc-Eneit Total
ek P, IO w1l T

I cartily that 1 worked th

As the Custamor's suthorized repfeseniative, | ¢ertily that the

staffing assuciste’s hours shown o ; time sheet are gorragt and
1hat the work was parformacd satisfastonly. 1 g¥so confinn the

Cusiomar's pgreement to the lerms Steted o the reverss side of
thiz lorm, UJ

Custamer Slgnature /"” \/'

P .,.¢ Teksap gy Tt b
A TING T




Invoice

Company ID invoice Number  Invoica Date
28321 12550297 14/12/2010
Branch: 02U San Francisco U

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P.
Ultimate Staffing Services « Ledgent

Adams & Martin Group
BACH # 119898
BHI To: © o Attm Doc# 78292
Conservation & Liguidation Offica Toni Sanchez
A{tn: Toni Sanchez
£.0. Box 26894
Conservation & Liquidation Office
San Francisco, CA 941286-08%4
Woeek
N Ending Name Wage Type Hours ~ Rate Amount
\l 14/07/2010  Halmla, Brian /
: Regular -3 40.00 21.88 876.20
21.88 a75.20 £

/1 1/07/2010  Shockley, Jonathan

Regular / 40,00

966.63005 996.63005.A131

N fL 782070 Mlagpady Wakammed
Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by
Golden State Mutual.

Per Regina onh 11/22/2010, the check will be issued by CLO.
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/16/2010 '

INVOICE MEETS CONTRACT TERM AND CAP - Alan Gandhi - 11/22/2010

Subtotal T 1,750.40
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
- Sales Taxable Amount ' 0.00
If payment Is made before 12/3/10, please pay - 1,750.40
If payment Is madoe after 12/3/10, please pay 1,855.42
REMIT TO:
Dept 8781
Los Angeles, CA 80084-8761
FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!

For biling questions, piease call: (714) 839-5999 Page 1 of 4
11715/2010 11: 31 44 AM
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ultimate e aenT ADAMSE f;&“ﬁ?ﬂm

A0 SEACNY

To chianga the dolivery
VEN (e method of your chack,
RO, BOX 11057 please contact your
ORANGE, CA 928668157 bronch olftce,
Assignment #

Employee i
Nama ___
Company Name
Report to

1 This i3 my first waek on a new assignnient or with 8 new
suparvisor. My Ambassedor Timecard Supplement I3 attached,
£ Thiz Is not my st weak on a new sssignmant and my
Arvbassador Supplemtent has boan tumed in for this assigament,
1 Other

EHTER ACTUA, HOURS WORKED (NS LUNGHITOTHE NEAREST 17t HOUR,
PLEASS WRITE LEGIRLY TQ AVGID r:nnoas i PﬂOCESSNG YOUR PAYCHECK.

- Date Yime Qut'} In Yirme ﬂm. Of or
Warked thunsh) !l,un.eﬁ] Out | Hours léau:e Hoyrs

Mon ft /) S?mfﬂb%m? g
me_1f1/28dlind i g ;@%Z
wod \1/B2) Gonl\ [49 T apsd A8
e /4 Groal) 4l ﬂ&fs’
Fr 1!/( &wil%ﬁf% %

Sat

Waek- Total -

Date; ﬁ_z‘ }Z’ﬂ Hours 40 ]
{ corlify that { workad the hours shown on tiis card on the days
Indleated and st this card has been certifled by & persan that |

belleve is an authorizad reprosoptagve of the Cuslomer,
Ambassador Signature . < ‘

As \he Custener's authorizad represontative,  certify that tha
staffing assosinta’s hours shown on this time sheet are corract and
that tha work was performad satisfactodly. | also confim: the

Customor's egreement 1o the terms stetad on tha reverse side of
this form, ij '
Custamasy Slgnature

AC&OUNTFNG DEPT. - j

A Y

Sun ] /




A &
ultimate LepGENT &m&ﬁm

AEAFTLRY STviclE

et o v

Te change the dallvary
VIR est method of your chack,
BO. BOX N0ET pleuse contast your
CRANGE, CA 92866-8167 branch offlce.

Asslgnment #
Employes ID -
Neme onN A"’TJ'}A” SHo GKJ;C)' '
Company Nams Q L. &
Repoft © Sy SA“I\/ N oc of\/

(O U A R

b e ———

£1This s my Firat woek on 2 new agsignment of with 3 new

supervisor. My Ambassador Timaca rd Sugplemaent is sitached.

.- is is niot my fitst waek o 8 new assignment and my
Ambassador Supplement bas baen turned Jn for this s3slgnment.

3 Other

ENTER ACTUAL HOURS WORKED (MINUS LUNCIHTO THE NEAREST 1/4 HOUR,
ALEASE WRITE L EGIBLY TO AVMO ERRORS 1N PROCESSNG YOUR PAWHECK,

Yime | Tims
o § Tima | Oul In Thne | Rep, § O [:h [
Worked} 1o {{tunshi}f{Lunck)] Ont Hours | Hours | Hours '

wor 3 WyipeHd €1 | 1
we 151 X [uygiadpys) ¥
wed 5] ug g@hds €
Thu M 3 . g
m ST g s g

Sat ‘
Sun

et p s . —ar

Waeek-Endin Total ct
/.Bata: W] &f 10 Hours Hal
1 certity that | veorked ths houts shown on Y is 38 prriys

indicatad and that this card hag jroan ceriifipd/y A

As tha Customer's authorizfd reprasgntative, | certify U
ataffing assotlale’s hotrs givwn on this time shest 56 £4
that the viork was parformad satistactarily. 1 eiso coltfim the
Customer's sgreement 1o tha 1erms statad oryine reverse sids of
this form.

p  Customer Signeture ¢
ACLOUNTING DEPT,

[ L

[




invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID . Invoice Number  Invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Services » Ledgent 278321 12549552 141122010
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 02U San Francisco U
) Timpsheets Attachad
Batch # 119928
Bil To: Attn: ‘Doc# 78318

Conservation & Liquidation-Office Human Resources

Afttn: Human Resources
425 Market Street

Suyite 2300 '

San Francisco, CA 94106

Woaek

Ending Name Wage Type Hours ' Rate Aaount

14/07/2010 Nocon, Susan

/ Regular / 40,00 67.50 2,700.00

996.63005 996.63005.A131

N JL L0070 gl Wahammed ,

Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010

to be processed and paid by

Golden State Mutual,

Per Rigina on 11/22/2010, the check will be issued by CLO
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/16/2010

INVOICE MEETS CONTRACT TERM AND CAP - Alan Gandhi - 11/22/2010

. \\\
Subtota) 2,700.00
Plus Sales Tax .00
Sales Taxable Amount .00
If payment Is made hefore 12/3/10, please pay 2,700,00
if payment Is made after 12/3/190, please pay 2,862.00
REMIT TO!
Dapt 8761
Los Angeles, CA 80084-8761
FIN #33-0633164 -

Thank you for your businessl!

For billing questions, please calk (714} 938-5999 , Page 1 of
1111672010 3:26:53 PM




@ G
ultimate Lep G et ADATES{MARTIY

SOATTENG SRV ICES

To change the delivery
VeR pabe mathed of your chogly,
PO, BOX 11057 pleasa contact your
ORANGE, CA 928588187 branch vffice,
Assignment #

Employes ID "

Name SX L, !Q/g'}! NoLoN
Company Name CLn

Report (o

CHECK ONE
£ This Is my first wask on o new sssignmant or with a now
suparvisor, My Arbassador Timacard Supplement is attached,
7 This s nok my fiest woek o 8 now assignment and my
Ambassator Supplemont hes beer furmed in for this assignment,
{73 Cthar

ERTER ACTUAL HOURS WORKED (MINUS CUMCH TOMIE UEAREST 14 HOUR,
PLEASE WIHTE LEGIBLY YO AVOID ERRONS 1H PROCESSIIG YOUR PNCHECK,

} Date § Time ?)2:‘: “;1"’ Tinie § Rep. 'OT BT
Workedf 10 [{Lunch funen)] Out § Hours | Houes ﬂougp
won 1/, Wrin [Thurii2adthun 9
we [V [&n el sabyc] &
Wed “}/3: oo (gl pdbyd &
a1 Won bRyt &
i UC I g1 Y §
Sat
Sun .
Woakphdog )y [lel 150 ] <]

H eem’fy-irwt t woﬂfod the hotrs shown on this card on the days
indloated and Ihat tis card has been certified by 8 person that 1

believe §a on authorized rapresenigiive of the Cuztemer,
Ambassador Signature /

As the Customer's suthorizod Tepresentative, | cerify that tho
staffing associate’s hours shown on this time shaet are corract and
that the work was perdonned satisfactorityf 1 algo confitm the

Custornar's agraemont to the terms stated on tho reverse side of
{hls form.

Customer Slgnature
ACéOUNTlNG DEPT,




Batch # 119892 .
Doc# 78286 invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID invoice Number invoice Date
278321 12545729 10/29/2010

Ultimate Staffing Services « Ledgent
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 02U San Frencisco U
_ ' Timuasheels Attached

Bill To: Aﬁn:

Conservation & Liguidation Office Human Resources
Attn: Human Resources

425 Market Street

Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 94105

Week

Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rata - Amount
10/2472010 Nocon, Susan
T / - Regutar —> 36,00 6750 5 243000

996.63005 986.63005.A131
N g 800 Myl Wakommed |
Send to Jennifer Murphy on 11/22/2010
to be processed and paid by
Golden State Mutual.

Per Regina on 11/22/2010, the check will be issued by CLO,
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/16/2010

INVOICE MEETS CONTRACT TERM AND CAR - Alan Gandhi - 11/22/2010

~

Subtotal \ 2,430.00

Plus Sales Tax 0.00

Sales Taxable Amount 0.00

if payment is made before 11/19/10, please pay 2,430,00

If payment Is made after 11/19/10, please pay 2,575.80
REMIT TC:
Dept 8761

Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0833164

Thank you for your business!

For billing guestions, piease call: (714) 839-5958 Page 1 of 4
11/16/2010 3:26:55 PM




A |
ultimate Lec%iw-r am&mm

. ' To changs the daliv
VER 08 : mothod ef your dm?k‘j
RO. BOX 11067 plesss ganlect your
‘ORANGE, CA 920858-8157 brench offion.

FEASHND KTAVICEE

Assignment #

Employae 1D . N
Nams  SUSAM Moo T - .
ARG tion £ H QA rion

Compeny Nome
Raport to M“OH'AMMW M M%f .

£ This Is sy firat wank on & new assignment or whth 2 now
supsrvison My AmbasesdorTimecard Supploment Is eltechod,
1 TS is not ty flrst woek on & new sssignment and my
Ambassador Supplsment has bean'tumed in fos this assignment,

3 Qther

EHTEN ACTUAL HOURS WORKED OWINUS LURCHT 10 THE NEARESY 144 HOUR.
PLEASE WIRITE LEGIOY TOAYOI ERADRS IN PROCESSNG YOUT RRTRECE,

e | Toma -
vasize] I L el Dot | Houes | e | sious
mon 107 1w tilidrpiscitb o] &
mo 100 [ WYL olthe] 8
wod 4010 0 [hygrfiayolthugs] §
vhu 10, 1 @orlilashia 3 4yl &
mo[iggslpe] ] — haw] 4
8at '
Sun
B T3 ol 1361 | -

1 sertity that I worked tho Hours shown on this card on the days
Indicated and thet thie cerd has basn cerfiflod by & porson thet |

Baliova ls vn suthorized Fepresentative of the Customer,
L]
Amhsgsador Signatire,

Az the Customer's autboﬁzé representotive, t cartify thet the
staifing assodite’s hours shoven on thiy ima sheet s7e comoct and
1hat tho work was perforeed satisfeclonty. talso conflim the
Customarty agceemant to the tarms stoted on the revarss slde of

e AW‘(/T‘/
Customar Slghature v '

- AGCOUNTING DEPY.

%)




Batch # 120021 -
Doc# 78355 invoice
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P, Company 1D involce Number  Invoice Date

Ulimate Staffing Services + Ledgent
Adams & Martin Group

702913 /f 12562253

11/19/2010

Branch: 01U Century City U

gill To: Attn:
Conservation & Liquidation Office <— Toni Sanchez

Attn: Tonl Sanchez
PO Box 26894
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Weok
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rate Amonnt
11114/2010  Watts, Niya Recul . ,
egular / 40.00 2.50 $00.00
N 1282070 Wyfads Makemmed
986.63005.A131
A Dosses, Soatt 777282070
woice Meets Contract Term and Cup, <Sharon Liang>1211/2010
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/23/2010
Subtotal 900,00
Plus Sales Tax .00
Sales Taxable Amount X 0.00
If payment is made before 12/10/10, please pay 0 900.00
If payment Is made aftor 12/10/10, please pay 854,00
REMIT TO;
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0833184
Thank you for your business!
For billing questions, please calk: (714) 938-5299 Page 1 of 1
11/22/2010 2:50:51 PM




TERMS OF SALE
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uriget t{muml # A it L ¥
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Roth Staffing Companies, L.P.
Ultimate Staffing Services + Ledgent
Adams & Martin Group

Batch # 120022
Doc# 78356 Invoice
Company 1D Invoice Number Invoice Date
28321 12552189 _» 11/19/2010

Branch: 02U San Franclseo U

/

Attn: /

8l To:
Conservation & Liguidation Office <~ Toni Sanchez
Attn: Toni Sanchez '
P.0, Box 26894
Canservation & Liguidation Office
San Francisco, CA 94126-0804 -
Waoek -
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rate Amount
4971472010 Helmle, Brian
Regular ~% 40.00 21.88 875.20
~3 44/4412010 Shockley, Jonathan .
Regular e 40,00 21.88 875,20
N fL 82070 Waieds Wlaklammed
896.63005.A131
A Boree, Seatr 77282070
voice Mosts Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang>12/1/2010
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/23/2010 i
Subtotal 1,760.40
Pius Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount Q.00
If payment is made before 12/10/10, please pay 1,750,40
If payment Is made after 12/10/190, please pay 1,866.42
REMITTO:
Dept 8761
Los Angefes, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0833164
Thank you for your business!
For billing questions, please calk: (714} 939-5998 Page 1 of 1
114222010 2:50:52 PM




QA @
‘ultimate LepGeNT Z&%&MM

STATIIHG SLAVICLE

. Yo change the delivary
hdibaind - method of your chagk,
£O, BOX 11087 pleass contact yous
ORANGE, CA $2866-8167 branch offive,
Asslgnment #

Employee |

Mame i 16 }-k!;.uf o =

I3 ¥
Company Narme (:L@
Repart to

CHECK ONE
U This iz my Tiest waak on a new asslanment of with a naw
superviser. My AmbassadorTimecsrd Supplemant is attached,
) This is not my {irst week on & new sssignment and my
Ambassador Supplemant has been turmed in for this assfgnment.
& Othar ’
ENTER ACTUAL HOURS WORKED IMINUS LUNCHS TO THE NEAREST 174 HOUR,
PLEASEWRITE LEGIBLY TO AVID EARORS (N PAOCESSING YOUR PAYCHECK.

Ytme § Yima
Date | Time { Out fr | Teog I Hea, [ OF | DX
Worked| I [(kuneh}|{luneh}[ Out | Hours | Hewrs | Hours

Mon WAZ| 8l jpislizdoi4:45] o
e |IJg Srad 11498050 okl
Wes | IVieiS o0 1145} 930 | egs -
™ i) |Feids] 20l §
Rl | BP0l S|

ORI

Sat

Bun

Weesk-Ending Total

Date; /7 7/ ¢% (2 iHows 40 s

i cortify that | worked the hotwrs shown on this card on the doys
Indicated snd that {hiy card has been certified by 8 parson thet

balfeve 13 on suthorizad representative wn/ .
Ambassador Signature AKA '

L o H
As the Castomer's suthorizod reprasantative, | cartify That the .
stelfing associste’s hours shown on this ime sheet sre comact and
that the work was performad selisfactortly, 1 aise conlirm the

Customar's agreement to the terms staled on ths reverse side of
s form, .

Customer Signalure '
ACCOUNTING DEPY, :




Q@
yltimate LemGenNT A’EAM‘?&M&RT{};{

1A HEY IHLES

Ta chonge tho doih
A mothod of ycalr ?:h:g:
£O. BOK 11067 please contact your
OHANGE, Ch 920668157 branch offica.
” S e
Assignment #
Ernplovee (D
name _ slad & THAM S (r\Oc,k.!é}{
Company Name L 0
Reportto UG AN pAaCcOM

CHECK ONE
* s Is v firat weok on ¢ now essignment or with 3 new
suporvisor, My AmbasssdarTimecsrd Supplement Is sttached,
i is a0t my first waek on & new assignment and my
Ambassader Supplement has bess turned in for this sssignment.
o Cnbar

FEITER ACTUAL FOURS WORKED MINUS LUNCH) TO THE NEAREST 4 HOUR,
W FASE W E LEGIBLY TO AVOID ERRORS N PROCESSIHG YOUR PAYCHECK.

Dyte | Thne rg-; 1?:’ Tima § P ox rh A
Worsd] n  [{amditifunch}] Out | Moter | Hours Hours
mon 11710 IR ldns) ¥
e [ X petd] 1ol yus €
wed [T S oo w4 3
AN L K
f i | % V¥l
Sat
Sun
T i 40 <]

1 certify that 1 worked the hours shown on this card on the days
wdlicatad and that this card has bper gariified by a parson that |

beliove iy an authorkad represa
Stalfing Asaptiate Signature

A3 the Custornors suthorhzsd reprasontative, | cordiiy that the
staffiag sssoclate’s houes show] on this time sheat are corest and
that the veork was peformed savsfactorlly. | also confitm tho
Custonrer's sgreement ta the terms steted of the reverse side of

thns foren.

Customer Signatura

TERMS OF SALE

% Soth Selfing Conyantss, 1,1 dba Ul Siatfing Sardons, Ledgeat, wd
Mg & Marsn Group Tn hesesfter sotirent to ax die "Company’ Extept
s i wepieately [ Wit Binne i davens Customar's ofrplted
i fitore tnporsry emplugment 85 s, Qo fcsadyy ak
wbsifiefes, afutes, and pariners, Customer, through Be suthoritad
{epratentalive, tellifrss that the xealfing assouain’s boues shuwn ort
hinhar Yme Swet ey cowstt aad thay the ik wax patoriead
satishuctorfly, fvo, Curstorner st notfy thy Curnpuny fnrmudetely of tw
watiplition or termimion 47 & STaMTU 2SS ALYS REEEHINeHT,

2. Tha Company chasien on ¥ weekly lasis mad treoces st purpdin vpon
eotpl, All beassfits 1o Custiaane fng., ginenteny, tray orfentation, stet
ate b nlfoct onfyvdinh W B ceosnad payenent vithin 1 days fuen the
fita hown on thr keokos, Custntaet shall prompdy pey e Cornpasey
Smvkeds, Qe Taw theeges of 8% and Meancae duges of LES pif moait
wid Al coltucton fnas, stoimey's Faes adl colof Gusts on al pwpaid
talancud,

M Contoner pgrnes St {tvAl ot shinst siatfing Rssodaies varl Uit ended
peoenlsss, cashy, chiscky, Yoy, credy conds, mahanite, confalentdl of
Iy gocrut Wfoindion, oesguisble in prits, of other vakusid
wiihout the vapress piod unfiten parrissin of i Conpany and thih unlv
untler the Colhiperr's recy supervision and cuntrol, andd gt it will 1unt
roquo o parlt aty viaftinyg sssodale U Ga8 a0y vefilcl of adpnmy,
rgediss of wwaarship, In cotibaction vArlk th poifumanc of st
Yar Custor, withaut the Companys septays prion waitten porixsen, Al
s sl ausks ansocintes? with sets ot ok of te Compay's
seafeat caimy arfsing from muwchyurance of This saction a1 ba

Custeenes's rasponitaity,

4 O v hoid the Cotrpaty froet of claims asnd costs wling
ler ocoupadoral safrty of htahth Leas vith taspect vo e Canpaiy's
stalfig s3sucdalas sxzigned tos, Thi Cornpitn Is it fesniaitia for fietry
totud iaims ot reported 10 them by fan nes in vaiting Wikin 30 days alter
QUIANTENDS,

5. Cusiomer dgreds hot 1o ditactiy o dadiectly tause of parmit any shing
data asslpgnait ta G i Uy the Gowpany 1 tanster t shodkar
abty's paytul, Ut ta petfurm sonvcor for Cutoinur white o o payroll uf
My o Fierm other than the Cormpsarry kg she terra ol the stalfing
aksocaty’s sasigainent to Customar pad for 265 days aftar s
sxslgnmont etds, o7 el any pavsin fafurred t Customer by tha
ot iy, vAthin & tipe peviod of 358 degn subiseuunt 16 wd rulend,
without the c‘unram exprusy wiiun parmission, I Custoing violats
thix pareprnpls, than Custoerer shatl pay le Uiy Comngary = fae In da
ammount of 40% of the statfing atsnddate’s stariatind o, ey
ol wusts of coletion sior rokmk ¢t fur xd [T
tess wiamisd toonforcs g dghts Hetastdon, “Tanste’ ndiudes, but s o
Feriied toe eimplowdag th parson diuctly, pechasiing By Parseerd gm vites
3 3 temparury; pryrrted of lgazedt semployam of s rgatdtedion whor tan
e Cornparty lar substerdalfy tho sstew sk assiginens) abtamyiy e
parpon's servicos tiough ahy IsdUaElunt LUATICIOL RgAncy facitey
slatfig or conmiiy ewiationsiipl of st sopgasting, endused),
facdasng, o Acqrnseng in the peasirTy ompliptnght ol reativient ey
weher ceguonator, Whsthit oF pox e puisn v e asaipred b
Lusrormm,

¥ Cystoenm s Sy cnto e ovm gy, of pipged at an ndepusitant
ottt 3 sl mesockt st thu staffing dsmtity has viotked &
Custotnte's sty for at daxss T2 tars b any Tmutah ponod, with oo
i i Rarvic, th Congany shall warvw Jiry placeniient ty, comavsion
{nh, o Tauideced deinages, provided dat Dustomet bas i ta e
Coengany o baaiced atvonte he soch Stalling sssudate, b th mnt St
existncrr Mrey of oimages nx an Yxlupendent contracied wy IRy
swsodiate pike o swch TGk pedod, Custorins dad pey to the
Compatty 8 {anealeatetnd ot 1% par theusstl of dut annualized s¥ay ol
e g, u t 3O%, lsa aey Gemos Fargin® pak to dato on that
suskyanont,

1. o

7
)

“faw accuphutice 6T rekersts fron Tl Tomjoiy bofistiteh vies sgfenihent
valh our fre suhredole,

v iross Mgl s dafiaed &3 the 113 Rate kst dre Pay Fato + Fapod Costs
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iy, CALIFORNIA INSURANCE COMMISSIONER

X8, Congervalion & Liquidation Offico ADDRESS# a8se
5 ga?! ;::;g?qca%m,a 841260804 VENDOR COPY Check No. 00966551
o Tal: 415.676.5000 | Fax: 415.678.5002 Stub + of 1 Dafe  12/6/2010
Irvoice Date] Involce Number Dascription Vouchier # Amount Pald
§1£19/2010 | 125663187 5, NOGON EXP, 10/13-14 PY78354 1,091.94
| 11/19/2010 12552253 N, WATTS WIE 11/t4/10 PVTB3GS 900.00
1441972010 | 12552189 BHELMLE 3 J.SHOCKLEY PV78356 1,750.40 |
vendor: Ultimate Staffing Services Check Total 2,742.34

3 Awfosm(&msu}zmc:&aomzssmuaa A w . -
= R0 Co tfory & Liguidation Cffite : " -
Pgigl:fz;gm q o o s Bﬁgc Mcgunls F}’?va?fﬂ " Ghatk No
o San P Hfomia 044260804 ! nion Baok of Califorla, oy '
o A Aog Gafifornis Straal. Dsale

- Tof: 416.670.5000 | Fax: 415.676

" ree Ultimate Stafing Sorvices
. ORDER Dapt 8761
OF Lag Angales GA 80084-8761

POOORESS bis 124 230004978

: . Safi Francfscamamr; L0

00@66551 :;:,1,9, -
“{9i6l2010" "

NOT VAULAFTER 1) DAYE

3"*“3,742.34

Tty AMOUNT OVER $10,000.00 REGUIHES TWO SKRRTURES




Batch # 120020 .
Doc# 78354 invoice
Roth Stéffing Companies, L.P, Company ID Involce Number . Invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Services » Ledgent 278321 12553187 11/19/2010
Adams & Martin Group +  Branch; 02U San Francisco U
Timashaots Attached
BHI To: Attt

Conservation & Liquidation Office Human Resources

Attn: Human Resources
425 Market Street

Suite 2300 -
San Francisco, CA 84105

Woek
Ending Name Viage Type Hours Rate Amount
- L
111472010 Nocon, Susan
_zr Expanses 1.00  1,091.94 1,091.94
996.65018.A131 /

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/1/2010

Please see back up for more detail signatures and contract check.

Subtotal

Plus Sales Tax

Sales Taxable Amount

If payment is made bofore 12/10/40, please pay
it payment is made after 12/10/10, please pay

REMIT TO:

Dept 8761

Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
_FIN #33-0833164

Thank you for your businoessl

109184
0.00

0,00

1,091,94
1,157.48

For billing questions, please call: {714) 938-5899

Page 4 of 1
11/30/2010 2:33:38 PM
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L Travel and Business Expense Report .~

Erployes: Susa Hosos Parlod Coverad: Neverber £ dru Noveather 14,3010 ACCT-04 &
TeeaB Ane A58 FIORE AT FMLEAT
Dopartment; Fatate Cherged: 998‘63005 fom Trave! Authorinsilon Hequast forn
DATE PLACRIOGCASION | GEOUND TRANSPORTATIO!N HOTEL | MEALS | PHONE |ncoTLe] ToTaLs
MEpi3e 81 Fores 1Ganl ToxdAlma | CerRontol | Prsiteg
N (21 ) [] i 3 [] k) 3 1
1A Prom Ctayoa Couetry I Lot Asgeler 1201 3814 . Si5.07
14 Fiom Lov Asgelet th Cingia Contry 19.07 e $19.87
35 10 Caryoa Ooilry o Los Angelss 15,07 181 319,07
s Froos Los Angeles ty Ompots Covsntry 1967 FEazs . $19.07
11050 LErom Canyoq Cotery ta Eos Aageics .01 304 $19.07
e iFrom Low Axgelet in Canyos Comniry 1947 His . sl
13003 {From Ceayon Country o Las Angries 19.07 J&I4 5 $19.07
1341 [From Los Angeled to Canyoe Conbey 19.07 k1AL w15 35533
5312 {Froen Cuspon Soanfry b Los Asgeles 1907 AT $1507
13A2 Frown Lot Angeder to Conyon Combry 19.07 80} L1987
Send-to-Jenniferdurphy-arr /282646 tobeiprocessed-andpaid by
Goiden Siate Mutual
RATH CHECKET - Gandhi] Alan [11/16/2010
[
K ] . N
™~ : J . A ™
TOTALS <> P 190,18 ELI R % $13535
L CiskAdrance: B, -

' . W ! = 3, 0 auwnmurnm [ $31696
Swurta Koeon elkficlal) [ /
~Bits -

“Employes Sidasturs
//ﬁfa;/m/p Hpyady Wakemmed
ermz“' T TBERED ApprovE | DOnCurenes "'""‘3""" :

f

AQITAR 012010




Travel and Business Expense Report
Perled Covered: Novimber 1 they Neveraber 7, 2010 AGCTOF S

Employan: Susta Hseon
Ciuxa reforencs pihordzsiion number
Dapatment: Estata Charged; 99 6-63005 Teotn Travel Avthoderfon Raqueal fom
DATE PLACE/OGCASION ] GROUND TRARBRPORTATION HOTEL. [ MEALS | PHONE {INCDTLS] TOTALS
L Kk Fapey [ Gy Teshimo rRenlslf Pafiing
LA eh T i 1 3 ] ] [ [ [}
114 ¥rar Canyon Cotirary i Lot Angeles 10.07 Ji.i4 3is.07
13141 Fram bos Avgeles o Crnyea Couttey 1301 3t.1¢ 1901
(23] ?»mCumCmny\a[mAgg:m hiiid 014 1907
1171 Frott Loy Asgeles tn Canpon Cociley 1307 314 319.07
List Frowt Ounydn Countey 1o Lot Angales 1907 LEAL) $19.00
112 Frens Lot Adgater s Canyon Counlry 19.01 kAL 31907
) [ Proes Capom Countey (o Log Ansiles 1907 38,14 . 30,07
(31 £roim kot Angedes b Conyed Cooplry i 314 1048 34008 |
2 From Conyon Connby o Loa Anpeles 19,67 e [ 319.07
1345 o, 1% Anpees 1 Catiyon Caniry 41 3814 31907
Send urphy on [13722/2010 t be processed and paidliby
olden-State-Muttiah
: MATH CHECRED - Ghndhl.[Alan_|T116/2010
\\
; =
TOTALS 19070 19140 | s10.68 f /f , N szz101 4
. - s . v / . 3 . e CeskAdvanee 37
. .o M /{ 33 f° [ AmsmtDaeBrotoree 1 s331.00
— e VA s IR
‘5 Hinployee BIpnats T
N SLTE0I0 Hgpady Fakammed
) ?uxv“amaumdomm Fpproval Tte TOICICED Appioval T Goneuirsner T
Q. .
L)
- .
.
% ACLT.02 015030
] A ———ay .

WveLie




CALIFORNIA INSURANCE COMMISSIONER

93 Consarvation & Liquidaton Office ADDRESS# 8859
BE P.0. Box 26894

. 086592
%7 Sen Franciacs, Calfornls 0412606894 VENDOR COPY Chock No. 00

1
Tet: 415.676.5000 | Fax: 415.576.5002 Stub of 1 Date  12/13/2010
Invoice Dats]lnvolos Number Dascription : IVouchor # Amount Baid
11912010 £ 42551450 S. NOCOMN WE 11714110 PV78409 2,700.00
Vendor; Ultimate Staffing Services Check Totei 2,700, oo

: cmmumhmsum;vcsmmwss:ouak ! ¢ . : .J . .:__.,1“.,-\.
tdalion Offica . T 5

35 g%ﬁ;,:: izlgg:‘;l.iqu ° - USOGAQcounta Payabts Chegk No, 00056592 11:4&1 .

. San Francisco, Catifrota $4128. BgmlL yété?g i?r?ar!:‘;;f g;g;c;miﬁ 27 Date 12”3;20101'213.__-

15,678,500 aiifo ' LoF o :

R »?15 Gﬁsmmlfoiq & -ﬁf San Francisco CA8A104 ¢k

HOT VALID AFTER La0 ays

§2,700.00

3 = v 1 .‘!
".:F-=,'"-~ ‘me Ulimeato Stalfing Services T s N o
. * ORDER  Dapta761 Cemd LA NI AR
_OF Los Angales CA 800848761 . L g - .
: A ", - > % . N' m .. .’v.;:.‘".. J..
L T et -~ - ‘ o i . m
"' . ' vy - iy " e 5"' TN

rO00ERSF & L 2ID00LYTE FI8001300 60




Batch # 120103 ' "
Doc# 78409 ‘ Invoice
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID Invoice Number  Invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Services * Ledgent 278321 / 12551450 14/19/2010
Adams & Martin Group . Branch: 02U San Francisco U
, Timashoals Attachad

Attn:

Bill To:
Human Resources

Conservation & Liquidation Office
Attn; Human Resources
425 Market Strest

Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 94105

Wook
Ending Name Wage Type Hours  Rate Amount
_ 111412010  Nocon, Susan
Regular 40.00 67.50 TS0 2,700.00

096.63005.A131
N 272070 Wypeds Mlabhommed ,

N Bonee, Gontt 72752070

woice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Lisng>12/972010

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/30/2010

Subtotat \\ 2,700.00
Pius Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0,00
If payment is made before 12/10/10, pleass pay 2,700.00
if payment is made after 12/10/10, please pay 2,862.00
REMIT TO:
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 60084-8751
FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your businessl

For billing questions, pléase call; (714) 936-5999 age 1 of 4
11/30/2010 2 33 '35 PM
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CALIFORNIA INSURANCE COMMISSIONER :
% gogs;:,vagon & \lguidation Officy ADDRESS# 8859
3% ¥ 26894
Y VENDOR COPY Check No, 00066753
Sen Francisgo, Gollfornia 94126-0804 ’
Y Tl 418,678 5000 | Fa: 418.876.5002 Sth t o of 1 Date  1/10/2011
fnvalce Date ] involcs NUmber ’ Deseription © {Voucher# ' Amount Paid
12/312010 [12555804 B.HELMLE & J.SHOCKLEY PV78810 §75.20
121312010 12855987 N.WATTS W/E 14728010 PV7B811 i 540.00
Vendar: Ultimate Staffing Services : Chack Total ) 1,415.20°
M . ™ M * .

.

“E T : o oo P s R .
g 255, CAUFORRIA IRSURANCE omnssxcm&a " ok f - c T et LT A
6.“ Conse:valtun& Uqu!da!lono o UEOCA t P o oo " A 9 ey, o T
) h¥) 2,0, Box 26884 - ccouns ayable ' 3! dpa 48
g Bun Franclsco, Callfom!a 94126-089& y Unlor Bafik of Californlz: ™ Check No. 00086763 1210 -
! 400 Gulfornla Siredt - LI Date 1/‘;0[201 i R,

“Tol; 41578, s&oolrar 415.676.5002 ,
= Wi A Ban Francfsco CAS4104 | - .-

NOT WALID AP TER (80 DAYS .

greaned 495 20

AMOURY OVER $20,000.00 REQUIRES TWO SIGNATURES

7, THE Ultimats Staffing Services ‘o,
” T B

"+ ORDER  Dopt 8761 ’
: OF Las Angelas CA 90084-87061 . ; - ’
- - R e e

ROD0BS 53T 112300049712 2380030




invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID Invoice Number  Invoice Date
Uitimate Staffing Services - Ledggnt- 28321 - 12555901 12/0372010
Adams & Martin Group Branch: yén Francisco U
7
Blit To: " Atto; Batch # 120404

Conservation & Liquidation Office Toni Sanchez  pge# 78610

Attn: Toni Sanchez

P.O. Box 26894

Conservation & Liquidation Office
San Francisco, CA 94128-0894

Weok

Ending Nama Wage Type Hours Rate Amount
11/28/2010  Helmle, Brian \ '

Regutar 16.00 21.88 350,08
14/28/2010  Shocklsy, Jonathan )

Regular / 24,00 21,88 525,12

996.63005.A131
N 22077 Wlgpady Wabommed

¥ Dooree, Soatt 122077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/16/2010 _

N _
voice Meets Contract Term and Cep, <Sharon Liang> 1/4/2011 Subtotal 8§75.20
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
_ Salas Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment Is made before 12/24/10, please pay 875,20
If payment is made afior 12/24/0, please pay 927.71
REMIT TO:
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-06833164
Thank you for your business!
For billing questions, please call: (714) 939-5999 Page 1 of 4

12113/2010 10:36:18 AM




QA& e
dithmate e cenT ADAMS &MAR’Q}:}

ATHIHEY RTRGERS

To change the dofivacy

aHas mathod of your chuck,
PO, BOX 11057 please contact your
GRANGE, CA 928688157 tranch office.
Agsignient #

trnployee 10
tare _rian, Hﬁlﬂr{{ &

Company Name _,CJ ‘C)
Report to ...

. This is roy fitst wotk on e now gssigament or with & new
suporvisor. by Ambassado Fitacerd Supplornont is sttached,
< T This is nol oy first waek on 8 naw agsigrmant aad my
mbsssador Supplement has been Turned in for this assignment,

oL Othar

THERE $TAGCTUAL YOURS WORKED thNUS LUNCHTO THE NESREST 114 HOUR.
£ FASE VWRITL LEGIBLS TO AVEID ERBONS IH PROCESSING YOUR PAYCHECK

YToena | Tima

Oate | Tima | Owt in Yirta } Reg. § OT. DY
worked [ Wy |Ewnch) jRunet)] Out | Hours § Hours | Hours

ton {1/42 o sl alddsl §
e lf/{.} o I IAEAT 8

Wed

This

i . g

Fri
Sut

Sun

Week-Ending Yotal }

Bate: L 72/ {0 |Houss W
1 cortily that [ workad the hours shown on this card on the'ays
itekeated and that this card hes been certified by a parson th
bediwe 15 an authorized ropresantative of the Cust

Staffing Azsaciate Sigaature

#5 the Cuurornor's suthorized representative, | certify thst the
staffing associnte’s hours shown on this time sheat are correct and
tha tha work was performed satisfectorily, 1 also confitm the
Cusitmer's agreamant 10 the terms stated on the rovoTea side of

gy forens,

Custamer Slgnature

2,

4

TERMS OF SALE
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rnlet Uin Cornpanry drett Suporvisson aid coorod, 6 that it vl
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26 ¥ teerporry, troliad o teasedt wepitrme of shorgshizabon ttiver Ian
i Cuttpany for subisiantially g suiel Wk asshpyuat whtahing Ui
petson's vt thieagh ety Indaprhat coniaci, speny, ety
staffing or consudng rulationshly 2 Anvieien, sagRtng, oty
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e
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Griony Mg 8 rinfirsnd vy 1o B Patp taks tha Pry Bate ¢ Parell Costs
\ndarm and $tate taxes, Worker's Unopienation wgantss pa'd and
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ultimate

ITAINNG tiwriced

VER (%08
RO, BOX 11057
ORANGE, CA B2856-8157

¢

LEDGENT

To change the dolivary
rathod of your check,
pivasn aontsct your
pranch offics.

Assignment #

Employse 1D

“TBAATHAN SHOCK LEY

Name o

o LD

Company Nerne

SUGAN Docen)

Report to

14 This [s my Birst wesk on

amiveszador Supplement b

supervisor, My Ambsssador Timeacerd Supplament {s altached.
‘5{1?:19 Is not my fiest waek ont u patw assignment and oy

a naw sssignment or with & nev/

a3 baen turned in Tor this assigament.
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f cartify that { warked the hours shown on this card on the days

i

Indicated snd that this card hasdfcongertifid ntheyl
beliave Is sn suthorized repregants of the A
Ambassador Signsturg

e

As the Cuslomer's aut
siaffing assovlata’s hou

zed representative, | cortiy that 1%
hLowit on this Gre sheat are cofrdGt snd

that the work was performed satisfactorily, 1slso conflem the

Customar's agréamasnt 1o the tems stated gn the feverse side of
this form. W}
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Batch # 120405
Doc#t 78611

invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P.
Uttimate Staffing Services = Ledgent
Adams & Martin Group

Company o invoice Number | Involce Date

702913 125565967 1210312010
Branch: 11U Century City U

Bill To:
Conservation & Liguidation Office
Attry: Tont Sanchez

PO Box 26894
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Attn;
Toni Sanchez

Weoek
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rata Amount
11/28/2010 Watls, Niya

Regular 24.00 22.50 540.00

996.63005.A131
N 222077 gl Wakarmed

¥ Baree, Soatt 17E2077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12{16/2010

voice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang>1/4/2011 Subtolat 340.00
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment Is made before 12/24/10, please pay ~840.00
If payment Is made after 12/24/10, please pay 572.40
REMIT TO;
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FiN #33-0633164
Thank you for your business! '
Page 1 of 1

For billing questions, please call: (714) 939-5399

12/13/2010 10:36:20 AM
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Ta change thae deflvery
VEA 240E method of yaur chack,

RO, BOX 11067 plagse contact your
ORANGE, CA 928568167 prench office.

Assignment #

emplopond VAL

Name
Company N
Report to

o rmem ey

1 This 13 my Tirst week on s new asslgnraant or with a new
suparvisor, My Ambass sdor Timecard Supplemsnt is atiachad,
£ This Is not iy frst waek on 8 Aaw assignment gnd my
Ambassador Supploment hes boen turaad in for this ssslgnmeant.

L3 Othar —

EMTER ACTUAL HOURS AKED IVINUS LUNCHI FOTHE HEAREST 14 HOUR.
PLEASE WRITE LEGIELY T& AVDID EARORE 1N PROCESSING YOUR PAYCHELK,
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Waok- d% Total E l 5, ©
Duto:_| /J.D Hou
1 certlfy thet | worked the hd 7% dn thi

indicated and that this card
Botinve is an authorizec(re

Ambassacdor 8ignature

As tha Customer's authoriied fRpTESes [tative, 1 cortlfy that the
stuffing associate’s hows shewn gn 1hy
1hat the work was parformed satistacfority. 1 nlso confirm the

Customet’s agresment 1o the tenns Stated, on the raverse side of

this Jorm.

s {ima sheet are corract and

Customer Bignature
ACCOUNTING DEPT,

PYPTIen T

oo = e iy ey et




Batch # 120566 Ei’ﬂf@i@&

, Doc# 78733
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company iD invoice Number  Invoice Date
28321 12557838 12/10/2010

Ultimate Staffing Services « Ledgent

Adams & Martin Group Branch: 02U San Francisco U

Bt To: Atin:

Conservation & Liguidation Office Toni Sanchez
Altn: Toni Sanchez

P.Q. Box 26894

Conservation & Liquidation Office

San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Waek : '
Ending MName Wage Type Houts Rate Amount
1210512010 Helmle, Briah P
) Regutar 40.00 21.88 : 875.20
12/05/2010 Shockley, Jonathan .
40.00 21.88 875.20

Regular _
996.63005.A131 7

N Wypad; Wakammed 2772077
R Farce, Seatd 1722077

.., L DAV
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/23/2010

Subtotal 1,750.40
woice Meets Contract Term und Cap, <Sharon Liang>1/11/2011 Plus Sales Tax 0.00
‘ Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
Y
if payment Is made before 12/31/10, please pay ~ 1,750.40
if payment Is made after 12/31/10, please pay 1,855.42
REMITTO:
Dept 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FIN #33-0833164

Thank you for your business!

For billing questions, please call; (714) 938-5999 Page 1 of
- 1211412010 4:00-37 PM
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N To change the delivery
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1 ; This fs iy first week on s niew ssolgnmunt or with a new
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/&Js 15 pat iy fiest weak of 8 asw saalgnmont and my
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Batch # 120584 Invoice

Doc# 78748
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID invoice Number  Involcs Date
Ultimate Staffing Services * Ledgent 702913 12657897 12110/2010
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 01U Century City U
Bl To: Attn:

Conservation & Liquidation Office Toni Sanchez

Attn: Toni Sanchez

PO Box 26884
San Franclsco, CA 94126-0894

Weaok . .
Ending Nama Wage Type Hours Rate Amount

12/05/2010 Walts, Niya
22.50 900.00

Regular 40,00

¥ Wypady Mabanmed 1752077

- Paree, Seett Wﬂf 7
585.63005 .A131

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/23/2010

\\ _
Subtotal 800.00
ice Meets Cantract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang>1/11/2011
Tolce Meets fantrae P g Plug Sales Tax 0.00
8ales Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment [s made before 12/31/10, please pay 800.00
If payment Is made after 12/31/10, please pay 954,00
' REMIT TO:
' Dept 8761
Los Angelos, CA 80084-8761
FIN #33-0633164
Thank you for your business!
Pagie 1 of 1

For billing questions, please call: (714) 839-6998
12/14/2010 4:.00:39 PM
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ultimate LE(S(?ENT AUAMSCMARTIN

STAYFIRD ATRVECKT

To changa the delivery

VEH 0aTH mathod of your chack,
RO, BOX 11057 plegan cantact your
ORANGE, CA 82866-8157 branch oftfea,
Assignment # —
Employes D [ ‘8" 0{ é5 é,,
Name
Company l\%me LO
Report to UﬁA’I\)

CHECK ONE

0] This & my first week on & now assignment or with 8 now
suparviser. My Ambsssador Timecard Supplamaent is attachad,
[} This Is not my first week on 8 new assignmant and my
Ambassador Supplament hos baan rned In for this assignfrent.

3 Other

ENTER ACTUAL HOURS WORKED (WINUS LUNCH) TO THE NEAREST 14 HOUR,
PLEASE WHITE LEQIBLY YO AVDLO ENRORS IN PROCESSING YOUR PAYCHECK

Time [ Yime
Nate | Time | Out Tienn 3 Reg. 1 O, oy

Worked ] fn (loneh)i{Lunchl| O Houes | Hours § Hours
Mo | Bwns‘{ﬁﬁaﬁ“&f‘ o)

1 hty !’%T@& l%/_ 1)
wed 5] 10 APISFRIDRD
mhe 1SS iR 0
F_IY218 - 11230 408, 0
Sat Q!+

* . Sun il \ AR

'Wj- dli ,p Tatal ' ]
Daete‘ ’ I :rs ( /A

{ cartify that 1 workedtha h 1 s chrd
indicated and thet thiy card ¥is 4 a t
beliove iy an avthorizedToprgsentath, Cur

Ambasssador Signeture

As the Customars euthorizad mpfcs&gt::%, | cartify that the
stefting asvocieto’s hours shown on thi#a shast ere coreat and
thai the work was parformed satistactordly. | slso contirm the
Customat's sgraament 1o the terms stated on the revorse side of

this form,

Customar Slgnature
Aé:GOUNTING DEPT,




Batch # 1205658
' Doc# 78732

L4

invoice

Invoice Dato

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company 1D Invoice Number
Ultimate Staffing Services » Ledgent 278321 / % 12/10/2010
Branich: 02U 8an Francisco U

Adams & Martin Group

Thmesheels Atlached

Bill To; Attn:

Consetvation & Liguidation Office Human Resources
Attn: Human Resources

425 Market Street

Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 84105

Week
Ending Name Wage Typg MHours Rate Amount
12105/2010  Nogon, Susan
: Expenses 1.00 241,79 241,79
/ Regular 2,700.00
996.65018.A131
996.63005.A131
M Boree, Geatt 1H L0
N Wgpally Wakammed 1772077 ‘
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 1/3/2011 \
\
wvoice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang>1/11/2011 Subtotal 2,941.79
: ’ \ Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
‘tf payment is made hefore 12/31/10, please pay 2,941.79 ;
3,118.30

If payment is made after 12/31/10, please pay

REMIT TO:

Dept 8761

Los Angeles, CA g0084-8761
FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!

For billing questions, please call: (714) 939-5999 p
12/20/2010 9:06:23 AM

age 1 of 4
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Assignment
Employes 10 L +
Name ~SUSAR NDLON
Compeny Namo é Lo *
Aopert 10
'

3 THis I oy Tirat Wk on o new axsdgrment o7 Wik 8 fiew

supirdior, My Ambisesador Timecard Supplement lratached,

I This 13 not my lixt ek on 2 Atw ssslanmant snd iy
_ gnah;lmdor Supplarent es been turned 1 for thie Sb¥gnmant. | ¢

I H

ERTEN ALIVAL ROLRS WORKEQ DVERUS LUNCHI TO THE REANERT f ROUA.
upéﬁmuﬁnwn&mmumt SOUR (54

ot "E' Tes 1 Mg [ OV | 'OX
ki) [Raack)d Dol ] Hoor | Youn | Hous

w
Mon 1AL QN o iy, iy

R PSS fm!{ bl ¥
wed 13, (605 Do) Pietlciel

g
oo {95k fdows Joealt Tl & ,
124 |0 ity 6 S

v

Oete | Tims
e I

Sun

Week-End Total 4@ <
Eg_tg,iw} W IHours “ {(AML_F
tcanily that ) wearked the hours shewn o this ced en Dre doys
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Az the Costomers atholia tapheyyntotlve, § cendly thar the
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plfimate LeocENT @L_&m@ b

STAFITG TRAVICHS

’ To chunge the defivary
VER D308 rathod of your shack,
RO, BOX 11057 | ploase cintest your
ORANGE, CA 92866-8157 branch office.

Assignmant #
Employee (D

Narna ~$‘!4~th4 N'De‘o'\i

Cormpany Name cLo
Raport 10

CHECK ONE
3 This Is my first wirsk on & naw assipnmant of with 2 new
suparvisor. My Ambassodor Timecerd Supplement is attached.
U1 This {8 not my fiest waak an a new assignment end my
Arbassador Supplemaent has bean umad in for this assignment.
[3 Other

ENTEA ACTUAL HOURS WORKED DAINUS LUNCH TO THE NEAREST J/& HOUR.
PLEASE WRITE LEGIELY TO AVOD EARORS 1N PADCESSING YOUR PAYCHECK

Vi | Tieo
Oato | Tenw | OCut i Thne | Reg. | QT fre
Wodod | v jRunch}| (onch| Out § Hours | Howes § Hours

Man il/:;{i gc’\ l;}_‘v\ p:#rd'q's
oo | U1 Gt Bl (] 4yt
wed |13/ | 9 |0 | 205115
tha (17, 8o 1w hnas TG
1 180 [l us 4R
Sat
Sun
Woek-End Total

Daiz: k) 4 / 1H H?Jurs 40
| cortify tha 4worl?ed thie hours shown on this sard on the days
indicated and that this card has been certitied by & persan that |

beliove Is an authorized represepistive of the Cugtomsn
Ambassador Signature y

As the Customar’s mthoriz{ed rapresantativa, | cartify that tha
staffing sssoclate’s hours shown on this time sheet are comrect snd
that the work was performed satisfactorlly. | also coafirm the
Customer’s agreamant to the terms sleted on the reverse slde of

this form.
Sustomor Slgaature W

AGCUUNTING DEPY,

Ol O] Bategy

v .
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Travel and Businasy Expense Report
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Batch # 120567 - Invoice

Doc# 78734
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P, Company ID Involce Number - Invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Services » Ledgent 702913 42559807 121172010
Adams & Martin Group ' Branch: 01U Century City U
' P
Bl To; : Attn:

Conservation & Liquidation Office Tonl Sanchez

Attn: Tonl Sanchez
PO Box 26894
San Francisco, CA 94126-0804

Week
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rate Amount
1211212010 Watts, Niya

Regular 40.00 22.60 200.00

/

996.630056.A131
A Wafaky Wakommed 1775 2077

N Basee Santtt 17E 2077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/22/2010

hY

ice Meots Contract T d Cap, <Sh Liang>111/2011 Subtotal 500.00
vore 7 arm an L, Siaran

voice Meets Contract Term p on Liang Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment is made before 1/7/11, please pay X 800.00
If payment is made after 1/7/11, please pay 854.00

REMIT TO:

Dept 8761

Los Angelas, CA 80084-8761

FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!

For bililng quésuons, please call; (714) 530-5089 Page 41 of4
| 1212272010 10:41:35 AM
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Ta change the delivesy |

VeRmos mathod of yaur check, | |

PO, BOX 11087 please contact your !
QRANGE, CA 92855-8167 hranch office.

Assignmant # :

Emp! V)YO
Name -T{’ [l ; e ————e,
Company Na p 2 b ( '

AN N

Report to .

CHECK ONE
] Thia is my flrst weok on 8 new sssignmant or with 8 naw
suparvisor. My Ambassador Timacerd Supplement (s ettadied,
O Thig s not my firet week on o new aesignment and my
Ambissador Supplamant hes been turned in for this essignrment,
0O Gther

ENTER ACTUAL HOURSWOHRXED IMINUS LUNCH) TOTHE NEAREST 174 HOUR.
PLEASE \WRITE LEGIBLY 1O AVOID ERIOAS IN PROCESSING YOUR PRYCHECK 3

Tima | time i
Date Yirn- Ourt n Tims | Rogte | QT oT
Wotked (L] et Out PHours | Howrs | Hours | -

von 1971 64&% LRy
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§~‘
=

wod @-Mé 7

:f "7% %jd; S

Sat ) U ; P

sun ) —g—ri A 1.

Waek-Fdi m Total : .
Date: @‘1?27 Haur

t sentify that § worked thefhourg/Shef it thls the days
indicated and thet {his cald hifpeeh ol partthat § .
befiave Is an suthorixed tve e

Ambossador Signature ¥ ; \

As the Customier's suthorixéd reprasentitive, | certify thot the

staffing sssociate’s hours shown o this Yme shest are comrect and
that the work was performaed satistegtasfy, | also confirm the
Custorner's sgresment to the tarms s end Hn tha 1everss slde of

this form, .

Customer Slgnature
AéGOUNTlI\!G DEPT. .




Batch ¥ 120589
Doc# 78735

invoice

Rath Slaffing Companies, L.P.
Ulttmato Stalfing Services » Ledpent
Adams & Mattin Broup

Company It Involce Number  Invoico Dats
- 283 12559746 1204712010
Brensh: 031 Sun Frangsco U

Rill Yo Atin:
Consarvation & Liguidation Office Tont Sanchex
Alin: Yo Sanchez

#.0. Box 20864

Cansarvation & Liguideiion OHlcs

San Frenslsce, CA 84120-0804

Wesk
Ending Kame Wage Typs Houre

Rafe

Amaunt

121212010 Helmie, Brian
Regutar g, 40,08

12122010 Shockiay, Jonathan Heg
\Har / 4000

996,63006.A131
A’%Aﬂ,’ Pladammes’ M/f

X Bser, Soctt L2007

MATH CHECKED - Gandhl, Alan 12/23/2010

21.88

2188

N

BYS.20

Br8.20

f Tor and Cap, <Shoson Linng> (11 172011 Subtotal s
pine Kouts Conleatt Torm ond Cap, ot Linng Plus Sstus Tax 0.00
Saloa Taxable Amount 2.00
tf payment is mado befora 177711, plesss pay 1,750.49
1Y payment ix mads aftar 17414, ploase pay 1,865.42
TN MOy

REMIT TQ:

Dagt 8784

Los Angetas, CA S0084-8761

FIN #33-0833164

Thank you lor your businoast
Papo tuft

For bating questions, please cal: (T14) 9385900

1202312010 10:26:46 AM
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Camiuar’y dgraument 10 thy terms stated pr the raversy dide of
i, g
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Customer Signature
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FL, 804 TS/ plotse contact your

CHALIGE, CA 928604187 brasch office.

fumgnrmant # e - - .
Lroployad 1B s e o % -

e . . JONATHAN Slhock (€9

Corngemny Name |,

flapurt 1o MQ(,{ éﬂ'}\j )\)5 COJ -
| CHECK ONE

. s 1 oy Tirst wook, ofr @ now ssignrnent of with & rew
surmrvsor My AmbassadorTimacard Supplemant is attached.
niy in not ry Hest waok on o new assigament snd my
Hrriussstder Sopploment hos boen turned in for tHis assignment,
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1] arh WWEATE LLGTELY T AVCRT EHRORS 11 PROCESSING YOUR PRYCHEGE )

—————

P

Tims | Time :
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wed 1291 § 110n)2:994:49 .
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Batch # 129568 w
ne invoice

, Doc# 78735
¥ o
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P, Company D Invoice Number  Invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Sarvices » Ledgent 278321 12559054 12/17/2010
Adams & Martin Group , Branch: 02U San Franclsco U |
Timeshaots Atlached ]
H
Bill To: ' Attn:

Conservation & Liquidation Office Human Resources

Attn: Human Resources
425 Market Strest

Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 94105

Weok
Ending Name Wage Type Hours Rate Amount

121122040 Nocon, Susan

Expenses 1.00 245.27 245,27
Regular 7 40.00 67.50 2,700.00

096.63005.A131 : _ ' |
N Wyioky Wakemmed 1722077 |
N Booree, Saalt 17072077 |

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/29/2010 ' |

Subtotat 2,945.27
vnice Mests Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang> 11172011 Plus Sales Tax , O'O-D
Sules Taxable Amount : 0.00
If payment Is made before 1/7/11, please pay " 2,94527
If payment is made after 1/7/41, please pay 3,121.89
REMIT TO:
Dapt 8781
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
FiN #33-0633164

Thank you for your businesst

For biliing questions, please call: {V14) 938-5989 Page 1 of
12129/2010 6:55:34 AM
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Employss: Susan Nocon \

Travel and Business Expense Report .
Pericd Covared: Deceniber § thre December 12, 2010

ACCT.Qf #
€033 (alarencs sANGIEERG NNTOAT

Rom Treval Authaduton Requast forrt

CATE PLACEOCCASION SROUND TRANSPORTAYION MEALS | PHONE !!!&ODTLB TOTALS
1 CLO rala i/ By ey tas] Ty
9500 n [} ] 3 1
1206 [From Ceayon 19.07 4 $19.07
12/ [Frocs Los Anpeles to Canipon County 19,07 34 $19.07
el Fioes Cazyod Counbyto Los Augeles 1207 18,14 31507
E7__ {FroutLos Angrles to Cenvon Countey 1907 %14 $1007
1A [Froe Cunyon Country to Loy Asgeles 1907 U $1o.07
198 levom Los Angeles o Cengon ooty | 19,07 1¢ 31997
125 [froe Cenyos Country taLas Angeles 1907 314 1907
128 [Froes Lot Asgeles to Chaydn Couniry 19.07 ki AL) 31907
1210 [Peoen Canpon Cotntry teLos Angeies 1947 130 $19.07
1219 [Froom Los Angales i Canyon Country 1907 Rl $19.07
2 50 j 26.00 $10.00
12l 3487 $HST
MATH CHECKED | Gandhi, Alan 12 <
\ ™~
] \
TOTALS »» 190,70 8140 55437 ML
Less Cask Advante
[ Amewnt bws Buptove | 5248.29
sty An Mt &, 12138018 ;
;mpiojm wra (i
Hgjal oy
SupendsorManagyTOTICH Apgeoval Q_, Babs BINCES Appraval T Conutrance Tits

ACCT4701.20.10

Paree, Saatt 1-E8-2077
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Roth Staffing Companies, L.P,
Ultimate Staffing Services » Ledgent
Adams & Martin Group

Batch # 120634 | ' .
Doc# 78784 | invoice
Company D Involce Number  Invoice Date

702913 7 12554188 11/26/2010

Bransh: 01U Gentury City U

Bit To:

Conservation & Liguidation Office
Attn: Toni Sanchez

PO Box 26894
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Attn:
Toni Sanchez

Weok

Hours

Ending Name Wagge Type

Regular

/ 1112172010 Watts, Niya ~~

A DBoaroe, Santt 1-7E2077

996.63005.A131

Ty, 140,00

voice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang>_1!14i2m1

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Atan 12/1/2010
!

Rate Amount

22.50 900.00

~

-

1
Subtothi N 900,00
Plus Sales Tafx 0.00
Sales Taxable Amour!tt a.00
if payment is made before 12/17/10, please pay 900,00
854,00

If payment is made after 1217/10, please pay

REMIT TO:
Dept 8761

Los Angeles, CA 80084-8781

FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your businessl

— .

For biiling questions, please call: (714) 939-5998

1113012010 2:35:48 Pm
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To change the delvary
VER FA0G method of your chack,
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Batch # 120633 .
Doc# 78783 invoice

Roth Staffing Companies, L.P.
Uitimate Staffing Services + Ledgent
Adams & Martin Group

Company ID Invoice Number Invoice Date
28321 /;7 12654124 7 1126/2010
Branch: 02U San Francisco U

Biil To:

Conservation & Liguidation Office
Altn: Toni Sanchez

P.O, Box 26894

Conservation & Liquidation Office
San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Attn;
Toni Sanchez

Waeek
Ending Name Wage Typo Hours Rate Amount
TS 44212010 Helmie, Brlan
Regular 3 40.00 2188 875.20
N 14/21/2010  Shockley, Jonathan
Regular -2 40,00 21.88 875.20

M Bnse, Seatt WW&//

096.63005.A131
M LR 2077 Wyl Wlokorsmed

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/1/2010

X

Subtotal N 1,750.40
voice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Liang>1/14/2011 Plus Sales Tax 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
if payment Is made boefore 12/17/10, please pay 1,750.40
if payment is made after 12/17/10, please pay 1,855.42
REMIT TO;
Dept 8781
Los Angeles, CA 50084-8761
FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your businesst

For billing questions, please call: (714) 939-6899

~ Page tof 4
11/30/2010 2:33:50 PM
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" ACCOUNTING DEPT,




I R I

el

e e Y e E s e - T
LR A T N A

Pl

‘u!tfmate Le L%iw“r m&m

FIATFING BTRUCTS

. To changs the dallvery
EROG0S
RO, BOX 11057 Mo sobrnt o
ORANGE, CA 928508157 brench offive,
Asslg?xmsm £
Emplovo o 1D
Mame \-’91\’4 H AN SH‘Q [ KLEY
Company Name

Report to S&l fn‘q” ’JOQO&I

D'W.siamyfhtwukan & how susiniment of with o new |
W«: 7 My Ambassadar Timasnrd Suppismont is sttoched,
&

i3 pot my frel wosk o g new sssignment erd my
Arrkressadar Supplement has baen'tumed In forthis uﬂfmmam.

=] mimr .
!N'IEAGTUAL swmsvmnmws & 10 THE umm
UMH} nwusrw

mmmsuowmnmeamsm

| e L S Lol e L, | 2,
mon 10761 N2l 51 % .
oo [t .;, IR
wat B [\ 1Yg 51 %
Tt ’% AT R
LRZARIRA LT K

Sut . '

Sun

Wesk-Ending - Total Hv
peto; L2 B 10, {ttours

T cortify thet workat! tha hours shoum on e sard on the deys
Indicotod and thet this card hos beon certified byra parson thal

Lalieve 19 sn guthorizad reprgsen of the ey, (/
1
“(

Arbsgsador Simstire ; T

#3 the Customar’s suthorlod raprosentsibve, 1 conlly thot the y '
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Batch # 120621
ne Invoice

Doc# 78771
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company ID Invoice Number  Invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Services + Ledgent 278321 12553368 11/26/2010
Adams & Martin Group / Branch: 02U San Francisca U
Tineshosts Allached
Bill To: Attn:

Conservation & Liquidation Office Human Resources

Attn: Human Resourcas
425 Market Streel

Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 94105

Weak
Ending pMame Wage Type Hours Rate Amount
11/24/2090 Nogon, Susan
Regular 40,00 67.50 2,700.00
T Expens/wo 269,59 259,59
986.63005.A131 . .
996.65018.A131

W Wyind; Wadanmed 1722077 |

N Boasee, Saott L7E 2077 5

Subtotal 2,858.59
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
$ales Taxabfe Amount 0.00
If payment is made before 12/1710, please pay 2,959.59
If payment Is made after 12117110, please pay 3,137.17
REMIT TO:
Dapt 8761
Los Angeles, CA 90084-8761
voice Mesls Contract Term end Cap, <Sharon Liang>1/11/2011 FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your businesst

For billing questions, please call: (714) 939-5899 Page 1 of 1
- 12/23/2010 10:26:49 AM
]
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Batch # 120635 ‘
Doc# 78785 invoice
Roth Staffing Companies. L.P. Company 1D Invoice Number  Invoice Date
Uitimate Staffing Services + Ledgent 28321 12561606 1212412010
Adams & Martin Group Branch: 02U San Francisco U

8ill To; Attn:

Conservation & Liquidation Office Toni Sanchez
Aftin: Tonj Sanchez

P.C. Box 26894

Conservation & Liguidation Office

San Francisco, CA 94126-0894

Amount

Weak "
Ending Name Wage Typs - Hours Rate
12118/2010  Shockley, Jonathan P
Regular 24.00 21.68 525.12
A
996.63005.A131
N L 72°2077 Wgpady MHakommed
A Boree, Saatt 1 7E 2077
woice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sheron Liang>1/14/2011
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 1/13/2011 _

Subftotal 526,12
Plus Sales Tax 0.00
- Salos Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment Is made hefore 1/14/11, please pay 525.12
if payment is made after 1/14/11, please pay 558.63

" REMITTO:

Dept 8761

Los Angeles, CA 80084-8761

FIN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!
Page 4 of 4

For bliing questions, please call; (714) 939-5599
1/3/2011 6:19:25 AM




R @
ultimate ve D(G/ENT a,_ws_&}zjﬁ‘,iﬁ

RTAFIING Shvred

T enange the delivary
VER o mathod of your check,
PO, BOX 11057 plsase contact your :
CORANGE, CA 92854-8167 branch offica. ’
"
Assignment #
¥
3

e ST ST CKIEY

Compay Neme .
Hepott to S“S&N AJOCO/‘J :
FHECK ONE

{1 “his Is my first week on ¢ new assigninant or with & new
sppecdson My Ambassadar Timecard Supplement Is ettachad,

Thig i not rmy first weaX on & new assigrensnt atd iy i

bossador Supplament has been turned in for this a=a§nnﬂan{

LY Other

EHTER ACTUAL BOJRSWORKED [MINUS LINCHITO THF NEAREST 14 HOUR,
FLEASEWH T {0011V TO AVQID ERRORS (N PROCESSINGYOUR PAYCHECE

e | T
Dm Tims | Ot n Time | Rea. § OT By,
In {{Lunex}{ lunchl Out | Hours | Hours | Hou

Mo m/» £ 12 st 8
me I R [iadpyd of ¢ ,
wed BISIE 13- [BAFYAL &

Thu

Fd .

Sat

Sun _ SR WS B e
P, 20 (B I

_ cortify that | worked the v un s

Ambassador Signatu ' \

As the Custemer's suthorizod regrasentative, 1 cartity that the
Stofiing associate’s hotis shova on this time shaet are corrool and
that the work was per d sallstaotorty. alac conthm the
Costamar’s agrramant to the sarms steted on the roveise sida of

thés form,
Customar Signature 7WJ

AGCOUNTING DEPT.

B e TLLT L TP C VSRR SR

- e mea . an ok e




CAUIFORNIA INSURANGE COMMISSIONER
Conservalion & Liquidation Office

ADDRESS# 8859
8 oo oo st SENDOR 0P, rbaie izaron
Tol: 418.678.5006 | Fax: 415.675.5002
fnvoice Dale Involee Number Dascription . Voucher # Armount Paid
12/24£2010 § 12560966 8. NCOCON WIE 1211910 PV18404 1,782.30
Ventors U!t!ma_!e Stafling Services Chack Total 1,782.30 -

'y e
A GALiFO‘RN!A mSURkNCEﬁOMMSS!ONER - .’ '
d Conservalion & Liquidatlon, Offica iy
:- 2.0, Box 266884 . "
: % 8an Francizco, Calitomls 94120»0534 "
F - Tl 415 676 GBOG] Fax 415.5?6 5002

'

. e Ullmate Staffing Services
' ORDER  pept 8761
oF

Log Angelos CA 90084.-8761

H*OOOLEHA S8 2121000497

Uaoc Accaunfs Payabre,.

Unlon Bank of Callfornia '~

4330"Callfsm!a Strgat -, LM
. San Francfsco cﬁs 94104 e

238001} 100

Check i, 00065@58 g‘? i
C 1 Date " 4124/2019 "

NOT VALID AFTER 180 DAYS

| $reeang 789 30

A




invoice

! " ;
Roth Staffing Companies, L.P. Company 1D Invoice Number  invoice Date
Ultimate Staffing Services + Ledgent 278321 / 12560966 12/24/2010
Adams & Martin Group ' Branch: 02U Sen Francisco U
Timeshools Altachad
-Batch # 120692
Bill To: Attn: Doc# 78804
Conservation & Liquidation Office Human Resources
Atin: Human Resources
425 Markel Street
Suite 2300
San Francisco, CA 94105
Week .
Ending Nama . Wage Type Hours ' Rate Amotnt
121192010 Nocon, Susan
Expenses . 162,30
Regular e 24.00 1,820.00
986.65018.A131
996.63005.A131 ,

N LG8 2007 Wy Kakammed
W Boser, Gostt 1202077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 1/3/2011

'vice Meets Contract Term and Cap, <Sharon Lieng> 1/21/2011 Subtotal 1782.30
Plus Sales Tax: 0.00
Sales Taxable Amount 0.00
If payment is made before 114111, please pay X 1,782.30
If payment is made after 1/14/11, please pay 1,889.24
REMIT TO:
Dept 8781

Los Angsles, CA 90084-8761
FiN #33-0633164

Thank you for your business!

For biling questions, please call: {(714) 939-5599 ' Pago 1 of 1
. 1/3/2011 10:27:50 AM
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A, '
ultimate LeoceNT ﬁm&&m

Lralring $EVL)

Yo chenge the dollyery
VRl mathod’oi your sheok,
FO. BOX 11057 plessn contact yaur
ORANGE, CA 028568187 , branch office,
Assignment #
Employas 1D

Name ASULCAN] NDCGA

Company Name LO

Report to

1 This o my first wook on & now sslgnmant or with & gow
superdsor, My Ambessador Timecnrd Supplementis attached,
CI'Thie 12 nat sy fiest weaok on o pew pssipnmoant and ny
Ambassador Supplament hes besn tumnad 4 for 1his sealgamont,
[T Qther

ENTER ACTUAL HOURS WORNED iMry5 LURCHI Y0 THE NEAREST 14 HOUR.
PLEASEWRITE LEGIBLY TO AVOID EARORS 14 PADCESSNGYIUR BAYCHECK,

Trae | Timg
Dits § Time | Out b [1eme § Beg | O oy
foneddHtmuhis Ot | Hewrs | Hours | Hours

Workad In
Mon (17 Qtog o\ prehil

oo 1171 2 0 I 212yt

gy g
wed F~{ S ool Dgg*l’bq:d’

Thu

Fa

8nt

i‘w .

Sun ]

G e gt o bt

EPE i+ r——t 3 @8

-~

T A A Ak e ey

-

s

loarel 2P 1010 Iroun B4 <

1 cartty that | worked the haurs ahown on thls cend on tha vays
indicatod and that thie esrd has baon teriified by g parson {hnt |

betlava is ag suthodfrad repasentsibw of tha Customay,
Ambazsador Signatura, ;W"

As the Customer's authaclzed raprasaniathg, 1 cortily that the

staffing exsocinle’s hours shown on thit Uma shast s comreet and

that the work way performed satlsfactartly, | #lbo confiem the

Custamer's sgroament 1o the 1aimy oloied on o tavarss 81 of
this form, W
Cugloemer Slgnzk

¥
3 ACCOUNTING DEPT.

PP

4

. N e

1/3/2011 10:27:.51 AM




Travel and Business Expense Report

Employes: Suxun Noted Perkad Covered: December 13 thro Dovomber 19, 210 ACCT-01 #
Cross tefsrence Por

Depastmont; . Eotate Charged: from Treved Atshocteston Requasl fam
DATE PLACEIOCCASION | GROUND TRANSPORTATION . | HOTEL | MEALs | PHONE IIHGOYLS] YOTALS
[T L0 o Faeafony] Todiing #,
n:m Drie) ] ] "l [ 1 ¥ ) i []
1213 [Procs Conyon Countoy b Lat Andes 15,01 RIAT i $1907
1271 Loy Avgreles 10 Cenyon Coonyy 1987 N1 07
12/t4__[Froch Cumoon Cowstey ipLod Angefos 1967 I . 31307
1214 |Frees Los Aspcles 15 Coryon Couenry 1907 1A siger
“[i2715 __ JFrom Genor Covatryta Los Angeles 1947 C .14 $1907
123 [From Los Aapsies o Capon 197 AL z o ST
1218 . i, |7 [
MATH CHBCKED - (3 ndhi jAlan 11/13/2011
3
N y
TOTALS -5 . (TR AT N A I e
b,
g . "
Suian LLASRUL0 -
g ployee Bigattunt t{’
s LAPL 2077 Wafady Hlakammed
8 W FO TV oA GO ORI APPTOVAT e % BOICHAG Approval] Conaurmance Doty .
K
g\, e Seatt LTL2077 :
iy
E ACCTO2 012040
~

TP tooaem

|




EXHIBIT 8



Batch # 120893
# 12880 . Doc  # 78932
covkes crating, inc. Speciailsts in the flue art of handiing Fine Arts

3124 East Eleventh S6

“ 0 *Sluce 1974
. 'y 84,000 sq. i of arl storage
RECHK! VEL * Climate controlled alr ride trucks
o Musenw quality eratlng

Los Angeles, CA 90023 .
B WIFEB -1 ARI0 L E o e sivimrin
Telephone:  323/268-5161 i
¥a x") * 323/262-2001 * Sculpture rigging & assemibliug
Bill To: CONOGS COI’S€R VA }E‘QN‘”E{V
CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE
P.O. BOX 265894 Inveice Number: P
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 34126 77121
Invoice Date; P
l"“tﬂ! MARY KIRK / Jan 30, 2011
GSM Salesman:
Customer Workorder:

Qty | UM |. Description Unit Price Extension
12/6/10 3 MEN PACK/RETURN 710 COOKBS 1,029,00
12/17/10 3 MEN PACK/RETURN TO COOKES 1,431.13
ON 8ITE MATERIALS 1, 068,00
INVENTORY/WRAP/L:ABEL/PLAC‘E IN STORAGRE /.:5.-— 1,580.28
MATERTALS 43.50
FUBL SURCHARGE 54.88
PULL/ INVENTORY /PHOTO 98.00
WRAP 49,00
MATERIALS 8.60
RELBASE 49.00
POIG42B
COOKES CRATING INC. ARPROVED
Kitk, Mary
20312014
NO CONTRACT

860.85015 = §1,580.25
£96.85003 = $§2.511.01
998.65004 = §1,118.10  ggs.65004

ook W/fwg{ 27 4

Poaree, Seatt SRB2077
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 2/1/2011

[~

"

PUC regulalions require payments within seven days \é?}b 1 \: ;210,36

Nore: Please make all checks payablo to Cooke's Crating, Ine, Sales Tax 109,11

Mail to; IO, Box 512817, Los Angeles, CA 900510817 !
{nvolce Tolal 5,319.49

SEE ATTACHED WORK ORDER
All involces over 30 days are subject 1o a 1 /2% (18% per annum} cherge,

Thank you, we appreciate your business,

201/201

1 11:35:40 AM




coovkes crating, inc. Specialists in the fine art of handling Fine Arts
* 84,000 5q. ft. of art storage Doc # 79225

* Climnarte confrofled air ride frucks

L R N &
LI L

3124 East Eleventh 8¢, ‘ a1 ; .
Los Angeles, CA 90023 o , tesercnt quality crating
Telestions ! 13268.5101 201 HAR 1 AHIO: 06 World-wide shipping
: # ture ri ;
Fay: 323/262.2001 Sealpture rigging & assembiing
Bill To: CONOSS L COMSERVATION £
Rl T T
CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE .
P.O. BOX 26894 7 Involce Number:
SAN PRANCISCO, CA 94126 ™\ 77262
fnvolce Date:
Attn: MARY KIRK Feb 28, 2011
Salesman:;
Customer Warkorder:
Qty | um Description Unit Price Extension
PULL FROM STORAGE/VIEW/RETURN TO STORAGE 1-21-11 — 281.75
PULL PROM STORAGE/VIEW/RECELVRE INBOUND/RETURN TG 245,00
STORAGE 1-27-12
RECEIVE INBOUND/INVENTORY/PLACE IN STORAGE 2-14-11 95,00
COOKES CRATING INC. APPROVED
Kirk, Mary
/92011
NG CONTRACT
056.65015
W Kod My 3792077
N Bosse, Gentt Z7E 077
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 3/8/2011 \
FUC regulations require payments within soven days, Sublo 624.75
Nole: Please make ail checks payable to Cooke’s Craling, Inc, Sales Tax
Muil to: P.O. Box 512817, Los Angeles, CA 90051-0817
nvolce Total | 624.75
SEE ATTACHED WORK ORDER

All involeer over 30 days are subject to a | /2% (1898 per anmnn) charge.

Thank you, we appreciate your business.

3/7/2011 12:00:20 PM




EXHIBIT 9



# 12885

Batch # 121071 Speclalists in the fine art of handling Fine Aris

ARTMOVERS,INC.  __ poep 79052

324 B 11'TH STREET * Sfnce 1974
LOS ANGELES, CA 56623-3508 CREQFIYE 3}34,0003:1. Jt of art storage
: * Cllmate controlled nir ride trucks
Telephone: 323/268-5101 OHFEB -3 AN 1030 Geum quality crating
Fax: 323/262-2001 ‘ * World-wide shlpping

* Scnipture rigglng & assembiing

Bill To: CONOIO , CONS fRVi\ TION £

CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE
PO, BOX 26834
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94116

Involce Number;

74008

Invoice Date:
Jan 31, 2011

Attn: MARY KIRK <
Salesman:
GSM Customer Workorder:
Qty | UM _ Degcription - Unit Price Extension
|STORAGE EPF: 12610 171,10
STORAGE EFF: 12-17-10 296.61
STCRAGE JAN, 2011 817,00
STORAGE FEB. 2011L 817.00 |
ART MOVERS, INC., APPROVED
Kirk, Mary
211612011
NO CONTRACT N —
996.65015
W ok, Hary Z776°2077
W Boasoe, Saatr 27782077
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 2/17/2011
: . Lo SN
PUC regulations requlre payments within sven dys. ) i
Note: Pleose make all checks payable to Art Movers, Ing, . % 230171
Mail to; IO, Box 513019, Los Angeles, CA 90051-1619 Sales Tax
. nvolce Toltal 2,0:.7M

All mvofees over 30 days are subfect to a 1 1/2% (18%/year} service charge,

Thank you, we appreciate youyr business,

2/3/2011 10:48:18 AM




Batch # 121376

ART MOVERS, INC. <«—DBoc# 79224 Speciallsts in the fine art of handling Fine Arfs
3124 E, {1TH STREET * Since 1974
U % Clmate controlled wir ride trucks
Telephoune; 323/268-5101 01 HAR -3 AMI0: O * Museum quality erating
Faxi 323/262-2001 "% World-wide shipping
* Seulfpture rigging & nssemibling
Bill To; CONOIO  CONSERYATION &
ggﬂggl;\;g;?hf & LIQUIDATION OFFICE s trivaice Number:
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 74300
involce Date:
| ——y BT 1, 2011
Attn;  MARY KIRK - Salesman:
GSM
Customer Workorder:
Qty | UM Description Unit Price Extension
STORAGE - MONTHLY - PO36428. 817,00
ART MOVERS, INC. APPROVED \
Kirk, Mary
2011
b | NG CONTRAGT
996.65015
N ok, Moy 3772077
‘bee oved PO 1648211 Man
A Bosee, Saatt Z7EAZ077
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 3/4/2011
: h,
PUC regulations require payments within seven days. -
Note: Pleass make il checks payable to At Movers, Inc Sublotaf 817.00
Mait to: P.O. Box $13019, Los Angeles, CA 90051-1019 Sales Tax
Involee Total BL7.00

Al tnvolces pver 30 days are subject to a 1 1/2% (18%/vear) service charge,

Thank you, we appreciate your busfness,

3/3/2011 12:51:35 PM




ART MOVERS, INC, - Sgeciaﬁ.rfs inthe ﬁne art of 'Irand!!ng Flne Arts

3124 E. 11TH STREET * Since 1974
LOS ANGELES, CA 900233608 i—:‘; F ('\ a ‘ 1} ::" ! ¥ *84,00030«_”‘ 0fﬂﬂ5f0fﬁg¢

¥ Climare comtrolled afr ride trucks
Tei%phane: Traea 00t 2011 APR -8 M0 BbMuseum quality crating
Fax; 323/262-2001 * World-wide siipping

* Sculptnre rigging & assembling
Batch # 121719

. Doc#
Bill To: CONOIO CONSERY ATION b, 79403
CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE . involce Number:

P.0O, BOX 26394
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 74513
involce Date:

P Apr 1, 3011

Altn;  MARY KIRK
Sdlesman;
GSM .
Customer Warkorder:
Qty | UM Dascription Unit Price Extension
817,00

STORAGE ~ MONTHLY - POIE448

ART MOVERS, INC, APPROVED

Kirk, Mary
411172011

NO CONTRACT
99665015

k;’/%/, W,@ey M//f"ﬂ/f

N B oares, Soatt
LATEA2077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 4/8/2011 S~

PUC regulutions require payments within scven days, T '
Nete: Please make all chiecks payable to Art Movers, Inc Sub‘:\ota : 8i7.90
Muil tot P.O. Box §13019, Los Angeles, CA 90051.1019 Sales Tax

Involes Total 817.00

1

Al lnvolces over 30 days are subject fo a | 1/2% {1834/ yeer} service eharge,

‘Thank you, we apprecinte your business, .

+ 418/2011 11:12:35 AM




Batch # 122029

ART MOVERS, ING, Doc# 79593 Speclalists in the fine ant of haudfing Fine Arts
3124 E. 11TH STREET ‘ . v *
e 4 Stice 1974

LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608 A F "IYEL I et sorage

. - *
Telephone: 323/268-5101 201 HAY <L ARIO: 23 Jgj;’;f;fgﬁ;’;j’g‘c’: ::,.’;l;""’ tritchs
Fax: 323/262-2001 * World-wide shipping

* Sculpture ripping & assembiing

COMSRRVATION &r_
Bill To: CONO1O A N R Y AR T
CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OHFICE nvoibs Nurber .

P.0. BOX 26394
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 74725
Ihvolce Date:

May 1, 2011
Attn:  MARY KIRK . .
Salesman;
GSM Cuslomer Workorder:
Qty | UM Description Unit Price Extension
STORRGE - MONTHLY - POLE428— 817.00
ART MOVERS, INC. APPROVED
Kirk, Mary
SI5/2011
NO CONTRACT
958.65015
W ok Mary 552077
ST G20
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 5/4/2011 \s '
PUC regulations require psyments within sewn days. '
Note: Pleass make ail chocks paysble to Art Movers, Inc, Subto §17.00
Ml fo: P.O. Box S13019, Los Anpeles, CA 90051-1019 Bales Tax
involce Tot) 817,00

All involees over 30 days are subject lo a 1 (/23 (18%/year) service charge,

Thank you, we appreciate your business,

5/4/2011 11:51:36 AM




ARTMOVERS, INC,

3124 E, 11TH STREET *Since 1974

LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608

Speclallsts In the flue art of landifug Five Arty

* 84,000 sq. f1. of art storage
* Clhnate coutrolled air ride trucks

. i S it I o
Telephone: 323/268-5101 RS A A * Museum qualily crating
Fax: 323/262-2001 0:0% * World-wide shipping
2811 JUN ~8 AH10: 0 * Sculpture rigging & assembling

Batch # 122299
Doc# 79762

Bill To: CONGIG
CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION 0GR
P.O. noxz’;ssa? Jumat SRR, Invoice Number: e
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 ART MOVERS, INC, APPROVED 74342
g;;’gégf;‘f Invoice Date:
NO CONTRACT Jun 1, 2011
Athe MARY KIRK 006.65015 Salesman::
N ok My 67702077
Customer Workorder,
Qty 1 UM Description Unit Price Extension
817,00

STORAGE - MONTHLY - -PO16428—

CTITT | ¥ Pascr S
Appr 6762077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 6/8/2011

N

PUC regulalions require payments swithin seven days,
Note: Pleass make all checks payable (o Ant Movers, Ine,
Mall 0 D,0. Box 511019, Los Angeles, CA 90051-1019

All involces over 30 duys are subject lo a | /2136 (18%/vear) service charge,

Thank you, we appreciate your business.

Sublotaf 817,00
Seles Tax
817,00

Irvoloe Total

6/8/2011 11:45:54 AM




ART MOVERS, INC, Speclalists in the fine art of handliug Fine Arts

3124 E, 11TH STREET *Stnce 1574
LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608 SENTIYED) *84,000sg. fi. of art storage
* Climate controlled alr ride trucks
! quality crating
Fax: 323/263-1001 | * World-wide shipping

« Seulpture rigging & assembling
Batch # 122754

' Doc# 80031
Bil} To: CONIO _ . 9})&;[;:!2}“!‘, }’gg}j .E-".:
‘ e
ggi:egtél;\gggfn & LIGQUIDATION OFFICE Involce Nuraber: -
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 _ 75163
{nvoica Date:
Jul 1, 2011
Attn:  MARY KIRK
tim: ¥ Salesman:
Customer Workorder:
Qty | UM \ Description Unil Price Extengion
STORAGE - MONTHLY - PO16428 . 817.00
ART MOVERS, INC, APPROVED
Kirk, Mary
7riBr2011
NOQ CONTRACT
896,65015 """
& ok Ty 27782077
ety
Y PBoaree, Gastt
2202077
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 7/11/2011 \
PUC regulations require payments within S}IWE‘F duys. \
Nete; Please make ail ehecks paysble to Art Movers, Ing, SS:.ibtota 817,00
Mail 10: .0, Box 513019, Lox Angeles, CA 90051-1019 ales Tax
Involce Total B17.00

All volees aver 30 days are sublect to a 1 1/2% (18%4/year) service churge.

Thank you, we appreciate your business.

71172011 10:57:01 AM




ART

3124 E, 1 1TH STREET
1,08 ANGELES, CA 90023-3608

Batch # 122898

MOVERS, INC, Doc# 80140 Specinllss In the fine art of handling Fine Aris

i T ER 84,600 sq. fI. of art storage

* led %
Telephone: 323/268-5101 BUAYG -1 AM s "5’;‘;’,5:’,,“,‘,’ ::;??;2,::;;;:“ e
Fax: 32312622001 * World-wide sttipping

Bill To: CONOIG

* Scutpture rigging & assembiing

] f:‘OH,Sg%YnA T!ON G’

AARRAT o P2

CONSERYATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE
PO, BOX 26894

7 Invoice Number;

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 75386
invoice Dale;
Aug 1, 2011
Atin:  MARY KIRK
Salesmanm
Customer Woikorder;
Qty | UM Descriplion Unit Price Extansion
STORAGE - MONTHLY - "POT6428- |PQ 1656 §17.00
ART MOVERS, INC, ARPROVED
Kirk, Mary
81212011
NO CONTRACT
996.65015 . ;
¥ Kok Mary &22077
M Booree, Snatt £73-2077
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 8/1/2011 \
PUC regutations tequire paynients within seven days,
Nese: Please make all checks payable to Art Movers, Inc, Subtotal 817.00
Madl to: P.O. Box §13019, Los Angsles, CA 90051-1019 Sales Tax
Invoice Total 817,00

All involees over 30 days are subject to a | I/23% (18%/year) service charge.

Thank you, we appreciate your business.

8/1/2011 1:40:15 PM




ART MOVERS, INC, . Specialists It the flne ant of&nﬁfght'ré I"gn.«i %?;62

3124 E, 11TH STREET

LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608 1’ t% 84’000 sq,'ﬂ 0ff"‘f S(O‘fﬂgﬂ

* Climate controfled alr vide frivcks

Telephone: 323/268-5101  ISEP 5 fy kptysennt
gunllyy crating
Fax:  323/262-2001 “Hwide shipping
* Sewipture rigging & assembling

CcoN
BNSERVATION &

RESE gt ond Doc# 81534

Bill To: CONOI0 TIoN &
CONSERVATION & LIGUIRATION QFFICE .
P.0. BOX 2639¢ invoice Number:
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 24126 ART MOVERS, INC. APPROVED e 15607
g};’,‘ém’y Invoice Date;
Attn; MARY KIRK o oL RACT Sep 1o 2012
4H H98.65015 s .
: alesman:
D Lok Mary 37772077
Customer Workorder;
Qty | UM Dascription Unit Price Extenslion
STORAGE ~ MONTHLY - POile428 PO # 16683 617.00
[V
MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 9/6/2011 ~_
PLC regulations require payntenis whiin saven doys. Sustold 817.00
Noie: Please moke aif checks paynblo to Art Movers, Inc. Sales Tax
Mail to: 1,0, Dox 513019, Los Angeles, CA 29051-100% are
involes Total 917.0¢

Al Invoices over 30 days are subject to a | I/2% (18%6/year) service charge.

Thank you, we appreciate your business,

9/6/2011 10:36:54 AM




ARTMOVERS, INC, /  Speciallsts ine the fine ant of handling Fine Arts

3124 B, {1TH STREET

- . *Since 1974
LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608 BECT)IvED *84,000 sq. 1. of art stornge

*
Telephone: 323/268-5101 2010CT -7 AiD: 3 Climate conrofled air ride tricks

Fax: 3237262-2081
*Seulpture rigglng & assembiing

& Musenm quality crating Batch #123852
* World-wide siippfng  DocH# 81761

ONSERVAT
Bill To; CONOI0 P ETATION &

CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE .

$.0. BOX 256894 , involce Number:

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126 . — 75832

involce Date:

oct 1, 2011

Att:  MARY KIRK Salesman:

Customar Workorder:

Qty | UM Dascription Unit Price Extension
STORAGE - MONTHLY - PO # 16598 817,00

| ART MOVERS, INC, APPROVED
Kirk, Mary

1611172011

NO CONTRACT

906.65015

N Kl My 707722077

N Borce, Soatt 7L VL L0

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 10/7/2011 ~—_

.

PUC reguintions require payments within seven diys,

817,00
Nete: Please make off chocks paysble to Art Movers, Ing, SS;’N'_’TW
Mall 1o: £,0. Box 513019, Los Anpeles, CA 900511019 ales fax 517, 06

Invoice Total

All tavofces over 30 days are subject fo a | 1/2% (18%%/year) service charge.

Thank you, we appreciate your business,

i

10/7/2011 11:09:39 AM f




ART MOVERS, INC,
3124 E. 11TH STREET
LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608

Telephone: 323/268-5101
Fax: 323/262-2001

Bill Toy CONOLO

CONSERVATION & LIQUIDATION OFFICE <&

PO, BOX 26894
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126

At MARY KIRK

AFCTIVED
2 NOV 10 PH 1413

cONSERVATIONZ.

Speclailsts in the fine adt of handiing Fine Arts

*Slnce 1974

* 34,000 yq. f1. of ari storage

* Clinmate controlled alr ride frucks
* Museuns quafity crating

* Woarli-whie shipping

* Senlpture ﬁ%gt igﬁ § airie‘i%&gf 74

Doc# 82235

Invoice Number: J
76068

Invoice Date:
Nov 3, 2011

Salesman:

Customer Workorder;

Unit Price Extension

. Qly

STORAGE ~ MONTHLY -

ART MOVERS, INC. APPROVED
Kirk, Mary

11712812011

NO CONTRACT

9D8.65015

L

B Bosee, Goatt
/W&’//

Ui Description

56

T T T

) Kok, Mlnsy 72282077

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 11/10/2011 \

! 817,00

o

PUC regulntions require payments within seven days,
Nete: Fiease make all checks payable 1o Art Movers, Inc,
Mail to: PO, Box 513019, Los Angeles, CA 900511019

AN Invoices over 30 days ore sublect to a T 1/2% (18%/vew) service charge,

‘Thank you, we appreciate your business,

Subtotal 817,00
Salos Tax
Involce Tolal

11710/2011 2:18:40 PM




Specialists in the fine art of handling Fine Arts

ART MOVERS, INC,
3124 E, 11TH STREET " O PNSInge 1974
LOS ANGELES, CA 90023-3608 REC ng 05;{,.35,,, 1 of art starage

. 201 * Gl nirolled ale ride trucks
Telephone; 323/268-5101 DEC | “*ﬂﬂ,ﬂfz&m,@ crating  Batch # 124688
Fax; 323/262-2001 * World-wide shipping Doc# 82404

* Sculpture rigging & assembling

Bl To: CONOIO tAcsiie
‘ g%ﬁggi;\;g;‘?ﬂ & LIQUIBATION OFFICE : Involce Number: /
76294

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94126
Involce Date; /

Dec 1, 2011

Attn:  MARY KIRK
, " _ S et Salesman:

Customer Workorder:

Linit Price Extansion

Qty 1 UM Dascription
744.40

STORAGE - MONTHLY

. ART MOVERS, ING, APPROVED
Kirk, Mary
121612011
NO CONTRACT
998.65015

N ok My 7277672077
N Boroe, Gosttt 170072

MATH CHECKED - Gandhi, Alan 12/14/2011 \

PUC regulatfons requite payments within sven days. Subtola 744,40
Nere: Please make alf checks payable to Art Movers, Inc, Sales Tax
744.40

Mait 1o: P.O. Bax 513019, Los Angeles, CA 90051-1019
Involce Tolal

Alf avolces over 30 days are subject 1o a 1 1/2% (18%/year) service charge,

'Thank you, we appreclate your business,

12/14/2011 11:12:06 AM




EXHIBIT 10




CONSUL?ANT BILLING SHEET

Consultant: Joshua B. Solornon, Esq. Estate: Golden State Mutual Life

Contract Number: 0900-11068
Billing Period: December 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009

Telecon w/Harrington re: removal of mainframe on Thursday & paper
goods requested by Paramount; Brief telecons w/Paramount rep., Joel
Prihcda, & his prop supplier, Grant Dolan, re: timing of removat of assets
& coordination w/Ranftl; Prepared and sent draft of Phase One schedule

121112009 {to Mojabl for review,

2 | $w00.00

Brief telecon w/Mojabi re: draft schedule, removal of mainframe & other

127272009 |large equipment, Phase One clean-up plans, etc, 0.25 $25.00

12/3/2009 |Mainframe/large equipment move; Telecon w/Mojabi re: same. 8.25 $825,00

Received & reviewed e-mafl from Dolan re: Paramount's purchase,
followed up w/same re: same; Made tentative alternative arrangements
for pickup of smatl etectronics w/Ranftl; Notiffed GSM security that
127472009 }pickup of remalnder of large equipment scheduled for 12/8; Coordinated
through pickup/sale of paper goods to Paramount w/ Prikoda & Dotan; Multiple

127712009 {telecons w/Mojabi re: preparing/expanding written schedule, z $100.00

Went to GSM to meet mainframe removal contractor/possibly coordinate
removal of smalt electronics; Made alternate arrangements via Ranftl for
removal of smatl electronics, continued to gather/stage same; Met
w/GSM representatives In each department re: waste paper for removal
by Paramount; Worked w/Paramount workforce & GSM employees to
gather/remove non-essentfal, non-confidential printed paperwork,
binders, etc. from each floor of bullding; Met/toured building w/iRanftl &

127812009 |wiltiams architectural salvage expert, Scott Bogatz. %.25 $925,00

Meeting w/Pearce, Hotloway & Mojabi re: clean-up/asset removai
schedule; Spoke wiPrihoda re: potential add assets needed by
Paramount & formalized payment arrangements for paper goods; Briefty
127972009 |swept building for additional small electronics for pickup.

2.75 $275.00

Pags 1



12/10/2009

Oversaw small equipment removal by Ranfd contractor K.W., arranged
data destruction & discusssed metal recycling removal w/same; Met
w{Brown re: upcoming schedule & management of clean-up by GSM
laborers {Larry & K.T.) & formulated plan to coordinate next clean-
up/organization phases w/GSM department heads, met w/Holloway re;
same; Provided instructions to Latry re: upcoming projects & specific
items to be removed or staged, walked relevant departments w/same re;
same; Contacted paper recycler to try to arrange bin delivery; Briefly
updated Mojobi re: progress, obtained authorization to contract data

destruction from same.

8,75

$875.00

12/11/2009

Met w/vintage furniture dealer J,C, re: potential asset sales, toured '
entire building w/same.

2.25

$225.00

1271472009

Met w/Brown to finalize plans for meeting w/department heads re: clean-
up project, locate staging area to sort/view historical/valuable goods,
progress of Larry/K.T., etc.; Met w/Flinck to discuss
gathering/sorting/inventorying historical documents & tour art locker;
Took visual inventory of metal scrap In basement & storage areas,

contacted K.W. to arrange removal of same; Called again re: recycling
hins, ’

4.5

$450.00

12/15/2009

up of main staging area; Telecon w/Ranftl re: recycling issues & furniture
sales; Viewed previously unseen areas of building w/Harrington; Finalized
details of next phase clean-up project w/Brown, along w/Brown met
w/heads of every department re:! tocating/organizing/marking assets &
paperwork for storage, destruction, disposal, etc., provided tags & basic
instructions for same; Reviewed Larry/K.T.’s clean-up progress, discussed

same w/same,

\
Began organizing staging area for historical documents, coordinated cleaw

6.75

$675.00

12/16/2009

Met w/Michael Weiss, Pearce, Holloway & Brown to discuss document
destruction/preservation, toured buflding fn connection w/same; Worked

w/Brown to expedite clean up process,

4,5.

$450.00

12/17/2009

Reviewed, signed & Returned data destruction certificates from/to 7K
Computers, Inc. (aka, K. W.}; Worked on varfous aspects of clean up
project w/Brown, Larry & K.T.; Met w/various department heads re:
questions about identifying documents and assets for disposal, retention,
ete.; Worked w/Flinck to begin organizing review of historical documents,
photographs, artwork, etc.; Set up areas where Flinck et al, could
store/examine assets & documents to determine disposition; Arranged
delivery of GRM storage boxes w/Mojabi & Kirk; Located potential paying

paper recycler, set up system for temporary storage of recyclable goods,

7.25

$725.00

Page 2



12/18/2009

Worked w/Brown, K.W. et al, to remove recyclable metal scrap from
building; Continued work organizing historical documents, etc. w/Flinck;

Photographed non-vintage furniture for soliciting bids from resellers, 7.5 5750.00

12/28/2009

Telecon w/Mojabi re: upcoming visit; Spoke w/K.W, re: removal of
remaining metal scrap fram fan room; Telecon w/Brown re: clean up

progress, Upcoming tasks, lower basement inventory, etc. 1.5 $150.00

12£29/2009

Toured GSM w/Mojabf to review clean up progress to date; Met w/Brown
to discuss improving clean up project speed/efficiency, staffing fssues,
lower basement inventory, ete.; Contacted Fily Martinez to work on clean

up project; Contacted Ranft! to arrange meeting w/Mojabl. 5 | $560.00

12/306/2009

Gathered tools/supplies w/Martinez, traveled to GSM w/same,
famitiarized him w/office & clean up project, had him begin working
w/Larry & K, T, on emptying fan room; Purchased addi clean up supplies
at Home Depot; Met w/Mojabl & Ranftl to discuss asset sales/disposal;
Met w/Pearce, Holloway, Mojahi & Brown to discuss status of current &

upcoming projects; Discussed plans to release K. T. w/Brown. b $600.00

12/3172009

Continued oversight of fan room clean up, picked up addi supplies from
Home Depot for same; Began downloading/organtzing photos of GSM
assets to use for soticiting buyers; identified multiple infections In Flinck's
workstation, began process of cleaning out same; Met w/vartous GSM

6.5 $650.00

employees re: status of clean up project(s),
Total Hours: 85 ({D

. ) s Net Due: 58@0
\ : ) / b /Stm
Date

Cons t Signa ule

Dectedlo, G, s [aers

Sup%isurﬂ&anagerlofﬁcw:h ro a! / U&—B’j B Date
/ﬁﬁﬁ‘

71 hewe VeV ew 2ok
M g:,\w <+ c,cem‘g vad Ao '7‘5{:2

C,em‘
%ﬁ iS“IOj
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Page 1 of 1

[\ Attachments can contaln viruses that may harm your computer, Attachments may nict display correctly.
From; Mofabl, Mohammed

Sent: Wed 1/13/2010 2:36 M

To; Holloway, Joe
Cet Pearce, Scott

Subject: FW: December 2009 GSM Bifling,

Attachments: | j50smon 12.2005 GSM Biifin. f(35KB

Joe, I've reviewed and approve December involce, Let me know if you have any questions,

Mohammed

S T e b e it 44 Sk i 4 Y b S B A i

P ST L e i L6 et 4 AR e o 3 T e £ e ol 53 0 b ey bty ven

From: Joshua Solomon {mailto:JSolomon@FTR.Cgrﬁ
Sent: Sunday, Jantary 10, 2010 10:25 PM

To: Mojabl, Mohammed
Subject: December 2009 GSM Blifing.

Hey Mojo,

Attached fs my December blll. Hopefully, it will meet with your approval, If no
away,

t, piease let me know right

Joshua
P.S, I got the freight elevator working. The total cost was around $500.00.

hitps://mail.caclo.org/exchange/Holloway Jnbox/F W:%20December%202009%20GSM%.  1/130010



CONSULTANT BILLING SHEET

Consultant: Joshua B. Solomon, Esq. Estate: Golden State Mutual Life

Contract Number: 0900-11068
Bilting Period: January 1, 2010 through January 31, 2010

Date

Obtained/ provided tools/supplies/instructions for final clean up of fan
room; Continued malware removal on Flinck's workstation; Drafted and
submitted summary of project completion objectives through January

3 $300,00

1/472010  |15th to Pearce,

Received and responded to inqulry from Pearce re: organization of
supplies; Oversaw completion of fan room ctean up; Had Martinez, et al,
clean out freight elevator, and move on to small outside storage room;
Researched freight elevator repair, located mechanic and worked w/same
to determine minimum necessary repairs/test machine; Researched
hydrautic fluid disposal rutes, tocated and arranged pick-up of 55 gal.
drums for storage/removal of same; Sorted and organized misc, ftems of
potential vatue located by crew during clean up process; Telecon
w/Ranftl re: payment for items recently picked up and processing of
1/5/2010  |mainframe check, provided latter to Brown for deposit. O
7R

v

7.5 $750,00

oo
P

Supervised/obtained materials for cleaning of frei’g]'ni etevator reservolr;
Had crew clean out remaining exterfor storage areas; Arranged meeting
w/J.C. to go through vintage furniture ready for immediate sale;
Researched/sourced soluable oil necessary for freight elevator repalr,
arranged for mechanic 1 return to complete repair of same; Examined
holes in elevator fluld reservoir located by Martinez, obtained materfal
for repair of same; Tetecon w/Flinck re: upcoming meetings/projects;

1/6/2010  |Completed removal of malware, etc. from Flinck's workstation, 6.5 '$650.00

Patched freight elevator's fluid reservolr, worked w/Martinez to complete |
cleaning of hydraulic system, worked w/mechanic to complete
repairs/adjustments to same; Started crew on clean up/organization of
GSM office supplies; Began removal of matware {rom Brown's workstation;

17872009  |Discussed status of departmental clean up projects w/Brown, 4 $400.00

Worked on removal of malware from Brown's workstation; Worked
w/Housten to provide network connection for “law lbrary” office; Met
briefly w/Pearce & Holloway to discuss general progress & disposition of

174172010  art works,

3 $300.00

Page 1




1/12/2010

r

Meeting w/former GSM emplovee DeVeaux, Flinck & Holloway re: art
tours, etc.] Met w/vintage furniture deater re: sale/pickup of desk,
cabinets, chalrs, etc. In staging room, consulted w/same re; sale of
modern furniture; Contacted Ranfti re: picking up latest batch of old
electronics; Met briefly w/Harrington re: clearing out area currently used
by GSM West; Contacted architectural antiques expert Bogatz red GSM art
collection, sent photos and inventory of same to same; Telecon w/Mojabi
re: monthly progress, issue w/iron Mountaln bill, etc.; Exchanged e-mails
w/Kirk re: Iron Mountairt bill; Paid/submitted check requests for

temporary labor force.

5.5

$550.00

171372010

Contacted Paramount rep re: payment status; Worked w/Ranftl to
remove saleable electronics from staging area and basement,
obtained/submitted partial payment for same; Contacted K. W, to arrange
pickup of Tatest batch of electronic waste; Worked briefly on de-bugging

Brown's workstation,

3.5

$350.00]

171472009

Met w/Brown to discuss shredding fssues, departments’ clean up progress,
etc.; Began sorting and organizing historical documents and photographs

in staging area, worked w/Flinck on same; Responded to follow-up e-mail
from Bogatz re: art collection; Met w/Harrington to discuss jssues relating -

to disposal of sensitive documents,

$300.00

1/15/2010

Verified internet connectivity in room adjacent to law library, attempted
to extend connection using existing (abandoned) telephone/network
wiring; Rescheduled electronic waste pickup; Spoke briefly w/Flinck re;
his follow-up meeting w/DeVeaux )

$200.00

1/19/2010

fottowed up w/Brown re: tatter.

Met KW, at GSM to coordinate removal of latest batch of electronic
waste; Ran new ethernet connection into law library; Met briefly w/Flinck
to discuss organization of historical materials; Met briefly w/Brown to
discuss sorting of unneeded materials by departments for destruction or
recycling; Telecon w/Mojabl re; planning upcoming phases & ensuring
GSM’s inventory of files to be sent to storage complies w/CLO standard,

$500.00

1/20/2010

Met w/J.C. et al. at GSM to discuss sale of vintage furniture, which ftems
he would take, alternative buyers for non-vintage items and scheduting
pickup of his purchase; Met briefly w/Brown to go over tasks to be

compteted white I'm away.

$200.00

Page 2



1/21/2010

Telecon w/Mojo re: upcoming CLO visit, Inventory details, GSM West
move, etc.; Spoke w/J.C, re: sale of certain GSM West ftems; Spoke
w/Brian Glannunzio (CG Office Furniture) regarding his Interest in GSM
West items; Arranged meeting b/w Giannunzio and Brown to facilitate
swift removal of assets from GSM West office; Telecon w/Brown re: GSM
West move, meeting w/Glannunzio and to discuss specific Information
that must be captured for file inventory,

2.25 $225.00

1/25/2010

Met w/Mojabi at CLO to discuss next phases of GSM project, box
Inventory and bar-coding detalls, scheduling, status of ongoing work,
etc.; Met w/Dalmaclo to go over/obtain CLO standard inventory
spreadsheet for use at GSM; Confirmed date and time for pickup of
vintage furniture w/J.C.'s assotiate, Russell Chemerisov,

$300.00

142712010

Supervised pickup of vintage furniture from staging area and GSM West;
Confirmed furniture pickup by Gfannuzio, and meetmg w/his metal
salvage contractor, Melvin Hili,

5.5 $550.00,

1/28/2010

Worked w/Brown, Harrington, et al, on GSM West move and arranging
final cleanup of vacated area; Met w/Giannuzio and Hill, toured building
w/same to fdentify add| items for sale or removal as scrap, arranged
details of scrap removal w/HE, including delivery of roll-off bin;
Contacted Chemerisov re: pickup of vintage furnfture which coutd not be
removed previous day; Met w/Ranft! and another potential furniture
buyer, K.C. and walked building w/same; Consulted w/Ranftl to verify all
items identified as scrap were of no value for individual sale; Located
add'l historical documents, had Flinck place same in vaulty Sent Brown a
copy of the CLO inventory template via e-mall.

6.5 $650,00

172972010

Met w/Hill to recelve roll-off bin, supervised removal of scrap matertats
from GSM West by same; Assisted wiremoval of remalning items from
GSM West, staged saleable items for pickup; Contacted Ranft! re: sale of
old phone equipment located iy GSM Wast office.

$400.00

173072009

supervised removal of scrap metal ftems from staging area, fan room,
second floor offices and basement by Hilt and hired crew; Arranged for
clean-up of debris left after removal of rusted metal from basement.

53

FOR HIRED LABOR.

NOTE; HOURS ABJUSTED TO REIMBURSE $300,00 PAID OUT OF POCKET

8 $800,00

Total Hours:

)/// ot

74.25
Net Duer  $7, 425 .00

?JH};

&MW
Wsc

Date

Date

«tag o



Page 1 of 1

l _}\ Attachments can contaln viruses that may harm your computer, Attachments may not display corractly.

From: Mofabi, Mohamr'n'ed

Sent: Tue 2/9/2010 4:23 PM

To! Holloway, Joe
Cer

Subfect: FW: January 2010 GSM Bliling.
Attachments: ) jsotomon 1-2010 GSM Bililng.pdf(36KE)

Joe, I have reviewed the nvolce and approve the hours.
- Mohammed

----Oiginal Message----—

From: Joshua Solomon [mallto;jsolomon@FTRINS.COM]
Sent: Saturday, February 06, 2010 4:41 PM

To: Mojabl, Mohammed

Subject: January 2010 GSM Bifiing,

See attached,

httos://mail.caclo.org/exchanoe/MnllowavIhaxy/FW2%IN Tanuare®A20NTNCAINCRAOAIN 27119010



112172010

Telecon w/Mnjo re: upcaming CLO visit, Inventory detalls, GSM West
mave, etc.) Speke w/J.C. re: sale of certain GSM West {tems; Spoke
w/Brian Glannunzio (CG Office Furniture) regarding his Interest in GSM
West items; Arranged meeting b/w Glannunzio and Brown to facllitate

swift removal of assets from GSM West office; Telecon wiBrown re; GSM
West move, meeting w/Glannunzie and to discuss specific information
that must be captured for file inventory,

225

$225.00

172572010

Met w/Mojabl at CLO to discuss next phases of GSM project, box
inventory and bar-coding detalls, scheduling, status of ongolng work,

tete.; Met w/Dalmaclo to go over/obtain CLO standard Tnventory

spreadsheet for use at GSM; Conflrmed date and time for pickup of
vintage furniture w/J.C.'s associate, Russelt Chemerisov,

3300.00

1727/2010

Supervised pickup of vintage furniture from staging area and G5M West;
Confirmed furniture pickup by Glanmuzio, and meeting w/his metal
salvage contractor, Melvin Hill,

5.5

$550,00

1728/2010

Worked w/Brown, Harrington, et al, on GSM West move and arranging
final cleanup of vacated aren; Met w/Gtannuzlo and Hilt, toured bullding
w/same to identify addt ftems Tor sale or removal as scrap, arranged
details of scrap retnoval w/HIl, including delivery of roll-off bin;
Contacted Chemerisov re: plckup of vintage furnfture which could not be
removed previous day; Met w/Ranftl and another potentlal furniture
buyer, K.C. and walked building w/same; Consulted w/Ranftl to verify all
ttems identified as scrap were of no vaiue for individual sale; Located
add’ historical documents, had Flinck place same i vault; Sent Brown a
copy of the CLO inventory template via e-mait,

6,3

$650.00

172912010

Met w/HR to racefve rofl-off bln, supervised removal of scrap materials
from GSM Wast by same; Assisted w/removal of remaining fterns from
GSM West, staged sateable ftems for pickup; Contacted Ranfti re: sale of
old phone equipment tocated In GSM West office,

$400,00

1/30/20609

Supervised removat of scrap metal ftems from staging area, fan room,
second floor offices and basement by Hitt and hired crevs; Arranged for
clean-up aof debris left after removal of rusted metal from basement,
NOTE: HOURS ADJUSTED TO REIMBURSE $300.00 PAID QUY OF POCKET

FOR HIRED LABOR.,

8

$800.00

-~ ' \9 Total Hours:
. ME:’;&‘::’/ ’ Natz)ue:

74,25

¥7,425,00




CONSULTANT BILLING SHEET

Consultant: Joshua B. Solomon, Esq. Estate: Golden State Mutual Life

Contract Number: 0900-11068

BT e

Billing Period: February 1, 2010 through February 28, 2010

9 T T R T ey S e
SR e TR L W
R gy .,_;‘._a_! !m
AL A e 9&'.&7 ey KK aquinty s R hont e

X DN

Went to GSM to supervise removal of remaining vintage furniture from staging area by
| 1.C.’s crew; Organized workspace, met briefly w/Donovan, Brown and Flinck while

27172010 there; Addressed minor GSM West layout dispute w/Harrington - NO CHARGE. 0 $0.00

. | Telecon w/Mojabi re: inventory staffing, Imaging resources, asset sales, etc,; Telecon
w/Flinck re: ongoing gathering and organfzation of historical items, resources for
assistance, potential interested parties, etc.; Telecon w/Brown re: Inventory
procedure and staffing; possible imaging project, etc.; Brief telecon w/Hotloway re:
meeting to discuss file removal/inventory and payment of labor fees for scrap metal

2/4/2010 | removal. yi $200.00

Met w/Flinck re: upcoming projects/mestings relating to gathering/organization of
historical items; Met w/Ftinck and DeVeaux re; possible public event at GSM; Met
briefly w/Brown to update him on Immediate action necessary in connection w/file
inventory/storage project; Met briefty w/Holloway to update him on DeVeauy, file

project, ete.; Updated and remaved malware from Harrington’s workstation. 3.5 $350,00

2/5/2010

Met w/Brown to go through lower basement files to prepare for making disposition
recommendation(s) and data capture requirements; Met w/Flinck to discuss upcoming
meeting(s) re: historical documents & artwork; Located add' historical documents in

tower basement; Checked on water damage to building and files f om,g.{ee?{%ﬁd rains
Y 2 $200.00

£
2/8/2010 | (NO CHARGE for this item). o B

‘.‘,‘ N - A
n

Exchanged e-matls w/Cherisov re: payment for vintage furniture; Had Daniels start
researching GSM Ubrary book values; Brought in Martinez to clean up varfous sections
of basement, supervised same; Worked w/Brown and Harrington on file
iventory/storage/ shredding project; Located and set aside numerous historical
documents; Spoke w/DeVeaux about revised event plans, followed up wiFlinck re:
same; Spoke w/Flinck re: preservation/ {dentification/organization of historical
documents and newly discovered artwork. NOTE: HOURS ADJUSTED TO COVER MONIES

2/9/1010 PAID QUT OF POCKET TO DANIELS & MARTINEZ.

9 | $900.00

Fotlowed up w/Brown, Flinck, GSM security & Holloway re: DeVeaux's revised event
plans; Met w/Brown and Wadibia re; file destruction/inventory detalls; Met w/art
historian Paul Von Blum at UCLA re: GSM art & preservation of historical items;
Reviewed inventory of GSM archives at UCLA; Met w/William Pajaud and his wife at

their home re; recently uncovered Biggers works and assisting w/historicat
preservation; Continued supervision of basement cleanup. NOTE: HOUR> ADJUSTED

971072016 | TO COVER MONIES PAID QUT OF POCKET TO DANIELS & MARTINEZ,

9,75]  $975.00




2/11/2010

Removed, sorted and organized art works, historicat items and saleable materials from
lower basement; Met w/Brown and Holloway to review and discuss the categories of
files slated for immediate destruction; Discussed upcoming event details w/DeVeaux
and Hines. NOTE: HOURS ADJUSTED TO COVER MONIES PAID OUT OF POCKET TO

MARTINEZ,

7.5

$750.00

2/12/2010

Met w/Weiss and various representatives of Buflding owner to examine murals, led
Owner’s historical consuitant on roof to sub-basement tour; Met w/Flinel, Hines and
DeVeaux re: Monday's event; Met briefly w/Weiss and Brown to discuss file
destruction; Spoke briefly w/Weiss re; bullding security; Provided Donovan
w/extremely brief informal response to Pearce's progress inqulry,

8.5

$550,00

2/15/2010

Supervised, participated in and assisted set-up and tear-down of "Old Timers®
gathering put on by DeVeaux, Met briefly with former GSM offlcers, Houston, Johns
and Cochran; Assigned several new "finds® to Danlels to determine significance/value,

NOTE; HOURS ADJUSTED TO COVER MONIES PAID OUT OF POCKET TO DANIELS.

9.25

$925.00

274772010

Spoke w/Donovan re: formal progress report for Pearce. Extended tetecon w/Mojabl
re: upcoming visit by CLO personnel, file inventory, etc.; Worked w/Flinck
finding/sorting artwork and historical documents in lower basement; Met w/Daniels to
discuss mechanism and terms for selling books and other assets; Briefly discussed
upcoming flle inventory/visit by CLO personnel w/S.K, Jones, NOTE: HOURS ADJUSTED

TO COVER MONIES PAID QUT OF POCKET TO DANIELS.

6.25

$625.00

2/18/2010

Obtatned contact info for prior bullding owner, Joseph Haydel, from Brown,
attempted to contact same via telephone; L/M for Welss re: file destruction; Spoke
w/Holloway about file destruction, data recovery from failed GSM drive and updated
him on progress; Went through 5th floor vault, removed and sorted numerous
historicat items, and personal property belonging to Houstons; Telecon w/DeVeaux re:
providing documentation to support expenses from event, etc. NOTE: HOURS
ADJUSTED TQ COVER MONIES PAID QUT OF POCKET TO DANIELS.

6.5

$650.00|

2/19/2010

Spoke at length with Haydel and the broker who handled both the purchase and sale of
building to Haydel, et al., Daron Campbeli, about the specifics of the sales, and their
understanding(s) of what was transferred, discussed obtaining coples of sales
documents from Campbell, sent him contact info In connection w/same; Briefly
researched person purportedty behind purchase by Dudley Ventures, Dexter
Henderson; Reviewed purchase inventory/prices sent by Chemerisay, researched asset

values online.

$300.00

272072010
throtugh
212412010

Performed data recovery on GSM hard drive, reviewed and sorted recovered files and
burned same to disk for Holloway; Attempted to gain access to locked GSM vaults

using recently located combinations,

5.25

5525.@0




J2422/2010

Went through staging area w/Danlels, showed him last of the assets that require
research (for now); Attempted to contact Cambell res building sales documents;
Discussed Jssues pertaining to building, art work, historical jtems, etc. wiPearce;}
Located and sorted additional histerical items; Determined approximate box count for
files fn basement and provided same to Donovan per Kirk's request.

7.23

$725.00

212372010

Met w/Majobt, Kirk, Datmacio & GSM staffers re: file organization, fnventory, etc.;
Toured building w/Mojabi to go over progress and upcoming tasks.

4.5

$450.00

2/24/2010

Meetings w/Mojabi and Mojabl, Kirk & Dalmaclo re: Issues relating to file fnventory,
and producing comprehensive plan for uptoming projects; Met w/Pearce to discuss
broad plan and tentative ideas far dealing with remaining material assets; Extended
meeting w/Brown to discuss broad spectrum of issues refating to upcoming
announcement of sale, staffing fssues and asset disposal; Spoke w/ Haydel re:
Campbell's failure to respond as promised, and had extended conversation about his
understanding of detalls of sale to Dudles and his group's Interaction w/original buyer
of buitding from GSM; Reviewed portion of historical photos w/N.A, Houstan, Brown &
Hines in effort to identify individuals, events, etc.; Reponded to tnqulrles from
Danfels re: sale(s} of specific ftems, and authorization to do so} Recelved event

| expenditure documentation from DeVeaux. NOTE: Dantels working in sales capacity,

off GSM clock this day.

$700.00

212512010

Began organizing papers and photographs in taw Hbrary in anticipation of visit by L.J.
and LA, Houston; Worked w/Brown to deal with accessing damaged basement vault,
had locksmith Install unique lock In law library entrance, provided key to same to

Hines.

-3

$300.00

142612010

Attended announcement of sale to 1A American by CLO to G5M staff,

Z

200,00

Total Hours:
Net Duer $9,325.00

Ptfou

Consultant Sigdature

Pate

/ e

SupervisopfManager/Officer Approval

Pana 3

Date ~

93.25



Went through staging area w/Danlels, showed him last of the assets that require
research (for now); Attempted to contact Cambell ro: building sales documents;
Discussed (ssuss pertatning to buliding, art work, historical ftems, étc, w/Pearce;
Located and sorted additional historical ftems; Determined approximate box count for

2/22/2010 | files In basement and provided same to Donovan per Kirk's request, 7.25 $725.00

Met w/Mofobi, Kirk, Dalmaclo & GSM staffers re: file organization, inventory, etc.;

272312010 | Toured bullding w/Mofall to go over progress and upcoming tasks, 4.5 $450.00

Meetings w/Mojabl and Mojabi, Kirk & Dalmacio re: fssues relating to file inventory,
and producing comprehensive plan for upcoming projects; Mat w/Pearce to discuss
broad plan and tentative ideas for deating with remaining material assets; Extended
meeting w/Brown to discuss broad spectrum of fssues relating to upcoming
announcement of sale, staffing Issues and asset disposal; Spoke w/Haydel re:
Campbell’s failure to respond as promised, and had extended conversation about his
understanding of details of sale to Dudles and his group’s Interaction w/original buyer
of bullding from GSM; Reviewad portion of historical photos w/N.A, Houston, Brows &
Hines In effort to fdentify individunls, events, etc.; Repanded to Inquirtes from
Danlels re: sale(s) of specific items, and authorization to do s6; Recelved avent
expenditure documentation from DaVeaux, NOTE: Dantels worktng in sales capacity,

212412010 | off GSM clock this day, 7 $700.00

Bagan organizing papers and photographs in law lsbra}y fn anticipation of visit by 1.J,
and LA, Houstony; Worked w/Brown to deal with accessing damaged basement vault,
had locksmith install unfque lock in taw Ubrary entrance, provided key to same to

272573010 | Hines, 3 $300.00

v $200.00
Total Haurse 93,25

m {’1 . Hetbuet $9,325.00
ﬂﬁ'— P % WLQJ - :f/ 55/99/0

contuftent stg ature

2/26/2010 | Attended announcement of sale to [A American by CLO to GSM staff,

Supewts};(ﬁanagerlamcer Approval Dsto
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Donovan, Todd

From: Holloway, Jo&

Sant: Monday, March 15, 2010 1:13 PM
To: Donovan, Todd; Pearce, Scolt
Ce: Wilson, David

Subject; RE: Joshua Solomon Involes
Todd,

David and | signed the nvolce and gave it to Scott totake to Golden State tomorrow.

Joe Holloway
On-Site Manager for the Conservalor
Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Comipany in Conssarvation

323-419-3644
holiowavi@cacio.org

From: Donovan, Todd
Sent: Mon 3/15/2010 11:50 AM
To: Pearce, Scolt; Holloway, Joe

Ce: Wilson, David
Subject: RE: Joshua Solomon Involce

Dear Joe and David,
Can you please review and approve the attached Involce via email?
Thank you,

Todd

From: Pearce, Scott
Sent: Monday, March 15, 2010 11:42 AM

To: Donovan, Todd; Holloway, Joe

Cc: Wiison, David
Subject: FW: Joshua Solomon Invoice

Todd:

| have reviewed and discussed the attached bill with Mohammed and Joshua, The bill is approved for payment please
get the proper approvals from David and Joe. | also have Joshua's fast progress report that aligns with this bifl.

Scott

From: Majabl, Mohammed
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2010 4:45 PM

To: Pearce, Scott
Subject: Joshua Solomon Invoice



Hi Scotf,

ast David has asked that | review and approve the involce via

Attached Is Joshua's Invoice for your approval. inthe p
d agree with the charges. Let me know if you need additional

emall before Joe signs off. {'ve reviewed this Involce an
information,

Mohammed

From: Joshua Solomon [maﬂto:jsoiomon@fmnt{erpaciﬁdnsurance.com}
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2010 2:59 PM

To: Mojabl, Mohammed

Subject: Heading! Upstalrs Now.

nmy way to PT. Attached is revised billing. I had a hell of a time doing this remotely with
ated software. Make sure it opens.

Wiil call from car o
my old Pentium I laptop with its outd

J



Donovan, Todd

Pearce, Scoft

From:

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2010 11:42 AM
To; . Donovan, Todd; Holloway, Joe

Cco: Wilson, David

Subject: FW: Joshua Solomon involce
Attachments: JSolomen 2-2010 GSM Billing 2.pdf
Todd:

| have reviewed and discussed the attachad bill with Mohammed and Joshua. The bill {s approved for payment please
get the proper approvals from David and Joe. 1also have Joshua's last progress report that aligns with this bill

Scolt

'From: Mofabl, Mohammed
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2010 4:45 PM

‘Fo: Pearce, Scott
Subject: Joshua Solomon Involce

Hi Scott,

Attached is Joshua's involee for your approval, In the past David has asked that | review and approve the involce via
emall before Joe signs off. I've reviewed this involce and agree with the charges. Let me know If you need additiona

Information.

Mohammed

From: Joshua Solomon [mallto:jsolomon@frontierpacificinsurance.com]
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2010 2:55 PM

To: Majabl, Mohammed
Subject: Headingl Upstairs Now. : ,

Will call from car on my way to PT, Attached is revised billing. Lhad a hell of a time doing this remotely with
my old Pentium III laptop with its outdated software, Make sure it opens.

J




Consultant: Joshua B, Solomon, Esq.
Contract Number: 0960-11068

Billing Period: March 1, 2010 through March 31, 2010

CONSULTANT BILLING SHEET

Estate: Golden State Mutual Life

31172010

Arranged meeting w/l.J. Houston to hand over personal items, discuss
preservation options for GSM assets; Reviewed boxes of GSM documentary
material assembled by former GSM P.R. representative, Bill Pajaud;
Worked on organization of taw Ubrary/prepping GSM laptop for use in
project fLast ftems 3 hours NO CHARGE].

5$200.00

3/2/2010

Met w/Flinck and DeVeaux to discuss nature and timing of possible second
event for G5M "Old Timers,” and DeVeaux's art tours; Worked with Flinck
to organize photos and documents for review/Identification by the
Houstons, confirmed attendance by LA. Houston, and topics for
discussion; Worked with Flinck to view and Identify remaining ftems in
the “caged” area in lower basement; Met briefly w/Pearce to verlfy
assets/licenses/rights retained by GSM.

$500.00

3/372010

Met w/l.J. Houston, LA, Houston, Brown, Flinck and N.A. Houston at GSM
offices to turn over personal {tems, discuss and {dentify historical
documents and discuss possibilities for the disposition of the remaining
portions and assets of GSM; Responded to follow-up inqulry from LJ.

Houston via telephone,

$400.00

3/4/2010

Followed up w/Haydel re; promised copies of sale documents; Followed
up w/Mojabi re: information requested by Pearce,

0.25

$25.00

3/5/2010

Telecon w/Brown re: schedule and upcoming tasks, sent e-mail to same
re: assignment for Larry; Respended to inquiry from Flinck re;
preservation of photos; Recelved building sale documents from Haydel,
spoke w/same about obtalning exhibits and purchase documents,
forwarded sale docs to Weiss, Pearce & Holloway via e-mail; Prepared
and sent summary of completed and upcoming tasks to Pearce, coples to

Mojabi and Pearce.

2.25

$225.00

pALD
B0eEh

Page 1



3/8/2010

Worked w/locksmith to open lower-basement vault, went through
contents after gaining access; Relocated add| historical decuments from
caged area In lower basement (films, recordings, tralning materials, etc.)
and organized same; Briefly researched purported building owner
Henderson, and his non-profit, SCLARC; Went through safe in fifth floor
vault, attempted to find key to cash box located therein; Made inguiries
into existence/status of safe-deposit boxes held by GSM, provided Murphy
w/information relating to keys located for such boxes {n vault and LT's
office: Collected and gave Murphy deposit records and passbooks located
in varfous tocation in fifth floor vault; Drilled lock to cash box and located
$600.00 in "petty cash” therein [NO CHARGE FOR LAST ITEM],

7.5

$750.00

3/10/2010

Delivered safe deposit keys to Murphy per Pearce; Briefly looked into
origins of “petty cash” found in fifth floor vault, delivered cash to Pearce;
Returned call from Austin Moore, L/M: Spoke to Flingk re; rescheduling
meeting w/California African American Museum ("CAAM"),

2.5

$250.00

3/11/2010

Telecon w/Brown, Kirk and Dalmacio re: file inventory, microfiche
scanning, efc.; Removed check stock and misc, financial files from lower
basement vault, delivered same to Murph; Briefly spoke w/5.K, Jones re:
his role in fite/box identification and Inventory; Attempted £o contact
purported building owner (or interested party) Henderson; Again tried to
reach Moore in response to his cail; Spoke to Ranftl re! reviewing prices

offered by J.C. for vintage furniture, sent copy of proposed payment

schedule to same via e-mail; Attempted to contact African art
expert/dealer, NNamdi re; valuation of collection, L/M for same;-Sorted,
organized and boxed Winston Mutual policies and files found in lower
basement, worked w/Brown and Cherle in connection w/same.

575

$575.00

371572010

Worked w/Flinck to prepare for 3/17/2010 meeting at CAAM, reviewed
retrieved historicat materials in connection w/same; Responded to
inquiry from i.J, Houston re: sale of book of bustness.

$200.00

3/16/2010

Contacted Southern California Library re: Nickerson Papers; Telecon
w/buflding owner Henderson re: murals, historical preservation, etc.,

followed up w/e-mail; Spoke w/daughter of Raymond Lewis re: historical |

photographs, foliowed up w/e-mail and scanned Image; Contacted
Paramount Pictures representative re: whereabouts of payment,

2,25

$225.00

Page 2



3/17/2010

Met w/Flinck and various representatives of the Californfa African
American Museum (CAAM) re: historical preservation, providing access to
GSM resources, disposition of art, etc,; Met w/Ranftl to inspect vintage
furniture and discuss values of same, possible consignment deals and to
sell phone equipment removed from GSM West; Spoke w/Kingsiey Jones
re: disposition of remaining GSM assets, arranged tentative meeting to
further discuss same; Met briefly w/Flinck to discuss plans/requests
proffered by DeVeaux; Met w/Pearce to discuss project plan, update him
as to meetings/conversations w/CAAM, Henderson and Jones and to
obtain addl information re: remaining financial obligations of GSM.

$800.00

3/1872010
through
3/2172010

Worked on organizing schedule for GSM closing plan; Arranged meeting
w/Dean Prator to allow access to GSM basketball banquet photographs;’
Organized files in preparation for review by CAAM archivist; Set up semi-
permanent office at GSM law Ubrary [ran new connections to aliow

- {phone/network access, installed personat workstation], ACTUAL TIME

SPENT AT GSM = MINIMUM 14 HOURS.

$200.00

372272010

Met w/Flinck, Brown and CAAM representatives, Sharon and Tiffany on-
site re: preservation of GSM artwork, photographs and historlcal
documents, reviewed samples of each w/same; Received and reviewed
GSM closure plan sent by Mojabi, telecon w/same re: same; Forwarded
copy of Mojabf's plan to Brown, met w/Brown re! same; Met briefty
w/Flinck re: GSM closure plan; Contacted Haydel re: obtaining addt
documents relating to sale{s) of building, L/M for his partner, Kevin
Johnson, re: same; Scanned slides from presentation on GSM art for CAAM

[NO CHARGE].

$600,00

372372010

Brief telecons w/Mojabt and Pearce re: Mojabi's draft closing plan, began
writing/organizing personal portion of same; Met briefly w/Brown re:
preparation of his portion of closing plan; Spoke briefly w/Flinck re:
addressing Ms. DeVeauxs plans for guided tours of GSM artworks, telecon
w/DeVeaux re: same; Spoke w/Henderson re: meeting to discuss
ownership of GSM murals, arranged in-person meeting b/w self, Pearce,
Henderson and Henderson's partner, Harrower; Extended after-hours
telecon w/Mojabl re: project plan [NO CHARGE],

$300.00

* | Telecon w/Brown, Mojabi, Crothers & Kirk ret globat CLO closing plan for

GSM and preparation of drafts of individual portions; Prepared and
submitted draft of personal portion of closing plan; Briefly reviewed
Brown’s unsubmitted draft plan; Confirmed meeting w/Henderson via e-

mail,

3/24/2010

$700.00

Page 3




3/25/2010

Telecon w/Mojabi and Crothers re; draft closing plan; Met w/Brown re!
his draft plan, obtained copy of same; Met w/CAAM representatives re:
preservation of archives, toured building w/archive specialist to show
poth archival materials and facilities available for work on preservattcn.
Rescheduled meeting with Henderson, et al,, confirmed same via e-mail;
Spoke w/K. Johnson re: obtaining copies of building sale documents,
arranged meeting to discuss/copy same; Met w/Prator to provide access
to GSM historical photos; Met w/Kingsley Jones re: future of GSM,
updated Pearce re: same; Met after hours w/Pearce to discuss closing
plan{s), detivered printed copies of same [NO CHARGE].

3/26/2010
through
3/27/2010

Purchased and installed parts/software in GSM workstation; Picked up
scanner sent by Mojabi for meeting w/K. Johnson Monday; Organized
office; Sold misc. non-vintage items to Ranftl; Tested/checked GSM
projectors {modern) for possible sale. AT GSM MINIMUM OF SIX HOURS

[NO CHARGE]

3/29/2010

Met w/prior owners of GSM building, Campbell and Johnson at Campbell's
office in Encino, obtained, organized and scanned all documents made
available relevant to the sale(s) of the building; Telecon w/K, Jones and
potential investor in GSM residuary, Stephan Robinson {1 hour, NO

CHARGE}

3/36/2010

Telecon w/K, Jones and NC Mutual representative, James Speed, re: his
company’s potential interest in GSM shell, and disposition of other assets,
followed up w/K. Jones re: same and potential upcoming meeting(s)
w/other parties interested fn GSM Residuary; Spoke w/l.J. Houston re!
recent G5M developments, CAAM request for his assistance, etc. [2.25

hours NO CHARGE],

373172010

Meeting w/Henderson and Pearce, followed up w/Pearce afterwards,
updated him on recent developments involving K. Jones; Met briefly
w/Brown re; project plan; Followed up w/K.W. re: last batch of
destruction certificates; Followed up w/Paramount representative re;
tocation of check; Fotlowed up w/Ranftl re: recent sales; Finalized prices

'w/J.C. for vintage furniture, requested check for same; Provided vendor

contact tist, accounting of cormpleted sales and certificates of destruction

to Mojabi per pmject plan,

6.5 $650.00
0 50.00
4.5 $450,00
0 $0.00
6.25 $625.00

Ej) & H E‘E ‘Total Hours: 76.75

(f) /‘/ "F05h . L/ /;e;:e. §7,675.00

Ag /;“;10
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Page 1 of 2

_f You repfied on 4/14/2010 5:51 PM,
Attachments can cantafn viruses that may harm your computer, Attachments may not display correctly.

oﬂowa Joe

From: Mojabl, Mohammed ‘ " Sent: Wed 4/14/2010 4:41 P
To: Holloway, Joe

Ce: Pearce, Scott

Subject: FW: March 2010 Bitfing.

Attachments:  ysolomon 3-2010 GSM Bllina.pdf(4

Joe,

Attached is Joshua's Invoice for the month of March, I have reviewed and
approve this month's Invoice




- c——— e ———

372572010

Telecon w/Mojabt and Crothers rei draft closing plan; Met w/Brown re:
his draft plan, obtained copy 0f same; Met w/CAAM representatives re;
preservation of archives, toured buiflding w/archive speciallst to show
both archival materfals and faciiities avallable for work on preservation;
Rescheduled meeting with Henderson, et al., confirmed same via e-mail;
Spoke w/K, Jotmson re; obtaining coples of building sale documents,
arranged meeting to discuss/copy same; Met w/Prator to provide access
to GSM historical photos; Met w/Kingsley Jones re: future of GSM,
updated Pearce re: same; Met after hours w/Pearce to discuss closing
ptan{s), detivered printed coples of same [NO CHARGE].

6.5 3650.00

3/26/2010
through
3127710

Purchased and fnstatled parts/software in GSM workstation; Picked up
scanner sent by Mojfabi for meeting w/K, Johason Monday; Organized
office; Sold misc, non-vintage ftems to Ranftl; Tested/checked GIM
projectors (modern} for possible sale, AT GSM MINIMUM OF SIX HOURS

{NG CHARGE].

) 50.00

3/29/2010

Met w/prior owaers of GSM buftding, Campbell and Johnson at Campbell’s

office In Encino, obtained, organized and scanned all documents made

available relevant to the sale(s) of the building; Telecon w/K. Jones and
potential investor in GSM residuary, Steplian Robinsen [1 hour, NO
CHARGE].

4.5 $450.001

34302010

Telecon w/K, Jones and NC Mutuat representative, James Speed, re: his
company's potentfal Interest in GSM shell, and disposition of other assets,
foliowed up w/K. Jones re: same and potentfal upcoming meeting(s)
wiother parties interested In GSM Resfduary; Spoke w/l. 4. Houston re:
recent GSM developments, CAAM request for his assistance, ete, [2.25
hours NO CHARGE].

o $0.00

3/3172000

Meeting w/Henderson and Pearce, followed up w/Pearce afterwards,
updated him on recent developments involving ¥, Jones; Met briefly
wiBrown re: profect plan; Followed up w/K.W. re; last batch of
destruction certificates; Followed up w/Paramount representative res
location of check; Followad up w/Ranfti rer recent sales; Finalized prices
w/ .. C, for vintage furniture, requested check for same; Provided vendor
contact tist, accounting of completed sales and certificates of destruction

to Majabi per project plan,

6.25 $625.00

Totat Hours: 76.75
Nel uer $7,675.00
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EDMUND G. BROWN JR.
Attorney General of the State of California
W. DEAN FREEMAN
Supervising Deputy Attorney General
FELIX LEATHERWOOD
Supervising Deputy Attorney General ‘
MARTA L. SMITH, State Bar No. 101955
Deputy Attorney General
300 South Spring Street, Room 1702
Los Angeles, California 90013
Telephone: (213) 857-2480
Fax: (213) 897-5775

 gEP 302008
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Attorneys for Applicant Insurance Commissioner

of the State of California

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA
FOR THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES

INSURANCE COMMISSIONER OF THE
STATE OF CALIFORNIA,

Applicant,

V.,

GOLDEN STATE MUTUAL LIFE
INSURANCE, a California corporation,

Respondent.

oL

caseno. BS123000

A
PIEOROSED] ORDER APPOINTING
CONSERVATOR AND RESTRAINING
ORDER

Assigned For All Purposes To the Honorable

FEROGRGSER]. ORDER APPOINTING CONSERVATOR AND RESTRAINING ORDER
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The verified Application of the Insurance Commissioner of the State of California (“the -
Commissioner”) having been filed herein and it appearing to this Court from said Application that
the Commissioner has (1) found Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company {“Golden State”)
to be in such condition that its further transaction of business will be hazardous to its
policyholders, creditors, and the public; and (2) found that said insurer does not comply with the
requirements for the issuance to it of a certificate of authority,

1T IS HEREBY ORDERED that:

1. The Commissioner is appointed as Conservator (hereinafter “Conservator”) of
Golden State and directed him to conduct the business of Golden State or so much thereof as he
may deem appropriate (Insurance Code §§ 1011 and 1037(2));

2. Title to all of the assets of Golden State, wheresoever situated, is vested in the
Conservator or his or her successor in office, in his official capacity as such, including without
limitation deposits, certificates of deposit, bank accounts, mutual funds, securities, contracts,
rights of actions, books, records and other assets of any and every type and nature, wheresoever
situated, presently in Golden State’s possession or control those which may be discovered |
hereafter (Insurance Code § 1011}

3. All funds and assets, including without limitation deposits, certificates of deposit,
bank accounts, securities, and mutual fund shares of Golden State, in various financial depositary
institutions, including without limitation banks, savings and loan associations, industrial loan
companies, mutual funds and/or stock brokerages, wheresoever situated, are subject to
withdrawal only upon direction or order by the Conservator (Insurance Code §§ 1011 and 1037
General Powers);

4. The Conservator is authorized forthwith to take possession of all of Golden State’s
books, records, property, real and personal, and assets including without limitation accounts, safe
deposit boxes, rights of actions and all assets as may be in the name of Golden State, wheresoever
situated (Insurance Code § 1011); .

5. The Conservator is authorized to collect all moneys due to Golden State, and to do

such other acts as are necessary or expedient to collect, conserve, or protect Golden State’s assets,
A iy

(EROPOEED] ORDER APPOINTING CONSERVATOR AND RESTRAINING ORDER
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property, and business (Insurance Code § 1037(a));

6.  The Conservator is authorized to collect all debts due and claims belonging to
Golden State and to have the authority to sell, compound, compromise, or assign, for the purpose
of collection upon such terrs and conditions as the Conservator deems best, any bad or doubtful |
debts (Insurance Code § 1037(b));

7. The Conservator is authorized to compound, compromise or in any other manner
negotiate settlements of claims against Golden State upon such terms and conditions as the
Conservator shall deem to be in the best interest of the estate of Golden State (Insurance Code §
1037(c));

8. The Conservator is authorized to acquire, hypothecate, encumber, lease, improve,
sell, transfer, abandon, or otherwise dispose of or deal with, any real or personal property of
Golden State at its reasonable market value, or, in cases other than acquisition, sale, or transfer on
the basis of reasonable market value, upon such terms and conditions as the Conservator may
deem proper, provided the market value of the property involved does not exceed the sum of
twenty thousand dollars ($20,000) (Insurance Code § 1037(d));

9, The Conservator, for the purpose of executing and performing any of the powers
and authority conferred upon the Conservator under Insurance Code § 1010 ef seq, in the name of
Golden State or in the Conservator’s own name, is authorized to initiate, prosecute, and/or defend
any and all suits and other legal proceedings, legal or equitable, and to execute, acknowledge and
deliver any and all deeds, assignments, releases and other instruments necessary and proper to
effectuate any sale of any real and personal property or other transaction in connection with the
administration, liquidation or other disposition of the assets of golden State, in this or other states
15 may appear to him necessary to carry out his functions as Conservator {Insurance Code §
1037(f) and 1037 General Powers);

10.  The Conservator is authorized to divert, take possession of and secure all mail of
Golden State and to effect a change in the rights fo use any and all post office boxes and other
mail collection facilities used by Golden State (Insurance Code §§ 1011 and 1037 General

Powers);
ak -3-

~HFROPOSED] ORDER AFPOINTING CONSERVATOR AND RESTRAINING ORIDER




e L e Y

NN N N NN NN N e
& 3 & G B BB = S 0 ® QA 4B RmL oSS

11.  The Conservator is authorized to invest and reinvest, in such manner as the
Conservator may deem suitable for the best interests of the policyholders and creditors of golden
State, such portions of the funds and assets of Golden State in his possession as do not exceed the
amount of the reserves required by law to be maintained by Golden State as reserves for life
insurance policies, annuity contracts, supplementary agreements incidental to life business, and
reserves for noncancellable disability policies, provided the investment or reinvestment to be
made does not exceed the sum of one hundred thousand dollars ($100,000), except that the
Conservator may make investments or reinvestments in excess of $100,000, but not exceeding
$5,000,000 per investment or reinvestment, if such investments or reinvestments are in
compliance with Golden State’s existing investment guidelines (Attached as Exhibit 2 to the
Application and incorporated by reference herein) or are made pursuant to the investment
guidelines of the Commissioner’s Conservation & Liquidation Office (Attached as Exhibit 3 to
the Application and incorporated by reference herein) including investments and reinvestments
through an investment pool consisting exclusively of assets from conserved and/or liquidating
estates (Insurance Code § 1037(g) and General'Powers);

12.  The Conservator is authorized, in his discretion, to pay or defer payment of some
or all claims, expenses, liabilities and/or obligations of Golden State, in whole or in part, accruing
prior and/or subsequent to his appointments as Conservator; to establish a 90-day moratorivm on
surrenders of and withdrawals from life insurance policies and annuities; to develop and
implement a procedure for surrenders of and withdrawals from life insurance policies and
annuities due to hardship (Insurance Code §§ 1011 and 1037 General Powers);

13.  The Conservator is authorized to appoint and employ under his hand and official
seal, special deputy commissioners and/or legal counsel, as his agents, and to employ clerks
and/or assistants, and to give to each of them those powers that the Consevator deems necessary
(Insurance Code §§ 1035(a) and 1036);

14. The Conservator is authorized to fix the costs of employing special deputy
commissioners, legal counsel, clerks, and/or assistants, and all expenses of taking possession of,

conserving, conducting, liquidating, disposing of, or otherwise dealing with the business and
G-M "4"
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property of Golden State, subject to the approval of the court, and to pay such costs out of the
assets of Golden State to the Conservator and others including without limitation expenses,
expense allocations, administrative costs, administrative overhead, and costs incurred and/or
allocated by the Conservation & Liquidation Office, and if there are insufficient funds to pay such
costs, then to pay such costs out of the Insurance Fund pursuant to Insurance Code § 1035
(Insurance Code §§ 1035(a), 1036 and 1037 General Powers);

15.  The Conservator is authorized to assume or reject, or to modify, any executory
contract, including without limitation, any lease, rental or utilization contract or agreement
{inchuding any schedule to any such contract or agreement), and any license or other arrangement
for the use of computer software of business information systems, to which Golden State is a
party or as to which Golden State agrees to accept an assignment of such contract, not later than
120 days of the date of the Order Appointing Conservator, unless such date is extended by
application to and further order of this Court, and if not expressly assumed by the Conservator
within that time then such executory contract is deemed rejected (Insurance Code § 1037 General
Powers);

16.  The Conservator is authorized to terminate compensation arrangements with
employees, to enter into new compensation arrangements with employees including arrangements
containing retention incentives, and to hire employees on such terms and conditions as he deems
reasonable (Insurance Code § 1037 General Powers),

17.  The Conservator is granted all the powers of the directors, officers and managers
of Golden State, whose authorities are suspended except as such powers may be redelegated in
writing by the Conservator (Jnsurance Code § 1037 General Powers),

18.  Except upon the express authorization of the Conservator, Golden State and its
officers, directors, agents, servants, and employees are enjoined from the transaction of Golden
State’s business or disposition of its property including without limitation from disposing of,
using, transferring, selling, assigning, canceling, alienating, hypothecating or concealing in any
manner or any way, or assisting any person in any of the foregoing, of the property or assets of

Golden State or property or assets in the possession of Golden State, of any nature or kind,
, -5
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including without limitation claims or causes of action, until further order of this Court and
further, such persons are enjoined from obstructing or interfering with the Conservator’s conduct.
of his or her duties as Conservator (Insurance Code §§ 1011, 1020 and 1037);

19.  All persons are enjoined from instituting or prosecuting or mainfaining any action
at law or suit in equity including without limitation actions or proceedingsto compel discovery or
production of documents or testimony, and matters in arbitration, and from obtaining or
attempting to attain preferences, judgments, foreclosures, attachments or other liens of any kind
or nature, against Golden State, its assets, or the Conservator, and from attaching, executing upon,
foreclosing upon, redeeming of, making levy upon, or taking any other legal proceedings against
any of the property and/or assets of Golden State, and from doing any act interfering with the
conduct of said business by the Conservator, except after an order from this Court obtained after
reasonable notice to the Conservator {Insurance Code §§ 1011, 1020 and 1037 Genera}l Powers);

20.  Enjoining the sale or deed for nonpayment of taxes or assessments levied by any
taxing agency of property and/or assets of Golden State (Insurance Code § 1020(f));

21,  Except with leave of court issued after a hearing in which the Conservator has
received reasonable notice, all persons are enjoined from accelerating the due date of any
obligation or claimed obligation, exercising any right of set-off, taking, retaining, retaking or
attempting to retake possession of any real or personal property, withholding or diverting any rent
or other obligation, and doing any act or other thing whatsoever to interfere with the possession of]
or management by the Conservator of the property and assets, owned or controlled, by Golden
State or in the possession of Golden State or in any way interfering with the Conservator or
interfering in any manner during the pendency of this proceeding with the exclusive jurisdiction
of this Court over Golden State (Insurance Code §§ 1020 and 1037 General Powers);

22, All persons are enjoined from the waste of the assets of Golden State (Insurance
Code § 1020);

23.  Golden State and all officers, directors, agents and employees of Golden State are
ordered to deliver to, and immediately make available to, the Conservator all assets, books,

records, accounts, information, computers, tapes, discs, writings, other recordings of information,
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equipment and other property of Golden State, wheresoever situated, in said persons custody or
control and further, directing the aforesaid to disclose verbally, or in writing if requested by the
Conservator, the exact whereabouts of the foregoing items if such items are not in the possession
custody or control of said persons (Insurance Code §§ 1011, 1020 and 1037 General Powers);

24,  All officers, directors, trustees, employees or agents of Golden State, or any other
person, firm, association, partnership, corporate parent, holding company, affiliate or other entity
in charge of any aspect of Golden State’s affairs, either in whole or in part, and including but not
limited to banks, savings and loan associations, financial or lending institutions, brokers, stock or
mutual associations, or any parent, holding company, subsidiary or affiliated corporation or any
other representative acting in éoncert with Golden State, are ordered to cooperate with the
Conservator in the performance of his or her duties (Insurance Code § 1037 General Powers);

25.  All persons who maintain records for Golden State, pursuant to written contract or
any other agreement, are ordered to maintain such records and to deliver to the Conservator such
records upon his request (Insurance Code §§ 1020 and 1037 General Powers);

26.  All agents of Golden State, and all brokers who have done business with Golden
State, are ordered to make all remittances of all funds collected by them or in their hands directly
to the Conservator (Insurance Code §§ 1020 and 1037 General Powers);

27.  All persons having possession of any lists of policyholders, escrow holders,
mortgages or mortgagees of Golden State are ordered to deliver such lists to the Conservator and
all persons are enjoined from using any such lists or any information contained therein without
the consent of the Conservator (Insurance Code §§ 1020 and 1037 General Powers);

28.  Golden State and its officers, directors, agents, servants, employees, successors,
assigns, affiliates, and other persons or entities under their control and all persons or entities in
concert or participation with Golden State, and each of them, are orde;'ed to turn over to the
Conservator all records, documentation, charts and/or descriptive materials of all funds, assets,
property (owned beneficially or otherwise), and all other assets of Golden State wherever
gituated, and all books and records of accounts, title documents and other documents in their

possession or under their control, which relate, directly or indirectly to assets or property owned
oI 7
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or held by Golden State or to the business or operations of Golden State (Insurance Code §§ 1020

and 1037 General Powers);

29, Any and all provisions of any agreement entered into by and between any third
party and Golden State, including by way of illustration, but not limited to, the following types of
agreements {as well as any amendments, assignments, or modifications thereto), shall be stayed,
and the assertion of any and all rights and remedies relating thereto shall also be stayed and
barred, except as otherwise ordered by this Court, and this Court shall retain jurisdiction over any
cause of action that has arisen or may otherwise arise under any such provision: financial
guarantee bonds, promissory notes, loan agreements, security agreements, deeds of trust,
mortgages, indemnification agreements, subrogation agreements, subordination agreements,
pledge agreements, assignments of rents or other collateral, financial statements, letters of credit,
leases, insurance policies, guaranties, escrow agreements, management agreements, real estate
brokerage and rental agreements, servicing agreements, attorney agreements, consulting
agreements, easement agreements, license agreements, franchise agreements, or employment
contracts that provide in any manner that selection, appointment or retention of a conservator,
receiver or trustee by any court, or entry of any order such as hereby made, shall be deemed to be,
or otherwise operate as, a breach, violation, event of default, termination, event of dissolution,

event of acceleration, insolvency, bankruptcy, or liguidation (Insurance Code §§ 1020 and 1037

(General Powers).

PRIKYA

Judge of the Supertor céur”
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DECLARATION OF SERVICE BY E-MAIL AND OVERNIGHT COURIER

Case Name: Insurance Commissioner v. Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Co.
No.:

i declare:

I am employed in the Office of the Attorney General, which is the office of a member of the
California State Bar, at which member’s direction this service is made. I am 18 years of age or
older and not a party to this matter; my business address is: 300 South Spring Street, Suite 1702,
Los Angeles, CA 90013. 1 am familiar with the business practice at the Office of the Attorney
General for collection and processing of correspondence for overnight mail with the FEDERAL
EXPRESS overnight mail service. In accordance with that practice, correspondence placed in
the internal mail collection system at the Office of the Attorney General is deposited with the
overnight courier that same day in the ordinary course of business.

On September 28, 2009, 1 served the attached [PROPOSED] ORDER APPOINTING
CONSERVATOR AND RESTRAINING ORBER by transmitting a true copy via electronic
mail. In addition, I placed a true copy thereof enclosed in a sealed envelope, in the internal mail
system of the Office of the Attorney General, for overnight delivery, addressed as follows:

Michael L. Rosenfield, Esq.

Barger & Wolen LLP

633 W. 5th Street

Forty-Seventh Floor

Los Angeles, Califormia 90071-2045

Phone: (213) 614-7321

Fax: (213) 614-7399

E-mail Address: mrosenfield@bargerwolen.com

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California the foregoing is true
and correct and that this declaration was executed on September 28, 2009, at Los Angeles,

California.

Veronica James

Declarant

LA2009601876
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On January 28, 2011, in Department 86 of the above-entitled Court, the Honorable Ann 1,
Jones, Judge Presiding (the “Court™), the Court held the hearing on the Court’s Order to Show
Cause and the Motion For Order Of Liguidation And Orders And Injunctions In Aid Of
Liquidation For Golden State Mutual Life Insurance Company, filed by Applicant Steve Poizner,
Insurance Commissioner of the State of California, in his capacity as Conservator (“Conservator™)
of Golden State Mutal Life Insurance Company in Conservation {“Golden State”). Deputy
Attorney General Marta L. Smith and attorney Michael R. Weiss appeared on behalf of the
Conservator. Other appearances, if any, are noted in the record.

The Court, having read and considered the Conservator’s Notice of Order to Show Cause
and Motion, Memorandum of Points and Authorities in support of the Motion, the Declarations of
David B. Wilson and Michael R. Weiss, and all documents and evidence submitted, and having
heard and considered the arguments presented to the Court, and upon good cause shown,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Conservator’s Motion. is granted and that:

A. Liguidation, Administration and Operation

1. As of September 30, 2010, Golden State is insolvent and remains insolvent today,
and 1t would be futile for the Commissioner to proceed as Conservator; and therefore, sufficient
grounds exist in accordance with Insurance Code § 1016 for entry of an order of liquidation of
Golden State. (Insurance Code § 1016.)

2. The Commissioner’s status as Conservator Is terminated, he is appointed
Liquidator of Golden State as set forth in Insurance Code § 1016, and he is directed as Liguidator
to liguidate and wind up the buéiness of Golden State and to act in all ways and exercise all
powers necessary for the purpose of carrying out this Order. (Insurance Code § 1016.)

3. Title to all of the assets of Golden State, wheresoever situated, shall remain vested
in the Commissioner, now as Liguidator, or his successor in office, in his official capacity as
such, including without limitation real and personal property, deposits, certificates of deposit,
bank accounts, mutsal funds, securities, contracts, rights of actions, books, records and other

assets of any and every type and nature, wheresoever situated, presently in Golden State’s

wl-
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possession and/or those which may be discovered hereafter. (Insurance Code §§ 1011, 1016 and
1037 General Powers.)

4. All funds and assets, including without limitation deposits, certificates of deposit,
bank accounts, securities, and muthal fund shares of Golden State, in various financial depositary
institutions, including without Jimitation banks, savings and loan associations, industrial loan
companies, rmutual funds and/or stock brokerages, wheresoever situated, are subject to withdrawal
only upon direction or order by the Liquidator. (Insurance Code §§ 1011, 1016 and 1037 General
Powers.)

5. The Liguidator is authorized to collect all moneys due to Golden State, and to do
sach other acts as are necessary or expedient to collect, conserve, protect and/or liquidate Golden
State’s assets, property and business. {Insurance Code § 1037(a).)

6. The Conservator is authorized to collect ali debts due and cilaims belonging to
Golden State and to have the authority to sell, compound, compromise, or assign, for the purpose
of collection upon such terms and conditions as the Liquidator deems best, any bad or doubtful
debts. {Insurance Code § 1037(b}.)

' 7. The Liquidator is authorized to compound, compromise or in any other mannper
negotiate settlements of claims against Golden State upon such terms and conditions as the
Liquidator shall deem to be most advantageous to the estate of Golden State. (Insurance Code §
1037(¢).)

8. The Liquidator is authorized, without permission of the court and without notice,
to acquire, hypothecate, encumber, lease, improve, sell, transfer, abandon, or otherwise dispose of
or deal with, any real or personal property of Golden State at its reasonable market value, or, in
cases other than acquisition, sale, or transfer on the basis of reasonable market value, upon such
terms and conditions as the Liquidator may deem proper, provided the market value of the
property involved does not exceed the sum of twenty thousand dollars (320,000). (Inswrance
Code § 1037(d).)

9. The Liquidator is authorized to transfer to a trustee or trustees, under a voting trust

agreement, the stock of Golden State heretofore or hereafter issued to the Liquidator i,
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connection with a rehabilitation or reinsurance agreement, or any other proceeding under

—r

Insurance Code § 1010 e/ seq. (Insurance Code § 1037(e).)

10.  The Liquidator is atithorized, for the purpose of executing and performing any of
the powers and authority conferred upon the Liquidator under Insurance Code § 1010 ef seq, in
the name of Golden State or in the Liguidator's own natne, to initiate, prosecute and/or defend any
and all suits and other legal proceedings, legal or equitable, and to execute, acknowledge and
deliver any and all deeds, assigninents, releases and other instruments necessary and proper to

effectuate any sale of any real and personal property or other transaction in connection with the
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administration, liquidation or other disposition of the assets of Golden Statc, in this or other states

as may appear to him necessary to carry out his functions as Liquidator. (Insurance Code §

a
<

114 1037(f) and 1037 General Powers.}

12 11.  The Liquidator is authorized to divert, take possession of and secure all mail of
13 Golden State and to effect a change in the rights to use any and all post office boxes and other
14 mail collection facilities used by Golden State. (Insurance Code §§ 1011 and 1037 General

154 Powers.)

16 12.  The Liquidator is authorized, without permission of the court and without notice,
170 to invest and reinvest, in such manner as the Liquidator may deem suitable for the best interests of
18] the policyholders and/or creditors of Golden State, such portions of the funds and assets of

19l Golden State in his poasession as do not exceed the amount of the reserves required by law to be
201 maintained by Golden State as reserves for life insurance policies, annuity contracts,

211l supplementary agreements incidental to life business, and reserves for non-cancelable disability
221 policies, and which funds and assefs are not immediately distributable to creditors, provided the
23l investment or reinvestment to be made does not exceed the sum of one hundred thousand dollars
a4l ($100,000), except that the Liquidator, without permission of the court and without notice, may
251 make investments or reinvestments in excess of $100,000, but not exceeding $5,000,000 per

26| investment or reinvestment, if such investments or reinvestments are part of Golden State’s

27l existing mvestments or are 